
RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; 

RWD; 4-Door
No Bid P  $                      43,570.00 P  $                              36,369.00 

Year No Bid 2023-2024 2023
Make No Bid Dodge Dodge
Model No Bid LDEE48 Charger Police AW
Engine No Bid 3.6L 3.6L

Engine Cylinder No Bid V6 V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 360 90-240

Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; 

RWD; 4-Door
No Bid P  $                      45,925.00 P  $                              36,817.00 

Year No Bid 2023-2024 2023

Make No Bid Dodge Dodge

Model No Bid LDDE48 Charger Police 

Engine No Bid 5.7L 5.7L

Engine Cylinder No Bid V8 V8

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 360 90-240

Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L; 

RWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grapevine DCJ, LLC

Grapevine, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

3

P = Primary

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Cameron Country CDJR

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

1

2



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; 

RWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid P  $                              34,769.00 

Year No Bid No Bid 2023
Make No Bid No Bid Dodge
Model No Bid No Bid Charger Pursuit
Engine No Bid No Bid 3.6L

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid 90-120

Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; 

RWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid P  $                              35,321.00 

Year No Bid No Bid 2023

Make No Bid No Bid Dodge

Model No Bid No Bid Charger Pursuit

Engine No Bid No Bid 5.5L

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid V8

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid 90-120

Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L; 

RWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC

Graham, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

1

2

3

Holiday Chevrolet

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Holiday Ford

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; 

RWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; 

RWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L; 

RWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

3

Rockdale Country Ford

Rockdale, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

PriceItem

Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD

Carrollton, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

1

2



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Grapevine DCJ, LLC

Grapevine, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P = Primary

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Cameron Country CDJR

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 

4WD; Super Crew
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; 

AWD: 5-Door
No Bid P  $                      44,575.00 P  $                              40,470.00 

Year No Bid 2023-2024 2023

Make No Bid Dodge Dodge

Model No Bid WDDE75 Durango Police

Engine No Bid 3.6L 3.6L

Engine Cylinder No Bid V6 V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 360 90-240

Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; 

AWD; 5-Door
No Bid P  $                      46,990.00 P  $                              43,193.00 

Year No Bid 2023-2024 2023

Make No Bid Dodge Dodge

Model No Bid WDDE75 Durango Police

Engine No Bid 5.7L 5.7L

Engine Cylinder No Bid V8 V8

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 360 90-240

4

5

6



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC

Graham, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Holiday Chevrolet

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Holiday Ford

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 

4WD; Super Crew
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; 

AWD: 5-Door
No Bid No Bid P  $                              38,087.00 

Year No Bid No Bid 2023

Make No Bid No Bid Dodge

Model No Bid No Bid Durango Pursuit

Engine No Bid No Bid 3.6L

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid 90-120

Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; 

AWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid P  $                              41,193.00 

Year No Bid No Bid 2023

Make No Bid No Bid Dodge

Model No Bid No Bid Durango Pursuit

Engine No Bid No Bid 3.6L

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid 90-120

6

4

5



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Rockdale Country Ford

Rockdale, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

PriceItem

Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD

Carrollton, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 

4WD; Super Crew
P  $                             49,775.00 P  $                             41,790.00 

Year 2023-2024 2023

Make Ford Ford

Model W1P F-150 Responder

Engine 3.5L 3.5L GTDI

Engine Cylinder V6 V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 120

Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; 

AWD: 5-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; 

AWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

4

5

6



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Grapevine DCJ, LLC

Grapevine, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P = Primary

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Cameron Country CDJR

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; 

AWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; 

AWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ford Explorer; 3.0L V6; 

AWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

7

9

8



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC

Graham, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Holiday Chevrolet

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Holiday Ford

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; 

AWD; 5-Door
No Bid P  $                      45,217.00 No Bid

Year No Bid 2023 No Bid

Make No Bid Ford No Bid

Model No Bid Police Interceptor No Bid

Engine No Bid 3.3L Hybrid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid V6 No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 90-120 No Bid

Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; 

AWD; 5-Door
No Bid P  $                      42,691.00 No Bid

Year No Bid 2023 No Bid

Make No Bid Ford No Bid

Model No Bid Police Interceptor No Bid

Engine No Bid 3.3L FFV No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid V6 No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 90-120 No Bid

Ford Explorer; 3.0L V6; 

AWD; 5-Door
No Bid P  $                      46,065.00 No Bid

Year No Bid 2023 No Bid

Make No Bid Ford No Bid

Model No Bid Police Interceptor No Bid

Engine No Bid 3.0L EcoBoost No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid V6 No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 90-120 No Bid

9

7

8



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Rockdale Country Ford

Rockdale, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

PriceItem

Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD

Carrollton, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; 

AWD; 5-Door
P  $                             49,970.00 P  $                             45,269.00 

Year 2023-2024 2023

Make Ford Ford

Model K8A-99W Police Interceptor

Engine 3.3L HYBRID 3.3L HYBRID

Engine Cylinder V6 V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 180

Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; 

AWD; 5-Door
P  $                             47,225.00 P  $                             41,243.00 

Year 2023-2024 2023

Make Ford Ford

Model K8A-99B Police Interceptor

Engine 3.3L HYBRID 3.3L TI-VCT

Engine Cylinder V6 V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 180

Ford Explorer; 3.0L V6; 

AWD; 5-Door
P  $                             50,885.00 P  $                             45,717.00 

Year 2023-2024 2023
Make Ford Ford
Model K8A-99C Police Interceptor
Engine 3.0L 3.0L Eco-Boost

Engine Cylinder V6 V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 180

9

7

8



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Grapevine DCJ, LLC

Grapevine, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P = Primary

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Cameron Country CDJR

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Chevrolet Tahoe, 5.3L V8, 

2WD; 5-Door
P  $                              46,775.00 No Bid No Bid

Year 2023-2024 No Bid No Bid

Make Chevrolet No Bid No Bid

Model CC10706 9C1 No Bid No Bid

Engine 5.3L No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder V8 No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 No Bid No Bid

Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 

4WD; 5-Door
P  $                              49,775.00 No Bid No Bid

Year 2023-2024 No Bid No Bid

Make Chevrolet No Bid No Bid

Model CK10706 9C1 No Bid No Bid

Engine 5.3L No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder V8 No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 No Bid No Bid

Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L 

PHEV; FWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

12

10

11



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC

Graham, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Holiday Chevrolet

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Holiday Ford

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Chevrolet Tahoe, 5.3L V8, 

2WD; 5-Door
P  $                             37,686.00 No Bid No Bid

Year 2023 No Bid No Bid

Make Chevrolet No Bid No Bid

Model Tahoe 9C1 PPV No Bid No Bid

Engine 5.3L No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder V8 No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
90-120 No Bid No Bid

Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 

4WD; 5-Door
P  $                             40,347.00 No Bid No Bid

Year 2023 No Bid No Bid

Make Chevrolet No Bid No Bid

Model Tahoe 9C1 PPV No Bid No Bid

Engine 5.3L No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder V8 No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
90-120 No Bid No Bid

Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L 

PHEV; FWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

12

10

11



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Rockdale Country Ford

Rockdale, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

PriceItem

Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD

Carrollton, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Chevrolet Tahoe, 5.3L V8, 

2WD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 

4WD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L 

PHEV; FWD; 4-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

11

12

10



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Grapevine DCJ, LLC

Grapevine, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P = Primary

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Cameron Country CDJR

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 

2WD; Crew Cab
P  $                              44,940.00 No Bid No Bid

Year 2023-2024 No Bid No Bid

Make Chevrolet No Bid No Bid

Model CC10543 5W4 No Bid No Bid

Engine 5.3L No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder V8 No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 No Bid No Bid

Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 

4WD; Crew Cab
P  $                              51,570.00 No Bid No Bid

Year 2023-2024 No Bid No Bid

Make Chevrolet No Bid No Bid

Model Ck10543 9C1 No Bid No Bid

Engine 5.3L No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder V8 No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 No Bid No Bid

Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

15

13

14



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC

Graham, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Holiday Chevrolet

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Holiday Ford

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 

2WD; Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 

4WD; Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

15

13

14



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Rockdale Country Ford

Rockdale, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

PriceItem

Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD

Carrollton, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 

2WD; Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 

4WD; Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; 

Crew Cab
P  $                             46,955.00 No Bid

Year 2023-2024 No Bid

Make Ford No Bid

Model W1S-SSV No Bid

Engine 3.5L No Bid

Engine Cylinder V6 No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 No Bid

13

14

15



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Grapevine DCJ, LLC

Grapevine, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P = Primary

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Cameron Country CDJR

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

18

17

16



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC

Graham, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Holiday Chevrolet

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Holiday Ford

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

17

18

16



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Rockdale Country Ford

Rockdale, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

PriceItem

Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD

Carrollton, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 

Crew Cab
P  $                             50,770.00 P  $                             45,900.00 

Year 2023-2024 2023

Make Ford Ford

Model W1P-PPV W1E

Engine 3.5L 3.5L GTDI

Engine Cylinder V6 V6

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 180

Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; 

Crew Cab
P  $                             46,915.00 P  $                             42,900.00 

Year 2023-2024 2023

Make Ford Ford

Model W1S-SSV W1C

Engine 5.0L 5.0L

Engine Cylinder V8 V8

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 180

Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; 

Crew Cab
P  $                             49,925.00 P  $                             48,750.00 

Year 2023-2024 2023
Make Ford Ford
Model W1T-SSV W1E
Engine 5.0L V8

Engine Cylinder V8 5.0L

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 180
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RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Grapevine DCJ, LLC

Grapevine, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P = Primary

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Cameron Country CDJR

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid P  $                      47,735.00 P  $                              38,920.00 

Year No Bid 2023-2024 2023

Make No Bid RAM RAM

Model No Bid DS6T98 SSV 1500 SSV

Engine No Bid 5.7L 5.7L

Engine Cylinder No Bid V8 V8

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 360 90-240

Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; 

RWD; 5-Door
No Bid P  $                      45,950.00 No Bid

Year No Bid 2023-2024 No Bid

Make No Bid Dodge No Bid

Model No Bid WDEE75 PPV No Bid

Engine No Bid 3.6L No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid V6 No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 360 No Bid

Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; 

RWD; 5-Door
No Bid P  $                      47,975.00 No Bid

Year No Bid 2023-2024 No Bid

Make No Bid Dodge No Bid

Model No Bid WDEE75 PPV No Bid

Engine No Bid 5.7L No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid V8 No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid 360 No Bid
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RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC

Graham, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Holiday Chevrolet

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Holiday Ford

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid P  $                              36,420.00 

Year No Bid No Bid 2023

Make No Bid No Bid Ram

Model No Bid No Bid 1500 SSV

Engine No Bid No Bid 5.7L

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid V8

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid 90-120

Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; 

RWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; 

RWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid
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RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Rockdale Country Ford

Rockdale, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

PriceItem

Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD

Carrollton, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; 

Crew Cab
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; 

RWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; 

RWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid
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RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Grapevine DCJ, LLC

Grapevine, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P = Primary

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Cameron Country CDJR

Caldwell, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 

4WD; 5-Door
P  $                              52,275.00 No Bid No Bid

Year 2023-2024 No Bid No Bid

Make Chevrolet No Bid No Bid

Model CK10706 5W4 No Bid No Bid

Engine 5.3L No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder V8 No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 No Bid No Bid

Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L 

V6; RWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L 

V6; 4WD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

24

Notes: There are no awards for items 3 &12 because no bids were received.
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RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC

Graham, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Holiday Chevrolet

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Holiday Ford

Whitesboro, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Item Price Price

Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 

4WD; 5-Door
P  $                             39,789.00 No Bid No Bid

Year 2023 No Bid No Bid

Make Chevrolet No Bid No Bid

Model Tahoe 5W4 SSV No Bid No Bid

Engine 5.3L No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder V8 No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
90-120 No Bid No Bid

Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L 

V6; RWD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L 

V6; 4WD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Notes: There are no awards for items 3 &12 because no bids were received.
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RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

Rockdale Country Ford

Rockdale, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

PriceItem

Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD

Carrollton, TX

HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 

4WD; 5-Door
No Bid No Bid

Year No Bid No Bid

Make No Bid No Bid

Model No Bid No Bid

Engine No Bid No Bid

Engine Cylinder No Bid No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
No Bid No Bid

Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L 

V6; RWD; 5-Door
P  $                             54,220.00 No Bid

Year 2023-2024 No Bid

Make Ford No Bid

Model K1F-SSV No Bid

Engine 3.5L No Bid

Engine Cylinder V6 No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 No Bid

Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L 

V6; 4WD; 5-Door
P  $                             57,785.00 No Bid

Year 2023-2024 No Bid

Make Ford No Bid

Model K1G-SSV No Bid

Engine 3.5L No Bid

Engine Cylinder V6 No Bid

Number of Delivery Days 

A.R.O
360 No Bid

Notes: There are no awards for items 3 &12 because no bids were received.
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