
RFB 2023-007 Annual Contract for Laboratory Test Kits and Reagents for Clinical Testing

Item Description Qty

1 Solana HSV 1+2/VZV Assay Kit, 48 tests/Kit; 
Quidel #M302 10 Kits No Bid No Bid

2 Solana HSV 1+2/VZV Control Set, Quidel #M118 4 Sets No Bid No Bid

3 TRUE 20 Plus hCG Urine Pregnancy Test Set, 
50 Tests/Kit, Stanbio #1430-050 30 Boxes No Bid No Bid

4

Test Kit, Rapid Membrane 
Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of 
Syphillis, Diagnostics Direct, Syphillis Health 
Check #VSC-11-01

170 Kits No Bid 200.00$            

5

Control Set, Rapid Membrane 
Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of 
Syphillis, Diagnostics Direct, Syphillis Health 
Check #VSC-11-02

98 Sets No Bid 49.00$              

6 Test Kit, HIV - 1/2 Rapid, Chembio #60-9505-1 120 Kits A 132.25$            No Bid

7 Control Kit for use with HIV - 1/2 Rapid Test Kit, 
Chembio #60-9549-0 4 Kits 65.00$              No Bid

8
Reagent Discs, Comprehensive Metabolic 
Panel, for use with Piccolo Analyzer, 10/box, 
Abaxis Piccolo #07P0208

75 Boxes No Bid No Bid

9

Chemistry and Lipid Controls, for 
Comprehensive Metabolic Panel, for use with 
Piccolo Analyzer, 6/box, Abaxis Piccolo 
#07P0401

12 Boxes No Bid No Bid

Estimated Delivery ARO 7 days  -

Minimum Order Requirements None -

Unit Price Unit Price

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Chembio 
Diagnostics, Inc.
Hauppauge, NY

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Diagnostics Direct, 
LLC

Stone Harbor, NJ
HUB - No



RFB 2023-007 Annual Contract for Laboratory Test Kits and Reagents for Clinical Testing

Item Description Qty

1 Solana HSV 1+2/VZV Assay Kit, 48 tests/Kit; 
Quidel #M302 10 Kits

2 Solana HSV 1+2/VZV Control Set, Quidel #M118 4 Sets

3 TRUE 20 Plus hCG Urine Pregnancy Test Set, 
50 Tests/Kit, Stanbio #1430-050 30 Boxes 

4

Test Kit, Rapid Membrane 
Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of 
Syphillis, Diagnostics Direct, Syphillis Health 
Check #VSC-11-01

170 Kits

5

Control Set, Rapid Membrane 
Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of 
Syphillis, Diagnostics Direct, Syphillis Health 
Check #VSC-11-02

98 Sets

6 Test Kit, HIV - 1/2 Rapid, Chembio #60-9505-1 120 Kits

7 Control Kit for use with HIV - 1/2 Rapid Test Kit, 
Chembio #60-9549-0 4 Kits

8
Reagent Discs, Comprehensive Metabolic 
Panel, for use with Piccolo Analyzer, 10/box, 
Abaxis Piccolo #07P0208

75 Boxes

9

Chemistry and Lipid Controls, for 
Comprehensive Metabolic Panel, for use with 
Piccolo Analyzer, 6/box, Abaxis Piccolo 
#07P0401

12 Boxes

Estimated Delivery ARO

Minimum Order Requirements

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

S 2,280.69$        P 1,918.90$       

S 335.40$           P 274.67$          

S 65.79$             P 65.27$            

S 234.90$           P 190.49$          

S 73.69$             P 48.64$            

215.55$            P 117.49$          

A 60.43$              P 43.36$            

S 131.34$           P 95.79$            

S 205.10$           P 166.62$          

3-7 days 1-3 days

None None

Unit Price Unit Price

Fisher Healthcare
Houston, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

McKesson Medical-
Surgical 

Government 
Solutions LLC
Henrico, VA
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes



RFB 2023-007 Annual Contract for Laboratory Test Kits and Reagents for Clinical Testing

Item Description Qty

1 Solana HSV 1+2/VZV Assay Kit, 48 tests/Kit; 
Quidel #M302 10 Kits A 2,544.00$         No Bid

2 Solana HSV 1+2/VZV Control Set, Quidel #M118 4 Sets A 368.00$            No Bid

3 TRUE 20 Plus hCG Urine Pregnancy Test Set, 
50 Tests/Kit, Stanbio #1430-050 30 Boxes A 67.75$              No Bid

4

Test Kit, Rapid Membrane 
Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of 
Syphillis, Diagnostics Direct, Syphillis Health 
Check #VSC-11-01

170 Kits No Bid No Bid

5

Control Set, Rapid Membrane 
Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of 
Syphillis, Diagnostics Direct, Syphillis Health 
Check #VSC-11-02

98 Sets No Bid No Bid

6 Test Kit, HIV - 1/2 Rapid, Chembio #60-9505-1 120 Kits 391.00$            S 130.00$           

7 Control Kit for use with HIV - 1/2 Rapid Test Kit, 
Chembio #60-9549-0 4 Kits 65.70$              S 58.00$             

8
Reagent Discs, Comprehensive Metabolic 
Panel, for use with Piccolo Analyzer, 10/box, 
Abaxis Piccolo #07P0208

75 Boxes No Bid No Bid

9

Chemistry and Lipid Controls, for 
Comprehensive Metabolic Panel, for use with 
Piccolo Analyzer, 6/box, Abaxis Piccolo 
#07P0401

12 Boxes No Bid No Bid

Notes:
No alternate awards for Items 4, 5, 8, 9

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Mercedes Medical 
LLC dba Mercedes 

Scientific
Bradenton, FL

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

Nerfherder 
Distribution, LLC

Austin, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Unit PriceUnit Price

Diagnostics Direct, LLC is not willing to accept a secondary or alternate award.

Estimated Delivery ARO 3-5 days 5 days

Minimum Order Requirements None 1 Kit
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