		Award		
			PURSUIT S	AFETY, INC
		ROYSE CITY, TX		
			Coop	Yes
			HUB	No
Item	Description	Qty	Price	Total
Section 1: New System Installation - Custom Built				
1	Extradition System	2	No bid	No bid
2	Transport System	1	No bid	No bid
3	Pick Up Delivery Fee	1	No bid	No bid
Section Total				
Section 2: New System Installation - Prefabricated Kit				
1	Extradition System	1	\$ 15,500.00	\$ 15,500.00
2	Transport System	1	\$ 28,800.00	\$ 28,800.00
3	Pick Up Delivery Fee	1	CGtoPU/Deliver	CGtoPU/Deliver
Section Total				\$ 44,300.00
Section 3: Refurbishment of Existing System - Custom Built				
1	Extradition System	1	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00
2	Transport System	7	\$ 9,200.00	\$ 64,400.00
3	Pick Up Delivery Fee	1	CGtoPU/Deliver	CGtoPU/Deliver
Section Total				\$ 71,900.00
Section 4: Refurbishment of Existing System - Prefabricated Kit				
1	Extradition System	1	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00
2	Transport System	1	\$ 9,200.00	\$ 9,200.00
3	Pick Up Delivery Fee	1	CGtoPU/Deliver	CGtoPU/Deliver
	Section Total			\$ 16,700.00
Additional Pricing				
Hour	ly Rate for Repairs to Exi	sting	¢95.00	
Systems Parts Mark Unifor Ports Used			\$85.00	
Parts Mark-Up for Parts Used During Repairs			5%	
Dulling Repairs 570				