

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response			
SECTION A: BOND PAPER									
1.	4000	case	Bond Paper, 20 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, White over 84 Brightness	Price per Sheet/EA	0.006560	P	0.008580	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	3.280000		4.290000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000		5,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	32.800000		42.900000		no bid
				Brand Bid	Suzano		Go Copy		no bid
2.	200	case	Bond Paper, 20 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	0.010180	P	0.013690	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	5.090000		6.950000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000		5,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	50.900000		68.450000		no bid
3.	150	case	Bond Paper, 20 lb., 8-1/2 x 14, White	Price per Sheet/EA	0.009780	P	0.011670	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	4.890000		5.835000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000		5,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	48.900000		58.350000		no bid
4.	15	case	Bond Paper, 20 lb., 8-1/2 x 14, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	0.013820	P	0.018850	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	6.910000		9.430000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000		5,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	69.100000		94.250000		no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response

SECTION B: REPRODUCTION CENTER USE							
5.	2000	case	20 lb., Bond Paper, 8-1/2 x 11 ,White, Brightness 92 Minimum, Domtar Copy #2750 Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.007140	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	3.570000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	35.700000		no bid
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
6.	30	case	Bond Paper, 20 lb., 11 x 17, White	Price per Sheet/EA	0.015380	P	0.018352 S no bid
				Price per Ream	7.690000		9.176000 no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,500.000000		2,500.000000 no bid
				Price per Case	38.450000		45.880000 no bid
7.	30	case	Bond Paper, 20 lb., 11 x 17, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	0.021700	P	0.029640 S no bid
				Price per Ream	10.850000		14.820000 no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,500.000000		2,500.000000 no bid
				Price per Case	54.250000		74.100000 no bid
8.	40	case	20 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, 25% Cotton, Light Cockle Finish, White, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.035200 P no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		17.600000 no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		5,000.000000 no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		176.000000 no bid
				Brand Bid	no bid		Capitol Bond no bid

P - Primary
S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response

SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

9.	20	case	24/60 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 11, White, Accent Opaque Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.016000	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		8.000000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		5,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		80.000000		no bid
10.	10	case	24/60 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 14, White, Accent Opaque Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.020370	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		10.185000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		5,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		101.850000		no bid
11.	16	case	24/60 lb., Text Smooth, 11 x 17, White, Accent Opaque Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.031720	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		15.860000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		2,500.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		79.300000		no bid
12.	50	case	24/60 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 11, Assorted Colors, Astrobrights Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.017260	P	<i>0.022480</i>	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	8.630000		<i>11.240000</i>		no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000		<i>5,000.000000</i>		no bid
				Price per Case	86.300000		<i>112.400000</i>		no bid
13.	50	case	24/60 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 14, Assorted Colors, Astrobrights Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.021960	P	<i>0.029100</i>	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	10.980000		<i>14.550000</i>		no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000		<i>5,000.000000</i>		no bid
				Price per Case	109.800000		<i>145.500000</i>		no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
14.	50	case	24/60 lb., Parchment, 8-1/2 x 11, Astroparche Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.024340 P	<i>0.032000</i> S	no bid
				Price per Ream	12.170000	<i>16.000000</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	4,000.000000	<i>4,000.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	97.360000	<i>128.000000</i>	no bid
15.	8	case	28 lb., Cranes Crest, 8-1/2 x 14, 100% Pearl White Woven Only, Watermark must face same direction, Wrapped 500 per carton, Priced per 1,000 sheets	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.222830 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	111.415000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	3,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	668.490000	no bid
16.	5	case	60 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, White, Pressure Sensitive, Uncoated crack and peel	Price per Sheet/EA	0.132800 P	withdrawn *	no bid
				Price per Ream	13.280000	withdrawn	no bid
				Sheets per Box	1,000.000000	withdrawn	no bid
				Price per Case	132.800000	withdrawn	no bid
17.	5	case	60 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, Hot Colors, Pressure Sensitive, Uncoated crack and peel, Astrobrights Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.168500 P	withdrawn *	no bid
				Price per Ream	16.850000	withdrawn	no bid
				Sheets per Box	1,000.000000	withdrawn	no bid
				Price per Case	168.500000	withdrawn	no bid
18.	5	case	60 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, Fluorescents, Pressure Sensitive, Uncoated crack and peel	Price per Sheet/EA	0.177800 P	withdrawn *	no bid
				Price per Ream	17.780000	withdrawn	no bid
				Sheets per Box	1,000.000000	withdrawn	no bid
				Price per Case	177.800000	withdrawn	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
19.	15	case	65 lb., Cover, 8-1/2 x 11, Colors, Parchment	Price per Sheet/EA	0.048200 P	0.081140 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	12.050000	20.280000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	96.400000	162.280000	no bid
20.	15	case	65 lb., Cover, 8-1/2 x 11, Assorted Colors, Astrobrights Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.034160 P	0.055640 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	8.540000	13.910000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	68.320000	111.280000	no bid
21.	10	case	67 lb., Vellum Cover, 8-1/2 x 11, White	Price per Sheet/EA	0.020040 P	0.026370 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	5.010000	6.592500	no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	40.080000	52.740000	no bid
22.	10	case	67 lb., Vellum Cover, 8-1/2 x 11, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	0.020960 P	0.026370 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	5.240000	65.592500	no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	41.920000	52.740000	no bid
23.	50	case	67 lb., Vellum Sheet, 23 x 35, White	Price per Sheet/EA	0.174680 P	0.262000 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	bulk	bulk	no bid
				Sheets per Box	750.000000	500.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	131.010000	131.000000	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response			
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS									
24.	50	case	67 lb., Vellum Sheet, 23 x 35, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	0.182280	P	0.262000	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	bulk		bulk		no bid
				Sheets per Box	750.000000		500.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	136.710000		131.000000		no bid
25.	3	case	70 lb., Text-Smooth, 8-1/2 x 11, Classic Crest Whitestone, 4,000/cs	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		withdrawn	*	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		withdrawn		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		withdrawn		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		withdrawn		no bid
26.	40	case	70 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 11, White, Accent Opaque, Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.017325	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		8.662500		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		4,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		69.300000		no bid
27.	100	case	70 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 14, White, Accent Opaque, Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.059500	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		29.796600		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		3,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		178.500000		no bid
28.	100	case	70 lb., Text Smooth, 11 x 17, White, Accent Opaque, Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.037000	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		18.500000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		2,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		74.000000		no bid

P - Primary
S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response			
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS									
29.	10	case	70 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 11, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	0.014520	P	0.017650	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	7.260000		8.825000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	4,000.000000		4,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	58.080000		70.600000		no bid
30.	50	case	70 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 14, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	0.021800	P	0.035300	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	10.900000		17.650000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	3,000.000000		4,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	65.400000		141.200000		no bid
31.	50	case	70 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 11, Cream, Springhill Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.017650	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		8.825000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		4,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		70.600000		no bid
32.	20	case	70 lb., Text Smooth, 8-1/2 x 14, Cream, Springhill Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.035300	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		17.650000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		4,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		141.200000		no bid
33.	10	case	70 lb., Text Smooth, 11 x 17, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	0.030300	P	0.035300	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	15.150000		17.650000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000		2,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	60.600000		70.600000		no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS						
34.	10	case	70 lb., Text, Linen, 8-1/2 x 11, White	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.040650 P
				Price per Ream	no bid	20.330000
				Sheets per Box	no bid	4,000.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	162.600000
35.	10	case	70 lb., Text, Linen, 8-1/2 x 14, White	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.086180 P
				Price per Ream	no bid	43.090000
				Sheets per Box	no bid	3,000.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	258.540000
36.	15	case	70 lb., Text, Linen, 8-1/2 x 11, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.040650 P
				Price per Ream	no bid	20.330000
				Sheets per Box	no bid	4,000.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	162.600000
37.	10	case	70 lb., Text, Linen, 8-1/2 x 14, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.086180 P
				Price per Ream	no bid	43.090000
				Sheets per Box	no bid	3,000.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	258.540000
38.	16	case	75 lb., Text Smooth, 7 x 9, Avalanche White, Neenah Classic Laid Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	no bid

P - Primary
S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
39.	10	case	80 lb., Cover, Smooth, 8-1/2 x 11, Crest Whitestone Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.087490 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	21.870000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	174.980000	no bid
40.	50	case	80 lb., Cover, Linen, 8-1/2 x 11, White	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.069500 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	17.380000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	139.000000	no bid
41.	50	case	80 lb., Cover, Linen, 8-1/2 x 11, Color	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.069500 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	17.380000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	139.000000	no bid
42.	10	case	80 lb., Cover, Smooth, 8-1/2 x 11, White	Price per Sheet/EA	0.027640 S	0.027400 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	6.910000	6.850000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	55.280000	54.800000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Domtar Lynx	Omnilux	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
43.	10	case	80 lb., Cover, Smooth, 8-1/2 x 11, White, Accent Opaque Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.027400 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	6.850000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	54.800000	no bid
44.	20	case	80 lb., Text, Digital, 8-1/2 x 11, Gloss, Futura Laser Gloss Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.013720 P	<i>0.020640</i> S	no bid
				Price per Ream	6.860000	<i>10.320000</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	4,000.000000	<i>3,000.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	54.880000	<i>61.920000</i>	no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo	<i>Sterling</i>	no bid
45.	20	case	80 lb., Text, Digital, 11 x 17, Gloss, Futura Laser Gloss Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.027440 P	<i>0.041280</i> S	no bid
				Price per Ream	13.720000	<i>20.640000</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000	<i>1,500.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	54.880000	<i>61.920000</i>	no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo	<i>Sterling</i>	no bid
46.	50	case	80 lb, Text, Digital, 12 x 18, Gloss, Futura Laser Gloss or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.031700 P	<i>0.046440</i> S	no bid
				Price per Ream	15.850000	<i>23.220000</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	1,500.000000	<i>1,500.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	47.550000	<i>69.660000</i>	no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo	<i>Sterling</i>	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response			
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS									
47.	20	case	80 lb., Text, Digital, 8-1/2 x 11, Dull, Futura Laser Dull Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.013720	P	0.020640	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	6.860000		10.320000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	4,000.000000		3,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	54.880000		61.920000		no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo		<i>Sterling</i>		no bid
48.	20	case	80 lb., Text, Digital, 11 x 17, Dull, Futura Laser Dull Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.027440	P	0.041280	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	13.720000		20.640000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000		1,500.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	54.880000		61.920000		no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo		<i>Sterling</i>		no bid
49.	20	case	80 lb., Text, Digital, 12 x 18, Dull, Futura Laser Dull Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.031700	P	0.046440	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	15.850000		23.220000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	1,500.000000		1,500.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	47.550000		69.660000		no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo		<i>Sterling</i>		no bid
50.	20	case	80 lb., Cover, Digital, 8-1/2 x 11, Gloss, Futura Laser Gloss Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.025760	P	0.038280	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	6.440000		9.570000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000		1,500.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	51.520000		57.420000		no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo		<i>Sterling</i>		no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response			
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS									
51.	20	case	80 lb., Cover, Digital, 11 x 17, Gloss, Futura Laser Gloss Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.051520	P	0.076560	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	12.880000		18.890000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	1,000.000000		750.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	51.520000		57.420000		no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo		<i>Sterling</i>		no bid
52.	20	case	80 lb., Cover, Digital, 12 x 18, Gloss, Futura Laser Gloss Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.059440	P	0.087120	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	14.860000		21.780000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	750.000000		750.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	44.580000		65.340000		no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo		<i>Sterling</i>		no bid
53.	20	case	80 lb., Cover, Digital, 8-1/2 x 11, Dull, Futura Laser Dull Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.025760	P	0.038280	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	6.440000		9.570000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,000.000000		1,500.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	51.520000		57.420000		no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo		<i>Sterling</i>		no bid
54.	20	case	80 lb., Cover, Digital, 11 x 17, Dull, Futura Laser Dull Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.051520	P	0.076560	S	no bid
				Price per Ream	12.880000		18.890000		no bid
				Sheets per Box	1,000.000000		750.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	51.520000		57.420000		no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo		<i>Sterling</i>		no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
55.	20	case	80 lb., Cover, Digital, 12 x 18, Dull, Futura Laser Dull Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.059440 P	0.087120 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	14.860000	21.780000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	750.000000	750.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	44.580000	65.340000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Flo	<i>Sterling</i>	no bid
56.	30	box	90 lb., Index, Smooth, 22-1/2 x 35, White, Boxed, 500/box	Price per Sheet/EA	0.197670 P	0.242000 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	bulk	<i>bulk</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000	500.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	98.835000	121.000000	no bid
57.	30	box	90 lb., Index, Smooth, 22-1/2 x 35 Assorted Colors, Boxed, 500/box	Price per Sheet/EA	0.205120 P	0.242000 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	bulk	<i>bulk</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000	500.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	102.560000	121.000000	no bid
58.	10	case	100 lb., Hi-Bulk, 8-1/2 x 11, 14 pt., Vellum Cover Only, Bright White Finch Opaque	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.052250 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	13.062500	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	1,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	52.250000	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
59.	5	case	100 lb., Opus Gloss Cover, 28 x 40 sheets, White, Long Grain, Boxed, 400/box Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.651000 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	bulk	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	400.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	260.400000	no bid
60.	5	case	9.1 pt. Invercote C2S Only, 18 x 12, 950/case	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.111300 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	bulk	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	950.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	105.735000	no bid
61.	75	quarts	Fan A Part Adhesive - Nekoosa Only	Price per Sheet/EA	41.640000 S	33.000000 P	no bid
				UOM	quart	quart	no bid
				Price per Case	41.640000	33.000000	no bid
62.	50	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 11, 2 Part, Black Ink Transfer Only, Reverse, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.016860 P	0.026280 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	8.430000	13.140000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	84.300000	131.400000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
63.	50	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 11, 3 Part, Black Ink Transfer Only, Reverse, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.018980 P	0.029670 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	9.490000	13.335000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	94.900000	148.350000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
64.	40	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 11, 4 Part, Black Ink Transfer Only, Reverse, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.020280 P	0.031710 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	10.140000	15.855000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	101.400000	158.550000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
65.	25	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 2 Part, White CF, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.021420 P	0.037370 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	10.710000	18.685000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	107.100000	186.850000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
66.	25	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 3 Part, Black Ink Transfer Only, Reverse, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.024140 P	0.042190 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	12.070000	21.095000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	120.700000	210.950000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
67.	25	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 4 Part, Black Ink Transfer Only, Reverse 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.025800 P	0.045090 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	12.900000	22.545000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	129.000000	225.450000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
68.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 11, 1 Part, White CF, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.013460 P	0.023520 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	6.730000	11.760000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	67.300000	117.600000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
69.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 11, 1 Part, White CB, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.018780 P	0.032880 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	9.390000	16.440000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	93.900000	164.400000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
70.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 11, 1 Part, White CFB, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.022760 P	0.039840 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	11.380000	19.920000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	113.800000	199.200000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
71.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 11, 1 Part, CF, Colors: Yellow, Pink, Blue, Green, Goldenrod, Black Ink Transfer Only 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.014820 P	0.023960 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	7.410000	11.980000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	74.100000	119.800000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
72.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 11, 1 Part, CB, Colors: Yellow, Pink, Blue, Green, Goldenrod, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.019060 P	0.033280 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	9.530000	16.640000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	95.300000	166.400000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
73.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 11, 1 Part, CFB, Colors: Yellow, Pink, Blue, Green, Goldenrod, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.023020 P	0.040240 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	11.510000	20.120000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	115.100000	201.200000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
74.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 1 Part, White CF, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.017080 P	0.030100 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	8.540000	15.050000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	85.400000	150.500000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid
75.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 1 Part, White CB, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.023760 P	0.042090 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	11.880000	21.045000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	5,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	118.800000	210.450000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	Pixelle	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
76.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 1 Part, White CFB, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.029020 P	<i>0.050990</i> S	no bid
				Price per Ream	14.510000	<i>25.495000</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	<i>5,000.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	145.100000	<i>254.950000</i>	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	<i>Pixelle</i>	no bid
77.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 1 Part, CF, Colors: Yellow, Pink, Blue, Green, Goldenrod, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.018840 P	<i>0.030660</i> S	no bid
				Price per Ream	9.420000	<i>15.330000</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	<i>5,000.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	94.200000	<i>153.300000</i>	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	<i>Pixelle</i>	no bid
78.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 1 Part, CB, Colors: Yellow, Pink, Blue, Green, Goldenrod, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.024080 P	<i>0.042090</i> S	no bid
				Price per Ream	12.040000	<i>21.045000</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	<i>5,000.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	120.400000	<i>210.450000</i>	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	<i>Pixelle</i>	no bid
79.	20	case	NCR Paper, 80 gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 1 Part, CFB, Colors: Yellow, Pink, Blue, Green, Goldenrod, Black Ink Transfer Only, 5,000/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.029320 P	<i>0.030660</i> S	no bid
				Price per Ream	14.660000	<i>15.330000</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	5,000.000000	<i>5,000.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	146.600000	<i>153.300000</i>	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	<i>Pixelle</i>	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
80.	20	case	NCR Manila Card, 170gsm ONLY, 8-1/2 x 14, 1 Part, CF, Black Ink Transfer Only, 2,500/case, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.043720 P	0.070920 S	no bid
				Price per Ream	10.930000	17.730000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,500.000000	3,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	109.300000	212.760000	no bid
				Brand Bid	Nekoosa	<i>Pixelle</i>	no bid
81.	20	case	NCR Computer Paper, 21 lbs., 9-1/2 x 11, 1 Part, Bright White, Laser Bond, Continuous Form, 1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs Each Side	Price per Sheet/EA	0.014500 P	no bid	no bid
				Price per Ream	bulk	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	2,200.000000	no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	31.900000	no bid	no bid
82.	20	case	NCR Computer Paper, 80 gsm., 9-1/2 x 11, 2 Part, Bright White, White CFB, White CF, Laser Bond, Continuous Form, 1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs Each Side, Carbonless, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.034250 P	no bid	no bid
				Price per Ream	bulk	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	1,400.000000	no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	47.950000	no bid	no bid
				Brand Bid	Print Works	no bid	no bid
83.	20	case	NCR Computer Paper, 19 lbs., 9-1/2 x 11, 3 Part, Bright White, White CFB, White CF, Laser Bond, Continuous Form, 1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs Each Side, Carbonless, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.052760 P	no bid	no bid
				Price per Ream	bulk	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	1,000.000000	no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	52.760000	no bid	no bid
				Brand Bid	Print Works	no bid	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response			
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS									
84.	20	case	NCR Computer Paper, 19 lbs., 9-1/2 x 11, 3 Part, W/C/P Black Ink Transfer, Continuous Form, 1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs Each Side, Carbonless, Nekoosa Or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.054860	P	no bid	no bid	
				Price per Ream	bulk		no bid	no bid	
				Sheets per Box	1,000.000000		no bid	no bid	
				Price per Case	54.860000		no bid	no bid	
				Brand Bid	Print Works		no bid	no bid	
85.	20	case	Green Bar Computer Paper, 14-7/8 x 11, 1 Part	Price per Sheet/EA	0.024400	P	no bid	no bid	
				Price per Ream	bulk		no bid	no bid	
				Sheets per Box	2,200.000000		no bid	no bid	
				Price per Case	53.680000		no bid	no bid	
86.	50	case	Labels, 3-1/2 W x 3/4 L, 2-Up, Cut Sheet, Bright White, Laser Quality, 28 labels per sheet, 1,000 Sheets per case consisting of 4-250 sheets wrapped packets	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.405000	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		bulk		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		1,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		405.000000		no bid
87.	50	case	Labels, 4 W x 1-7/16 L, 2-Up, Cut Sheet, Bright White, Laser Quality, 14 labels per sheet, 1,000 Sheets per case consisting of 4-250 sheets wrapped packets	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.405000	P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		bulk		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		1,000.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		405.000000		no bid
88.	50	case	Computer Labels, 3.3 x 15/16, 4-Up, 48 labels per sheet, 20,000/box, Continuous Feed	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		no bid		no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid		no bid		no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		no bid		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		no bid		no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS						
89.	20	case	Labels, 4 x 3-1/3, 6-Up, Fluorescent Green, 100 sheets/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.405000 P
				Price per Ream	no bid	bulk
				Sheets per Box	no bid	1,000.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	405.000000
90.	20	case	#6 Tag with Reinforced Hole, Manila, 10 Pt., Gangs of 4, No Perforation	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.468750 P
				Price per Ream	no bid	117.190000
				Sheets per Box	no bid	1,000.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	468.750000
91.	20	case	#6 Tag with Reinforced Hole, Hot Colors, 10 Pt., Gangs of 4, No Perforation	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.468750 P
				Price per Ream	no bid	117.190000
				Sheets per Box	no bid	1,000.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	468.750000
92.	20	case	#8 Tag with Reinforced Hole, Manila, 10 Pt., Gangs of 4, No Perforation	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.593750 P
				Price per Ream	no bid	148.437500
				Sheets per Box	no bid	1,000.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	593.750000
93.	20	case	#8 Tag with Reinforced Hole, Hot Colors, 10 Pt., Gangs of 4, No Perforation	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.593750 P
				Price per Ream	no bid	148.437500
				Sheets per Box	no bid	1,000.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	593.750000

P - Primary
S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
94.	20	case	Door Hangers, Die Cut, 3-Up, 8-1/2 x 11, Hot Colors	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.416000 P	no bid
				Price per Ream	no bid	52.000000	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	2,000.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	832.000000	no bid
95.	25	case	Chipboard, 8-1/2 x 11, 0.22 thick	Price per Sheet/EA	0.037500 P	<i>0.038865</i> S	no bid
				UOM	bulk	<i>bulk</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	960.000000	<i>960.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	36.000000	<i>37.310000</i>	no bid
96.	25	case	Chipboard, 8-1/2 x 14, 0.22 thick	Price per Sheet/EA	<i>0.050000</i> S	0.049092 P	no bid
				UOM	<i>bulk</i>	bulk	no bid
				Sheets per Box	<i>720.000000</i>	760.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	<i>36.000000</i>	37.310000	no bid
97.	1	case	Chipboard, 11 x 17, 0.22 thick	Price per Sheet/EA	0.075000 P	<i>0.077729</i> S	no bid
				UOM	bulk	<i>bulk</i>	no bid
				Sheets per Box	480.000000	<i>480.000000</i>	no bid
				Price per Case	36.000000	<i>37.310000</i>	no bid
98.	50	case	#6040 Letterhead Boxes, 8-1/2 x 11, Knock-down/flat in bundles	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.816000 P	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	100.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	81.600000	no bid
				Count per bundle	no bid	100.000000	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS						
99.	50	case	#581001 Business Card Boxes for 7-1/4 x 3-3/4 x 2 Knock-down/flat in bundles	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	2.340000 P
				Sheets per Box	no bid	100.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	234.000000
				Count per bundle	no bid	100.000000
100.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 20 lb., 24" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Must be Untaped, Oce Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	22.730000 P
				Roll	no bid	2.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	45.460000
101.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 18" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Oce Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	18.530000 P
				Roll	no bid	4.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	74.120000
102.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 18" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Must be Untaped ,Oce or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	17.250000 S	16.530000 P
				Roll	4.000000	4.000000
				Price per Case	69.000000	66.120000
				Brand Bid	Roll Bond	Roll Bond
103.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 24" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Must be Untaped, Oce Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	23.500000 P
				Roll	no bid	2.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	47.000000
104.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 24" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Must be Untaped, Oce or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	22.950000 S	22.500000 P
				Roll	2.000000	2.000000
				Price per Case	45.900000	45.000000
				Brand Bid	Roll Bond	Roll Bond

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response			
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS									
105.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 30" x 300' Roll, 3" Core, Color bond, 2 Rolls Per Case, Must be Untaped	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	no bid	27.600000	P	
				Roll	no bid	no bid	2.000000		
				Price per Case	no bid	no bid	55.200000		
106.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 30" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Must be Untaped, Oce Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	no bid	29.380000	P	
				Roll	no bid	no bid	2.000000		
				Price per Case	no bid	no bid	58.760000		
107.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 30" x 500', 3" Core, Must be Untaped, Oce or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	26.220000	P	no bid	<i>28.700000</i>	S
				Roll	2.000000		no bid	<i>2.000000</i>	
				Price per Case	52.440000		no bid	<i>57.400000</i>	
				Brand Bid	Roll Bond		no bid	<i>Roll Bond</i>	
108.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 36" x 300' Roll, 3" Core, Color bond, 2 Rolls Per Case, Must be Untaped	Price per Sheet/EA	<i>56.350000</i>	S	no bid	27.600000	P
				Roll	<i>2.000000</i>		no bid	2.000000	
				Price per Case	<i>112.700000</i>		no bid	55.200000	
109.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 36" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Must be Untaped, Oce Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		no bid	36.050000	P
				Roll	no bid		no bid	2.000000	
				Price per Case	no bid		no bid	72.100000	
110.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24 lb., 36" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Must be Untaped, Oce or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	<i>32.550000</i>	S	no bid	28.000000	P
				Roll	<i>2.000000</i>		no bid	2.000000	
				Price per Case	<i>65.100000</i>		no bid	56.000000	
				Brand Bid	<i>Roll Bond</i>		no bid	as specified	

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response			
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS									
111.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 36" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Must be Untaped, Oce 45111R 20 lb. Bond for, Oce ColorWave 600 Printer, Oce Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	no bid	32.250000	P	
				Roll	no bid	no bid	2.000000		
				Price per Case	no bid	no bid	64.500000		
112.	1	roll	Engineering Bond, 24" x 500' Roll, 3" Core, Must be Untaped, Oce 45111R 20 lb. Bond for Oce ColorWave 600 Printer, Oce Only	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	no bid	22.890000	P	
				Roll	no bid	no bid	2.000000		
				Price per Case	no bid	no bid	45.780000		
113.	1	roll	3620 Maranello Photo Paper Only, PE195 Satin, 42" x 100' Roll, 2" Core, 195 gsm	Price per Sheet/EA	192.050000	S	no bid	112.000000	P
				Roll	1.000000		no bid	1.000000	
				Price per Case	192.050000		no bid	112.000000	
114.	1	roll	24 lb., Plotter Paper, 36" x 150' Roll, 2" Core, Inkjet Bond, Bright White	Price per Sheet/EA	20.420000	S	no bid	12.120000	P
				Roll	1.000000		no bid	2.000000	
				Price per Case	20.420000		no bid	24.240000	
115.	135	case	Thermal Paper, 2-1/4" x 50' Roll, 1/2" Core, Single Ply, Lint Free, 50 rolls per case	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		no bid	no bid	
				Roll	no bid		no bid	no bid	
				Price per Case	no bid		no bid	no bid	
116	100	case	Thermal Paper, 3-1/8" x 220' Roll, 1/2" Core, Single Ply, Lint Free, 50 rolls per case	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		5.700000	P	no bid
				Roll	no bid		50.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		285.000000		no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response		
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS								
117.	25	box	#9 Envelope, 24 lb., Astrobrights Only, 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	0.070960	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	35.480000		no bid	no bid
118.	25	box	#9 Envelope, 24 lb., White, Standard Window, 500/box, 2500/case, PrintMaster Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.022940	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	11.470000		no bid	no bid
119.	20	box	#9 Envelope, 24 lb., 3-7/8 x 8-7/8, White, Regular, 500/box, 2500/case, PrintMaster Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.020240	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	10.120000		no bid	no bid
120.	8	box	#9 Envelope, 24 lb., Colors, 500/box, 2500/case, PrintMaster or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.024860	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	12.430000		no bid	no bid
121.	25	box	#9 Envelope, 24 lb., White with Blue Inside Tint, Standard Window, 500/box, 2500/case, PrintMaster Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.025540	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	12.770000		no bid	no bid
122.	25	box	#10 Envelope, 24 lb., Pastels, 500/box, 2500/case, PrintMaster or Equivalent	Price per Sheet/EA	0.024860	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	12.430000		no bid	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes		
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response		
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS								
123	25	box	#10 Envelope, 24 lb., Astrobrights Only, 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	0.049960	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	24.980000		no bid	no bid
124.	400	box	#10 Envelope, 24 lb., White, Standard Window, 500/box, 2500/case, PrintMaster Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.022940	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	11.470000		no bid	no bid
125.	25	box	#10 Envelope, 24 lb., White, Right Hand Window, 500/box, 2500/case, PrintMaster Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.023520	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	11.760000		no bid	no bid
126.	720	box	#10 Envelope, 24 lb., White, Regular, Executive Flap or Pointed Flap, 500/box, 2500/case, PrintMaster Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.019060	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	9.530000		no bid	no bid
127.	25	box	#10 Envelope, 24 lb., White with Blue Inside Tint, Standard Window, 500/box, 2500/case, PrintMaster Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.025540	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	12.770000		no bid	no bid
128.	25	box	#10 Envelope, 24 lb., White with Blue Inside Tint, Right Hand Window, 500/box, 2500/case, Print Master Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.026120	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	13.060000		no bid	no bid
129	25	box	#10 Envelope, 24/60 lb., Standard Window, Cream, Springhill Only, 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	0.030360	P	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	15.180000		no bid	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS						
130	25	box	#10 Envelope, 24/60 lb., Cream, Springhill Only, 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	0.027640	P no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	13.820000	no bid
131	100	box	#10 Envelope, 24 lb., Brown Kraft 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	0.029780	P no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	14.890000	no bid
132	25	box	#11 Envelope, 24 lb., White, Regular, Top Open, Gummed Flap, 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	0.037460	P no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	18.730000	no bid
133	25	box	#11 Envelope, 24 lb., White, 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	0.040980	P no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	20.490000	no bid
134	25	box	#14 Envelope, 24 lb., White, 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	0.054700	P no bid
				Sheets per Box	500.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	27.350000	no bid
135	50	box	#14 Envelope, 28 lb., Brown Kraft, Regular, 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	no bid
136	10	box	Monarch Envelope, 24 lb., 3-7/8 x 7-1/2, Monarch Avalanche White, Neenah Classic Laid Only, 500/box, 2500/case	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.145360 P no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	500.000000 no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	72.680000 no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes			
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response			
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS									
137	25	box	#1 Catalog Envelope, 24 lb., 6 x 9, Open End, White, 500/box, PrintMaster Only	Price per Sheet/EA	0.033120	P	no bid	no bid	
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid	
				Price per Case	16.560000		no bid	no bid	
138	25	box	#1 Catalog Envelope, 24 lb., 6 x 9, Open End, Brown Kraft, 500/box	Price per Sheet/EA	0.035440	P	no bid	no bid	
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid	
				Price per Case	17.720000		no bid	no bid	
139	50	box	Catalog Envelope, 24 lb., 9 x 12, Open End, White, Regular, Peel & Seal, 500/box	Price per Sheet/EA	0.094420	P	no bid	no bid	
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid	
				Price per Case	47.210000		no bid	no bid	
140	50	box	Catalog Envelope, 24 lb., 9 x 12n Open End, Brown Kraft, Regular, Peel & Seal, 500/box	Price per Sheet/EA	0.105100	P	no bid	no bid	
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid	
				Price per Case	52.550000		no bid	no bid	
141	25	box	#12-1/2 Catalog Envelope, 28, lb., 9-1/2 x 12-1/2, Brown Kraft, Open End, Peel & Seal, 500/box	Price per Sheet/EA	0.108780	P	no bid	no bid	
				Sheets per Box	500.000000		no bid	no bid	
				Price per Case	54.390000		no bid	no bid	
142	50	box	#5-1/2 Baronial Envelope, 70 lb., Solar White, Neenah Classic Crest, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.124080	P	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		250.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		31.020000		no bid
143	50	box	#6 Baronial Envelope, 70 lb., Solar White, Neenah Classic Crest, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid		0.136150	P	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid		250.000000		no bid
				Price per Case	no bid		34.037500		no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS						
144	50	box	#5-1/2 Baronial Envelope, 70 lb., Classic Cream, Neenah Classic Crest, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.124080 P
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	31.020000
145	50	box	#6 Baronial Envelope, 70 lb., Classic Cream, Neenah Classic Crest, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.136150 P
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	34.037500
146	50	box	#5-1/2 Folding Panel Card, Baronial, 80 lb., Classic Cream, Neenah Classic Crest, Cover, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.143120 P
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	35.780000
147	50	box	#6 Folding Panel Card, Baronial, 80 lb., Classic Cream, Neenah Classic Crest, Cover, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.157400 P
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	39.350000
148	50	box	#5-1/2 Folding Panel Card, Baronial, 80 lb., Solar White, Neenah Classic Crest, Cover, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.143120 P
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	35.780000
149	50	box	#6 Folding Panel Card, Baronial, 80 lb., Solar White, Neenah Classic Crest, Cover, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.157400 P
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	39.350000
150	50	box	#5-1/2 Panel Card, Baronial, 110 lb., Solar White, Neenah Classic Crest, Cover, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.135800 P
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000
				Price per Case	no bid	33.950000

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.

SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, ENVELOPES AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION				Western BRW Paper Co. Carrollton, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	FasClampitt Paper Store Fort Worth, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	Archive Supplies, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No Coop - Yes	
Item	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Response	Response	Response	
SECTION C: PAPER AND OTHER RELATED PRODUCTS							
151	50	box	#6 Panel Card, Baronial, 110 lb., Solar White, Neenah Classic Crest, Cover, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.140280 P	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	35.070000	no bid
152	50	box	#5-1/2 Panel Card, Baronial, 110 lb., Classic Cream, Neenah Classic Crest, Cover, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.135800 P	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	33.950000	no bid
153	50	box	#6 Panel Card, Baronial, 110 lb., Classic Cream, Neenah Classic Crest, Cover, 250/box	Price per Sheet/EA	no bid	0.140280 P	no bid
				Sheets per Box	no bid	250.000000	no bid
				Price per Case	no bid	35.070000	no bid

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Only no bids were received for items 38, 88, 115 & 135, *FasClampitt withdrew price on items 16, 17, 18 & 25 due to math errors.