

RFB NO. 2022-046 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR BIOMEDICAL AND HAZARDOUS CHEMICAL WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL

SECTION I - BIOMEDICAL WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL

AWARD

*Medsharps, LLC not willing to accept secondary award. ^^Extended price for scheduled pick-up and disposal of pathological waste based on estimated 13 boxes/month			Medsharps, LLC Schertz, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes		RedAway, Inc. Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes		Red Arc Environmental Inc. Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes		Green Planet, Inc. Royse City, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	
Item Description	UNIT	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
Scheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Biomedical Waste (not including pathological waste)	Per Box	280-300 Boxes Per Year	\$20.00	\$6,000.00	\$20.00	\$6,000.00	No Bid		No Bid	
Unscheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Biomedical Waste	Per Box	Unknown	\$20.00	-	\$20.00	-	No Bid		No Bid	
Scheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Pathological Waste)	Per Pickup	250 kg (551 lbs.) Per Month	\$50.00/box <i>Flat Fee</i>	\$7,800.00^^	\$35.00/box Flat Fee	\$5,460.00^^	No Bid		No Bid	
TOTAL			\$13,800.00*		\$6,000.00		-		-	

			Trilogy Medwaste West, LLC Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes		Tradebe Environmental Services, LLC Merrilville, IN HUB - No COOP - No		Cleaning Guys LLC dba CG Environmental Fort Worth, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item Description	UNIT	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
Scheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Biomedical Waste (not including pathological waste)	Per Box	280-300 Boxes Per Year	\$55.00	\$16,500.00	No Bid		\$250.00	\$75,000.00
Unscheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Biomedical Waste	Per Box	Unknown	\$55.00	-	No Bid		\$375.00	-
Scheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Pathological Waste)	Per Pickup	250 kg (551 lbs.) Per Month	\$2.75/lb	\$18,183.00	No Bid		\$800.00 <i>Flat Fee/Mo.</i>	\$9,600.00
TOTAL			\$34,683.00		-		\$84,600.00	

RFB NO. 2022-046 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR BIOMEDICAL AND HAZARDOUS CHEMICAL WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL

SECTION II - HAZARDOUS CHEMICAL WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL

*Estimated quantities refer to number of pickups per year. **Green Planet, Inc. did not meet specifications because of an inability to guarantee disposal of chemical waste within thirty (30) days of pickup as required.			PRIMARY AWARD				<i>SECONDARY AWARD</i>			
			Tradebe Environmental Services, LLC Merrilville, IN HUB - No COOP - No		RedAway, Inc. Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes		<i>Red Arc Environmental Inc. Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes</i>		Medsharps, LLC Schertz, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item Description	UNIT	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
DNA Extraction Cartridges	55 Gal. Open Drum	2-3	\$579.92	\$1,739.76	No Bid		\$667.20	\$2,001.60	No Bid	
Formalin and Water	55 Gal. Closed Drum	8-12	\$340.92	\$4,091.04	No Bid		\$667.20	\$8,006.40	No Bid	
Inorganic Salts Solution	35 Gal. Open Drum	2	\$173.50	\$347.00	No Bid		\$356.18	\$712.36	No Bid	
Paraffin and Xylene	35 Gal. Open Drum	3-6	\$152.25	\$913.50	No Bid		\$498.52	\$2,991.12	No Bid	
Spent Acid in Rinse Water	5 Gal. Container	2	\$109.47	\$218.94	No Bid		\$403.64	\$807.28	No Bid	
Spent Organic Solvents	55 Gal. Closed Drum	12	\$149.92	\$1,799.04	No Bid		\$240.88	\$2,890.56	No Bid	
Liquid Waste Stream for Public Health Lab	15 Gal. Drum	3-4	\$197.78	\$791.12	No Bid		\$304.24	\$1,216.96	No Bid	
Halogenated Solvents	5 Gal. Drum	2-3	\$89.47	\$268.41	No Bid		\$360.00	\$1,080.00	No Bid	
TOTAL			\$10,168.81		-		\$19,706.28		-	

SUPPLIES (IF NEEDED)

Empty, Poly, Open Drum 55G	Each	-	\$65.00	No Bid	\$82.00	No Bid
Empty, Poly, Open Pail - 5G	Each	-	\$15.00	No Bid	\$30.00	No Bid
Empty, Poly, Closed Drum - 5G	Each	-	\$15.00	No Bid	\$28.00	No Bid

RFB NO. 2022-046 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR BIOMEDICAL AND HAZARDOUS CHEMICAL WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL

SECTION II - HAZARDOUS CHEMICAL WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL

*Estimated quantities refer to number of pickups per year. **Green Planet, Inc. did not meet specifications because of an inability to guarantee disposal of chemical waste within thirty (30) days of pickup as required.			Trilogy Medwaste West, LLC Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes		Cleaning Guys LLC dba CG Environmental Fort Worth, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes		Green Planet, Inc. Royse City, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	
Item Description	UNIT	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
DNA Extraction Cartridges	55 Gal. Open Drum	2-3	\$514.50	\$1,543.50	\$1,250.00	\$3,750.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00
Formalin and Water	55 Gal. Closed Drum	8-12	\$525.00	\$6,300.00	\$545.00	\$6,540.00	\$325.00	\$3,900.00
Inorganic Salts Solution	35 Gal. Open Drum	2	\$504.00	\$1,008.00	\$420.00	\$840.00	\$250.00	\$500.00
Paraffin and Xylene	35 Gal. Open Drum	3-6	\$546.00	\$3,276.00	\$710.00	\$4,260.00	\$425.00	\$2,550.00
Spent Acid in Rinse Water	5 Gal. Container	2	\$483.00	\$966.00	\$175.00	\$350.00	\$95.00	\$190.00
Spent Organic Solvents	55 Gal. Closed Drum	12	\$546.00	\$6,552.00	\$420.00	\$5,040.00	\$250.00	\$3,000.00
Liquid Waste Stream for Public Health Lab	15 Gal. Drum	3-4	\$460.00	\$1,840.00	\$585.00	\$2,340.00	\$350.00	\$1,400.00
Halogenated Solvents	5 Gal. Drum	2-3	\$367.50	\$1,102.50	\$190.00	\$570.00	\$95.00	\$285.00
TOTAL			\$22,588.00		\$23,690.00		\$14,075.00**	

SUPPLIES (IF NEEDED)

Empty, Poly, Open Drum 55G	Each	-	\$85.00	\$125.00	\$55.00
Empty, Poly, Open Pail - 5G	Each	-	\$55.00	\$75.00	\$15.00
Empty, Poly, Closed Drum - 5G	Each	-	\$55.00	\$85.00	\$15.00