

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes	Cardio Partners Brentwood, TN HUB - No COOP - Yes	Con10gency Consulting Selma, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	0 - 25	\$448.00	\$269.00	No Bid
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	0 - 10	\$498.00	\$269.00	No Bid
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	0 - 10	\$129.00	\$84.25	No Bid
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	0 - 70	\$69.00	\$30.95	No Bid
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	0 - 10	\$158.00	\$84.95	No Bid
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	0 - 40	\$119.00	\$57.50	No Bid

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	CPR Savers & First Aid Supply LLC Scottsdale, AZ HUB - No	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No	General Medical Devices, Inc. Palatine, IL HUB - No
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	0 - 25	\$345.00	\$398.00	\$285.00
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	0 - 10	\$340.00	\$395.00	\$288.00
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	0 - 10	\$85.00	\$122.21	\$89.00
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	0 - 70	\$43.00	\$56.19	\$36.00
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	0 - 10	\$92.00	\$92.66	\$86.00
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	0 - 40	\$55.00	\$71.07	\$57.00

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC Henrico, VA HUB - No COOP - Yes	One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	R. S. Hughes Co., Inc. Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	0 - 25	\$264.02	\$270.00	\$351.18
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	0 - 10	\$264.02	\$270.00	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$248.53</b>
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	0 - 10	<i>Secondary</i> \$80.22	\$84.00	\$89.12
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	0 - 70	\$30.51	\$31.20	\$45.00
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	0 - 10	\$83.78	\$85.68	\$90.00
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	0 - 40	\$57.32	\$57.96	\$60.89

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Rescue One Training for Life, Inc. Gaithersburg, MD HUB - No COOP - Yes	School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Sterlington Medical d/b/a Mdd Marketing, Inc. Houston, TX HUB - No
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	0 - 25	<i>Secondary</i> \$257.00	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$255.66</b>	\$329.00
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	0 - 10	\$257.00	<i>Secondary</i> \$255.66	\$329.00
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	0 - 10	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$74.00</b>	\$80.34	\$84.00
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	0 - 70	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$28.00</b>	<i>Secondary</i> \$29.54	\$44.00
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	0 - 10	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$78.00</b>	<i>Secondary</i> \$81.13	\$84.00
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	0 - 40	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$54.00</b>	<i>Secondary</i> \$54.88	\$59.00

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Supply Store Now LLC Spring, TX HUB - Yes	Top Safety Products Company, Inc. Branchburg, NJ HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	0 - 25	\$299.98	No Bid
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	0 - 10	\$299.98	No Bid
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	0 - 10	\$99.98	No Bid
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	0 - 70	\$48.98	No Bid
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	0 - 10	\$98.98	No Bid
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	0 - 40	\$64.98	No Bid

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes	Cardio Partners Brentwood, TN HUB - No COOP - Yes	Con10gency Consulting Selma, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	0 - 5	\$309.00	\$188.00	No Bid
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Cardiac Science Powerheart G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9390A-1001P	0 - 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-Language Cardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	0 - 3	No Bid	<i>Secondary</i> \$1,235.00	No Bid
10	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #168-6000-006	0 - 2	No Bid	<b>Primary</b> \$66.75	No Bid
11	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #9157-004	0 - 2	\$469.00	<b>Primary</b> \$237.75	No Bid
12	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	0 - 2	\$169.00	<b>Primary</b> \$59.99	No Bid

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	CPR Savers & First Aid Supply LLC Scottsdale, AZ HUB - No	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No	General Medical Devices, Inc. Palatine, IL HUB - No
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	0 - 5	\$195.00	\$204.53	\$181.00
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Cardiac Science Powerheart G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9390A-1001P	0 - 3	\$1,295.00	\$2,299.00	No Bid
9	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-Language Cardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	0 - 3	\$1,455.00	No Bid	\$1,475.00
10	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #168-6000-006	0 - 2	\$97.00	No Bid	\$92.00
11	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #9157-004	0 - 2	\$285.00	No Bid	\$266.00
12	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	0 - 2	\$97.00	\$101.66	\$92.00

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC Henrico, VA HUB - No COOP - Yes	One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	R. S. Hughes Co., Inc. Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	0 - 5	\$184.82	\$202.00	\$198.53
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Cardiac Science Powerheart G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9390A-1001P	0 - 3	No Bid	*\$425.00 (Refurbished)	\$1,405.89
9	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-Language Cardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	0 - 3	\$1,377.63	\$1,249.00	\$1,411.77
10	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #168-6000-006	0 - 2	No Bid	\$94.00	\$98.83
11	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #9157-004	0 - 2	\$266.13	\$272.00	\$285.89
12	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	0 - 2	\$76.27	\$78.00	\$98.83



Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Rescue One Training for Life, Inc. Gaithersburg, MD HUB - No COOP - Yes	School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Sterlington Medical d/b/a Mdd Marketing, Inc. Houston, TX HUB - No
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	0 - 5	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$178.00</b>	<i>Secondary</i> \$178.97	\$189.00
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Cardiac Science Powerheart G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9390A-1001P	0 - 3	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$1,195.00</b>	\$1,357.95	\$1,295.00
9	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-Language Cardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	0 - 3	\$1,249.00	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$1,215.90</b>	\$1,395.00
10	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #168-6000-006	0 - 2	<i>Secondary</i> \$89.00	\$89.09	Free
11	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #9157-004	0 - 2	\$258.00	<i>Secondary</i> \$257.73	\$289.00
12	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	0 - 2	\$75.00	<i>Secondary</i> \$73.86	Free only if entire bid is won

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Supply Store Now LLC Spring, TX HUB - Yes	Top Safety Products Company, Inc. Branchburg, NJ HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	0 - 5	\$198.98	No Bid
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Cardiac Science Powerheart G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9390A-1001P	0 - 3	No Bid	No Bid
9	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-Language Cardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	0 - 3	\$1,499.98	No Bid
10	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #168-6000-006	0 - 2	\$109.98	No Bid
11	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #9157-004	0 - 2	\$319.98	No Bid
12	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	0 - 2	\$99.98	No Bid

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes	Cardio Partners Brentwood, TN HUB - No COOP - Yes	Con10gency Consulting Selma, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
13	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	0 - 2	\$529.00	\$315.00	No Bid
14	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5 Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	0 - 2	No Bid	\$125.00	No Bid
15	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED008A	0 - 2	No Bid	\$45.00 Free w/AED purchase	No Bid
16	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	0 - 2	\$59.00	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$8.75 or Free</b> <b>w/AED purchase</b>	No Bid
17	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with Alarm Cardiac Science #50-00392-20	0 - 2	\$388.00	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$99.00</b>	No Bid

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	CPR Savers & First Aid Supply LLC Scottsdale, AZ HUB - No	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No	General Medical Devices, Inc. Palatine, IL HUB - No
13	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	0 - 2	\$325.00	\$331.70	\$292.00
14	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5 Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	0 - 2	\$135.00	\$133.41	\$121.00
15	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED008A	0 - 2	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.00
16	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	0 - 2	\$52.00	\$61.00	\$48.00
17	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with Alarm Cardiac Science #50-00392-20	0 - 2	\$215.00	No Bid	\$205.00

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC Henrico, VA HUB - No COOP - Yes	One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	R. S. Hughes Co., Inc. Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
13	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	0 - 2	\$299.81	\$306.60	\$322.06
14	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5 Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	0 - 2	No Bid	\$132.30	\$129.71
15	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED008A	0 - 2	No Bid	Free w/AED Not available as standalone	<i>Secondary</i> \$43.77
16	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	0 - 2	\$27.44	<i>Secondary</i> \$10.00	\$53.83
17	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with Alarm Cardiac Science #50-00392-20	0 - 2	\$207.28	<i>Secondary</i> \$99.00	\$223.24

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Rescue One Training for Life, Inc. Gaithersburg, MD HUB - No COOP - Yes	School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Sterlington Medical d/b/a Mdd Marketing, Inc. Houston, TX HUB - No
13	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	0 - 2	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$290.00</b>	<i>Secondary</i> <i>\$290.34</i>	\$329.00
14	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5 Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	0 - 2	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$109.00</b>	<i>Secondary</i> <i>\$116.93</i>	\$119.00
15	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED008A	0 - 2	\$48.00	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$38.63</b>	Free w/Item 9
16	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	0 - 2	\$15.00	\$26.58	Free w/Item 9
17	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with Alarm Cardiac Science #50-00392-20	0 - 2	\$200.00	\$201.03	\$215.00

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Supply Store Now LLC Spring, TX HUB - Yes	Top Safety Products Company, Inc. Branchburg, NJ HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
13	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	0 - 2	\$349.98	No Bid
14	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5 Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	0 - 2	\$134.98	No Bid
15	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5 Cardiac Science #XCAAED008A	0 - 2	\$89.98	No Bid
16	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	0 - 2	\$69.98	No Bid
17	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with Alarm Cardiac Science #50-00392-20	0 - 2	\$249.98	No Bid

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes	Cardio Partners Brentwood, TN HUB - No COOP - Yes	Con10gency Consulting Selma, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
18	Inspection Tag, AED HeartSmart #HST-ACC01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	No Bid  No Bid	Free w/AED purchase  Cardo Partners CPCT	No Bid  No Bid
19	Wall Sign, 2-way AED, 10" x 7" with 1" mount flap HeartSmart #HST-WS01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	No Bid  No Bid	<i>Secondary</i> <i>\$7.95 or Free</i> <i>w/cabinet purchase</i>  <i>Cardio Partners</i> <i>CPAEDTRISIGN</i>	No Bid  No Bid
20	Decal, Facility, 4" x 5" peel and stick HeartSmart #HST-ACC02 or approved equal	0 - 2	No Bid  No Bid	Free w/AED purchase  Cardio Partners CPDECAL-SM	No Bid  No Bid



Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	CPR Savers & First Aid Supply LLC Scottsdale, AZ HUB - No	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No	General Medical Devices, Inc. Palatine, IL HUB - No
18	Inspection Tag, AED HeartSmart #HST-ACC01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$4.00  Accuform AEDTG5	\$9.50  AED HST-ACC01	Declined award due to low value \$0.15  AED Professionals AP-Insptag
19	Wall Sign, 2-way AED, 10" x 7" with 1" mount flap HeartSmart #HST-WS01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$12.95  Defibtech DAC-231	No Bid  No Bid	Declined award due to low value \$3.15  AED Professionals AP-3DWS-PLA
20	Decal, Facility, 4" x 5" peel and stick HeartSmart #HST-ACC02 or approved equal	0 - 2	\$3.00  CPR Savers AED-DECAL	No Bid  No Bid	Declined award due to low value \$0.05  AED Professionals AP-DECAL

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC Henrico, VA HUB - No COOP - Yes	One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	R. S. Hughes Co., Inc. Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
18	Inspection Tag, AED HeartSmart #HST-ACC01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	No Bid	Free w/any other item	\$8.83  POWERHEART 160-0164-001
19	Wall Sign, 2-way AED, 10" x 7" with 1" mount flap HeartSmart #HST-WS01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	No Bid	\$12.00 or Free w/cabinet purchase	\$12.98  AED PLUS 9310-0738
20	Decal, Facility, 4" x 5" peel and stick HeartSmart #HST-ACC02 or approved equal	0 - 2	No Bid	Free w/any other item	\$4.42  POWERHEART 160-0163.001

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Rescue One Training for Life, Inc. Gaithersburg, MD HUB - No COOP - Yes	School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Sterlington Medical d/b/a Mdd Marketing, Inc. Houston, TX HUB - No
18	Inspection Tag, AED HeartSmart #HST-ACC01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	1 Free w/purchase of items 1-9  Rescue One SSS-Check Tag	<b>Primary \$0.55</b>  <b>School Health 55926</b>	Free w/Item 9  Sterlington Medical TAG102
19	Wall Sign, 2-way AED, 10" x 7" with 1" mount flap HeartSmart #HST-WS01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$13.00  Rescue One SSS-021	<b>Primary \$5.53</b>  <b>School Health 55925</b>	Free only if entire bid is won  Sterlington Medical WS104
20	Decal, Facility, 4" x 5" peel and stick HeartSmart #HST-ACC02 or approved equal	0 - 2	1 Free w/purchase of items 1-9  Rescue One AED Decal	<b>Primary \$1.29</b>  <b>School Health 58990</b>	Free w/Item 9  Sterlington Medical DS106

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Supply Store Now LLC Spring, TX HUB - Yes	Top Safety Products Company, Inc. Branchburg, NJ HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
18	Inspection Tag, AED HeartSmart #HST-ACC01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$2.98  Generic AED TAG	No Bid  No Bid
19	Wall Sign, 2-way AED, 10" x 7" with 1" mount flap HeartSmart #HST-WS01 or approved equal.	0 - 2	\$14.98  Generic AED SIGN	No Bid  No Bid
20	Decal, Facility, 4" x 5" peel and stick HeartSmart #HST-ACC02 or approved equal	0 - 2	\$4.98  Generic AED Decal Sticker	No Bid  No Bid

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes	Cardio Partners Brentwood, TN HUB - No COOP - Yes	Con10gency Consulting Selma, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
21	Bleed Control Kit North American Rescue #80-0465 or approved equal	0 - 10	\$69.00  North American Rescue 80-0465	\$37.95  Curaplex 8600-STB001B	<b>Primary</b> <b>\$33.65</b>  <b>Con10gency</b> <b>KIT-BCK-TARRANT</b>

\*One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC failed to meet specifications for item 8 because they bid refurbished and specifications stated that refurbished products would not be accepted.

-General Medical Devices, Inc. declined award of items 18, 19, and 20 due to low overall value of a contract for those items.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for item 8 because the item has been discontinued by the manufacturer and it is not anticipated that there will be a need for a secondary for that item.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for items 18 or 20 because several vendors offered the items free with another purchase.

-Tie bids for primary vendor for Item 17 was determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order #60616, Procedure for Awarding Tie Bids.

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	CPR Savers & First Aid Supply LLC Scottsdale, AZ HUB - No	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No	General Medical Devices, Inc. Palatine, IL HUB - No
21	Bleed Control Kit North American Rescue #80-0465 or approved equal	0 - 10	\$45.95  North American Rescue 80-0465	\$61.47  North American Rescue 80-0465	\$40.60  North American Rescue 80-0465

\*One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC failed to meet specifications for item 8 because they bid refurbished and specifications stated that refurbished products would not be accepted.

-General Medical Devices, Inc. declined award of items 18, 19, and 20 due to low overall value of a contract for those items.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for item 8 because the item has been discontinued by the manufacturer and it is not anticipated that there will be a need for a secondary for that item.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for items 18 or 20 because several vendors offered the items free with another purchase.

-Tie bids for primary vendor for Item 17 was determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order #60616, Procedure for Awarding Tie Bids.

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC Henrico, VA HUB - No COOP - Yes	One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	R. S. Hughes Co., Inc. Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
21	Bleed Control Kit North American Rescue #80-0465 or approved equal	0 - 10	\$40.93  North American Rescue 80-0465	\$35.99  One Beat Medical OBC-BK-Custom	No Bid  No Bid

\*One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC failed to meet specifications for item 8 because they bid refurbished and specifications stated that refurbished products would not be accepted.

-General Medical Devices, Inc. declined award of items 18, 19, and 20 due to low overall value of a contract for those items.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for item 8 because the item has been discontinued by the manufacturer and it is not anticipated that there will be a need for a secondary for that item.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for items 18 or 20 because several vendors offered the items free with another purchase.

-Tie bids for primary vendor for Item 17 was determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order #60616, Procedure for Awarding Tie Bids.

Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Rescue One Training for Life, Inc. Gaithersburg, MD HUB - No COOP - Yes	School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Sterlington Medical d/b/a Mdd Marketing, Inc. Houston, TX HUB - No
21	Bleed Control Kit North American Rescue #80-0465 or approved equal	0 - 10	\$43.00  North American Rescue 80-0465	\$36.32  North American Rescue 57784	\$65.00  North American Rescue 80-0465

\*One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC failed to meet specifications for item 8 because they bid refurbished and specifications stated that refurbished products would not be accepted.

-General Medical Devices, Inc. declined award of items 18, 19, and 20 due to low overall value of a contract for those items.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for item 8 because the item has been discontinued by the manufacturer and it is not anticipated that there will be a need for a secondary for that item.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for items 18 or 20 because several vendors offered the items free with another purchase.

-Tie bids for primary vendor for Item 17 was determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order #60616, Procedure for Awarding Tie Bids.



Bid 2022-041

Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AEDs), Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

Item	Item Description	Estimated Quantity	Supply Store Now LLC Spring, TX HUB - Yes	Top Safety Products Company, Inc. Branchburg, NJ HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
21	Bleed Control Kit North American Rescue #80-0465 or approved equal	0 - 10	\$49.98  North American Rescue 80-0465	<i>Secondary</i> \$33.95  <i>Top Safety Products</i> TSP# 640-761

\*One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC failed to meet specifications for item 8 because they bid refurbished and specifications stated that refurbished products would not be accepted.

-General Medical Devices, Inc. declined award of items 18, 19, and 20 due to low overall value of a contract for those items.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for item 8 because the item has been discontinued by the manufacturer and it is not anticipated that there will be a need for a secondary for that item.

-There is no secondary award recommendation for items 18 or 20 because several vendors offered the items free with another purchase.

-Tie bids for primary vendor for Item 17 was determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order #60616, Procedure for Awarding Tie Bids.