

RFB 2022-011 Annual Contract for Truck Mounted, Telescopic Boom, Hydraulic Excavators

	Kirby Smith Machinery Fort Worth, Texas
	HUB: No
	Co-op: Yes
Description	Unit Price
<b>Item 1: 3100 Series or Equivalent</b>	\$401,641.00
Brand/ Model Bid:	Gradall XL3100 V
Delivery:	45 Days
Standard Warranty:	2 Year Full Factory
Discount Off for Current Item of Future Equivalent Model:	0%
Optional 24" Excavating Bucket	\$4,740.00
Optional 36" Excavating Bucket	\$5,560.00
Optional 48" Excavating Bucket	\$6,440.00
Optional 40" Pavement Removal Bucket	\$10,640.00
Optional 60" Ditching Bucket, with Bolt on Edge	\$6,030.00
Optional 66" Ditching Bucket, with Bolt on Edge	\$6,340.00
Optional 72" Ditching Bucket, with Bolt on Edge	\$6,730.00
Optional Fixed Thumb Grapple	\$10,300.00
Optional Tree Limb Shear	\$14,670.00
<b>Item 2: 4100 Series or Equivalent</b>	\$475,929.00
Brand/ Model Bid:	Gradall XL4100 V
Delivery:	45 Days
Standard Warranty:	2 Year Full Factory
Discount Off for Current Item of Future Equivalent Model:	0%
Optional 24" Excavating Bucket	\$4,740.00
Optional 36" Excavating Bucket	\$5,560.00
Optional 48" Excavating Bucket	\$6,440.00
Optional 40" Pavement Removal Bucket	\$10,640.00
Optional 60" Ditching Bucket, with Bolt on Edge	\$6,030.00
Optional 66" Ditching Bucket, with Bolt on Edge	\$6,340.00
Optional 72" Ditching Bucket, with Bolt on Edge	\$6,730.00
Optional Fixed Thumb Grapple	\$10,300.00
Optional Tree Limb Shear	\$14,670.00
<b>Item 3: D152 Series or Equivalent</b>	\$289,396.00
Brand/ Model Bid:	Gradall D152
Delivery:	30 Days
Standard Warranty:	2 Year Full Factory
Discount Off for Current Item of Future Equivalent Model:	0%
Optional 36" Excavating Bucket	\$6,200.00
Optional Fixed Thumb Grapple	\$9,200.00

RFB 2022-011 Annual Contract for Truck Mounted, Telescopic Boom, Hydraulic Excavators

	Kirby Smith Machinery Fort Worth, Texas
	HUB: No
	Co-op: Yes
Description	Unit Price
<b>Item 3: D152 Series or Equivalent</b>	\$289,396.00
Optional Tree Limb Shear	\$12,200.00
<b>Item 4: D154 Series or Equivalent</b>	No Bid
Brand/ Model Bid:	No Bid
Delivery:	No Bid
Standard Warranty:	No Bid
Discount Off for Current Item of Future Equivalent Model:	No Bid
Optional 36" Excavating Bucket	No Bid
Optional Fixed Thumb Grapple	No Bid
Optional Tree Limb Shear	No Bid
<b>Optional Pricing:</b>	
Optional Extended Warranty for Item 1:	\$9,153.00
Warranty Terms:	5 Year/3500 hour Premier EPG Warranty
Optional Extended Warranty for Item 1:	\$16,534.00
Warranty Terms:	7 Year/4500 hour Premier EPG Warranty
Optional Extended Warranty for Item 2:	\$10,702.00
Warranty Terms:	5 Year/3500 hour Premier EPG Warranty
Optional Extended Warranty for Item 2:	\$19,230.00
Warranty Terms:	7 Year/4500 hour Premier EPG Warranty
Optional Extended Warranty for Item 2:	\$22,128.00
Warranty Terms:	7 Year/5000 hour Premier EPG Warranty