

Bid No. 2022-029, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LABORATORY TEST KITS AND REAGENTS FOR CLINICAL TESTING

P = PRIMARY S = Secondary A = Alternate No bid: Ortho Medical of Oklahoma, Inc. No alternate awards for Items 1, 2, and 3 due to high pricing. Fisher Healthcare withdrew their bid for Item 9.			Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Diagnostics Direct, LLC Stone Harbor, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	McKesson Medical Surgical Government Solutions LLC Henrico, VA HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
1	Solana HSV 1+2/VZV Assay Kit, 48 tests/Kit; Quidel #M302	10 Kits	\$2,998.00	No Bid	\$1,832.00 - P	\$1918.90 - S
2	Solana HSV 1+2/VZV Control Set, Quidel #M118	4 Sets	\$455.00	No Bid	\$326.45 - S	\$274.67 - P
3	TRUE 20 Plus hCG Urine Pregnancy Test Set, 50 Tests/Kit, Stanbio #1430-050	30 Boxes	\$245.00	No Bid	\$53.21 - P	\$65.27 - S
4	Test Kit, Rapid Membrane Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of Syphilis, Diagnostics Direct, Syphilis Health Check #VSC-11-01	170 Kits	\$335.00	\$186.54 - P	\$200.00 - A	\$190.49 - S
5	Control Set, Rapid Membrane Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of Syphilis, Diagnostics Direct, Syphilis Health Check #VSC-11-02	98 Sets	\$96.00	\$39.00 - P	\$56.25 - A	\$48.64 - S
6	Test Kit, HIV - 1/2 Rapid, ChemBio #60-9505-1	120 Kits	\$169.00 - S	No Bid	\$176.16 - A	\$116.91 - P
7	Control Kit for use with HIV - 1/2 Rapid Test Kit, ChemBio #60-9549-0	4 Kits	\$69.00 - A	No Bid	\$41.96 - P	\$43.36 - S
8	Reagent Discs, Comprehensive Metabolic Panel, for use with Piccolo Analyzer, 10/box, Abaxis Piccolo #07P0208	75 Boxes	\$148.00 - A	No Bid	\$102.05 - S	\$94.03 - P
9	Chemistry and Lipid Controls, for Comprehensive Metabolic Panel, for use with Piccolo Analyzer, 6/box, Abaxis Piccolo #07P0401	12 Boxes	\$265.00 - S	No Bid	Withdrew Bid	\$163.56 - P
Minimum Order Requirements			\$1,000.00	None	\$110.00	None
Estimated Delivery ARO			1-2 weeks	3-5 days	5-10 days	1-7 days