

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 1: Reinforced Concrete Pipe, In 4 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
1	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 12 Inch Diameter	\$ 96.00
2	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 15 Inch Diameter	\$ 115.00
3	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 18 Inch Diameter	\$ 131.00
4	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 21 Inch Diameter	\$ 153.00
5	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 24 Inch Diameter	\$ 195.00
6	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 27 Inch Diameter	\$ 220.00
7	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 30 Inch Diameter	\$ 265.00
8	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 33 Inch Diameter	\$ 323.00
9	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 36 Inch Diameter	\$ 348.00
10	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 39 Inch Diameter	No Bid
11	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 42 Inch Diameter	\$ 534.00
12	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 45 Inch Diameter	No Bid
13	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 48 Inch Diameter	\$ 649.00
14	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 54 Inch Diameter	\$ 867.00
15	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 60 Inch Diameter	\$ 1,027.00
16	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 4 Foot Length, 72 Inch Diameter	\$ 1,472.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prarie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 1: Reinforced Concrete Pipe, In 4 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%
Location of Plant:		Grand Prarie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0
Section 2: Reinforced Concrete Pipe, In 6 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
17	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 12 Inch Diameter	\$ 126.00
18	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 15 Inch Diameter	\$ 151.00
19	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 18 Inch Diameter	\$ 174.00
20	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 21 Inch Diameter	\$ 204.00
21	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 24 Inch Diameter	\$ 256.00
22	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 27 Inch Diameter	\$ 289.00
23	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 30 Inch Diameter	\$ 348.00
24	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 33 Inch Diameter	\$ 426.00
25	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 36 Inch Diameter	\$ 510.00
26	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 39 Inch Diameter	No Bid
27	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 42 Inch Diameter	\$ 702.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prarie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 2: Reinforced Concrete Pipe, In 6 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
28	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 45 Inch Diameter	No Bid
29	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 48 Inch Diameter	\$ 852.00
30	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 54 Inch Diameter	\$ 1,146.00
31	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 60 Inch Diameter	\$ 1,350.00
32	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 6 Foot Length, 72 Inch Diameter	\$ 1,938.00
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%
Location of Plant:		Grand Prarie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0
Section 3: Reinforced Concrete Pipe, In 8 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
33	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 12 Inch Diameter	\$ 168.00
34	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 15 Inch Diameter	\$ 232.00
35	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 18 Inch Diameter	\$ 232.00
36	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 21 Inch Diameter	\$ 272.00
37	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 24 Inch Diameter	\$ 336.00
38	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 27 Inch Diameter	\$ 384.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 3: Reinforced Concrete Pipe, In 8 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
39	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 30 Inch Diameter	\$ 464.00
40	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 33 Inch Diameter	\$ 568.00
41	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 36 Inch Diameter	\$ 680.00
42	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 39 Inch Diameter	No Bid
43	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 42 Inch Diameter	\$ 936.00
44	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 45 Inch Diameter	No Bid
45	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 48 Inch Diameter	\$ 1,136.00
46	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 54 Inch Diameter	\$ 1,528.00
47	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 60 Inch Diameter	\$ 1,800.00
48	Reinforced Concrete Pipe, 8 Foot Length, 72 Inch Diameter	\$ 2,584.00
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%
Location of Plant:		Grand Prairie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0
Section 4: Concrete Box Culverts, Direct Drive in 4 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
49	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 3' x 2'	\$ 560.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 4: Concrete Box Culverts, Direct Drive in 4 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
50	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 3' x 3'	\$ 585.00
51	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 4' x 2'	\$ 659.00
52	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 4' x 3'	\$ 758.00
53	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 4' x 4'	\$ 857.00
54	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 5' x 3'	\$ 947.00
55	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 5' x 4'	\$ 1,046.00
56	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 5' x 5'	\$ 1,142.00
57	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 6' x 3'	\$ 1,244.00
58	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 6' x 4'	\$ 1,356.00
59	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 6' x 5'	\$ 1,472.00
60	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 6' x 6'	\$ 1,584.00
61	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 7' x 4'	\$ 1,660.00
62	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 7' x 5'	\$ 1,788.00
63	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 7' x 6'	\$ 1,920.00
64	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 4 Foot Length, 7' x 7'	\$ 2,044.00
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 4: Concrete Box Culverts, Direct Drive in 4 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
Location of Plant:		Grand Prairie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0
Section 5: Concrete Box Culverts, Direct Drive in 6 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
65	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 3' x 2'	\$ 804.00
66	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 3' x 3'	\$ 834.00
67	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 4' x 2'	\$ 936.00
68	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 4' x 3'	\$ 1,080.00
69	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 4' x 4'	\$ 1,224.00
70	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 5' x 3'	\$ 1,350.00
71	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 5' x 4'	\$ 1,488.00
72	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 5' x 5'	\$ 1,626.00
73	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 6' x 3'	\$ 1,770.00
74	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 6' x 4'	\$ 1,926.00
75	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 6' x 5'	\$ 2,100.00
76	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 6' x 6'	\$ 2,256.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 5: Concrete Box Culverts, Direct Drive in 6 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
77	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 7' x 4'	\$ 2,364.00
78	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 7' x 5'	\$ 2,550.00
79	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 7' x 6'	\$ 2,742.00
80	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 6 Foot Length, 7' x 7'	\$ 2,910.00
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%
Location of Plant:		Grand Prairie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0
Section 6: Concrete Box Culverts, Direct Drive in 8 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
81	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 3' x 2'	\$ 1,072.00
82	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 3' x 3'	\$ 1,112.00
83	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 4' x 2'	\$ 1,284.00
84	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 4' x 3'	\$ 1,440.00
85	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 4' x 4'	\$ 1,632.00
86	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 5' x 3'	\$ 1,800.00
87	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 5' x 4'	\$ 1,984.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 6: Concrete Box Culverts, Direct Drive in 8 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
88	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 5' x 5'	\$ 2,168.00
89	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 6' x 3'	\$ 2,360.00
90	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 6' x 4'	\$ 2,568.00
91	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 6' x 5'	\$ 2,800.00
92	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 6' x 6'	\$ 3,008.00
93	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 7' x 4'	\$ 3,152.00
94	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 7' x 5'	\$ 3,400.00
95	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 7' x 6'	\$ 3,656.00
96	Concrete Box Culvert, Direct Drive, 8 Foot Length, 7' x 7'	\$ 3,880.00
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%
Location of Plant:		Grand Prairie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0
Section 7: Concrete Box Culverts, Fill Height Two Feet, In 4 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
97	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 3' x 2'	\$ 560.00
98	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 3' x 3'	\$ 585.00



BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 7: Concrete Box Culverts, Fill Height Two Feet, In 4 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
99	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 4' x 2'	\$ 659.00
100	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 4' x 3'	\$ 785.00
101	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 4' x 4'	\$ 857.00
102	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 5' x 3'	\$ 947.00
103	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 5' x 4'	\$ 1,046.00
104	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 5' x 5'	\$ 1,142.00
105	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 6' x 3'	\$ 1,244.00
106	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 6' x 4'	\$ 1,356.00
107	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 6' x 5'	\$ 1,472.00
108	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 6' x 6'	\$ 1,584.00
109	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 7' x 4'	\$ 1,660.00
110	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 7' x 5'	\$ 1,788.00
111	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 7' x 6'	\$ 1,920.00
112	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 4 Foot Length, 7' x 7'	\$ 2,044.00
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%
Location of Plant:		Grand Prairie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 7: Concrete Box Culverts, Fill Height Two Feet, In 4 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0
Section 8: Concrete Box Culverts, Fill Height Two Feet, In 6 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
113	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 3' x 2'	\$ 804.00
114	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 3' x 3'	\$ 834.00
115	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 4' x 2'	\$ 936.00
116	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 4' x 3'	\$ 1,080.00
117	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 4' x 4'	\$ 1,224.00
118	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 5' x 3'	\$ 1,350.00
119	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 5' x 4'	\$ 1,488.00
120	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 5' x 5'	\$ 1,626.00
121	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 6' x 3'	\$ 1,770.00
122	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 6' x 4'	\$ 1,926.00
123	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 6' x 5'	\$ 2,100.00
124	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 6' x 6'	\$ 2,256.00
125	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 7' x 4'	\$ 2,364.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 8: Concrete Box Culverts, Fill Height Two Feet, In 6 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
126	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 7' x 5'	\$ 2,550.00
127	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 7' x 6'	\$ 2,742.00
128	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 6 Foot Length, 7' x 7'	\$ 2,910.00
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%
Location of Plant:		Grand Prairie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0
Section 9: Concrete Box Culverts, Fill Height Two Feet, In 8 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
129	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 3' x 2'	\$ 1,072.00
130	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 3' x 3'	\$ 1,112.00
131	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 4' x 2'	\$ 1,284.00
132	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 4' x 3'	\$ 1,440.00
133	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 4' x 4'	\$ 1,632.00
134	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 5' x 3'	\$ 1,800.00
135	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 5' x 4'	\$ 1,984.00
136	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 5' x 5'	\$ 2,168.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prarie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 9: Concrete Box Culverts, Fill Height Two Feet, In 8 Foot Lengths, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
137	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 6' x 3'	\$ 2,360.00
138	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 6' x 4'	\$ 2,568.00
139	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 6' x 5'	\$ 2,800.00
140	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 6' x 6'	\$ 3,008.00
141	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 7' x 4'	\$ 3,152.00
142	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 7' x 5'	\$ 3,400.00
143	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 7' x 6'	\$ 3,656.00
144	Concrete Box Culvert, Fill Height Two Feet, 8 Foot Length, 7' x 7'	\$ 3,880.00
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%
Location of Plant:		Grand Prarie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0
Section 10: Precast Safety End Treatments, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
145	Precast Safety End Treatment, 12", 6:1 Ratio	\$ 590.00
146	Precast Safety End Treatment, 15", 6:1 Ratio	\$ 544.00
147	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 18", 3:1 Ratio	\$ 488.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prairie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 10: Precast Safety End Treatments, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
148	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 18", 4:1 Ratio	\$ 571.00
149	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 18", 6:1 Ratio	\$ 779.00
150	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 24", 3:1 Ratio	\$ 652.00
151	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 24", 4:1 Ratio	\$ 803.00
152	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 24", 6:1 Ratio	\$ 1,039.00
153	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 30", 3:1 Ratio	\$ 1,018.00
154	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 30", 4:1 Ratio	\$ 1,267.00
155	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 30", 6:1 Ratio	\$ 1,792.00
156	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "C" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 30", 3:1 Ratio	\$ 1,518.00
157	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "C" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 30", 4:1 Ratio	\$ 1,910.00
158	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "C" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 30", 6:1 Ratio	\$ 2,813.00
159	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "P" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 30", 3:1 Ratio	\$ 1,637.00
160	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "P" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 30", 4:1 Ratio	\$ 1,910.00
161	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 36", 3:1 Ratio	\$ 1,558.00
162	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 36", 4:1 Ratio	\$ 1,971.00
163	Precast Safety End Treatment, Without Galvanized Pipe Runners, 36", 6:1 Ratio	\$ 2,738.00

BID No. 2021-151 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP),  
 CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS AND SAFETY END TREATMENTS

		Forterra Pipe and Precast
		Grand Prarie, TX
		HUB: NO
		Co-Op: YES
Item	Description	Price
Section 10: Precast Safety End Treatments, Delivered to Job Site in Tarrant County		
164	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "C" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 36", 3:1 Ratio	\$ 1,752.00
165	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "C" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 36", 4:1 Ratio	\$ 2,294.00
166	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "C" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 36", 6:1 Ratio	\$ 3,732.00
167	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "P" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 36", 3:1 Ratio	\$ 2,128.00
168	Precast Safety End Treatment, With Type "P" Galvanized Pipe, Runners, 36", 4:1 Ratio	\$ 2,382.00
Percentage Discount for Similar Items Not Specified Above:		5%
Discount if Picked Up from Plant:		3%
Location of Plant:		Grand Prarie, TX
Hours of Operation:		7:00-5:00
Normal Delivery Time After Receipt of Order:		48
Delivery Time for Emergency Orders:		same day
Additional Cost:		0