

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

AWARD

Item Number	Description	Qty	*Ford Audio Video Systems LLC Oklahoma City, OK HUB - Yes		*AVI-SPL, LLC Tampa, FL HUB - No		Pro Sound, Inc. Miami, FL HUB - No		Howard Technology Solutions Ellisville, MS HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Connectronics 4K/2K HDMI Cable v1.4 Ethernet Type-A Male to Make - 30 foot #HDMI-14-30	30	\$43.20	\$1,296.00	\$23.15	\$694.50	\$35.00	\$1,050.00	\$29.00	\$870.00
2	Crestron Electronics Saros Sound Bar 200, Powered, Black #SB-200-P-B	15	\$272.00	\$4,080.00	\$263.16	\$3,947.40	\$265.00	\$3,975.00	\$264.00	\$3,960.00
3	Dell 75" 4K Interactive Touch Monitor #C7520QT	15	\$3,596.00	\$53,940.00	\$3,943.95	\$59,159.25	\$4,145.00	\$62,175.00	\$4,288.00	\$64,320.00

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Network Cabling Services, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB- No		Digital Resources, Inc. Southlake, TX HUB - Yes		Evco Partners LP dba Burgoon Company Texas City, TX HUB - Yes	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Connectronics 4K/2K HDMI Cable v1.4 Ethernet Type-A Male to Make - 30 foot #HDMI-14-30	30	\$43.26	\$1,179.80	\$30.45	\$913.50	\$39.19	\$1,175.70
2	Crestron Electronics Saros Sound Bar 200, Powered, Black #SB-200-P-B	15	\$311.54	\$4,673.10	\$294.12	\$4,411.80	\$438.46	\$6,576.90
3	Dell 75" 4K Interactive Touch Monitor #C7520QT	15	\$4,805.18	\$72,077.70	\$5,145.44	\$77,181.60	\$5,600.00	\$84,000.00

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

AWARD

Item Number	Description	Qty	*Ford Audio Video Systems LLC Oklahoma City, OK HUB - Yes		*AVI-SPL, LLC Tampa, FL HUB - No		Pro Sound, Inc. Miami, FL HUB - No		Howard Technology Solutions Ellisville, MS HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
4	Kramer Electronics 3.5mm Male to IR Receiver Control Cable 3' #C-A35M/IRRN-3	15	\$8.50	\$127.50	\$8.11	\$121.65	\$10.25	\$153.75	\$9.00	\$135.00
5	Kramer Electronics Infared Remote Control #RC-IR3	15	\$88.00	\$1,320.00	\$83.95	\$1,259.25	\$90.00	\$950.00	\$85.00	\$1,275.00
6	Kramer Electronics 4x2 UHD HDMI Matrix Switcher #VS-42UHD	15	\$583.00	\$8,745.00	\$492.11	\$7,381.65	\$509.00	\$7,635.00	\$491.00	\$7,365.00

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Network Cabling Services, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB- No		Digital Resources, Inc. Southlake, TX HUB - Yes		Evco Partners LP dba Burgoon Company Texas City, TX HUB - Yes	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
4	Kramer Electronics 3.5mm Male to IR Receiver Control Cable 3' #C-A35M/IRRN-3	15	\$9.39	\$140.85	\$8.85	\$132.75	\$15.98	\$239.70
5	Kramer Electronics Infared Remote Control #RC-IR3	15	\$79.75	\$1,458.90	\$91.67	\$1,375.05	\$129.92	\$1,948.80
6	Kramer Electronics 4x2 UHD HDMI Matrix Switcher #VS-42UHD	15	\$576.78	\$8,651.70	\$543.60	\$8,154.00	\$751.63	\$11,274.45

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

AWARD

Item Number	Description	Qty	*Ford Audio Video Systems LLC Oklahoma City, OK HUB - Yes		*AVI-SPL, LLC Tampa, FL HUB - No		Pro Sound, Inc. Miami, FL HUB - No		Howard Technology Solutions Ellisville, MS HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
7	Liberty AV Solutions HDMI Premium 18G CBL w/NET 6' #HDPMM06F	20	\$12.00	\$240.00	\$11.37	\$227.40	\$13.75	\$275.00	\$13.00	\$260.00
8	Liberty AV Solutions Z100 3.5SM-L/R RCA Y 6' CBL #Z100AY6FT	15	\$5.80	\$87.00	\$4.65	\$69.75	\$7.50	\$112.50	\$7.00	\$105.00
9	Peerless-AV Motorized Height Adjustable Cart 42"-86" Displays #SR598ML3	15	\$1,208.00	\$18,120.00	\$1,143.95	\$17,159.25	\$1,229.00	\$18,435.00	\$1,499.00	\$22,485.00

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Network Cabling Services, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB- No		Digital Resources, Inc. Southlake, TX HUB - Yes		Evco Partners LP dba Burgoon Company Texas City, TX HUB - Yes	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
7	Liberty AV Solutions HDMI Premium 18G CBL w/NET 6' #HDPMM06F	20	\$12.82	\$256.40	\$12.68	\$253.60	\$20.37	\$407.40
8	Liberty AV Solutions Z100 3.5SM-L/R RCA Y 6' CBL #Z100AY6FT	15	\$5.13	\$76.95	\$5.98	\$89.70	\$11.32	\$169.80
9	Peerless-AV Motorized Height Adjustable Cart 42"-86" Displays #SR598ML3	15	\$1,479.93	\$22,198.95	\$1,532.00	\$22,980.00	\$1,812.08	\$27,181.20

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

AWARD

Item Number	Description	Qty	*Ford Audio Video Systems LLC Oklahoma City, OK HUB - Yes		*AVI-SPL, LLC Tampa, FL HUB - No		Pro Sound, Inc. Miami, FL HUB - No		Howard Technology Solutions Ellisville, MS HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
10	Sanus Series 1 Soundbar Mount #SA405-B1	15	\$11.00 *alternate was not accepted	\$165.00 *alternate was not accepted	*No-bid	*No-bid	\$27.00	\$405.00	\$25.00	\$375.00
Total			\$88,120.50		\$90,020.10		\$95,166.25		\$101,150.00	

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Network Cabling Services, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB- No		Digital Resources, Inc. Southlake, TX HUB - Yes		Evco Partners LP dba Burgoon Company Texas City, TX HUB - Yes	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
10	Sanus Series 1 Soundbar Mount #SA405-B1	15	\$40.56	\$608.40	\$34.62	\$519.30	\$52.56	\$788.40
Total				\$111,322.85		\$116,011.30		\$133,762.35

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

AWARD

Item Number	Description	Qty	*Ford Audio Video Systems LLC Oklahoma City, OK HUB - Yes		**AVI-SPL, LLC Tampa, FL HUB - No		Pro Sound, Inc. Miami, FL HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	Connectronics 4K/2K HDMI Cable v1.4 Ethernet Type-A Male to Make - 30 foot #HDMI-14-30	30	\$43.20	\$1,296.00	\$23.15	\$694.50	\$35.00	\$1,050.00
2	Crestron Electronics Saros Sound Bar 200, Powered, Black #SB-200-P-B	15	\$272.00	\$4,080.00	\$263.16	\$3,947.40	\$265.00	\$3,975.00
3	Dell 75" 4K Interactive Touch Monitor #C7520QT	15	\$3,596.00	\$53,940.00	\$3,943.95	\$59,159.25	\$4,145.00	\$62,175.00

*Apparent low-bidder did not meet specifications - bid alternate product for item 10

** Second apparent low-bidder did not meet specifications - bid no-bid for item 10

3-C Technology, LLC, Adorama, Inc., and OneScreen Solutions submitted no-bids

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Howard Technology Solutions Ellisville, MS HUB - No		Network Cabling Services, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB- No	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	Connectronics 4K/2K HDMI Cable v1.4 Ethernet Type-A Male to Make - 30 foot #HDMI-14-30	30	\$29.00	\$870.00	\$43.26	\$1,179.80
2	Crestron Electronics Saros Sound Bar 200, Powered, Black #SB-200-P-B	15	\$264.00	\$3,960.00	\$311.54	\$4,673.10
3	Dell 75" 4K Interactive Touch Monitor #C7520QT	15	\$4,288.00	\$64,320.00	\$4,805.18	\$72,077.70

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Digital Resources, Inc. Southlake, TX HUB - Yes		Evco Partners LP dba Burgoon Company Texas City, TX HUB - Yes	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Connectronics 4K/2K HDMI Cable v1.4 Ethernet Type-A Male to Make - 30 foot #HDMI-14-30	30	\$30.45	\$913.50	\$39.19	\$1,175.70
2	Crestron Electronics Saros Sound Bar 200, Powered, Black #SB-200-P-B	15	\$294.12	\$4,411.80	\$438.46	\$6,576.90
3	Dell 75" 4K Interactive Touch Monitor #C7520QT	15	\$5,145.44	\$77,181.60	\$5,600.00	\$84,000.00

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

AWARD

Item Number	Description	Qty	*Ford Audio Video Systems LLC Oklahoma City, OK HUB - Yes		**AVI-SPL, LLC Tampa, FL HUB - No		Pro Sound, Inc. Miami, FL HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
4	Kramer Electronics 3.5mm Male to IR Receiver Control Cable 3' #C-A35M/IRRN-3	15	\$8.50	\$127.50	\$8.11	\$121.65	\$10.25	\$153.75
5	Kramer Electronics Infared Remote Control #RC-IR3	15	\$88.00	\$1,320.00	\$83.95	\$1,259.25	\$90.00	\$950.00
6	Kramer Electronics 4x2 UHD HDMI Matrix Switcher #VS-42UHD	15	\$583.00	\$8,745.00	\$492.11	\$7,381.65	\$509.00	\$7,635.00

*Apparent low-bidder did not meet specifications - bid alternate product for item 10

** Second apparent low-bidder did not meet specifications - bid no-bid for item 10

3-C Technology, LLC, Adorama, Inc., and OneScreen Solutions submitted no-bids

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Howard Technology Solutions Ellisville, MS HUB - No		Network Cabling Services, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB- No	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Total Price
4	Kramer Electronics 3.5mm Male to IR Receiver Control Cable 3' #C-A35M/IRRN-3	15	\$9.00	\$135.00	\$9.39	\$140.85
5	Kramer Electronics Infared Remote Control #RC-IR3	15	\$85.00	\$1,275.00	\$79.75	\$1,458.90
6	Kramer Electronics 4x2 UHD HDMI Matrix Switcher #VS-42UHD	15	\$491.00	\$7,365.00	\$576.78	\$8,651.70

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Digital Resources, Inc. Southlake, TX HUB - Yes		Evco Partners LP dba Burgoon Company Texas City, TX HUB - Yes	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
4	Kramer Electronics 3.5mm Male to IR Receiver Control Cable 3' #C-A35M/IRRN-3	15	\$8.85	\$132.75	\$15.98	\$239.70
5	Kramer Electronics Infared Remote Control #RC-IR3	15	\$91.67	\$1,375.05	\$129.92	\$1,948.80
6	Kramer Electronics 4x2 UHD HDMI Matrix Switcher #VS-42UHD	15	\$543.60	\$8,154.00	\$751.63	\$11,274.45

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

AWARD

Item Number	Description	Qty	*Ford Audio Video Systems LLC Oklahoma City, OK HUB - Yes		**AVI-SPL, LLC Tampa, FL HUB - No		Pro Sound, Inc. Miami, FL HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
7	Liberty AV Solutions HDMI Premium 18G CBL w/NET 6' #HDPMM06F	20	\$12.00	\$240.00	\$11.37	\$227.40	\$13.75	\$275.00
8	Liberty AV Solutions Z100 3.5SM-L/R RCA Y 6' CBL #Z100AY6FT	15	\$5.80	\$87.00	\$4.65	\$69.75	\$7.50	\$112.50
9	Peerless-AV Motorized Height Adjustable Cart 42"-86" Displays #SR598ML3	15	\$1,208.00	\$18,120.00	\$1,143.95	\$17,159.25	\$1,229.00	\$18,435.00

*Apparent low-bidder did not meet specifications - bid alternate product for item 10

** Second apparent low-bidder did not meet specifications - bid no-bid for item 10

3-C Technology, LLC, Adorama, Inc., and OneScreen Solutions submitted no-bids

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Howard Technology Solutions Ellisville, MS HUB - No		Network Cabling Services, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB- No	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Total Price
7	Liberty AV Solutions HDMI Premium 18G CBL w/NET 6' #HDPMM06F	20	\$13.00	\$260.00	\$12.82	\$256.40
8	Liberty AV Solutions Z100 3.5SM-L/R RCA Y 6' CBL #Z100AY6FT	15	\$7.00	\$105.00	\$5.13	\$76.95
9	Peerless-AV Motorized Height Adjustable Cart 42"-86" Displays #SR598ML3	15	\$1,499.00	\$22,485.00	\$1,479.93	\$22,198.95

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description	Qty	Digital Resources, Inc. Southlake, TX HUB - Yes		Evco Partners LP dba Burgoon Company Texas City, TX HUB - Yes	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
7	Liberty AV Solutions HDMI Premium 18G CBL w/NET 6' #HDPMM06F	20	\$12.68	\$253.60	\$20.37	\$407.40
8	Liberty AV Solutions Z100 3.5SM-L/R RCA Y 6' CBL #Z100AY6FT	15	\$5.98	\$89.70	\$11.32	\$169.80
9	Peerless-AV Motorized Height Adjustable Cart 42"-86" Displays #SR598ML3	15	\$1,532.00	\$22,980.00	\$1,812.08	\$27,181.20

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

AWARD

Item Number	Description	Qty	*Ford Audio Video Systems LLC Oklahoma City, OK HUB - Yes		**AVI-SPL, LLC Tampa, FL HUB - No		Pro Sound, Inc. Miami, FL HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
10	Sanus Series 1 Soundbar Mount #SA405-B1	15	\$11.00 *alternate was not accepted	\$165.00 *alternate was not accepted	*No-bid	*No-bid	\$27.00	\$405.00
Total			\$88,120.50		\$90,020.10		\$95,166.25	

*Apparent low-bidder did not meet specifications - bid alternate product for item 10

** Second apparent low-bidder did not meet specifications - bid no-bid for item 10

3-C Technology, LLC, Adorama, Inc., and OneScreen Solutions submitted no-bids

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description		Howard Technology Solutions Ellisville, MS HUB - No		Network Cabling Services, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB- No	
		Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Total Price
10	Sanus Series 1 Soundbar Mount #SA405-B1	15	\$25.00	\$375.00	\$40.56	\$608.40
Total			\$101,150.00		\$111,322.85	

RFB 2021-131
PURCHASE OF AV EQUIPMENT FOR MOBILE DISPLAYS

Item Number	Description		Digital Resources, Inc. Southlake, TX HUB - Yes		Evco Partners LP dba Burgoon Company Texas City, TX HUB - Yes	
		Qty	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
10	Sanus Series 1 Soundbar Mount #SA405-B1	15	\$34.62	\$519.30	\$52.56	\$788.40
Total			\$116,011.30		\$133,762.35	