

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Alternate			
		Alert Patrol, Inc. Margate, FL HUB: No		Applied Operations Security and Investigation Services, Inc. HUB: Yes COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 1: Jury Parking Site Area					
Item 1: Unarmed Security Guard with Vehicle					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$10.00)		\$10.00		\$13.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.08		\$1.12	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.60		\$0.63	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.20		\$2.15	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$7.00		\$4.89	
Other		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	2,220	\$18.88	\$41,913.60	\$21.79	\$48,373.80

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

Secondary

		<i>Olympus Protection Arlington, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes</i>		Smith Protective Services Fort Worth, TX HUB: No	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 1: Jury Parking Site Area					
Item 1: Unarmed Security Guard with Vehicle					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$10.00)		\$10.00		\$14.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.10		\$0.90	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.42		\$0.80	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$1.00		\$0.30	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.50		\$11.35	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$2.00		\$2.99	
Other		\$2.00		\$0.18	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	2,220	\$17.02	\$37,784.40	\$30.52	\$67,754.40

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Primary	
		Vets Securing America San Antonio, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 1: Jury Parking Site Area			
Item 1: Unarmed Security Guard with Vehicle			
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$10.00)		\$11.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.15	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.84	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.10	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$2.13	
Other		\$2.51	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	2,220	\$17.73	\$39,360.60

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Alternate			
		Alert Patrol, Inc. Margate, FL HUB: No		Applied Operations Security and Investigation Services, Inc. HUB: Yes COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 2: Lynn W. Ross Site Area					
Item 1: Armed Security Guard					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$15.50)		\$15.50		\$15.50	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.50		\$1.89	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.60		\$0.96	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.13		\$2.15	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$8.45		\$5.10	
Other		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	928	\$26.18	\$24,295.04	\$25.60	\$23,756.80

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

Secondary

		<i>Olympus Protection Arlington, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes</i>		Smith Protective Services Fort Worth, TX HUB: No	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 2: Lynn W. Ross Site Area					
Item 1: Armed Security Guard					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$15.50)		\$15.50		\$16.50	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.70		\$0.90	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.65		\$0.80	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$1.00		\$0.30	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.50		\$1.08	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$2.00		\$13.21	
Other		\$1.50		\$0.18	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	928	\$22.85	\$21,204.80	\$32.97	\$30,596.16

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Primary	
		Vets Securing America San Antonio, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 2: Lynn W. Ross Site Area			
Item 1: Armed Security Guard			
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$15.50)		\$15.50	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.62	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$1.24	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.10	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$2.27	
Other		\$0.00	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	928	\$20.73	\$19,237.44

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Alternate			
		Alert Patrol, Inc. Margate, FL HUB: No		Applied Operations Security and Investigation Services, Inc. HUB: Yes COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 3: Resource Connection Site Area					
Item 1: Unarmed Security Guard with Vehicle					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$13.00)		\$13.00		\$13.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.31		\$1.12	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.60		\$0.96	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.20		\$2.15	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$8.31		\$4.56	
Other		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	8,760	\$23.42	\$205,159.20	\$21.79	\$190,880.40

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

Secondary

		<i>Olympus Protection Arlington, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes</i>		Smith Protective Services Fort Worth, TX HUB: No	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 3: Resource Connection Site Area					
Item 1: Unarmed Security Guard with Vehicle					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$13.00)		\$13.00		\$14.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.42		\$0.90	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.55		\$0.80	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$1.00		\$0.30	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.50		\$4.50	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$2.00		\$3.50	
Other		\$2.00		\$0.18	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	8,760	\$20.47	\$179,317.20	\$24.18	\$211,816.80

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Primary	
		Vets Securing America San Antonio, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 3: Resource Connection Site Area			
Item 1: Unarmed Security Guard with Vehicle			
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$13.00)		\$13.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.36	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$1.14	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.10	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$2.13	
Other		\$1.58	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	8,760	\$19.31	\$169,155.60

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Alternate			
		Alert Patrol, Inc. Margate, FL HUB: No		Applied Operations Security and Investigation Services, Inc. HUB: Yes COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 3: Resource Connection Site Area					
Item 2: Unarmed Security Guard with Golf Cart					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$13.00)		\$13.00		\$13.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.31		\$1.12	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.60		\$0.96	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.20		\$2.15	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$8.31		\$4.56	
Other		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	1	\$23.42	\$23.42	\$21.79	\$21.79

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

Secondary

		<i>Olympus Protection Arlington, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes</i>		Smith Protective Services Fort Worth, TX HUB: No	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 3: Resource Connection Site Area					
Item 2: Unarmed Security Guard with Golf Cart					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$13.00)		\$13.00		\$14.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.42		\$0.90	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.55		\$0.80	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$1.00		\$0.30	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.50		\$2.64	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$2.00		\$2.82	
Other		\$1.50		\$0.18	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	1	\$19.97	\$19.97	\$21.64	\$21.64

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Primary	
		Vets Securing America San Antonio, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 3: Resource Connection Site Area			
Item 2: Unarmed Security Guard with Golf Cart			
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$13.00)		\$13.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.36	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$1.14	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.10	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$2.00	
Other		\$0.45	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	1	\$18.05	\$18.05

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Alternate			
		Alert Patrol, Inc. Margate, FL HUB: No		Applied Operations Security and Investigation Services, Inc. HUB: Yes COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 3: Resource Connection Site Area					
Item 3: Unarmed Security Guard on Foot					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$13.00)		\$13.00		\$13.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.31		\$1.12	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.60		\$0.96	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.13		\$2.15	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$8.31		\$4.56	
Other		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	1	\$23.35	\$23.35	\$21.79	\$21.79
Total:			\$271,414.61	\$263,054.58	

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

Secondary

		<i>Olympus Protection Arlington, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes</i>		Smith Protective Services Fort Worth, TX HUB: No	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 3: Resource Connection Site Area					
Item 3: Unarmed Security Guard on Foot					
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$13.00)		\$13.00		\$14.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.42		\$0.90	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$0.55		\$0.80	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$1.00		\$0.30	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.50		\$1.80	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$2.00		\$10.48	
Other		\$0.00		\$0.18	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	1	\$18.47	\$18.47	\$28.46	\$28.46
Total:			\$238,344.84	\$310,217.46	

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.

RFB 2021-085
Annual Contract for Security Guard Services

		Primary	
		Vets Securing America San Antonio, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Description	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Price
Section 3: Resource Connection Site Area			
Item 3: Unarmed Security Guard on Foot			
Direct Wages to Employee (minimum of \$13.00)		\$13.00	
Federal, State Unemployment Tax, FICA, Medical Tax on Employee		\$1.36	
Worker's Compensation and General Liability on Employee		\$1.14	
Medical, Dental, Life Insurance, if applicable		\$0.00	
Retirement, Pension, etc., per Employee, if applicable		\$0.00	
Supplies, Equipment Cost/Upkeep/Depreciation		\$0.10	
Vendor's Overhead, Vendor Supervisor Pay, Profit, etc.		\$1.95	
Other		\$0.00	
Total Labor Rate, Per Hour, Billed to Tarrant County	1	\$17.55	\$17.55
Total:			\$227,789.24

Investigation Technologies, Inc. d/b/a International Investigators submitted a no bid.

ISF Security Group d/b/a Ameritex Guard Services was deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a signed Addendum.