

BID NO. 2021-043 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TACTICAL GEAR

			G T Distributors, Inc. Austin, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes			Kiesler Police Supply, Inc. Jeffersonville, IN HUB: No COOP: Yes		
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	UNIT	EXTENDED		UNIT	EXTENDED	
1.	Tactical Entry Body Armor Carrier System							
	Carrier Brand/Model:	25	\$1,433.00	\$35,825.00	S	NO BID	NO BID	
	Ballistics Brand/Model:	25	\$1,100.00	\$27,500.00	A	NO BID	NO BID	
	Chest & Rear Plate Brand/Model:	25	\$550.00	\$13,750.00	S	NO BID	NO BID	
2.	Tactical Assaulter's Ballistic Plate, Carrier, Standard, PICO-PRO	20	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Carrier Brand/Model:							
3.	Tactical Assaulter's Ballistic Plate, Carrier, Advanced, PICO-AA	20	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Carrier Brand/Model:							
4.	Tactical Dual-Comm Communication Headset	15	NO BID	NO BID		\$786.74	\$11,801.10	P
	Headset Brand/Model:							
5.	Tactical Helmet	15	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Helmet Brand/Model:							
6.	Tactical Drop Leg Holster	15	\$156.24	\$2,343.60	P	NO BID	NO BID	
	Holster Brand/Model:							

There are no secondary or alternate awards for item(s): 3, 5, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 15 because only one (1) bid was received.

There are no alternate awards for item(s): 2, 4, 6, 8 9 because only two (2) bids were received.

BID NO. 2021-043 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TACTICAL GEAR

			G T Distributors, Inc. Austin, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes		Kiesler Police Supply, Inc. Jeffersonville, IN HUB: No COOP: Yes			
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	UNIT	EXTENDED		UNIT	EXTENDED	
7.	Tactical Belt	15	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Belt Brand/Model:							
8.	Tactical Glove, Pair	15	NO BID	NO BID		\$15.11	\$226.65	P
	Glove Brand/Model:							
9.	Tactical Ballistic Eye Protection	15	NO BID	NO BID		\$60.48	\$907.20	P
	Eye Protection:							
10.	Tactical Shirt, Standard	40	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Standard Shirt Brand/Model:							
11.	Tactical Shirt, All-Weather	40	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	All-Weather Shirt Brand/Model:							
12.	Tactical Pant, Standard	40	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Standard Pant Brand/Model:							
13.	Tactical Pant, All-Weather	40	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	All-Weather Pant Brand/Model:							

There are no secondary or alternate awards for item(s): 3, 5, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 15 because only one (1) bid was received.

There are no alternate awards for item(s): 2, 4, 6, 8 9 because only two (2) bids were received.

BID NO. 2021-043 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TACTICAL GEAR

			G T Distributors, Inc. Austin, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes		Kiesler Police Supply, Inc. Jeffersonville, IN HUB: No COOP: Yes			
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	UNIT	EXTENDED		UNIT	EXTENDED	
14.	Tactical Jacket	40	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Jacket Brand/Model:							
15.	Tactical Protective Gas Mask	15	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
	Gas Mask Brand/Model:							
Able to Conduct On-Site Fittings?			Yes			No		

There are no secondary or alternate awards for item(s): 3, 5, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 15 because only one (1) bid was received.
 There are no alternate awards for item(s): 2, 4, 6, 8 9 because only two (2) bids were received.

BID NO. 2021-043 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TACTICAL GEAR

			Municipal Emergency Services dba Lawmen Supply Company Houston, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes			U. S. Armor Corporation Santa Fe Springs, CA HUB: No COOP: Yes			
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	UNIT	EXTENDED		UNIT	EXTENDED		
1.	Tactical Entry Body Armor Carrier System								
	Carrier Brand/Model:	25	\$1,890.99	\$47,274.75	A	\$1,059.00	\$26,475.00	P	
	Ballistics Brand/Model:	25	\$791.37	\$19,784.25	S	\$518.00	\$12,950.00	P	
	Chest & Rear Plate Brand/Model:	25	\$134.02	\$3,350.50	P	\$618.00	\$15,450.00	A	
2.	Tactical Assaulter's Ballistic Plate, Carrier, Standard, PICO-PRO	20	\$210.90	\$4,218.00	P	\$234.00	\$4,680.00	S	
	Carrier Brand/Model:								
3.	Tactical Assaulter's Ballistic Plate, Carrier, Advanced, PICO-AA	20	\$404.60	\$8,092.00	P	NO BID	NO BID		
	Carrier Brand/Model:								
4.	Tactical Dual-Comm Communication Headset	15	\$790.24	\$11,853.60	S	NO BID	NO BID		
	Headset Brand/Model:								
5.	Tactical Helmet	15	\$550.00	\$8,250.00	P	NO BID	NO BID		
	Helmet Brand/Model:								
6.	Tactical Drop Leg Holster	15	\$177.88	\$2,668.20	S	NO BID	NO BID		
	Holster Brand/Model:								

There are no secondary or alternate awards for item(s): 3, 5, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 15 because only one (1) bid was received.

There are no alternate awards for item(s): 2, 4, 6, 8 9 because only two (2) bids were received.

BID NO. 2021-043 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TACTICAL GEAR

			Municipal Emergency Services dba Lawmen Supply Company Houston, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes			U. S. Armor Corporation Santa Fe Springs, CA HUB: No COOP: Yes		
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	UNIT	EXTENDED		UNIT	EXTENDED	
7.	Tactical Belt	15	\$74.09	\$1,111.35	P	NO BID	NO BID	
	Belt Brand/Model:							
8.	Tactical Glove, Pair	15	<i>\$16.86</i>	<i>\$252.90</i>	<i>S</i>	NO BID	NO BID	
	Glove Brand/Model:							
9.	Tactical Ballistic Eye Protection	15	<i>\$93.46</i>	<i>\$1,401.90</i>	<i>S</i>	NO BID	NO BID	
	Eye Protection:							
10.	Tactical Shirt, Standard	40	\$49.00	\$1,960.00	P	NO BID	NO BID	
	Standard Shirt Brand/Model:							
11.	Tactical Shirt, All-Weather	40	\$62.67	\$2,506.80	P	NO BID	NO BID	
	All-Weather Shirt Brand/Model:							
12.	Tactical Pant, Standard	40	\$49.00	\$1,960.00	P	NO BID	NO BID	
	Standard Pant Brand/Model:							
13.	Tactical Pant, All-Weather	40	\$78.53	\$3,141.20	P	NO BID	NO BID	
	All-Weather Pant Brand/Model:							

There are no secondary or alternate awards for item(s): 3, 5, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 15 because only one (1) bid was received.
 There are no alternate awards for item(s): 2, 4, 6, 8 9 because only two (2) bids were received.

BID NO. 2021-043 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TACTICAL GEAR

			Municipal Emergency Services dba Lawmen Supply Company Houston, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes		U. S. Armor Corporation Santa Fe Springs, CA HUB: No COOP: Yes		
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	UNIT	EXTENDED		UNIT	EXTENDED
14.	Tactical Jacket	40	\$97.43	\$3,897.20	P	NO BID	NO BID
	Jacket Brand/Model:						
15.	Tactical Protective Gas Mask	15	\$493.57	\$7,403.55	P	NO BID	NO BID
	Gas Mask Brand/Model:						
Able to Conduct On-Site Fittings?			Yes			Yes	

There are no secondary or alternate awards for item(s): 3, 5, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 15 because only one (1) bid was received.
 There are no alternate awards for item(s): 2, 4, 6, 8 9 because only two (2) bids were received.