

RFB 2021-024

Annual Contract for DNA Laboratory Long Term Freezer Storage

| | | | D.A.I. Scientific Equipment Mundelein, IL HUB: No | | VWR International, LLC Suwanee, GA HUB: No COOP: No Primary | | Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes Secondary | |
|------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------|------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------|
| Item | Description | Qty. | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 1. | DNA Laboratory Freezer (Fisher catalog #TSX5030FA or approved equivalent) Minimum Requirements: • Capable of maintaining samples at -20 degrees C as a setpoint • 50 – 55 cu. ft. Storage Capacity • Double Door Style • NEMA 5-15 plug preferred; NEMA 5-20 also acceptable. • 115 V 60 Hz electrical requirement • Auto Defrost • Minimum one (1) year warranty • Door Locks • Includes inside delivery, unpacking, set up, and testing. | 3 | \$4,601.18 | \$13,803.54 | \$10,010.41 | \$30,031.23 | \$11,510.10 | \$34,530.30 |
| | | | D.A.I. Scientific | DAI-HC-SSP-49FA | Thermo Scientific | TSX5030FA | <i>Thermo Scientific</i> | <i>TSX5030FA</i> |
| 2. | Optional: A compatible temperature monitoring probe capable of transmitting data to a computer or smartphone via both wireless and networked interfaces | 3 | \$257.65 | \$772.95 | \$45.50 | \$136.50 | \$233.28 | \$699.84 |
| 3. | Optional: Temperature chart recorder with appropriate temperature range, minimum of seven (7) days recording | 3 | \$1,369.41 | \$4,108.23 | \$780.80 | \$2,342.40 | \$1,976.40 | \$5,929.20 |
| 4. | Optional: Certificate of Calibration | 3 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | <i>No Bid</i> | <i>No Bid</i> |
| 5. | Optional: Surge Protector | 3 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | <i>No Bid</i> | <i>No Bid</i> |

Thomas Scientific Holdings, LLC was deemed non-responsive for failure to complete the price form as required.

D.A.I. Scientific Equipment - Freezer bid does not meet minimum specifications. It is smaller than specified.