

RFB 2020-192 Aggregate Road Surface Treatment

			PRIMARY		PRIMARY	
			CJA Enterprises LLP Collinsville, TX		Vulcan Construction Materials LLC San Antonio, TX	
			HUB	Yes	HUB	No
			Co-OP	Yes	Co-OP	Yes
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. USAGE IN TONS	UNIT PRICE PER TON		UNIT PRICE PER TON	
SECTION I - COVERSTONE						
1.	Coverstone Type B, Grade 3 SAC B Aggregate	5,000	\$13.50		No Bid	
2.	Coverstone Type B, Grade 4 SAC B Aggregate	75,000	\$28.00		\$32.00	
3.	Coverstone Type B, Grade 4 SAC B Aggregate	10,000	\$24.00		No Bid	
SECTION II - GABION STONE - TXDOT ITEM 459						
4.	Gabion Stone - 4 to 8 inch minimum, wire baskets	100	No Bid		No Bid	
5.	Gabion Stone - 3 to 6 inch minimum, wire baskets	100	No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION III - PEA GRAVEL						
6.	Pea Gravel, 3/4 inch or less in size, smooth surface, washed	500	\$12.50		No Bid	
SECTION IV - RIPRAP STONE - TXDOT ITEM 432						
7.	Riprap Stone - 12 inch	100	\$20.50		No Bid	
8.	Riprap Stone - 15 inch	100	\$21.00		No Bid	
9.	Riprap Stone - 18 inch	100	\$21.50		No Bid	
10.	Riprap Stone - 24 inch	100	\$23.00		No Bid	
SECTION V - ROCK						
11.	Rock, Belt Run, 1 1/2 inch	150	\$15.00		\$14.50	

RFB 2020-192 Aggregate Road Surface Treatment

			PRIMARY		PRIMARY	
			CJA Enterprises LLP Collinsville, TX		Vulcan Construction Materials LLC San Antonio, TX	
			HUB	Yes	HUB	No
			Co-OP	Yes	Co-OP	Yes
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. USAGE IN TONS	UNIT PRICE PER TON		UNIT PRICE PER TON	
SECTION VI - SAND						
12.	Sand, Manufactured Type B - Grade Special -ASTM C33	500	\$9.00		No Bid	
13.	Sand, Washed - Fine Aggregate	100	\$5.00		No Bid	
14.	Sand, Cushion - Fine Aggregate - ASTM 33	100	\$5.00		No Bid	
15.	Sand, Manufactured	3,500	\$8.50		\$8.00	
DELIVERY CHARGES						
16.	Tandem Truck: Delivery Charge <i>F.O.B. Precinct Facility/Jobsite</i>		\$0.22/Ton	\$0.22/Mile	\$13.20/ton	\$0.22/Mile
17.	Tandem Truck: Minimum Delivery Charge		\$0.00		\$158.40	
18.	Tandem Truck: Minimum Delivery Size		25 Tons		12 Tons	
19.	Flowboy: Delivery Charge <i>F.O.B. Precinct Facility/Jobsite</i>		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20.	Flowboy: Minimum Delivery Charge		No Bid		No Bid	
21.	Flowboy: Minimum Delivery Size		No Bid		No Bid	
22.	Demurrage Charge		No Bid		No Bid	
23.	Normal Expected Delivery ARO:		24 hours ARO		5 Days	
Vendor - Plant Name			Address	City, Zipcode	Days of Operation	Hours of Operation
CJA Enterprises LLP - Martin Marietta Bridgeport			1795 STX 101	Bridgeport, TX 76426	Mon - Fri	4 am- Midnight
CJA Enterprises LLP - Martin Marietta Chico			856 FM 2952	Chico, TX 76431	Mon - Fri	4 am - Midnight
CJA Enterprises LLP - Vulcan Bridgeport			2560 TX 101	Bridgeport, TX 76426	Mon - Fri	6 am - 5 pm

RFB 2020-192 Aggregate Road Surface Treatment

			PRIMARY		PRIMARY	
			CJA Enterprises LLP Collinsville, TX		Vulcan Construction Materials LLC San Antonio, TX	
			HUB	Yes	HUB	No
			Co-OP	Yes	Co-OP	Yes
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. USAGE IN TONS	UNIT PRICE PER TON		UNIT PRICE PER TON	
	CJA Enterprises LLP - ARMCO Yuba OK		2650 Smith Rd	Hendrix, OK 74741	Mon - Fri	4 am- Midnight
	CJA Enterprises LLP - Martin Marietta Mill Creek OK		10435 Kelly Rd	Mill Creek, OK 74856	Mon - Fri	5 am -4 pm
	CJA Enterprises LLP - NTNSM Aubrey		9130 Ike Byron Rd	Aubrey, TX 76227	Mon - Fri	5 am - 5 pm
	Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC - Weatherford		89980 IH 20	Santo, TX 76472	Mon - Fri	24 hours