

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Caldwell Country Chevrolet  Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dodge City of McKinney  McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC  Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section I Police Package Vehicles (PPV)</b>						<b>Primary 2</b>	<b>Primary 1</b>
1.	<b>Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; RWD; 4-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$26,637.00 2021  Charger LDEE48 Yes 60-120 Days	No Bid	<b>\$26,466.00 2021  Charger Pursuit Yes 60-90 Days</b>	<b>\$24,145.00 2021  Charger LDEE48 Yes 90-120 Days</b>
2.	<b>Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; RWD; 4-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	<b>Primary 3 \$24,695.00 2021  Charger LDDE48 Yes 60-120 Days</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary 1 \$24,500.00 2021  Charger Pursuit Yes 60-90 Days</b>	\$24,865.00 2021  Charger LDDE48 Yes 90-120 Days
3.	<b>Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L; RWD; 4-Door</b>  Year Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

There are no awards for items 3 and 12 because only no bids were received.

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Chevrolet  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Ford  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford  Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Jim Bass Ford  San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section I Police Package Vehicles (PPV)</b>			<b>Primary 3</b>				
1.	<b>Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; RWD; 4-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>\$26,540.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Charger</b> <b>LDEE48</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2.	<b>Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; RWD; 4-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>\$24,598.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Charger</b> <b>LDDE48</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3.	<b>Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L; RWD; 4-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Lake Country Chevrolet Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section I Police Package Vehicles (PPV)</b>							
1.	<b>Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; RWD; 4-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2.	<b>Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; RWD; 4-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$25,360.00 2021 Charger Pursuit LDDE48 Yes 120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3.	<b>Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L; RWD; 4-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

# BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section I Police Package Vehicles (PPV)</b>				
1.	<b>Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; RWD;</b> <b>4-Door</b> Year Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
2.	<b>Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; RWD;</b> <b>4-Door</b> Year Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
3.	<b>Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L;</b> <b>RWD; 4-Door</b> Year Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Dodge City of McKinney	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge	Grapevine DCJ, LLC
			Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section II Police Package Pickup Truck</b>							
<b>4.</b>	<b>Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 4WD; Super Crew Year</b>  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>A.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>B.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>C.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>D.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>E.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>F.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>G.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Chevrolet  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Ford  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford  Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Jim Bass Ford  San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section II Police Package Pickup Truck</b>					<b>Primary 2</b>		
<b>4.</b>	<b>Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 4WD; Super Crew Year</b>  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$32,700.00 2021</b>  <b>F150 W1P Yes 90-120 Days</b>	\$34,127.00 2021  F150 W1P Yes 90-120 Days	No Bid
<b>A.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$329.00</b>	N/A	No Bid
<b>B.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>	N/A	No Bid
<b>C.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Included</b>	Standard	No Bid
<b>D.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$340.00</b>	\$450.00	No Bid
<b>E.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Included</b>	No Cost	No Bid
<b>F.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>	Standard	No Bid
<b>G.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$120.00</b>	N/A	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Lake Country Chevrolet	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
			Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section II Police Package Pickup Truck</b>							<b>Primary 3</b>
<b>4.</b>	<b>Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 4WD; Super Crew</b> Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$33,430.00 2021 F150 Police Interceptor Yes 90-120 Days	No Bid	<b>\$32,845.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>Responder W1F</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>150-180 Days</b>
<b>A.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$760.00	No Bid	<b>\$845.00</b>
<b>B.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>
<b>C.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>D.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$940.00	No Bid	<b>\$575.00</b>
<b>E.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>F.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>
<b>G.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Silsbee Ford
			Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section II Police Package Pickup Truck</b>			<b>Primary 1</b>	
<b>4.</b>	<b>Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 4WD; Super Crew</b> Year	0-5	<b>\$31,956.00</b> <b>2021</b>	\$37,392.00 2021
	Model & Model No.		<b>W1P</b>	W1P
	Pursuit Rated		<b>Yes</b>	Yes
	No. Delivery Days ARO		<b>120-140 Days</b>	90-120 Days
<b>A.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	<b>\$895.00</b>	\$445.00
<b>B.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	<b>N/A</b>	\$300.00
<b>C.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	<b>\$0.00</b>	\$0.00
<b>D.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	<b>\$1,050.00</b>	\$595.00
<b>E.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	<b>\$350.00</b>	\$0.00
<b>F.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	<b>N/A</b>	N/A
<b>G.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	<b>N/A</b>	N/A



## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dodge City of McKinney McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section III Police Package Mid-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
5.	<b>Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$31,031.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>AWD Pursuit</b> <b>WDEE75</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>60-120 Days</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$30,650.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Durango</b> <b>Pursuit</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	\$31,231.00 2021 Durango WDEE75 Yes 90-150 Days
6.	<b>Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$33,582.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>AWD Pursuit</b> <b>WDEE75</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>60-120 Days</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$33,200.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Durango</b> <b>Pursuit</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	\$33,807.00 2021 Durango WDEE75 Yes 90-150 Days

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Chevrolet  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Ford  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford  Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Jim Bass Ford  San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section III Police Package Mid-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
5.	<b>Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; AWD; 5-Door</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Pursuit Rated</div> <div style="text-align: right;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$30,330.00</b>  <b>2021</b>  <b>Durango</b> <b>WDEE75</b>  <b>Yes</b>  <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6.	<b>Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; AWD; 5-Door</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Pursuit Rated</div> <div style="text-align: right;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$32,906.00</b>  <b>2021</b>  <b>Durango</b> <b>WDEE75</b>  <b>Yes</b>  <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Lake Country Chevrolet Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section III Police Package Mid-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
5.	<b>Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$31,231.00 2021  Durango WDEE75 Yes 120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6.	<b>Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$33,807.00 2021  Durango WDEE75 Yes 120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

# BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section III Police Package Mid-Size Utility Vehicles</b>				
5.	<b>Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
6.	<b>Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dodge City of McKinney McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
7.	<b>Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8.	<b>Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Chevrolet  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Ford  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford  Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Jim Bass Ford  San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
7.	<b>Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$34,180.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>Utility</b> <b>Interceptor K8A</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	\$34,945.00 2021  Utility Interceptor K8A Yes 90-120 Days	\$36,259.00 2021  Utility Interceptor K8A Yes 100-110 Days
8.	<b>Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$30,998.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>Utility</b> <b>Interceptor K8A</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	\$31,794.00 2021  Utility Interceptor K8A Yes 90-120 Days	\$33,108.00 2021  Utility Interceptor K8A Yes 90-100 Days

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Lake Country Chevrolet  Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford  Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Reliable Chevrolet  Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale Country Ford  Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
7.	<b>Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; AWD; 5-Door</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div>  <div style="text-align: right;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Pursuit Rated</div> <div style="text-align: right;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$34,860.00 2021	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$33,835.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>K8A</b> <b>Yes</b>  <b>150-180 Days</b>
8.	<b>Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; AWD; 5-Door</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div>  <div style="text-align: right;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Pursuit Rated</div> <div style="text-align: right;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$31,740.00 2021	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$30,720.00</b> <b>2020</b>  <b>K8A FFV</b> <b>Yes</b>  <b>150-180 Days</b>

**BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES**

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Silsbee Ford
			Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
7.	<b>Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$32,994.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>K8A</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>120-140 Days</b>	\$36,559.00 2021  K8A Yes 90-120 Days
8.	<b>Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$29,843.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>K8A</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>120-150 Days</b>	\$33,325.00 2021  K8A Yes 90-120 Days



## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Dodge City of McKinney	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge	Grapevine DCJ, LLC
			Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>9.</b>	<b>For Explorer; 3.0L V6; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>H.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	\$495.00	No Bid	\$490.00	\$540.00
<b>I.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	\$136.00	No Bid	\$130.00	\$137.00
<b>J.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	\$120.00	No Bid	\$112.00	\$116.00
<b>K.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	\$600.00	No Bid	\$400.00	\$504.00
<b>L.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	No Charge	\$577.00
<b>M.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	No Charge	No Charge
<b>N.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	\$150.00	No Bid	\$400.00	N/A

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford	Jim Bass Ford
			Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>9.</b>	<b>For Explorer; 3.0L V6; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$34,888.00</b>  <b>2021</b>  <b>Utility</b> <b>Interceptor K8A</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	\$35,650.00 2021  Utility Interceptor K8A Yes 90-120 Days	\$36,964.00 2021  Utility Interceptor K8A Yes 90-100 Days
<b>H.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	N/A	No Bid	<b>\$375.00</b>	\$420.00	\$420.00
<b>I.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	N/A	No Bid	<b>\$49.00</b>	\$50.00	\$50.00
<b>J.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	Included	No Bid	<b>Included</b>	No Cost	Included
<b>K.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	\$340.00	No Bid	<b>\$340.00</b>	\$450.00	\$790.00
<b>L.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	\$530.00	No Bid	<b>Included</b>	No Cost	Included
<b>M.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	Included	No Bid	<b>Included</b>	\$273.00	\$610.00
<b>N.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	\$120.00	No Bid	<b>\$120.00</b>	\$50.00	N/A

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Lake Country Chevrolet	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
			Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>9.</b>	<b>For Explorer; 3.0L V6; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$35,620.00 2021  Sport Utility Interceptor Yes 90-120 Days	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$34,615.00</b> <b>2020</b>  <b>K8A ECO</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>150-180 Days</b>
<b>H.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	\$595.00	\$390.00	No Bid	<b>\$370.00</b>
<b>I.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.00	No Bid	<b>\$46.00</b>
<b>J.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	\$595.00	No Charge	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>K.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$977.00	No Bid	<b>\$545.00</b>
<b>L.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	\$595.00	No Charge	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>M.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$573.00	No Bid	<b>\$565.00</b>
<b>N.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Charge	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>9.</b>	<b>For Explorer; 3.0L V6; AWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$33,699.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>K8A</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>120-150 Days</b>	\$37,340.00 2021  K8A Yes 90-120 Days
<b>H.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	<b>\$395.00</b>	\$395.00
<b>I.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	<b>\$50.00</b>	\$50.00
<b>J.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	<b>Standard</b>	\$0.00
<b>K.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	<b>\$679.00</b>	\$385.00
<b>L.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	<b>No Charge</b>	\$0.00
<b>M.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	<b>\$610.00</b>	\$0.00
<b>N.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	<b>No Charge</b>	\$0.00

**BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES**

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dodge City of McKinney McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section IV Police Package Full-Size Utility Vehicles</b>			<b>Primary 1</b>		<b>Primary 3</b>		
10.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, 5.3L V8, 2WD; 5-Door</b> Year Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>\$33,075.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Tahoe CC10706</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>150</b> <b>Approximately</b>	No Bid	<b>\$33,500.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Tahoe 9C1</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>60-90 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid
11.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door</b> Year Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>\$35,875.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Tahoe CK10706</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>150</b> <b>Approximately</b>	No Bid	<b>\$36,300.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Tahoe 9C1</b> <b>Yes</b> <b>60-90 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid

**BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES**

			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford	Jim Bass Ford
			Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section IV Police Package Full-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
10.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, 5.3L V8, 2WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$33,795.00 2021 Tahoe 9C1 CC10706 Yes  90-120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$36,545.00 2021 Tahoe 9C1 CK10706 Yes  90-120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Lake Country Chevrolet  Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford  Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Reliable Chevrolet  Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale Country Ford  Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section IV Police Package Full-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
10.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, 5.3L V8, 2WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	\$33,718.00  2021  Tahoe 9C1 CC10706  Yes  90-120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$33,313.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>Tahoe CC15706</b> <b>Yes</b>  <b>65-85 Days</b>	No Bid
11.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	\$36,452.00  2021  Tahoe 9C1 CK10706  Yes  90-120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$36,061.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>Tahoe CK15706</b> <b>Yes</b>  <b>65-85 Days</b>	No Bid

# BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford  Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee Ford  Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section IV Police Package Full-Size Utility Vehicles</b>				
10.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, 5.3L V8, 2WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
11.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. Pursuit Rated  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid



## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Dodge City of McKinney	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge	Grapevine DCJ, LLC
			Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>O.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	<b>\$704.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$450.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
<b>P.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	<b>\$25.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$88.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Q.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid	<b>No Charge</b>	No Bid	No Bid
<b>R.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	<b>\$585.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$380.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
<b>S.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid	<b>No Charge</b>	No Bid	No Bid
<b>T.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid	<b>No Charge</b>	No Bid	No Bid
<b>U.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	<b>\$44.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$300.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Section I Special Service Sedans</b>							
<b>12.</b>	<b>Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L PHEV; FWD; 4-Door</b>  Year Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Chevrolet  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Ford  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford  Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Jim Bass Ford  San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>O.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	\$495.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>P.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	\$27.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Q.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	Included	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>R.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	\$340.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>S.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	Included	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>T.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	Included	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>U.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	\$120.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Section I Special Service Sedans</b>							
<b>12.</b>	<b>Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L PHEV; FWD; 4-Door</b>  Year Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Lake Country Chevrolet	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
			Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>O.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	\$794.00	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$705.00</b>	No Bid
<b>P.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	\$23.00	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$23.00</b>	No Bid
<b>Q.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
<b>R.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	\$590.00	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$500.00</b>	No Bid
<b>S.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Standard</b>	No Bid
<b>T.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Standard</b>	No Bid
<b>U.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>	No Bid
<b>Section I Special Service Sedans</b>							
<b>12.</b>	<b>Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L PHEV; FWD; 4-Door</b>  Year Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Silsbee Ford
			Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>O.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
<b>P.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Q.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
<b>R.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
<b>S.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
<b>T.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
<b>U.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Section I Special Service Sedans</b>				
<b>12.</b>	<b>Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L PHEV; FWD; 4-Door</b>  Year Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Caldwell Country Chevrolet  Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dodge City of McKinney  McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC  Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section II Special Service Pickup Truck</b>			<b>Primary 2</b>				
13.	<b>Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>\$25,775.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>CC10543</b> <b>150</b> <b>Approximately</b>	No Bid	\$27,600.00 2021  Silverado 5W4  75-95 Days	No Bid	No Bid
14.	<b>Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>\$27,989.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>CK10543</b> <b>150</b> <b>Approximately</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$28,800.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>Silverado 5W4</b>  <b>75-95 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid
15.	<b>Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Chevrolet  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Ford  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford  Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Jim Bass Ford  San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section II Special Service Pickup Truck</b>				<b>Primary 1</b>			
13.	<b>Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	<b>\$25,720.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Silverado 5W4</b> <b>CC10543</b>  <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14.	<b>Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	<b>\$28,020.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Silverado 5W4</b> <b>CK10543</b>  <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15.	<b>Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$28,876.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>F150 XL 4X2</b> <b>W1C</b>  <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Lake Country Chevrolet  Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford  Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Reliable Chevrolet  Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale Country Ford  Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section II Special Service Pickup Truck</b>			<b>Primary 3</b>				
13.	<b>Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>\$26,542.00</b>  2021  <b>CC10543</b>  <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$26,621.00  2021  Crewcab SSV CC15543  65-85 Days	No Bid
14.	<b>Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	\$28,801.00  2021  CK10543  90-120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	\$28,894.00  2021  Crewcab SSV CK15543  65-85 Days	No Bid
15.	<b>Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$28,580.00</b>  2021  <b>W1C</b>  <b>150-180 Days</b>

# BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section II Special Service Pickup Truck</b>				
13.	<b>Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
14.	<b>Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
15.	<b>Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No.  No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$28,903.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>W1C</b> <b>120-150 Days</b>	\$31,714.00 2021  W1C 90-120 Days



## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dodge City of McKinney McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
16.	<b>Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17.	<b>Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18.	<b>Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford	Jim Bass Ford
			Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
16.	<b>Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$31,597.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>F150 XL 4X4</b> <b>W1E</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid
17.	<b>Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$28,358.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>F150 XL 4X2</b> <b>W1C</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid
18.	<b>Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$31,029.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>F150 XL 4X4</b> <b>W1E</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Lake Country Chevrolet  Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford  Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Reliable Chevrolet  Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale Country Ford  Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
16.	<b>Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div> <div style="text-align: center;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: center;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$30,175.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>W1E</b> <b>150-180 Days</b>
17.	<b>Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div> <div style="text-align: center;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: center;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$27,990.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>W1C</b> <b>150-180 Days</b>
18.	<b>Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div> <div style="text-align: center;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: center;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$30,680.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>F150 SSV</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$30,235.00</b> <b>2021</b>  <b>W1C</b> <b>150-180 Days</b>

# BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Silsbee Ford
			Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
16.	<b>Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div> <div style="text-align: center;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: center;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	<b>Primary 2</b>  <div style="text-align: center;"><b>\$31,435.00</b></div> <div style="text-align: center;"><b>2021</b></div> <div style="text-align: center;"><b>W1E</b></div> <div style="text-align: center;"><b>120-150 Days</b></div>	\$34,910.00 2021  W1E 90-120 Days
17.	<b>Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div> <div style="text-align: center;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: center;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	<b>Primary 3</b>  <div style="text-align: center;"><b>\$28,385.00</b></div> <div style="text-align: center;"><b>2021</b></div> <div style="text-align: center;"><b>W1C</b></div> <div style="text-align: center;"><b>120-150 Days</b></div>	\$30,790.00 2021  W1C 90-120 Days
18.	<b>Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  <div style="text-align: right;">Year</div> <div style="text-align: center;">Model &amp; Model No.</div> <div style="text-align: center;">No. Delivery Days ARO</div>	0-5	\$32,117.00 2021  W1E 120-150 Days	\$33,965.00 2021  W1E 90-120 Days

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Dodge City of McKinney	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge	Grapevine DCJ, LLC
			Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>19.</b>	<b>Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$26,848.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>RAM SSV</b> <b>DS6T98</b> <b>60-120 Days</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$26,500.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>RAM DS6T98</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	\$27,518.00 2021 RAM SSV DS6T98 90-125 Days
<b>A.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	\$897.00	<b>\$550.00</b>	\$400.00	<b>\$425.00</b>	\$570.00
<b>B.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	\$22.00	<b>N/A</b>	\$23.00	<b>N/A</b>	N/A
<b>C.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	\$0.00	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Charge	<b>No Charge</b>	\$44.00
<b>D.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	\$545.00	<b>\$850.00</b>	\$400.00	<b>\$400.00</b>	\$505.00
<b>E.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	\$0.00	<b>\$95.00</b>	No Charge	<b>No Charge</b>	\$97.00
<b>F.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	N/A	<b>N/A</b>	N/A	<b>N/A</b>	N/A
<b>G.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	\$65.00	<b>\$150.00</b>	\$380.00	<b>\$400.00</b>	N/A

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford	Jim Bass Ford
			Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>19.</b>	<b>Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$26,265.00</b>  <b>2021</b>  <b>RAM DS6T98</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>A.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	<b>N/A</b>	\$495.00	No Bid	N/A	No Bid
<b>B.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	<b>N/A</b>	\$27.00	No Bid	N/A	No Bid
<b>C.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	<b>Included</b>	Included	No Bid	N/A	No Bid
<b>D.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	<b>\$340.00</b>	\$340.00	No Bid	\$450.00	No Bid
<b>E.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	<b>See Attached</b>	Included	No Bid	No Charge	No Bid
<b>F.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	<b>N/A</b>	N/A	No Bid	Standard	No Bid
<b>G.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	<b>\$120.00</b>	\$120.00	No Bid	N/A	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Lake Country Chevrolet	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
			Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>19.</b>	<b>Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$27,774.00 2021  RAM DS6T98 120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>A.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	\$1,020.00	\$595.00	\$760.00	\$898.00	\$885.00
<b>B.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	\$23.00	N/A
<b>C.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
<b>D.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	\$590.00	\$625.00	\$940.00	\$550.00	\$575.00
<b>E.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	\$0.00	\$200.00	No Charge	\$0.00	\$0.00
<b>F.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	N/A
<b>G.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>19.</b>	<b>Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
<b>A.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	\$895.00	\$445.00
<b>B.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	N/A	\$0.00
<b>C.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	Standard	\$0.00
<b>D.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	\$1,050.00	\$595.00
<b>E.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	\$350.00	\$0.00
<b>F.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	N/A	N/A
<b>G.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	N/A	N/A



## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dodge City of McKinney McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section III Special Service Mid-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
20.	<b>Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$28,480.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>SSV Durango</b> <b>WDDE75</b> <b>60-120 Days</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$27,999.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Durango SSV</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$28,705.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>SSV Durango</b> <b>WDDE75</b> <b>100-150 Days</b>
21.	<b>Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$30,307.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>SSV Durango</b> <b>WDDE75</b> <b>60-120 Days</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$29,900.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>Durango SSV</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$30,532.00</b> <b>2021</b> <b>SSV Durango</b> <b>WDDE75</b> <b>100-150 Days</b>

**BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES**

			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Chevrolet  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Ford  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford  Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Jim Bass Ford  San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section III Special Service Mid-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
20.	<b>Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21.	<b>Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Lake Country Chevrolet Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>Section III Special Service Mid-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
20.	<b>Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$29,305.00 2021 SSV Durango WDDE75 120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21.	<b>Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$31,132.00 2021 SSV Durango WDDE75 120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES**

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Section III Special Service Mid-Size Utility Vehicles</b>				
20.	<b>Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; RWD; 5-Door</b> Year Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
21.	<b>Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; RWD; 5-Door</b> Year Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dodge City of McKinney McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
H.	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	<b>\$550.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$425.00</b>	<b>\$572.00</b>
I.	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>
J.	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	<b>\$595.00</b>	No Bid	<b>No Charge</b>	<b>\$690.00</b>
K.	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	<b>\$850.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>\$505.00</b>
L.	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	<b>\$550.00</b>	No Bid	<b>No Charge</b>	<b>\$577.00</b>
M.	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid	<b>No Charge</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
N.	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	<b>\$150.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$380.00</b>	<b>N/A</b>
<b>Section IV Special Service Full-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
22.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$35,140.00</b>  <b>2021</b>  <b>CK10706</b> <b>Not Provided</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$35,650.00</b>  <b>2021</b>  <b>Tahoe 5W4</b> <b>60-90 Days</b>	No Bid	No Bid
23.	<b>Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Chevrolet  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Holiday Ford  Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford  Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Jim Bass Ford  San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
H.	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
I.	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
J.	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
K.	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
L.	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
M.	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
N.	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Section IV Special Service Full-Size Utility Vehicles</b>							
22.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	\$35,795.00 2021 Tahoe 5W4 CK10706 90-120 Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23.	<b>Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 3</b>  <b>\$37,998.00</b> <b>2020</b> <b>K1F</b> <b>90-120 Days</b>	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Lake Country Chevrolet  Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram  Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford  Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Reliable Chevrolet  Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale Country Ford  Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
H.	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
I.	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
J.	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
K.	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
L.	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
M.	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
N.	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Section IV Special Service Full-Size Utility Vehicles</b>						<b>Primary 2</b>	
22.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	\$36,382.00 2021 Tahoe 5W4 CK10706 Not Provided	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$35,545.00</b> 2021 <b>Tahoe</b> <b>CK15706/5W4</b> <b>65-85 Days</b>	No Bid
23.	<b>Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$40,710.00 2020 K1F 90-110 Days	No Bid	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$37,220.00</b> 2021 <b>K1F</b> <b>150-180 Days</b>

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Silsbee Ford
			Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
H.	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
I.	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
J.	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
K.	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
L.	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
M.	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
N.	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Section IV Special Service Full-Size Utility Vehicles</b>				
22.	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid
23.	<b>Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; RWD; 5-Door</b>  Year  Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$37,304.00</b>  <b>2021</b>  <b>K1F</b>  <b>90-120 Days</b>	\$40,326.00  2021  K1F  90-120 Days



## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Dodge City of McKinney	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Chevrolet	Ed Morse Automotive Freedom Dodge	Grapevine DCJ, LLC
			Caldwell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dallas, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Duncanville, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Grapevine, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>24.</b>	<b>Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 5-Door</b>  Year Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>O.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	\$704.00	No Bid	\$450.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>P.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	\$25.00	No Bid	\$89.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Q.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	\$0.00	No Bid	No Charge	No Bid	No Bid
<b>R.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	\$545.00	No Bid	\$380.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>S.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	\$0.00	No Bid	No Charge	No Bid	No Bid
<b>T.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	\$0.00	No Bid	No Charge	No Bid	No Bid
<b>U.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	\$44.00	No Bid	\$300.00	No Bid	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Holiday Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford	Jacksboro FM LLC, d/b/a Four Stars Ford	Jim Bass Ford
			Graham, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Whitesboro, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Jacksboro, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	San Angelo, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>24.</b>	<b>Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 5-Door</b>  Year Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary 3 \$40,699.00 2020 K1G 90-120 Days</b>	No Bid
<b>O.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	No Bid	\$495.00	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>	No Bid
<b>P.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	No Bid	\$27.00	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>	No Bid
<b>Q.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	No Bid	Included	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>	No Bid
<b>R.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	No Bid	\$340.00	No Bid	<b>\$450.00</b>	No Bid
<b>S.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	No Bid	Included	No Bid	<b>No Charge</b>	No Bid
<b>T.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	No Bid	Included	No Bid	<b>Standard</b>	No Bid
<b>U.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	\$120.00	No Bid	<b>N/A</b>	No Bid

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

			Lake Country Chevrolet	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
			Jasper, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Garland, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Richardson, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Rockdale, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
<b>24.</b>	<b>Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 5-Door</b>	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	\$43,240.00	No Bid	<b>Primary 1</b>  <b>\$39,975.00</b>
	Year Model & Model No. No. Delivery Days ARO				2020 K1G 90-110 Days		<b>2021</b> <b>K1G</b> <b>150-180 Days</b>
<b>O.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	\$794.00	No Bid	\$780.00	\$705.00	<b>\$845.00</b>
<b>P.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	\$28.00	No Bid	N/A	\$23.00	<b>N/A</b>
<b>Q.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	\$0.00	No Bid	No Charge	\$0.00	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>R.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	\$590.00	No Bid	\$984.00	\$500.00	<b>\$545.00</b>
<b>S.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	\$0.00	No Bid	No Charge	\$0.00	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>T.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>U.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	<b>N/A</b>

## BID 2020-174 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit Price	Unit Price
			Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Silsbee Ford
			Carrollton, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Silsbee, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>24.</b>	<b>Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 5-Door</b>	0-5	<b>Primary 2</b>  <b>\$39,990.00</b>	\$43,385.00
	Year		<b>2021</b>	2021
	Model & Model No.		<b>K1G</b>	K1G
	No. Delivery Days ARO		<b>90-120 Days</b>	90-120 Days
<b>O.</b>	Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb)	0-5	<b>\$695.00</b>	\$445.00
<b>P.</b>	Keyed Alike	0-5	<b>N/A</b>	\$300.00
<b>Q.</b>	Cloth Front Bucket Seats/Vinyl Rear Bench Seat	0-5	<b>Standard</b>	\$0.00
<b>R.</b>	Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal	0-5	<b>\$1,050.00</b>	\$595.00
<b>S.</b>	Color, other than White	0-5	<b>\$350.00</b>	\$0.00
<b>T.</b>	Rear-Air Conditioner	0-5	<b>Standard</b>	\$0.00
<b>U.</b>	Pre-Drilled Holes, Front Head Lamp Housing	0-5	<b>N/A</b>	N/A