

BID NO. 2020-131 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTRICAL POWER STRIPS AND POWER STRIP TOWERS

		Argent Associates, Inc. Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Dallas Digital Services, LLC Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		<i>Dealers Electrical Supply Company Fort Worth, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes</i>		
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)	
1	8-Outlet Power Strip with Surge Protection, 120V							
		1 - 50	\$ 66.90		\$ 22.11	*	\$ 58.00 S	
		51 - 100	\$ 64.12		\$ 22.11	*	\$ 57.00 S	
		101 - 500	\$ 59.94		\$ 21.00	*	\$ 56.00 S	
		Over 500	\$ 59.94		\$ 20.56	*	\$ 55.00 S	

		Lofton Innovation, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Mavich, LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes COOP: No		Primus Electronics Corporation Morris, IL HUB: No COOP: Yes		
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)	
1	8-Outlet Power Strip with Surge Protection, 120V							
		1 - 50	\$ 47.10	P	\$ 58.11	*	\$ 58.60 A	
		51 - 100	\$ 47.03	P	\$ 57.53	*	\$ 58.60 A	
		101 - 500	\$ 47.00	P	\$ 56.95	*	\$ 58.60 A	
		Over 500	\$ 47.00	P	\$ 56.37	*	\$ 58.60 A	

BID NO. 2020-131 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTRICAL POWER STRIPS AND POWER STRIP TOWERS

		Argent Associates, Inc. Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Dallas Digital Services, LLC Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Dealers Electrical Supply Company Fort Worth, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)
2	12-Outlet Vertical Power Strip, 120V						
		1 - 50	\$ 66.90		\$ 52.64	S	\$ 58.00 A
		51 - 100	\$ 64.12		\$ 52.64	S	\$ 57.00 A
		101 - 500	\$ 59.94		\$ 50.00	S	\$ 56.00 A
		Over 500	\$ 59.94		\$ 48.95	S	\$ 55.00 A

		Lofton Innovation, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Mavich, LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes COOP: No		Primus Electronics Corporation Morris, IL HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)
2	12-Outlet Vertical Power Strip, 120V						
		1 - 50	\$ 47.25	P	\$ 80.91		\$ 58.60
		51 - 100	\$ 47.25	P	\$ 80.10		\$ 58.60
		101 - 500	\$ 47.15	P	\$ 78.48		\$ 58.60
		Over 500	\$ 47.10	P	\$ 78.48		\$ 58.60

BID NO. 2020-131 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTRICAL POWER STRIPS AND POWER STRIP TOWERS

		Argent Associates, Inc. Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Dallas Digital Services, LLC Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Dealers Electrical Supply Company Fort Worth, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)
3	20-Outlet Vertical Power Strip, 120V						
		1 - 50	\$ 75.00		\$ 63.16	S	\$ 64.50 A
		51 - 100	\$ 71.88		\$ 63.18	S	\$ 63.50 A
		101 - 500	\$ 67.19		\$ 60.00	S	\$ 62.50 A
		Over 500	\$ 67.19		\$ 58.74	S	\$ 61.50 A

		Lofton Innovation, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Mavich, LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes COOP: No		Primus Electronics Corporation Morris, IL HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)
3	20-Outlet Vertical Power Strip, 120V						
		1 - 50	\$ 56.70	P	\$ 71.92		\$ 65.72
		51 - 100	\$ 56.70	P	\$ 71.20		\$ 65.72
		101 - 500	\$ 56.50	P	\$ 70.48		\$ 65.72
		Over 500	\$ 56.50	P	\$ 69.76		\$ 65.72

BID NO. 2020-131 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTRICAL POWER STRIPS AND POWER STRIP TOWERS

		Argent Associates, Inc. Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Dallas Digital Services, LLC Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Dealers Electrical Supply Company Fort Worth, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes		
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)	
4	Electric Power Strip Tower with 8.4A USB Surge Protection, 8-Outlet Plugs, 1250/2500W	1 - 50	\$ 24.90	**	\$ 22.11	**	No Bid	
		51 - 100	\$ 23.87	**	\$ 22.11	**	No Bid	
		101 - 500	\$ 22.31	**	\$ 21.00	**	No Bid	
		Over 500	\$ 22.31	**	\$ 20.56	**	No Bid	

		Lofton Innovation, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Mavich, LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes COOP: No		Primus Electronics Corporation Morris, IL HUB: No COOP: Yes		
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)	
4	Electric Power Strip Tower with 8.4A USB Surge Protection, 8-Outlet Plugs, 1250/2500W	1 - 50	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		51 - 100	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		101 - 500	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		Over 500	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

BID NO. 2020-131 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTRICAL POWER STRIPS AND POWER STRIP TOWERS

			Argent Associates, Inc. Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Dallas Digital Services, LLC Colleyville, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Dealers Electrical Supply Company Fort Worth, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)	
5	IF BIDDING ALTERNATE PRODUCT:							
		1 - 50	\$ 93.90	***	No Bid		No Bid	
		51 - 100	\$ 89.99	***	No Bid		No Bid	
		101 - 500	\$ 84.19	***	No Bid		No Bid	
		Over 500	\$ 84.19	***	No Bid		No Bid	

			Lofton Innovation, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB: Yes COOP: Yes		Mavich, LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes COOP: No		Primus Electronics Corporation Morris, IL HUB: No COOP: Yes	
Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)		Net Price Each (\$)	
5	IF BIDDING ALTERNATE PRODUCT:							
		1 - 50	\$ 26.00	***	No Bid		No Bid	
		51 - 100	\$ 26.00	***	No Bid		No Bid	
		101 - 500	\$ 26.00	***	No Bid		No Bid	
		Over 500	\$ 26.00	***	No Bid		No Bid	

