

BID NO. 2019-202 NORTHEAST COURTHOUSE FURNISHINGS SHELL FINISH OUT

WRG, LLC Carrollton, TX HUB - Yes	Corporate Source LTD. Dallas, TX HUB - Yes	Furniture By William Webb Carrollton, TX HUB - No
---	---	--

KEY	SUB ID#	MFG.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
SECTION I: DESK, BOOKCASES AND TABLES							
DU-1A	A1-1	National Office Furniture	U-Shaped Desk Unit, 72 x 36 Single Pedestal Desk Recessed Modesty	1	\$ 2,020.08	\$ 2,000.98	No Bid
DL-1A	A2-1	National Office Furniture	L-Shape Desk Unit w/Right Return, 30 x 66 Single Pedestal Desk Recessed Modesty	5	\$ 1,477.18	\$ 1,429.42	No Bid
DL-1B	A3-1	National Office Furniture	L-Shape Desk Unit w/Left Return, 30 x 66 Single Pedestal Desk Recessed Modesty	3	\$ 1,483.85	\$ 1,429.42	No Bid
BC-1	A4-1	National Office Furniture	Bookcase BC-1	1	\$ 416.01	\$ 385.20	No Bid
BC-2A	A5-1	National Office Furniture	Storage Bookcase BC-2A	5	\$ 671.27	\$ 672.54	No Bid
BC-2B	A6-1	National Office Furniture	Storage Bookcase BC-2B	3	\$ 679.60	\$ 672.54	No Bid
T-1	A7-1	National Office Furniture	Flip/Nest Training Table T-1	4	\$ 754.72	\$ 699.19	No Bid
SECTION II: CHAIRS							
C-1	B1-1	Humanscale	Task Chairs w/Carpet Casters - C-1	10	\$ 645.56	\$ 634.98	\$ 672.69
C-2	B2-1	Haworth	Guest Chair - C-2	20	\$ *393.27 Herman Miller	No Bid	\$ 433.00
C-3	B3-1	National Office Furniture	Conference Chair C-3	10	\$ 600.53	\$ \$572.83	No Bid
GS-1	B4-1	Spec Furniture	Ganged Waiting Chairs W/Arms and Wood Back, Upholstered Seat - GS-1B	4	\$ 404.09	\$ 291.70	\$ 476.00

BID NO. 2019-202 NORTHEAST COURTHOUSE FURNISHINGS SHELL FINISH OUT

WRG, LLC Carrollton, TX HUB - Yes	Corporate Source LTD. Dallas, TX HUB - Yes	Furniture By William Webb Carrollton, TX HUB - No
---	---	--

KEY	SUB ID#	MFG.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
-----	---------	------	-------------	----------	------------	------------	------------

SECTION III: FILES

LF-1	C1-1	Office Specialty	Metal Lateral File Cabinet -5 Dr. - LF-1	3	\$ 766.28	\$ 899.34	\$ 757.00
SC-1	C2-1	Office Specialty	Metal Storage Cabinet 30" x 18" - SC-1	1	\$ 499.34	\$ 644.94	\$ 449.00
MP-1	C3-1	Office Specialty	Mobile Pedestal - MP-1	1	\$ 395.15	\$ 494.18	\$ 380.00

SECTION IV: MISCELLANEOUS

WB-1	D1-1	Magnuson Group	2-Unit Recycling Trash Receptacle - WB-1	1	\$ 1,395.00	\$ 1,133.33	\$ 1,408.00
A-1	D2-1	Peter Pepper Products	Wall Mounted Battery Operated Clock - A-1	2	\$ 250.45	\$ 224.77	\$ 344.00
A-2	D3-1	Peter Pepper Products	Wall/Door Mounted Coat Hooks - A-2	11	\$ 21.96	\$ 21.39	\$ 32.00
A-3	D4-1	Rubbermaid	Individual Waste Basket - A-3	14	\$ 16.45	\$ 12.38	\$ 37.00
A-4	D5-1	Rubbermaid	Blue Medium Desk-Side Recycle Bin - A-4	14	\$ 15.71	\$ 12.38	\$ 37.00
A-5	D6-1	Clarus	Magnetic Glassboard with Box Tray and Magnets - Starphire Tempered	1	\$ 1,749.47	\$ 1,771.08	No Bid

**Award Recommendation: Corporate Source: Section I - All, Section II; B-1-1, B 3-1, B4-1, Section IV : All
Furniture By William Webb: Section II; B2-1, Section III; All
Section II *B2-1 Herman Miller Not an Approved Equal**