

# RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>Est. Qty Copies</b>	<b>SECTION I KONICA MINOLTA COPIERS</b>				
1		<b>BizHub 181</b>				
	1,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.20	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
2		<b>BizHub 222</b>				
	5,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.08	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
3		<b>BizHub 223</b>				
	158,777	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013 - S	*\$0.0145

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

# RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
4		<b>BizHub 250</b>				
	218,177	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
5		<b>BizHub 282</b>				
	89,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
6		<b>BizHub 284e</b>				
	1,200	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.30	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
7		<b>BizHub 363</b>				
	766,194	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013 - S	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
8		<b>BizHub 420</b>				
	286,072	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013 - S	*\$0.0145

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
9		<b>BizHub 421</b>				
	180,949	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
10		<b>BizHub 500</b>				
	37,764	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.05	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
11		<b>BizHub 501</b>				
	345,143	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	No Bid	<i>\$0.013 - S</i>	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	<i>\$200.00</i>	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	<i>0%</i>	5%
12		<b>BizHub 552</b>				
	431,403	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
13		<b>BizHub 600</b>				
	47,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.03	*\$0.0145 - S

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
14		<b>BizHub 754</b>				
	320,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	<i>\$0.009 - S</i>	\$0.013	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	<i>\$195.00</i>	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	5%	0%	5%
15		<b>Di3510</b>				
	20,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.03	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
16		<b>Di470</b>				
	5,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.10	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
17		<b>EP4000</b>				
	2,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.10	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
18		<b>BizHub C360</b>				
	79,430	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013	*\$0.0145 - S

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
	32,638	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.065 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.09	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
19		<b>BizHub C522</b>				
	160,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013	*\$0.0145 - S
	68,700	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.065 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.09	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
20		<b>BizHub C544e</b>				
	167,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0073 - P</b>	\$0.011 - S	\$0.013	*\$0.0145
	57,900	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.065 - P</b>	\$0.065 - S	\$0.09	*\$0.0590

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest



RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	\$195.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	5%	0%	5%
21		<b>BizHub C558</b>				
	533,500	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0059 - P</b>	\$0.009 - S	\$0.02	*\$0.0145
	81,600	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.045 - P</b>	\$0.055 - S	\$0.20	*\$0.0590
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	\$195.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	5%	0%	5%
22		<b>KM2530</b>				
	1,226	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.30	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
23		<b>KM5035</b>				
	15,500	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0125 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.1013	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
		<b>SECTION II KYOCERA COPIERS</b>				
24		<b>TASKalfa 3010i</b>				
	35,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013 - S	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
25		<b>TASKalfa 3011i</b>				
	263,400	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0041 - P</b>	No Bid	<i>\$0.013 - S</i>	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	<i>\$200.00</i>	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	<i>0%</i>	5%
26		<b>TASKalfa 3212i</b>				
	245,323	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0041 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
27		<b>TASKalfa 3500i</b>				
	46,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	<i>\$0.013 - S</i>	*\$0.0145

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
28		<b>TASKalfa 3501i</b>				
	1,493,935	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013 - S	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
29		<b>TASKalfa 3511i</b>				
	30,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
30		<b>TASKalfa 4002i</b>				
	866,972	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0041 - P</b>	No Bid	<i>\$0.013 - S</i>	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	<i>\$200.00</i>	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	<i>0%</i>	5%
31		<b>TASKalfa 4500i</b>				
	199,173	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	<i>\$0.013 - S</i>	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	<i>\$200.00</i>	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	<i>0%</i>	5%
32		<b>TASKalfa 4501i</b>				
	2,406,907	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	<i>\$0.013 - S</i>	*\$0.0145

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
33		<b>TASKalfa 5002i</b>				
	1,699,630	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013 - S	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
34		<b>TASKalfa 5500i</b>				
	100,396	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
35		<b>TASKalfa 5501i</b>				
	1,281,384	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	<i>\$0.013 - S</i>	*\$0.0145
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	<i>\$200.00</i>	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	<i>0%</i>	5%
36		<b>TASKalfa 6500i</b>				
	40,874	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
37		<b>TASKalfa 6501i</b>				
	1,977,562	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	<i>\$0.013 - S</i>	*\$0.0145

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
38		<b>TASKalfa 8001i</b>				
	60,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0045 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
39		<b>Taskalfa Color 2552ci</b>				
	5,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0068 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013	*\$0.0145 - S
	10,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.09	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest



RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
40		<b>Taskalfa Color 3050ci</b>				
	22,987	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0068 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013	*\$0.0145 - S
	14,487	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.09	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
41		<b>Taskalfa Color 3051ci</b>				
	315,512	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0068 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013	*\$0.0145 - S
	299,469	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.065	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
42		<b>Taskalfa Color 3252ci</b>				
	41,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0068 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
	12,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.15	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
43		<b>Taskalfa Color 3501ci</b>				
	41,588	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0068 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013	*\$0.0145 - S
	34,181	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.09	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
44		<b>Taskalfa Color 4052ci</b>				
	111,805	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0068 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.02	*\$0.0145 - S

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

# RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
	44,028	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.09	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
45		<b>Taskalfa Color 4551ci</b>				
	734,345	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0068 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013	*\$0.0145 - S
	179,210	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.09	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
46		<b>Taskalfa Color 5052ci</b>				
	450,413	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0068 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013	*\$0.0145 - S

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
	231,609	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.09	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
47		<b>Taskalfa Color 5551ci</b>				
	86,200	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	<b>\$0.0068 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.013	*\$0.0145 - S
	140,600	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Color</b>	<b>\$0.039 - P</b>	No Bid	\$0.065	*\$0.0590 - S
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	<b>\$69.95</b>	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	<b>22%</b>	No Bid	0%	5%
		<b>SECTION III RICOH COPIERS</b>				
48		<b>AF1075</b>				
	10,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.30 - S	*\$0.0145 - P

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

# RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	No Bid	No Bid	\$200.00	<b>\$200.00</b>
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	No Bid	No Bid	0%	<b>5%</b>
49		<b>AF3025</b>				
	5,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.10 - S	<b>*\$0.0145 - P</b>
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	No Bid	No Bid	\$200.00	<b>\$200.00</b>
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	No Bid	No Bid	0%	<b>5%</b>
		<b>SECTION IV TOSHIBA COPIERS</b>				
50		<b>E-Studio 757</b>				
	40,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	\$0.0175 - S	No Bid	\$0.04	<b>*\$0.0145 - P</b>
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	\$69.95	No Bid	\$200.00	<b>\$200.00</b>
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	22%	No Bid	0%	<b>5%</b>

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest

RFB 2019-177 Annual Contract for Copier Maintenance and Supplies

			Kyocera Document Solutions America, Inc. d/b/a Kyocera Document Solutions Southwest, LLC Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Novatech, Inc. Irving, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Electronic Risks Consultants, Inc. Phillipsburg, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	LogixService, Inc. dba AMTEK Computer Services San Clemente, CA HUB - No COOP - Yes
51		<b>E-Studio 857</b>				
	60,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	\$0.0175 - S	No Bid	\$0.03	<b>*\$0.0145 - P</b>
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	\$69.95	No Bid	\$200.00	<b>\$200.00</b>
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	22%	No Bid	0%	<b>5%</b>
52		<b>E-Studio 7508A</b>				
	325,000	A. Maintenance Agreement <b>Cost Per Copy - Black &amp; White</b>	\$0.0175	No Bid	<b>0.01 - P</b>	<i>*\$0.0145 - S</i>
		B. Labor Cost Per Hour in lieu of Maintenance Agreement	\$69.95	No Bid	<b>\$200.00</b>	<i>\$200.00</i>
		C. Percentage Discount Off List Price for Parts	22%	No Bid	<b>0%</b>	<i>5%</i>

P=Primary

S=Secondary

\* Recalculated to obtain Price Per Copy.

No Bids: Southwest Office Systems and Xerox Business Solutions Southwest