

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
<b>Section 1: Erosion Control Services</b>						
1	Silt Fence, by machine, installed	2000 LF	<b>\$2.90 - P</b>	<b>\$5,800.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
1A	Silt Fence, by hand, installed	500 LF	<b>\$4.90 - P</b>	<b>\$2,450.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
1B	Materials for item one, not installed	250 LF	<b>\$1.50 - P</b>	<b>\$375.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
2	Labor for repairs to existing erosion control	500 HR	<b>\$31.00 - P</b>	<b>\$15,500.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
3	Rock Berm Installed with rock provided by Vendor	1000 LF	<b>\$33.00 - P</b>	<b>\$33,000.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
3A	Rock Berm Installed with rock provided by Tarrant County	2000 LF	<b>\$22.00 - P</b>	<b>\$44,000.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
4	Erosion Mat, Straw, installed	5000 SF	<b>\$0.22 - P</b>	<b>\$1,100.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
4A	Materials for item four, not installed	500 SF	<b>\$0.12 - P</b>	<b>\$60.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
5	Erosion Mat, Excelsior Curlex, installed	5000 SF	<b>\$0.28 - P</b>	<b>\$1,400.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
5A	Materials for item five, not installed	500 LF	<b>\$0.18 - P</b>	<b>\$90.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
6	Filter Fabric, 6 ga. Wire, installed	100 LF	<b>\$6.20 - P</b>	<b>\$620.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.

Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**

*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
7	Stabilized Construction Entrance, installed	1000 SF	<b>\$1.40 - P</b>	<b>\$1,400.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
8	Sediment Control Log (SCL) (Straw), 9" diameter, installed	1000 LF	<b>\$4.40 - P</b>	<b>\$4,400.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
8A	Materials for item 8, not installed	100 LF	<b>\$2.80 - P</b>	<b>\$280.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
9	SCL (Straw), 12" diameter, installed	2000 LF	<b>\$5.70 - P</b>	<b>\$11,400.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
9A	Materials for item 9, not installed	500 LF	<b>\$4.40 - P</b>	<b>\$2,200.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
10	Erosion Mat, 12 oz. Permanent Turn Reinforcement Mat (TRM), installed	3000 SF	<b>\$0.82 - P</b>	<b>\$2,460.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
10A	Materials for item 10, not installed	300 SF	<b>\$0.66 - P</b>	<b>\$198.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
11	Sediment Control Log (Excelsior), 9" diameter, installed	1000 LF	<b>\$4.90 - P</b>	<b>\$4,900.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
11A	Materials for item 11, not installed	100 LF	<b>\$3.20 - P</b>	<b>\$320.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
12	Sediment Control Log (Excelsior), 12" diameter, installed	2000 LF	<b>\$7.10 - P</b>	<b>\$14,200.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.

Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
12A	Materials for item 12, not installed	500 LF	<b>\$5.40 - P</b>	<b>\$2,700.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total			<b>\$148,853.00 - P</b>		No Bid	
Minimum Site Visit Charges			<b>\$220.00</b>		No Bid	
Normal Delivery			<b>3 Days</b>		No Bid	
Expedited Delivery			<b>1 Day</b>		No Bid	
Cost for Expedited Delivery			<b>\$200.00</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Services			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Materials			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
<b>Section 2: Organic Erosion Control Services</b>						
1A1	Erosion Control Blanket, 1" seeded; installed; Summer Blend	1 SF	\$0.28 - S	\$0.28 - S	<b>\$0.18 - P</b>	<b>\$0.18 - P</b>
1A2	Erosion Control Blanket, 1" seeded; installed; Winter Blend	1 SF	\$0.27 - S	\$0.27 - S	<b>\$0.18 - P</b>	<b>\$0.18 - P</b>
1B	Erosion Control Blanket, 1" unseeded; installed	1 SF	\$0.26 - S	\$0.26 - S	<b>\$0.17 - P</b>	<b>\$0.17 - P</b>
1C1	Erosion Control Blanket, 2" seeded; installed; Summer Blend	1 SF	\$0.50 - S	\$0.50 - S	<b>\$0.36 - P</b>	<b>\$0.36 - P</b>
1C2	Erosion Control Blanket, 2" seeded; installed; Winter Blend	1 SF	\$0.49 - S	\$0.49 - S	<b>\$0.36 - P</b>	<b>\$0.36 - P</b>

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.  
Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND  
HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1D	Erosion Control Blanket, 2" unseeded; installed	1 SF	\$0.48 - S	\$0.48 - S	<b>\$0.34 - P</b>	<b>\$0.34 - P</b>
1E1	Erosion Control Blanket, 3" seeded; installed; Summer Blend	1 SF	\$0.72 - S	\$0.72 - S	<b>\$0.54 - P</b>	<b>\$0.54 - P</b>
1E2	Erosion Control Blanket, 3" seeded; installed; Winter Blend	1 SF	\$0.71 - S	\$0.71 - S	<b>\$0.54 - P</b>	<b>\$0.54 - P</b>
1F	Erosion Control Blanket, 3" unseeded; installed	1 SF	\$0.70 - S	\$0.70 - S	<b>\$0.54 - P</b>	<b>\$0.54 - P</b>
2A	Erosion Control Mulch Blanket, 1" unseeded; installed	1 SF	\$0.26 - S	\$0.26 - S	<b>\$0.18 - P</b>	<b>\$0.18 - P</b>
2B	Erosion Control Mulch Blanket, 2" unseeded; installed	1 SF	\$0.48 - S	\$0.48 - S	<b>\$0.36 - P</b>	<b>\$0.36 - P</b>
2C	Erosion Control Mulch Blanket, 3" seeded; installed	1 SF	\$0.70 - S	\$0.70 - S	<b>\$0.54 - P</b>	<b>\$0.54 - P</b>
3A1	Compost Filter Berms/Check Dams 1 ft. x 2 ft. seeded; installed; Summer Blend	1 LF	\$16.20 - S	\$16.20 - S	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>
3A2	Compost Filter Berms/Check Dams 1 ft. x 2 ft. seeded; installed; Winter Blend	1 LF	\$16.10 - S	\$16.10 - S	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.

Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND  
HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
3B	Compost Filter Berms/Check Dams 1 ft. x 2 ft. unseeded; installed	1 LF	\$16.00 - S	\$16.00 - S	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>
3C1	Compost Filter Berms/Check Dams 3 ft. x 5 ft. seeded; installed; Summer Blend	1 LF	\$85.20 - S	\$85.20 - S	<b>\$7.50 - P</b>	<b>\$7.50 - P</b>
3C2	Compost Filter Berms/Check Dams 3 ft. x 5 ft. seeded; installed; Winter Blend	1 LF	\$85.10 - S	\$85.10 - S	<b>\$7.50 - P</b>	<b>\$7.50 - P</b>
3D	Compost Filter Berms/Check Dams 3 ft. x 5 ft. unseeded; installed	1 LF	\$85.00 - S	\$85.00 - S	<b>\$7.50 - P</b>	<b>\$7.50 - P</b>
4A	Mulch Filter Berms/Check Dams 1 ft. x 2 ft. unseeded; installed	1 LF	\$15.00 - S	\$15.00 - S	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>
4B	Mulch Filter Berms/Check Dams 3 ft. x 5 ft. unseeded; installed	1 LF	\$78.00 - S	\$78.00 - S	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>
5A	Compost, Filter Tubes/Check Dams 8" Dia., no stakes; installed	1 LF	\$7.70 - S	\$7.70 - S	<b>\$2.50 - P</b>	<b>\$2.50 - P</b>
5B	Compost, Filter Tubes/Check Dams 8" Dia., with stakes; installed	1 LF	\$9.90 - S	\$9.90 - S	<b>\$2.75 - P</b>	<b>\$2.75 - P</b>

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.

Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
5C	Compost, Filter Tubes/Check Dams 12" Dia., no stakes; installed	1 LF	\$11.20 - S	\$11.20 - S	\$3.50 - P	\$3.50 - P
5D	Compost, Filter Tubes/Check Dams 12" Dia., with stakes; installed	1 LF	\$13.40 - S	\$13.40 - S	\$3.75 - P	\$3.75 - P
5E	Compost, Filter Tubes/Check Dams 18" Dia., no stakes; installed	1 LF	\$21.50 - S	\$21.50 - S	\$8.00 - P	\$8.00 - P
5F	Compost, Filter Tubes/Check Dams 18" Dia., with stakes; installed	1 LF	\$23.70 - S	\$23.70 - S	\$8.50 - P	\$8.50 - P
6A	Mulch Filter Tubes/Check Dams 8" Dia., no stakes; installed	1 LF	\$7.30 - S	\$7.30 - S	\$2.50 - P	\$2.50 - P
6B	Mulch Filter Tubes/Check Dams 8" Dia., with stakes; installed	1 LF	\$9.40 - S	\$9.40 - S	\$2.75 - P	\$2.75 - P
6C	Mulch Filter Tubes/Check Dams 12" Dia., no stakes; installed	1 LF	\$10.80 - S	\$10.80 - S	\$3.50 - P	\$3.50 - P

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.

Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

6D	Mulch Filter Tubes/Check Dams 12" Dia., with stakes; installed	1 LF	\$12.80 - S	\$12.80 - S	\$3.75 - P	\$3.75 - P
6E	Mulch Filter Tubes/Check Dams 18" Dia., no stakes, installed	1 LF	\$19.70 - S	\$19.70 - S	\$8.00 - P	\$8.00 - P

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
6F	Mulch Filter Tubes/Check Dams 18" Dia., with stakes; installed	1 LF	\$22.60 - S	\$22.60 - S	<b>\$8.50 - P</b>	<b>\$8.50 - P</b>
7A	Install Organic Filter Tube, 8" Dia.	1 LF	\$9.90 - S	\$9.90 - S	<b>\$3.50 - P</b>	<b>\$3.50 - P</b>
7B	Install Organic Filter Tube, 12" Dia.	1 LF	\$13.20 - S	\$13.20 - S	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>	<b>\$4.50 - P</b>
Section Total			\$595.55		<b>\$115.29 - P</b>	
Minimum Site Visit Charges			\$1,100.00		<b>\$1,200.00</b>	
Normal Delivery			3 Days		<b>7 Days</b>	
Expedited Delivery			1 Day		<b>3 Days</b>	
Cost for Expedited Delivery			\$200.00		<b>\$100.00</b>	
Discount for Related Services			0%		<b>0%</b>	
Discount for Related Materials			0%		<b>0%</b>	

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.

Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
S = Secondary

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
<b>Section 3: Hydromulch Services</b>						
1	Hydromulch Application per specifications per SF; installed	5000 SF	<b>\$0.09 - P</b>	<b>\$450.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
2	Medium Slope, Hydraulically-Applied, EFM Hydromulch; installed	5000 SF	<b>\$0.12 - P</b>	<b>\$600.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Brand Offered for Item 2			<b>Profile</b>		No Bid	
3	Steep Slope, Hydraulically-Applied, EFM Hydromulch; installed	2000 SF	<b>\$0.13 - P</b>	<b>\$260.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Brand Offered for Item 3			<b>Profile</b>		No Bid	
Section Total			<b>\$1,310.00 - P</b>		No Bid	
Minimum Site Visit Charges			<b>\$1,100.00</b>		No Bid	
Normal Delivery			<b>3 Days</b>		No Bid	
Expedited Delivery			<b>1 Day</b>		No Bid	
Cost for Expedited Delivery			<b>\$200.00</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Services			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Materials			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
<b>Section 4: Fiber</b>						
1	100% Pure Wood Mulch	1 Bag	<b>\$22.00 - P</b>	<b>\$22.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 1 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>50</b>		No Bid	

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.  
Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*



**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
2	Wood with Tac	1 Bag	<b>\$31.00 - P</b>	<b>\$31.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 2 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>50</b>		No Bid	
3	Hydro Blanket	1 Bag	<b>\$65.00 - P</b>	<b>\$65.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 3 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>50</b>		No Bid	
4	Wood Cellulose Fiber	1 Bag	<b>\$14.60 - P</b>	<b>\$14.60 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 4 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>50</b>		No Bid	
5	Guar Tacking Agent	1 Bag	<b>\$74.00 - P</b>	<b>\$74.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 5 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>10</b>		No Bid	
Section Total			<b>\$206.60 - P</b>		No Bid	No Bid
Minimum Site Visit Charges			<b>\$440.00</b>		No Bid	
Normal Delivery			<b>3 Days</b>		No Bid	
Expedited Delivery			<b>1 Days</b>		No Bid	
Cost for Expedited Delivery			<b>\$200.00</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Services			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Materials			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
<b>Section 5: Seed</b>						
1	Hulled Bermuda 95/85	1 Bag	<b>\$450.00 - P</b>	<b>\$450.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 1 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>50</b>		No Bid	
2	Unhulled Bermuda 95/85	1 Bag	<b>\$350.00 - P</b>	<b>\$350.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 2 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>50</b>		No Bid	

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.

Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**

*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
3	Annual Rye Grass 95/85	1 Bag	<b>\$50.00 - P</b>	<b>\$50.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 3 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>50</b>		No Bid	
4	Winter Wheat 95/85	1 Bag	<b>\$24.00 - P</b>	<b>\$24.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 4 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>50</b>		No Bid	
Section Total			<b>\$874.00 - P</b>		No Bid	No Bid
Minimum Site Visit Charges			<b>\$440.00</b>		No Bid	
Normal Delivery			<b>3 Days</b>		No Bid	
Expedited Delivery			<b>1 Day</b>		No Bid	
Cost for Expedited Delivery			<b>\$200.00</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Services			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Materials			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
<b>Section 6: Fertilizer</b>						
1	Water Soluble Fertilizer, 16/45/7	1 Bag	<b>\$225.00 - P</b>	<b>\$225.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 1 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>2.5 gallons</b>		No Bid	
2	Homogenized Fertilizer, 13/13/13	1 Bag	<b>\$19.00 - P</b>	<b>\$19.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Item 2 Bag Size In Pounds			<b>50</b>		No Bid	
Section Total			<b>\$244.00</b>		No Bid	No Bid
Minimum Site Visit Charges			<b>\$440.00</b>		No Bid	
Normal Delivery			<b>3 Days</b>		No Bid	

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.  
Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
Expedited Delivery			<b>1 Days</b>		No Bid	
Cost for Expedited Delivery			<b>\$200.00</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Services			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Materials			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
<b>Section 7: Top Soil</b>						
1	Topsoil, delivered	300 CY	<b>\$42.00 - P</b>	<b>\$12,600.00 P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Minimum Quantity per Delivery			<b>10 CY</b>		No Bid	
2	Topsoil, picked-up	300 CY	<b>\$29.00 - P</b>	<b>\$8,700.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Minimum Quantity per Pick-Up			<b>10 CY</b>		No Bid	
Section Total			<b>\$21,300.00 - P</b>		No Bid	
Minimum Site Visit Charges			<b>\$430.00</b>		No Bid	
Normal Delivery			<b>3 Days</b>		No Bid	
Expedited Delivery			<b>1 Days</b>		No Bid	
Cost for Expedited Delivery			<b>\$200.00</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Services			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Materials			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
<b>Section 8: Transition Mat</b>						
1	TM (4' X 4' panel), 8 anchors, installed	15 Panels	<b>\$255.00 - P</b>	<b>\$3,825.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.  
Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
Minimum Quantity per Delivery			4		No Bid	
Section Total			<b>\$3825.00 - P</b>		No Bid	
Minimum Site Visit Charges			<b>\$1,020.00</b>		No Bid	
Normal Delivery			<b>3 Days</b>		No Bid	
Expedited Delivery			<b>1 Day</b>		No Bid	
Cost for Expedited Delivery			<b>\$200.00</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Services			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Materials			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
<b>Section 9: Control Mat</b>						
1	Roll of 10' x 30', installed	2 Rolls	<b>\$2,390.00 - P</b>	<b>\$4,780.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Brand Offered for Item 1			<b>Flexamat</b>		No Bid	
<i>(Motz Enterprise Flexamat or approved equal)</i>					No Bid	No Bid
Minimum Quantity per Delivery			1		No Bid	No Bid
2	Roll of 10' x 30', delivered	2 Rolls	<b>\$1,470.00 - P</b>	<b>\$2,940.00 - P</b>	No Bid	No Bid
Brand Offered for Item 1			<b>Flexamat</b>		No Bid	
<i>(Motz Enterprise Flexamat or approved equal)</i>					No Bid	No Bid
Minimum Quantity per Delivery			1		No Bid	No Bid
Section Total			<b>\$7720.00 - P</b>		No Bid	No Bid
Minimum Site Visit Charges			<b>\$2,390.00</b>		No Bid	
Normal Delivery			<b>3 Days</b>		No Bid	
Expedited Delivery			<b>1 Days</b>		No Bid	

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.  
 Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*

**RFB NO. 2019-109 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EROSION CONTROL AND  
HYDROMULCH SERVICES AND MATERIALS**

			C. Green Scaping Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes		Soil Express, Ltd Gunter, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	
Item	Item	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
Cost for Expedited Delivery			<b>\$200.00</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Services			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	
Discount for Related Materials			<b>0%</b>		No Bid	

Non-Responsive: Hanes Geo Components for failure to bid all items within each Section as required.

Guaranteed Hydromulch, LLC and Justin Seed Company for failure to submit signed Addendum No. 1 as required.

**P = Primary**  
*S = Secondary*