
BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION
SUPPLYWORKS
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

JANA FOOD
SERVICE

ARLINGTON, TX
HUB-NO

PRAETORIAN 
OPERATING 

INC
dba CAMPBELL

PAPER CO
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

POLLOCK 
PAPER
GRAND 

PRAIRIE, TX
HUB-NO

EMPIRE
PAPER 

WICHITA FALLS, 
TX

HUB-NO

1 C FOLD PAPER TOWELS 17.07 16.34 13.99 18.14 15.44-S

2 ROLL PAPER TOWELS 0.003642 0.003976 0.003300 0.004000 0.049310

3 TOILET SEAT COVERS 23.00 25.05 29.11 24.37-S 34.63

4 PAPER BAGS 57 LB N/B 29.50 29.43-S 30.06 33.93

5 PAPER BAGS 8 LB N/B

38.90/2000
9.73/500 N/B

43.88/2000
10.97/500

42.76/2000
10.69/500-S

6 PAPER BAGS 4 LB N/B
54.95/4000

6.87/500
54.00/4000
6.75/500-S

54.16/4000
6.77/500

48.72/2000
6.09/500

7 FOOD HANDLER GLOVES IMP 8600L N/B 45.90/10,000 48.50/1,000 44.50/10,000-S N/B

8 FOOD HANDLER GLOVES EQUIVALENT IMP 8600L N/B 36.50/10,000-S 33.28/2,000 11.91/2,000 30.76/5,000

9 JUMBO TOILET PAPER 2 PLY 0.001790 0.001708 0.001400-S 0.002510 0.001900

10 DISPENSER FOR JUMBO TOILET PAPER 1 ROLL 17.00 12.25 16.70 16.25 14.41



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION
SUPPLYWORKS
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

JANA FOOD
SERVICE

ARLINGTON, TX
HUB-NO

PRAETORIAN 
OPERATING 

INC
dba CAMPBELL

PAPER CO
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

POLLOCK 
PAPER
GRAND 

PRAIRIE, TX
HUB-NO

EMPIRE
PAPER 

WICHITA FALLS, 
TX

HUB-NO

11 DISPENSER FOR JUMBO TOILET PAPER 2 ROLL 29.00 18.95-S 29.11 28.13 17.40

12 TOILET PAPER, 2-PLY SINGLE ROLL 0.002219 0.003208 0.000200 * 0.005700 0.000700 *

13 STYROFOAM TRAY WITH FLIP OVER LID 14.12 15.25 15.14-S 16.25 15.39

14 SCHOOL TRAY 6 COMPARTMENT N/B 35.00 33.25-S 45.60 N/B

15 STYROFOAM CUPS 6 OZ 12.95 14.55 13.85-S 14.27 14.08

16 LIDS FOR 6 OZ CUPS 9.19 9.99 9.59 9.70 9.57-S

17 STYROFOAM CUPS 12 OZ 21.50 23.59 23.40 23.70 23.34-S

18 LIDS FOR 12 OZ CUPS 12.82 13.50 13.28 13.28 13.10-S

19 STYROFOAM CUPS 16 OZ 31.37-S 34.49 34.00 34.20 34.12

20 PORTION CUPS 34.80 45.24 36.00-S 39.57 36.66

21 LIDS FOR PORTION CUPS 22.12 29.50 26.25 31.76 26.20-S

22 BOWLS 12 OZ 34.39 36.95 36.70 36.70 36.21-S

23 SQUAT BOWLS 8 OZ 17.15 18.69 18.10 18.30 18.06-S



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION
SUPPLYWORKS
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

JANA FOOD
SERVICE

ARLINGTON, TX
HUB-NO

PRAETORIAN 
OPERATING 

INC
dba CAMPBELL

PAPER CO
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

POLLOCK 
PAPER
GRAND 

PRAIRIE, TX
HUB-NO

EMPIRE
PAPER 

WICHITA FALLS, 
TX

HUB-NO

24 SQUAT BOWLS 4 OZ 16.10 17.59 17.15 17.18 17.13-S

25 BOWL LIDS 12.20 12.19 12.20-S 12.50 12.32

26 SANDWICH BAGS FOLD OVER 6 X 8 7.84 9.95 6.20 10.00 9.65

27 ZIPLOC GALLON STORAGE BAGS 36.00 13.95 13.60-S 37.66 16.64

28 QUILLON PAN LINERS N/B 29.95 31.58-S 36.10 38.15

29 FOOD WRAP 18" X 2000' 11.75 12.95 N/B 11.97-S 16.89

30 ALUMINUM FOIL HD 18" X 500' 16.75 22.95 17.87 17.87-S 36.11

31 FACIAL TISSUE 2 PLY 17.60 12.50-S 12.36 16.12 15.57

32 PRE STRETCH HANDFILM 6.60 N/B 5.29 5.94 N/B

33 SPOONS, WHITE 11.90-S 15.95 N/B 11.58 N/B

34 FORKS, WHITE MED WEIGHT 6.00 9.95 6.00-S 11.58 7.87

35 NAPKIN FULL FOLD 40.00 36.04-S 34.75 42.82 36.29

36 CONE CUPS 61.00 39.95-S N/B 39.71 46.28



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION
SUPPLYWORKS
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

JANA FOOD
SERVICE

ARLINGTON, TX
HUB-NO

PRAETORIAN 
OPERATING 

INC
dba CAMPBELL

PAPER CO
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

POLLOCK 
PAPER
GRAND 

PRAIRIE, TX
HUB-NO

EMPIRE
PAPER 

WICHITA FALLS, 
TX

HUB-NO

37 COFFEE CUPS WITH HANDLE 8 OZ N/B 67.95-S N/B 64.10 N/B

38 TABLE COVER PAPER WITH PLASTIC LINING N/B 25.95-S N/B 13.23 N/B

39 APRON, HEAVY WEIGHT 38.25/500 34.95/500-S N/B 37.85/1000 * 42.78/1000-S

40 PROPERTY BAG 36.50 47.95-S N/B 25.05 * N/B

41 ENMOTION TOWELS 51.50-S N/B 50.20 51.81-S 52.63

42 TOUCHLESS ROLL TOWEL 49.20 39.76-S 49.00 49.52 50.47

43 ENMOTION HC TOWELS 54.50 N/B 51.26 51.81 52.80

44 ENMOTION DISPENSER 15.00 N/B 12.22 13.75 11.93-S

45 TRASH CAN LINERS 24 X 24 18.96 14.25 11.78 13.87 14.15

46 TRASH CAN LINERS 40 X 46 10.85 9.29 10.81 12.58 13.05

47 TRASH CAN LINERS 43 X 47 1-10 CASES 12.00 13.95 12.54-S 16.57 17.15

TRASH CAN LINERS 43 X 47 11-20 CASES 12.00 13.87 12.54-S 16.57 17.15

TRASH CAN LINERS 43 X 47 21 OR MORE 12.00-S 13.79 12.54 16.57 17.15



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION
SUPPLYWORKS
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

JANA FOOD
SERVICE

ARLINGTON, TX
HUB-NO

PRAETORIAN 
OPERATING 

INC
dba CAMPBELL

PAPER CO
FT WORTH, TX

HUB-NO

POLLOCK 
PAPER
GRAND 

PRAIRIE, TX
HUB-NO

EMPIRE
PAPER 

WICHITA FALLS, 
TX

HUB-NO

48 TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 2.7 MIL 1-10 ROLLS 23.86 29.95 26.47 N/B N/B

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 2.7 MIL 11-20 ROLLS 23.86 29.87 26.47 N/B N/B

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 2.7 MIL 21 OR MORE 23.86 29.79 26.47 N/B N/B

49 TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 3.5 MIL 1-10 ROLLS N/B 36.95 35.07-S N/B N/B

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 3.5 MIL 11-20 ROLLS N/B 3.6.87 35.07 N/B N/B

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 3.5 MIL 20 OR MORE N/B 36.79 35.07 N/B N/B



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

1 C FOLD PAPER TOWELS

2 ROLL PAPER TOWELS

3 TOILET SEAT COVERS

4 PAPER BAGS 57 LB

5 PAPER BAGS 8 LB

6 PAPER BAGS 4 LB

7 FOOD HANDLER GLOVES IMP 8600L

8 FOOD HANDLER GLOVES EQUIVALENT IMP 8600L

9 JUMBO TOILET PAPER 2 PLY

10 DISPENSER FOR JUMBO TOILET PAPER 1 ROLL

COUNTRY
MAID SERVICES 

LLC
MANSFIELD, TX

HUB-YES

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
TAMPA, FL

HUB-NO

UNIPAK CORP
BROOKLYN, NY

HUB-NO

CENTRAL POLY
CORP

LINDEN, NJ
HUB-NO

ALL AMERICAN
POLY

PISCATAWAY, 
NJ

HUB-NO

16.25 20.98 N/B 17.79 N/B

0.0034062-S N/B N/B 0.005000 N/B

28.00 25.98 N/B N/B N/B

25.32 N/B N/B N/B N/B

45.50/2000
11.38/500 N/B N/B N/B N/B

63.28/4000
7.91/500 N/B N/B N/B N/B

N/B 38.90/10,000 N/B N/B N/B

31.25/10,000 38.90/10,000 N/B N/B N/B

0.001330 N/B N/B 0.002000 N/B

12.50-S 18.99 N/B 25.00 N/B



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

11 DISPENSER FOR JUMBO TOILET PAPER 2 ROLL

12 TOILET PAPER, 2-PLY SINGLE ROLL

13 STYROFOAM TRAY WITH FLIP OVER LID

14 SCHOOL TRAY 6 COMPARTMENT

15 STYROFOAM CUPS 6 OZ

16 LIDS FOR 6 OZ CUPS

17 STYROFOAM CUPS 12 OZ

18 LIDS FOR 12 OZ CUPS

19 STYROFOAM CUPS 16 OZ

20 PORTION CUPS

21 LIDS FOR PORTION CUPS

22 BOWLS 12 OZ

23 SQUAT BOWLS 8 OZ

COUNTRY
MAID SERVICES 

LLC
MANSFIELD, TX

HUB-YES

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
TAMPA, FL

HUB-NO

UNIPAK CORP
BROOKLYN, NY

HUB-NO

CENTRAL POLY
CORP

LINDEN, NJ
HUB-NO

ALL AMERICAN
POLY

PISCATAWAY, 
NJ

HUB-NO

20.00 50.75 N/B 32.99 N/B

0.001740 * N/B N/B N/B N/B

15.99 N/B N/B N/B N/B

34.41 N/B N/B N/B N/B

14.50 17.89 N/B N/B N/B

10.43 12.98 N/B N/B N/B

23.50 27.98 N/B N/B N/B

13.26 17.54 N/B N/B N/B

34.00 39.95 N/B N/B N/B

54.50 55.98 N/B N/B N/B

27.80 35.98 N/B N/B N/B

37.85 45.99 N/B N/B N/B

18.75 24.69 N/B N/B N/B



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

24 SQUAT BOWLS 4 OZ

25 BOWL LIDS

26 SANDWICH BAGS FOLD OVER 6 X 8

27 ZIPLOC GALLON STORAGE BAGS

28 QUILLON PAN LINERS

29 FOOD WRAP 18" X 2000'

30 ALUMINUM FOIL HD 18" X 500'

31 FACIAL TISSUE 2 PLY

32 PRE STRETCH HANDFILM

33 SPOONS, WHITE 

34 FORKS, WHITE MED WEIGHT

35 NAPKIN FULL FOLD

36 CONE CUPS

COUNTRY
MAID SERVICES 

LLC
MANSFIELD, TX

HUB-YES

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
TAMPA, FL

HUB-NO

UNIPAK CORP
BROOKLYN, NY

HUB-NO

CENTRAL POLY
CORP

LINDEN, NJ
HUB-NO

ALL AMERICAN
POLY

PISCATAWAY, 
NJ

HUB-NO

18.10 23.98 N/B N/B N/B

13.10 17.79 N/B N/B N/B

7.60-S 45.98 N/B N/B N/B

15.02 13.49 N/B N/B N/B

33.90 N/B N/B N/B N/B

15.50 N/B N/B 13.99 N/B

21.95 N/B N/B 28.89 N/B

13.95 15.89 N/B 16.92 N/B

N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B

16.95 N/B N/B N/B N/B

9.90 N/B N/B N/B N/B

38.50 N/B N/B N/B N/B

41.50 46.93 N/B N/B N/B



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

37 COFFEE CUPS WITH HANDLE 8 OZ

38 TABLE COVER PAPER WITH PLASTIC LINING

39 APRON, HEAVY WEIGHT

40 PROPERTY BAG

41 ENMOTION TOWELS

42 TOUCHLESS ROLL TOWEL

43 ENMOTION HC TOWELS

44 ENMOTION DISPENSER

45 TRASH CAN LINERS 24 X 24

46 TRASH CAN LINERS 40 X 46

47 TRASH CAN LINERS 43 X 47 1-10 CASES

TRASH CAN LINERS 43 X 47 11-20 CASES

TRASH CAN LINERS 43 X 47 21 OR MORE 

COUNTRY
MAID SERVICES 

LLC
MANSFIELD, TX

HUB-YES

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
TAMPA, FL

HUB-NO

UNIPAK CORP
BROOKLYN, NY

HUB-NO

CENTRAL POLY
CORP

LINDEN, NJ
HUB-NO

ALL AMERICAN
POLY

PISCATAWAY, 
NJ

HUB-NO

69.33 N/B N/B N/B N/B

27.68 N/B N/B N/B N/B

59.50/1000 N/B N/B N/B N/B

N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B

N/B N/B N/B 49.99 * N/B

39.75 N/B N/B 43.99 N/B

N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B

N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B

13.25 N/B N/B 9.90 34.54

16.35 N/B 8.20 9.60 10.91

18.25 N/B N/B 13.00 36.36

18.25 N/B N/B 13.00 14.53

18.25 N/B N/B 12.80 13.32



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

48 TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 2.7 MIL 1-10 ROLLS

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 2.7 MIL 11-20 ROLLS

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 2.7 MIL 21 OR MORE

49 TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 3.5 MIL 1-10 ROLLS

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 3.5 MIL 11-20 ROLLS

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 3.5 MIL 20 OR MORE

COUNTRY
MAID SERVICES 

LLC
MANSFIELD, TX

HUB-YES

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
TAMPA, FL

HUB-NO

UNIPAK CORP
BROOKLYN, NY

HUB-NO

CENTRAL POLY
CORP

LINDEN, NJ
HUB-NO

ALL AMERICAN
POLY

PISCATAWAY, 
NJ

HUB-NO

43.50 N/B N/B 21.90-S 29.91

43.50 N/B N/B 21.70 19.53-S

43.50 N/B N/B 20.10 18.73-S

36.01 N/B N/B 30.00 38.88

36.01 N/B N/B 28.00-S 25.40

36.01 N/B N/B 24.00 24.36-S



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

1 C FOLD PAPER TOWELS

2 ROLL PAPER TOWELS

3 TOILET SEAT COVERS

4 PAPER BAGS 57 LB

5 PAPER BAGS 8 LB

6 PAPER BAGS 4 LB

7 FOOD HANDLER GLOVES IMP 8600L

8 FOOD HANDLER GLOVES EQUIVALENT IMP 8600L

9 JUMBO TOILET PAPER 2 PLY

10 DISPENSER FOR JUMBO TOILET PAPER 1 ROLL

INTERBORO
PACKAGING 

CORP
MONTGOMERY, 

NY
HUB-YES

M.A.N.S.
DISTRIBUTORS

INC
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-YES

WESTERN
BRW PAPER 

CO
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-NO

BNO 
ELECTRICAL 

INC
FT WORTH, 

TX
HUB-YES

QUILL &
WASTEZERO

NO BID

N/B 19.56 18.9 N/B

N/B 0.040900 0.004200 N/B

N/B 31.05 46.25 217.60

N/B 34.55 N/B N/B

N/B
75.44/2000
18.86/500 N/B N/B

N/B
78.60/4000
19.65/500 N/B N/B

N/B N/B N/B N/B

39.00/10,000 11.50/1,000 N/B N/B

N/B 0.001690 0.002200 N/B

N/B 24.00 13.25 N/B



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

11 DISPENSER FOR JUMBO TOILET PAPER 2 ROLL

12 TOILET PAPER, 2-PLY SINGLE ROLL

13 STYROFOAM TRAY WITH FLIP OVER LID

14 SCHOOL TRAY 6 COMPARTMENT

15 STYROFOAM CUPS 6 OZ

16 LIDS FOR 6 OZ CUPS

17 STYROFOAM CUPS 12 OZ

18 LIDS FOR 12 OZ CUPS

19 STYROFOAM CUPS 16 OZ

20 PORTION CUPS

21 LIDS FOR PORTION CUPS

22 BOWLS 12 OZ

23 SQUAT BOWLS 8 OZ

INTERBORO
PACKAGING 

CORP
MONTGOMERY, 

NY
HUB-YES

M.A.N.S.
DISTRIBUTORS

INC
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-YES

WESTERN
BRW PAPER 

CO
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-NO

BNO 
ELECTRICAL 

INC
FT WORTH, 

TX
HUB-YES

QUILL &
WASTEZERO

NO BID

N/B 38.00 24.75 N/B

N/B 0.002390 0.002300 N/B

N/B 15.88 N/B N/B

N/B 23.68 N/B N/B

N/B 15.13 N/B N/B

N/B 13.56 N/B N/B

N/B 27.26 N/B N/B

N/B 23.60 N/B N/B

N/B 27.00 N/B N/B

N/B 47.13 N/B N/B

N/B 47.13 N/B N/B

N/B 40.44 N/B N/B

N/B 21.06 N/B N/B



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

24 SQUAT BOWLS 4 OZ

25 BOWL LIDS

26 SANDWICH BAGS FOLD OVER 6 X 8

27 ZIPLOC GALLON STORAGE BAGS

28 QUILLON PAN LINERS

29 FOOD WRAP 18" X 2000'

30 ALUMINUM FOIL HD 18" X 500'

31 FACIAL TISSUE 2 PLY

32 PRE STRETCH HANDFILM

33 SPOONS, WHITE 

34 FORKS, WHITE MED WEIGHT

35 NAPKIN FULL FOLD

36 CONE CUPS

INTERBORO
PACKAGING 

CORP
MONTGOMERY, 

NY
HUB-YES

M.A.N.S.
DISTRIBUTORS

INC
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-YES

WESTERN
BRW PAPER 

CO
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-NO

BNO 
ELECTRICAL 

INC
FT WORTH, 

TX
HUB-YES

QUILL &
WASTEZERO

NO BID

N/B 19.34 N/B N/B

N/B 13.78 N/B N/B

7.74 11.48 N/B N/B

N/B 25.85 N/B N/B

N/B 32.38 N/B N/B

N/B 16.36 N/B N/B

N/B 25.45 N/B N/B

N/B 18.82 16.64 142.20

N/B 8.33 N/B N/B

N/B 19.59 N/B N/B

N/B 9.16 N/B N/B

N/B 38.79 N/B N/B

N/B 44.58 N/B N/B



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

37 COFFEE CUPS WITH HANDLE 8 OZ

38 TABLE COVER PAPER WITH PLASTIC LINING

39 APRON, HEAVY WEIGHT

40 PROPERTY BAG

41 ENMOTION TOWELS

42 TOUCHLESS ROLL TOWEL

43 ENMOTION HC TOWELS

44 ENMOTION DISPENSER

45 TRASH CAN LINERS 24 X 24

46 TRASH CAN LINERS 40 X 46

47 TRASH CAN LINERS 43 X 47 1-10 CASES

TRASH CAN LINERS 43 X 47 11-20 CASES

TRASH CAN LINERS 43 X 47 21 OR MORE 

INTERBORO
PACKAGING 

CORP
MONTGOMERY, 

NY
HUB-YES

M.A.N.S.
DISTRIBUTORS

INC
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-YES

WESTERN
BRW PAPER 

CO
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-NO

BNO 
ELECTRICAL 

INC
FT WORTH, 

TX
HUB-YES

QUILL &
WASTEZERO

NO BID

N/B 72.53 N/B N/B

N/B 34.16 N/B N/B

42.00/1000 13.65/100 N/B N/B

N/B N/B N/B N/B

N/B N/B 53.45 N/B

N/B N/B 48.64 N/B

N/B N/B 53.45 N/B

N/B N/B 11.00 N/B

9.94-S 17.80 N/B N/B

9.24-S 17.95 N/B N/B

12.98 20.62 N/B N/B

12.98 20.62 N/B N/B

11.98 20.24 N/B N/B



BID 2017-004 A/C FOR PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS

PRIMARY AWARD
S-Secondary Award
* Does not meet specifications
See court communications for details

ITEM
NO

DESCRIPTION

48 TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 2.7 MIL 1-10 ROLLS

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 2.7 MIL 11-20 ROLLS

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 2.7 MIL 21 OR MORE

49 TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 3.5 MIL 1-10 ROLLS

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 3.5 MIL 11-20 ROLLS

TRASH CAN LINERS 38 X 63 3.5 MIL 20 OR MORE

INTERBORO
PACKAGING 

CORP
MONTGOMERY, 

NY
HUB-YES

M.A.N.S.
DISTRIBUTORS

INC
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-YES

WESTERN
BRW PAPER 

CO
CARROLLTON, 

TX
HUB-NO

BNO 
ELECTRICAL 

INC
FT WORTH, 

TX
HUB-YES

QUILL &
WASTEZERO

NO BID

16.32 55.09 N/B N/B

16.32 55.09 N/B N/B

15.32 54.13 N/B N/B

38.82 N/B N/B N/B

38.82 N/B N/B N/B

37.82 N/B N/B N/B
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