
BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES

* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

All prices are per each unless othewise specified  Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

Henry Schein
Melville, NY

HUB-No

Cuevas Dist. Inc
FW, TX

HUB-Yes

VWR INTL.
Suwanee, GA

HUB-No

Moore Medical 
Farmington, CT

HUB-No

Medline 
Industries

Mundelein, IL
HUB-No

Products 
Unlimited
Justin, TX
HUB-Yes

Supreme Med.
Mobile, AL
HUB-No

   SECTION I: NEEDLES, SYRINGES AND LANCETS

1. Needle Pro, 1000/cs, Sims Portex #4140
No Substitutions 0.22000 no bid 0.36000 0.19055 0.23000 no bid 0.14600

1A. Needle Pro, 1000/cs,
Equivalent to Sims Portex #4140 0.22000 no bid 0.36000 no bid no bid no bid no bid

2. Needle - Pro, 25g x 1", 800/cs, Sims Portex #4292
No Substitutions 0.30000 no bid no bid no bid 0.32500 no bid 0.13372

2A. Needle - Pro, 25g x 1", 800/cs,
Equivalent to Sims Portex #4292 0.30000 no bid no bid no bid 0.22800 no bid no bid

3. Needle - Pro, 25g x 5/8", 800/cs, Sims Portex #4291
No Substitutions 0.30000 no bid no bid no bid 0.32500 no bid 0.13372

3A. Needle - Pro, 25g x 5/8", 800/cs,
Equivalent to Sims Portex #4291 0.30000 no bid no bid no bid 0.22800 no bid no bid

4. Syringe, 3 cc, 22g x 1", 100/bx   BD 9572 
No Substitutions 0.13000 no bid 0.14000 0.11700 0.14000 no bid no bid

5. Syringe, 3cc, 25g x 5/8", 100/bx  BD 9570  
No Substitutions 0.13000 no bid 0.14000 0.11700 0.14000 no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES

* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

All prices are per each unless othewise specified  Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

Henry Schein
Melville, NY

HUB-No

Cuevas Dist. Inc
FW, TX

HUB-Yes

VWR INTL.
Suwanee, GA

HUB-No

Moore Medical 
Farmington, CT

HUB-No

Medline 
Industries

Mundelein, IL
HUB-No

Products 
Unlimited
Justin, TX
HUB-Yes

Supreme Med.
Mobile, AL
HUB-No

6. Syringe, Without Needle, 10 cc, 
With Luer Lock Cap, BD 309604
No Substitutions

0.12000 no bid 0.12000 0.10270 0.12300 no bid no bid

7. Syringe, without needle, 30 cc  BD 309651
No Substitutions 0.58000 no bid 0.63000 0.30775 0.63600 no bid no bid

8. Vacutainer Needle, 22g x 1", 100/bx  BD 7210
No Substitutions 0.16000 no bid 0.17000 0.14430 0.17300 0.17500 no bid

8A. Vacutainer Needle, 22g x 1", 100/bx
Equivalent to BD 7210 0.16000 no bid 0.17000 no bid 0.08600 no bid no bid

9. Vacutainer Blood Collection Set,  Safety-Lok, 50/bx
BD 367283  No Substitutions 1.10000 no bid 1.17000 no bid 1.18400 no bid no bid

9A. Vacutainer Blood Collection Set,  Safety-Lok, 50/bx
Equivalent to BD 367283 1.10000 no bid 1.17000 no bid 0.92400 no bid 0.66670

10. Retractable Syringe, 3cc, 25g x 1,  
Vanishpoint 10391, No Substitutions 0.46000 no bid no bid 0.38460 0.75300 0.36600 0.4404840

11. Retractable Syringe, 3cc, 25g x 5/8,
Vanishpoint 10301  No Substitutions 0.46000 no bid no bid 0.38460 0.75300 0.36600 0.4404840

12. Lancet, Safety,
Surgilance 240100015 No Substitutions 0.11000 no bid no bid 0.13790 no bid no bid 0.1180940



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES

* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested
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ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

Henry Schein
Melville, NY

HUB-No

Cuevas Dist. Inc
FW, TX

HUB-Yes

VWR INTL.
Suwanee, GA

HUB-No

Moore Medical 
Farmington, CT

HUB-No

Medline 
Industries

Mundelein, IL
HUB-No

Products 
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Justin, TX
HUB-Yes

Supreme Med.
Mobile, AL
HUB-No

12A. Lancet, Safety
Equivalent to Surgilance 240100015 0.11000 no bid no bid no bid 0.11400 no bid no bid

13. Lancet, Safety
Surgilance 200100015  No Substitutions 0.11000 no bid no bid 0.13790 no bid no bid 0.1180940

13A. Lancet, Safety
Equivalent to Surgilance 200100015 0.11000 no bid no bid no bid 0.12100 no bid no bid

14. Huber Infusion Set, 20g x 3/4"
No Substitutions 3.27000 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES

* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
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Henry Schein
Melville, NY

HUB-No

Cuevas Dist. Inc
FW, TX

HUB-Yes

VWR INTL.
Suwanee, GA

HUB-No

Moore Medical 
Farmington, CT

HUB-No

Medline 
Industries

Mundelein, IL
HUB-No

Products 
Unlimited
Justin, TX
HUB-Yes

Supreme Med.
Mobile, AL
HUB-No

15. Nebulizer, With Mouthpiece
Hudson 1732, or approved equal 0.84000 no bid no bid 0.66000 0.68800 no bid 0.8916000

16. Blood Tube, Red Top, 6 ML, BD 36-7815
No Substitutions 0.19000 no bid 0.20000 no bid 0.20100 0.20600 no bid

17. Blood Tube, Purple Top, 4 ML, BD 36-7844
No Substitutions 0.24000 no bid 0.25000 0.21620 0.25900 0.28000 no bid

18. Collection Container, 3 gal, 20/cs
Kendall 8527R, or approved equal 6.08000 no bid 8.40000 5.53000 6.27000 6.68000 4.4991670 ****

19. Collection Container, 2 gal, 20/cs
Kendall 8970, or approved equal 3.20000 no bid 5.20000 2.91000 2.82000 3.98000 3.2940000

20. Collection Container, 8 gal, 10/cs
Kendall 8980, or approved equal 9.70000 no bid 9.05000 8.83000 12.78000 10.92000 7.1220000 ****

21. Collection Container, 6.9 qrt., 12/cs,   BD 5489
No Substitutions 5.92000 no bid 7.15000 5.76000 6.91000 7.06000 no bid

22. Medical Bottle, with Child Proof Cap
Must be 13 dram 0.44000 no bid no bid 0.0678570 0.34900 no bid no bid

   SECTION II: TUBES, BOTTLES & RELATED MEDICAL 
                         CONTAINERS/SUPPLIES
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* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

All prices are per each unless othewise specified  Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

Henry Schein
Melville, NY

HUB-No

Cuevas Dist. Inc
FW, TX

HUB-Yes

VWR INTL.
Suwanee, GA

HUB-No

Moore Medical 
Farmington, CT

HUB-No

Medline 
Industries

Mundelein, IL
HUB-No

Products 
Unlimited
Justin, TX
HUB-Yes

Supreme Med.
Mobile, AL
HUB-No

23. Specimen Transport Bags, 8 x 8
Medline DYND 30271, or approved equal 0.03500 no bid no bid no bid 0.04200 no bid 0.0632000

24. Specimen Transport Bags, 6 x 6
Medline DYND 30260, or approved equal 0.03500 no bid 0.30000 0.01363 0.02700 no bid 0.0384600

25. Specimen Transport Bags, 2 x 3 Ziplock
8861040, or approved equal 0.00500 no bid 0.02000 0.00481 0.01000 no bid 0.0097200

26. Specimen Container, 4 oz, Sterile,
Premium Plastice With Lid,
DYND 30334, or approved equal

no bid no bid 0.36000 0.11810 0.13400 no bid 0.1520000

27. Alcohol, Isopropyl, 12/cs, 16 oz. 1.15000 no bid no bid 1.43000 1.38000 no bid 1.5208340

28. Alcohol Prep Pad, 200/bx
Kendall 6818, or approved equal 0.00800 no bid 0.01200 0.00715 0.01000 no bid 0.0108950

29. Cotton Balls, Medium, Non-Sterile, 2,000/bg, 2 bags/cs
No Substitutions on Size 4.69 per bag no bid 8.00 per bag 4.58 per bg 6.00 per bag no bid 6.17 per bag

   SECTION III: APP, SWABS, MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL
                        DRESSINGS



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES

* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

All prices are per each unless othewise specified  Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

Henry Schein
Melville, NY

HUB-No

Cuevas Dist. Inc
FW, TX

HUB-Yes

VWR INTL.
Suwanee, GA

HUB-No

Moore Medical 
Farmington, CT

HUB-No

Medline 
Industries

Mundelein, IL
HUB-No

Products 
Unlimited
Justin, TX
HUB-Yes

Supreme Med.
Mobile, AL
HUB-No

30. Procto Swabs, 8", 50/bx
Puritan 808, or approved equal 4.42000 no bid 4.46000 no bid no bid no bid 3.48800

31. Disposalbe Probe Cover,  Welch Allyn 05031-101
No Substitutions 0.03300 no bid 0.04300 0.03824 0.04200 no bid 0.04193

32. Anoscope, Plastic Disposable without Notch
Cooper Surgical 182420, or approved equal 0.50000 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

33. Bandage, Fabric, 3/4" x 3", Henry Schein 101-5515
No Substitutions 0.02000 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

34. Bandage, Fabric, 3/4" x 3",
Equivalent to Henry Schein 101-5515 0.02000 no bid 0.05000 0.01370 0.01800 no bid 0.01535 **

35. Bandage, Fabric, 1" x 3", Quikstrip 80123
No Substitutions no bid no bid no bid 0.02950 no bid no bid no bid

36. Bandage, Cartoon, 3/4" x 3", Stat Strips 1073737
No Substitutions 0.04100 no bid no bid 0.03590 no bid no bid 0.0382416

36A. Bandage, Cartoon, 3/4" x 3",
Equivalent to Stat Strips 1073737 0.04100 no bid no bid 0.02530 0.05800 no bid 0.0382416

37. Gauze Pads, 2" x 2", Non-Sterile, 200/pkg
Kendall 2146, or approved equal 0.00400 no bid 0.01300 0.00355 0.00300 * no bid 0.0031200
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* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award
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Supreme Med.
Mobile, AL
HUB-No

   SECTION IV: GOWNS & EXAM TABLE PAPER

38. Drape Sheet, 3-Ply, 40" x 48", 100/cs
Graham 302, or approved equal 0.18000 no bid 0.29000 0.18640 0.23100 0.02500 * 0.2315000

39. Exam Gown, Disposable, 50/cs,
Graham 221, or approved equal 0.28000 no bid 1.24000 0.30680 0.35300 0.39800 0.4572000

40. Personal Protection Gown  Sage 8576
No Substitutions 0.91000 no bid no bid no bid no bid 2.19300 0.9757340

41. Exam Table Paper Crepe, 21 x 225, 12/cs
Banta 916216, or approved equal 1.46000 no bid no bid no bid 1.77000 no bid 1.9283340
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* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award
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FW, TX
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Supreme Med.
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   SECTION V: MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

42. Hand Soap, Pump Bottle, 17.5 oz, Lysol IC 95717
No Substitutions 8.59000 no bid no bid 4.50000 no bid 5.70000 no bid

43. Surgical Lubricant, Single Pk, 
144/Medline MDS032273Z, or approved equal 0.04800 no bid no bid 0.0614580 0.03800 no bid 0.0707640

44. Hand Sanitizer, Instant, 24/cs, Purell 9651-24
No Substitutions 1.65000 2.05000 2.33000 1.50000 1.80000 no bid no bid

45. Hand Sanitizer, Instant, Epic-Clenz, #MSC097040
No Substitutions 4.10000 no bid no bid no bid 2.40000 * no bid 3.6458330

46. Disinfectant Spray, 19 oz, Linen or Country Scent, 
12/cs, Lysol, No Substitutions 7.61000 no bid no bid no bid no bid 6.65000 no bid

46A. Disinfectant Spray, 19 oz, Linen or Country Scent, 
12/cs, Equivalent to Lysol 7.61000 no bid 9.43000 no bid no bid no bid no bid

47. Deodorizing Air Freshener, Lysol Neutra Air 19007971
No Substitutions no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 3.50000 no bid

48. Dispatch Cleaner/Disinfectant, 
Caltech Industries 68978  No Substitutions 18.40000 21.25000 21.89000 no bid 24.69000 no bid no bid
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* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award
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Justin, TX
HUB-Yes

Supreme Med.
Mobile, AL
HUB-No

49. Clorox Bleach, 96 oz. Bottle, #44600-02490
No Substitutions no bid 4.00000 2.68000 no bid no bid no bid no bid

50. Vaginal Speculum, Small, Amsino ASO32S, 
or approved equal 0.25000 no bid no bid 0.21900 0.40100 no bid 0.2667000

51. Vaginal Speculum, Medium
Amsino ASO32M, or approved equal 0.25000 no bid no bid 0.21900 0.40100 no bid 0.2667000

52. Vaginal Speculum, Large
Amsino ASO32L, or approved equal 0.25000 no bid no bid 0.22400 0.41200 no bid 0.3067000

   SECTION VI: MICROSCOPE SUPPLIES

53. Microscope Slides, Frosted, 3.x 1 in.
Fisher 12-544-3  No Substitutions no bid 317.50/cs no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

54. Microscope Slide Covers, 22 x 22 mm 
Fisher 12-544-10  No Substitutions no bid 280.000/cs no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

   SECTION VII: GLOVES

55. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Long Cuff, 12", Small
Kimberly Clark 50601, or approved equal 0.19500 0.16800 0.22000 0.13580 0.10900 no bid 0.08000 ***



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES

* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award
** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

All prices are per each unless othewise specified  Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

Henry Schein
Melville, NY

HUB-No

Cuevas Dist. Inc
FW, TX

HUB-Yes

VWR INTL.
Suwanee, GA

HUB-No

Moore Medical 
Farmington, CT

HUB-No

Medline 
Industries

Mundelein, IL
HUB-No

Products 
Unlimited
Justin, TX
HUB-Yes
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56. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Long Cuff, 12" Medium
Kimberly Clark 50602, or approved equal 0.19500 0.16800 0.22000 0.13580 0.10900 no bid 0.08000 ***

57. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Long Cuff, 12" Large
Kimberly Clark 50603, or approved equal 0.19500 0.16800 0.22000 0.13580 0.10900 no bid 0.08000 ***

58. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Long Cuff, 12",  X-Large
Kimberly Clark 50604, or approved equal 0.19500 0.16800 0.22000 0.13580 0.10900 no bid 0.08000 ***

59. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Small
Microflex Ultra Sense US-220-S  No Substitutions 0.06000 0.05900 0.09300 0.06240 no bid no bid no bid

60. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Medium
Microflex Ultra Sense US-220-M  No Substitutions 0.06000 0.05900 0.09300 0.06240 no bid no bid no bid

61. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Large
Microflex Ultra Sense US-220-L  No Substitutions 0.06000 0.05900 0.09300 0.06240 no bid no bid no bid

62. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, X-Small 0.02700 0.06000 0.07800 0.03630 0.04200 no bid 0.02927 **

63. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, Small 0.02700 0.06000 0.07800 0.03270 0.04200 no bid 0.02927

64. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, Medium 0.02700 0.06000 0.07800 0.03270 0.04200 no bid 0.02927

65. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, Large 0.02700 0.06000 0.07800 0.03270 0.04200 no bid 0.02927
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Supreme Med.
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66. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, X-Large 0.02700 0.06000 0.07800 0.03270 0.04700 no bid 0.02927

67. Gloves, Latex, Powdered, Small 0.03300 0.04100 0.05100 0.03690 0.03100 * no bid 0.03415 **

68. Gloves, Latex, Powdered, Medium 0.03300 0.04100 0.05100 0.03690 0.03100 * no bid 0.03415

69. Gloves, Latex, Powdered, Large 0.03300 0.04100 0.05100 0.03690 0.03100 * no bid 0.03415

70. Gloves, Latex, Powdered, X-Large 0.03300 0.04100 0.05100 0.03690 0.03100 * no bid 0.03415
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   SECTION VIII: TOXICOLOGY SUPPLIES

71. Eppendorf Tips, 2-200 ul
Brinkman Ins. #022492039, or approved equal no bid 45.00/cs 42.35/ cs no bid no bid no bid no bid

72. Pipette Tips, 1000 ul.
VWR #53508-989, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.01200 no bid no bid no bid no bid

73. Culture Tubes, 10 x 75 mm
VWR #47729-568, or approved equal no bid 31.00/cs 22.09/cs 10.821/cs 42.10/cs no bid no bid

74. Headspace Glass Vials, 20 mm
Kimble 60827a-2375, or approved equal no bid no bid 240.10/cs no bid no bid no bid no bid

75. Crimp Caps Vials, 20 mm
CRS 320301, or approved equal no bid no bid 7.43 per pk no bid no bid no bid no bid

76. Septa Headspace Vials, 20 mm
CRS 320401, or approved equal no bid no bid 12.30 per pk no bid no bid no bid no bid

77. Inserts, 0.25 ml, Conical Bottom for WM, 12-32 Vial
SUN SRI 500-304, or approved equal no bid no bid 40.35 per pk no bid no bid no bid no bid

78. Crimp Clear Tapered, 0.2 ml, 8 mm
SUN SRI 502-003, or approved equal no bid no bid 175.00 per pk no bid no bid no bid no bid
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79. Crimp with PTFE Liner, 8 mm
SUN SRI 502-192, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.07200 no bid no bid no bid no bid

80. Vial Clear, 2 ml, 5 x 32 mm
SUN SRI 502-004, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.17600 no bid no bid no bid no bid

81. Alum Seal PTFE/RBR, Silver, 11 mm
National Scientific C4011-7A, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.07200 no bid no bid no bid no bid

82. Nalgene Bottle, Narrow Mouth, HDPE, 30 ml,
Fisher 2002-001, or approved equal no bid 1.16666 0.80500 no bid no bid 0.82000 no bid

83. Bandages, Gauze, Dressings, Sponges, Tapes, and like 
items 25% 0% no bid 16% 50% 10% 2%

84. Hand Cleaners, Paper & Cotton Products, Swabs, 
Gowns, Capes, Towels, Tissue, Drinking Cups, Tongue 
Deprssors, Prep Pads, Alcohol, Disinfectants, and like 
items

25% 0% no bid 16% 70% 10% 2%

85. Exam, Surgical, Latex, Vinyl, Synthetic, Nitrile, Sterile, 
Non-Sterile, Powder, Powder-Free, Finger Cots, and 
Dispensers, and like items

25% 25% no bid 16% 60% 10% 2%

   SECTIONS IX - XIV
   DISCOUNT OFF LIST
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SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

All prices are per each unless othewise specified  Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

Henry Schein
Melville, NY

HUB-No

Cuevas Dist. Inc
FW, TX

HUB-Yes

VWR INTL.
Suwanee, GA

HUB-No

Moore Medical 
Farmington, CT

HUB-No

Medline 
Industries

Mundelein, IL
HUB-No

Products 
Unlimited
Justin, TX
HUB-Yes

Supreme Med.
Mobile, AL
HUB-No

86. Collection, Shaprs, Medicine Bottles, Specimen, Vials, 
Waste Bags, Blood Tubes, Culture Tubes, Blood Shields, 
and like items

25% 0% no bid 16% 50% 10% 2%

87. Scissors, Forceps, Needle Holders, Cutters, Vaginal 
Specula, and like items 25% 0% no bid 16% 70% 10% 2%

88. Needles and Syringes, and like items 25% 0% no bid 16% 40% 10% 2%



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

   SECTION I: NEEDLES, SYRINGES AND LANCETS

1. Needle Pro, 1000/cs, Sims Portex #4140
No Substitutions 0.19000 no bid 0.20200 no bid no bid no bid

1A. Needle Pro, 1000/cs,
Equivalent to Sims Portex #4140 0.19000 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

2. Needle - Pro, 25g x 1", 800/cs, Sims Portex #4292
No Substitutions 0.22000 no bid 0.28500 no bid no bid no bid

2A. Needle - Pro, 25g x 1", 800/cs,
Equivalent to Sims Portex #4292 0.22000 no bid 0.19900 no bid no bid no bid

3. Needle - Pro, 25g x 5/8", 800/cs, Sims Portex #4291
No Substitutions 0.22000 no bid 0.28500 no bid no bid no bid

3A. Needle - Pro, 25g x 5/8", 800/cs,
Equivalent to Sims Portex #4291 0.22000 no bid 0.19900 no bid no bid no bid

4. Syringe, 3 cc, 22g x 1", 100/bx   BD 9572 
No Substitutions 0.12000 no bid 0.10000 no bid no bid no bid

5. Syringe, 3cc, 25g x 5/8", 100/bx  BD 9570  
No Substitutions 0.12000 no bid 0.10000 no bid no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

6. Syringe, Without Needle, 10 cc, 
With Luer Lock Cap, BD 309604
No Substitutions

0.10500 no bid 0.10900 no bid no bid no bid

7. Syringe, without needle, 30 cc  BD 309651
No Substitutions 0.55000 no bid 0.39400 no bid no bid no bid

8. Vacutainer Needle, 22g x 1", 100/bx  BD 7210
No Substitutions 0.14900 no bid 0.12000 no bid no bid no bid

8A. Vacutainer Needle, 22g x 1", 100/bx
Equivalent to BD 7210 0.14900 no bid 0.13600 no bid no bid no bid

9. Vacutainer Blood Collection Set,  Safety-Lok, 50/bx
BD 367283  No Substitutions 0.91000 no bid 0.98400 no bid no bid no bid

9A. Vacutainer Blood Collection Set,  Safety-Lok, 50/bx
Equivalent to BD 367283 0.91000 no bid 0.79000 no bid no bid no bid

10. Retractable Syringe, 3cc, 25g x 1,  
Vanishpoint 10391, No Substitutions 0.40600 no bid 0.45200 no bid 0.33000 no bid

11. Retractable Syringe, 3cc, 25g x 5/8,
Vanishpoint 10301  No Substitutions 0.40600 no bid 0.45200 no bid 0.33000 no bid

12. Lancet, Safety,
Surgilance 240100015 No Substitutions 0.10700 no bid 0.11300 no bid no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

12A. Lancet, Safety
Equivalent to Surgilance 240100015 0.10700 no bid 0.19800 no bid no bid no bid

13. Lancet, Safety
Surgilance 200100015  No Substitutions 0.10700 no bid 0.11300 no bid no bid no bid

13A. Lancet, Safety
Equivalent to Surgilance 200100015 0.10700 no bid 0.19400 no bid no bid no bid

14. Huber Infusion Set, 20g x 3/4"
No Substitutions no bid no bid 3.44000 no bid no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

15. Nebulizer, With Mouthpiece
Hudson 1732, or approved equal no bid no bid 1.21000 no bid no bid no bid

16. Blood Tube, Red Top, 6 ML, BD 36-7815
No Substitutions no bid no bid 0.10100 no bid no bid no bid

17. Blood Tube, Purple Top, 4 ML, BD 36-7844
No Substitutions no bid no bid 0.09400 no bid no bid no bid

18. Collection Container, 3 gal, 20/cs
Kendall 8527R, or approved equal no bid no bid 6.36000 no bid no bid no bid

19. Collection Container, 2 gal, 20/cs
Kendall 8970, or approved equal no bid no bid 3.78000 no bid no bid no bid

20. Collection Container, 8 gal, 10/cs
Kendall 8980, or approved equal no bid no bid 10.14000 no bid no bid no bid

21. Collection Container, 6.9 qrt., 12/cs,   BD 5489
No Substitutions no bid no bid 4.18000 no bid no bid no bid

22. Medical Bottle, with Child Proof Cap
Must be 13 dram no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

   SECTION II: TUBES, BOTTLES & RELATED MEDICAL 
                         CONTAINERS/SUPPLIES



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

23. Specimen Transport Bags, 8 x 8
Medline DYND 30271, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.09800 no bid no bid no bid

24. Specimen Transport Bags, 6 x 6
Medline DYND 30260, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.07000 no bid no bid no bid

25. Specimen Transport Bags, 2 x 3 Ziplock
8861040, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.00900 no bid no bid no bid

26. Specimen Container, 4 oz, Sterile,
Premium Plastice With Lid,
DYND 30334, or approved equal

no bid no bid 0.22700 no bid no bid no bid

27. Alcohol, Isopropyl, 12/cs, 16 oz. 1.08000 no bid 1.15000 no bid no bid no bid

28. Alcohol Prep Pad, 200/bx
Kendall 6818, or approved equal 0.01000 no bid 0.00740 no bid no bid no bid

29. Cotton Balls, Medium, Non-Sterile, 2,000/bg, 2 bags/cs
No Substitutions on Size 5.80 per bag no bid 5.20/bg no bid no bid no bid

   SECTION III: APP, SWABS, MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL
                        DRESSINGS



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

30. Procto Swabs, 8", 50/bx
Puritan 808, or approved equal no bid no bid 3.90000 no bid no bid no bid

31. Disposalbe Probe Cover,  Welch Allyn 05031-101
No Substitutions no bid no bid 0.04100 no bid no bid no bid

32. Anoscope, Plastic Disposable without Notch
Cooper Surgical 182420, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.47200 no bid no bid no bid

33. Bandage, Fabric, 3/4" x 3", Henry Schein 101-5515
No Substitutions no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

34. Bandage, Fabric, 3/4" x 3",
Equivalent to Henry Schein 101-5515 0.03000 no bid 0.02100 no bid no bid no bid

35. Bandage, Fabric, 1" x 3", Quikstrip 80123
No Substitutions no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

36. Bandage, Cartoon, 3/4" x 3", Stat Strips 1073737
No Substitutions no bid no bid 0.03700 no bid no bid no bid

36A. Bandage, Cartoon, 3/4" x 3",
Equivalent to Stat Strips 1073737 no bid no bid 0.03300 no bid no bid no bid

37. Gauze Pads, 2" x 2", Non-Sterile, 200/pkg
Kendall 2146, or approved equal 0.00490 no bid 0.00720 no bid no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

   SECTION IV: GOWNS & EXAM TABLE PAPER

38. Drape Sheet, 3-Ply, 40" x 48", 100/cs
Graham 302, or approved equal 0.18000 no bid 0.19600 no bid no bid no bid

39. Exam Gown, Disposable, 50/cs,
Graham 221, or approved equal no bid 0.36200 0.31600 no bid no bid no bid

40. Personal Protection Gown  Sage 8576
No Substitutions no bid no bid 0.93000 no bid no bid no bid

41. Exam Table Paper Crepe, 21 x 225, 12/cs
Banta 916216, or approved equal no bid no bid 1.74000 no bid no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

   SECTION V: MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

42. Hand Soap, Pump Bottle, 17.5 oz, Lysol IC 95717
No Substitutions no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

43. Surgical Lubricant, Single Pk, 
144/Medline MDS032273Z, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.02600 no bid no bid no bid

44. Hand Sanitizer, Instant, 24/cs, Purell 9651-24
No Substitutions no bid no bid 1.51000 no bid no bid no bid

45. Hand Sanitizer, Instant, Epic-Clenz, #MSC097040
No Substitutions no bid no bid 4.20000 no bid no bid no bid

46. Disinfectant Spray, 19 oz, Linen or Country Scent, 
12/cs, Lysol, No Substitutions no bid no bid 8.10000 no bid no bid no bid

46A. Disinfectant Spray, 19 oz, Linen or Country Scent, 
12/cs, Equivalent to Lysol no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

47. Deodorizing Air Freshener, Lysol Neutra Air 19007971
No Substitutions no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

48. Dispatch Cleaner/Disinfectant, 
Caltech Industries 68978  No Substitutions no bid no bid 17.74000 no bid no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

49. Clorox Bleach, 96 oz. Bottle, #44600-02490
No Substitutions no bid no bid 2.55000 no bid no bid no bid

50. Vaginal Speculum, Small, Amsino ASO32S, 
or approved equal no bid no bid 0.24800 no bid no bid no bid

51. Vaginal Speculum, Medium
Amsino ASO32M, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.24800 no bid no bid no bid

52. Vaginal Speculum, Large
Amsino ASO32L, or approved equal no bid no bid 0.31000 no bid no bid no bid

   SECTION VI: MICROSCOPE SUPPLIES

53. Microscope Slides, Frosted, 3.x 1 in.
Fisher 12-544-3  No Substitutions no bid no bid 223.92/cs no bid no bid no bid

54. Microscope Slide Covers, 22 x 22 mm 
Fisher 12-544-10  No Substitutions no bid no bid 226.15/cs no bid no bid no bid

   SECTION VII: GLOVES

55. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Long Cuff, 12", Small
Kimberly Clark 50601, or approved equal 0.14830 0.10060 *** 0.14300 0.09980 no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

56. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Long Cuff, 12" Medium
Kimberly Clark 50602, or approved equal 0.14830 0.10060 *** 0.14300 0.09980 no bid no bid

57. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Long Cuff, 12" Large
Kimberly Clark 50603, or approved equal 0.14830 0.10060 *** 0.14300 0.09980 no bid no bid

58. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Long Cuff, 12",  X-Large
Kimberly Clark 50604, or approved equal 0.14830 0.10060 *** 0.14300 no bid no bid no bid

59. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Small
Microflex Ultra Sense US-220-S  No Substitutions no bid no bid 0.06600 no bid no bid 0.05500

60. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Medium
Microflex Ultra Sense US-220-M  No Substitutions no bid no bid 0.06600 no bid no bid 0.04800

61. Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Large
Microflex Ultra Sense US-220-L  No Substitutions no bid no bid 0.06530 no bid no bid 0.05500

62. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, X-Small 0.03900 no bid 0.03130 0.03690 no bid no bid

63. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, Small 0.03900 0.03440 0.02760 0.03690 no bid 0.02795

64. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, Medium 0.03900 0.03440 0.02760 0.03690 no bid 0.02795

65. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, Large 0.03900 0.03440 0.02760 0.03690 no bid 0.03350



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

66. Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, X-Large 0.03900 0.03440 0.02760 0.03690 no bid 0.03350

67. Gloves, Latex, Powdered, Small 0.04200 0.02900 *** 0.03860 0.04290 no bid no bid

68. Gloves, Latex, Powdered, Medium 0.04200 0.02900 *** 0.03860 0.04290 no bid 0.02895

69. Gloves, Latex, Powdered, Large 0.04200 0.02900 *** 0.03860 0.04290 no bid 0.03250

70. Gloves, Latex, Powdered, X-Large 0.04200 0.02900 *** 0.03860 0.04290 no bid 0.02895



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

   SECTION VIII: TOXICOLOGY SUPPLIES

71. Eppendorf Tips, 2-200 ul
Brinkman Ins. #022492039, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

72. Pipette Tips, 1000 ul.
VWR #53508-989, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

73. Culture Tubes, 10 x 75 mm
VWR #47729-568, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

74. Headspace Glass Vials, 20 mm
Kimble 60827a-2375, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

75. Crimp Caps Vials, 20 mm
CRS 320301, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

76. Septa Headspace Vials, 20 mm
CRS 320401, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

77. Inserts, 0.25 ml, Conical Bottom for WM, 12-32 Vial
SUN SRI 500-304, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

78. Crimp Clear Tapered, 0.2 ml, 8 mm
SUN SRI 502-003, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

79. Crimp with PTFE Liner, 8 mm
SUN SRI 502-192, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

80. Vial Clear, 2 ml, 5 x 32 mm
SUN SRI 502-004, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

81. Alum Seal PTFE/RBR, Silver, 11 mm
National Scientific C4011-7A, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

82. Nalgene Bottle, Narrow Mouth, HDPE, 30 ml,
Fisher 2002-001, or approved equal no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

83. Bandages, Gauze, Dressings, Sponges, Tapes, and like 
items no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

84. Hand Cleaners, Paper & Cotton Products, Swabs, 
Gowns, Capes, Towels, Tissue, Drinking Cups, Tongue 
Deprssors, Prep Pads, Alcohol, Disinfectants, and like 
items

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

85. Exam, Surgical, Latex, Vinyl, Synthetic, Nitrile, Sterile, 
Non-Sterile, Powder, Powder-Free, Finger Cots, and 
Dispensers, and like items

no bid no bid no bid 0.000% no bid 50.00%

   SECTIONS IX - XIV
   DISCOUNT OFF LIST



BID NO. 2009-080  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES/DISPOSABLES
* Notified Purchasing that price was bid incorrect, remove from award

** Vendor wishes not to participate in Secondary Award

PRIMARY *** Bid does not meet specifications, Min order requirements
SECONDARY **** Bid does not meet specifications, bid other than requested

 Tie Bids received for items 27 & 38, award in accordance with tie bid procedure 
All prices are per each unless otherwise specified

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

RND Medical
Supplies

Marietta, GA
HUB-No

Tronex Intl. Inc
Parsippany, NJ

HUB-Yes

Midwest Medical
Earth City, MO

HUB-No

Dash Medical
Gloves Inc

Franklin, WI
HUB-No

Medical Products 
Supply Inc

Babylon, NY
HUB-No

Interboro Pkging 
Corp

Mongomery, NY
HUB-Yes

86. Collection, Shaprs, Medicine Bottles, Specimen, Vials, 
Waste Bags, Blood Tubes, Culture Tubes, Blood Shields, 
and like items

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

87. Scissors, Forceps, Needle Holders, Cutters, Vaginal 
Specula, and like items no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

88. Needles and Syringes, and like items no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid


