RFB NO. 2009-056 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS FURNITURE

. BKM
Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
SECTION A: DESKS -- WOOD
Executive "U" Shaped Unit, High Pressure Laminate Top,
_; |Contemporary Radius Edge (National Waveworks: Desk
A-1 #WV3672DRFL1: Bridge #WV2448BEFL: Credenza #W\2472CLFL2; NO BID 1681.11 NO BID 1618.63 1717.40 1965.34 NO BID 1681.12 1910.66
Keyboard Tray #NAC1924KTM)
Desk, Double Pedestal with Wood Top, Traditional Style, All Wood
A-2 Veneer, 42d x 86"w (Kimball #PR4286WSSW and #PR3375DC) NO BID 2193.16 NO BID 2135.34 NO BID 1944.44 NO BID 2562.16 NO BID
Desk, Double Pedestal, 72" x 36"
A-3 (Hon 92792 with Center Drawer 90250) 952.20 1071.49 NO BID 1382.41 1018.30 1000.84 NO BID 1161.00 1193.25
Desk, Double Pedestal, 66" x 30"
A-4 (Hon 92776 with Center Drawer 90250) 897.97 1015.95 NO BID NO BID 1112.71 946.88 NO BID 1144.99 1129.39
Desk, Double Pedestal, 60" x 30"
A-5 (Hon 92772 with Center Drawer 90250) 884.30 1001.96 NO BID NO BID 921.65 933.33 NO BID 1111.97 1113.29
SECTION B: DESKS - WOODGRAIN LAMINATE
Desk, Double Pedestal, Contemporary Radius Edge, 72"w x 36"d,
B-1 (Hon 10791 with Center Drawer 1526) 553.52 663.18 NO BID NO BID 2876.23 588.92 NO BID 627.50 723.79
i Desk, Double Pedestal, Contemporary Radius Edge, 66"w x 30"d
B-2 (Hon 10775 with Center Drawer 1526) 530.75 639.86 NO BID NO BID 694.32 581.59 NO BID 602.25 666.98
i Desk, Double Pedestal, Contemporary Radius Edge, 60"w x 30"d,
B-3 (Hon 10771 with Center Drawer 1526) 474.86 582.62 NO BID NO BID 5017.47 510.68 NO BID 583.52 631.15
Desk, Single Pedestal, Contemporary Radius Ede, 66"w x 30"d,
B-4 (Hon 10783R or 10784L with Center Drawer 1522) 428.49 535.13 NO BID NO BID 498.90 479.87 NO BID 583.52 566.56
B5 |Desk, Single Pedestal, Contemporary Radius Edge, 72'w x 36'd, 464.09| 57159 NO BID NO BID 3330.38 499.97 NO BID 566.11 618.49

(Hon 10785R or 10786L with Center Drawer 1522)




RFB NO. 2009-056 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS FURNITURE

. BKM
Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
SECTION C: DESK - METAL
C-1 |Desk, Double Pedestal, Laminate Top, Contemporary Radius Edge,
66"w x 30"d, (Hon 38170 with Center Drawer D8) 581.26 691.59 NO BID NO BID 751.80 1563.44 730.00 NO BID 756.45
C-2 |Secretarial "L" Unit, Laminate Top, Contemporary Radius Edge,
Desk: 66"w x 30"d; Return: 48"w x 24"d x 28-1/2"h, with Center
Drawer Desk: (Hon 38292L or 38291R): Return: (Hon 38215R or 806.06 929.22 NO BID NO BID 1043.70 870.88 952.00 NO BID 944.14
38216L); Center Drawer: (Hon D2)
C-3 |Desk, Double Pedestal, Laminate Top, Traditional Classic Style, 60"w 365.98 45815 NO BID NO BID 506.83 41769 NO BID NO BID 466.95

x 30"d, (Hon 88962)

C-4 |Secretarial "L" Unit, Laminate Top, Traditional Classic Style,
Desk: 60"w x 30"d; Return: 48"w x 24"d x 26-1/2"h, 565.11 682.26 NO BID NO BID 751.50 631.18 NO BID NO BID 737.44
Desk: (Hon 88266L or 88265R); Return: (Hon 88236L or 88235R)

C-5 |Desk, Single Pedestal, Laminate Top, Traditional Classic Style,

48'w x 30"d (Hon 88251R) 298.91 389.46 NO BID NO BID 430.50 351.00 NO BID NO BID 387.98
SECTION D: MISCELLANEOUS DESK COMPONENTS

D-1 [Return, Executive Height, Contemporary Radius Edge,

60"w x 24'd, (Hon 10717R or 10718L) 309.26 400.06 NO BID NO BID 442.28 330.55 NO BID NO BID 400.16
D-2 [Return, Executive Height, Contemporary Radius Edge,

47"w x 24"d, (Hon 10715R or 10716L) 272.83 362.75 NO BID NO BID 3646.87 294.38 NO BID 345.32 357.26
D-3 [Peninsula with End Panel, Contemporary Radius Edge,

72'w x 36'd, (Hon 10721) 394.54 487.40 NO BID NO BID 539.33 423.11 NO BIDB44.45/LaCasse 500.59
D-4 Hutch, Stack-On Storage with Enclosed Back,

65-5/8"w x 14-5/8"d x 37-1/8"h, for use with 72" Credenza (Hon 771.70 873.67 NO BID NO BID 968.52 798.29 NO BID 855.52 944.70

92735)
D-5 [Highback Organizer (National, Waveworks ww7238HBH2L) NO BID 488.62 NO BID 427.69 495.65 481.98 NO BID 460.85 501.94




RFB NO. 2009-056 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS FURNITURE

. BKM
Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
Hutch, Stack-On, Contemporary Radius Edge,
D-6 [65-5/8"w x 14-5/8"d x 37-1/8"h, for use with 72" Credenza 558.94 450.94 NO BID NO BID 468.44 411.20 NO BID 448.76 458.66
(Hon 10734)
D-7 |Back Enclosure for Stack-On, for use with Hutch 10734 (Hon 10738) 71.21 156.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID 86.15 NO BID NO BID 119.85
Hutch, Stack-On, Contemporary Radius Edge,
D-8 |62-5/8"w x 14-5/8"d x 37-1/8"h, for use with 66" Credenza 353.98 445.85 NO BID NO BID 453.82 382.75 NO BID 417.83 452.81
(Hon 10733)
D-9 |Back Enclosure for Stack-On, for use with Hutch 10733 (Hon 10737) 66.65 151.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID 81.62 NO BID NO BID 114.49
i Bridge to Connect Desk to Credenza, Contemporary Radius Edge,
D-10 47w x 24"d (Hon 10770) 122.54 208.83 NO BID NO BID 227.62 137.22 NO BID 182.68 180.30
i Bridge to Connect Desk to Credenza, Contemporary Radius Edge,
D-11 42'w x 24"d (Hon 10760) 117.58 203.75 NO BID NO BID 220.72 141.96 NO BID 177.46 174.45
D-12 |Keyboard Platform, Laminate, 21-1/2"w x 10"d (Hon 4022) 63.76 148.63 NO BID NO BID 73.71 73.66 NO BID 69.07 111.08
D-13 |Keyboard Platform, Veneer, 21-1/2"w x 10-1/2"d (Hon 90150) 94.39 180.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 104.11 NO BID[69.07/LaCasse 147.15
Keyboard Platform with 8" Mouse Holder and 17" Arm
D-14 (Anatome: Platform P100-19; Arm CA300: Mouseholder M100) NO BID 184.06 NO BID 165.56 10903.15 186.68 NO BID 180.59 NO BID
SECTION E: CREDENZAS -- LAMINATE & WOOD
Credenza, without Kneespace, Contemporary Radius Edge,
E-1 72'w x 24"d, (Hon 10744) 496.39 591.71 NO BID NO BID 576.87 539.74 NO BID 610.06 620.51
Credenza, with Kneespace, Contemporary Radius Edge,
E-2 72'w x 24"d, (Hon 10743) 442.57 536.59 NO BID NO BID 500.93 486.20 NO BID 529.08 557.14
Credenza, with Kneespace, Contemporary Radius Edge,
E-3 66'w x 24'd, (Hon 10766) 411.52 504.79 NO BID NO BID 487.53 455.32 NO BID 501.65 520.58
_, |Credenza, Single Pedestal, Contemporary Radius Edge,
E-4 72'w x 24"d, (Hon 10745R or 10746L) 357.28 449.24 NO BID NO BID 1293.36 401.38 NO BID 419.78 456.17
g5 |Credenza Single Pedestal, Contemporary Radius Edge, 345.69 437.37 NO BID NO BID 565.50 351.13 NO BID 406.71 443.06

66"w x 24"d, (Hon 10763R or 10764L)




RFB NO. 2009-056 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS FURNITURE

. BKM
Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB-YES | HUB - YES YES
Credenza, Single Pedestal, with 36" Locking Lateral File,
E-6 Contemporary Radius Edge, 72w x 24"d (Hon 10747R or 10748L) 492.25 587.47 NO BID NO BID 578.90 535.62 NO BID 519.93 615.64
E-7 |Credenza, Wood Veneer, with Doors, 72"w x 24"d (Hon 92742) 936.05 1041.99 NO BID NO BID[912.31/National 977.15 NO BID 1097.91 1138.24
E-8 |Credenza, Wood Veneer, with Kneespace, 72"w x 24"d (Hon 92743) 740.23 841.44 NO BID NO BID 891.19 782.31 NO BID 909.77 907.65
E9 Vertical Storage Unit, Traditional Style, with Molding and Wood Top.
Closed Storage on Bottom with Box/Box/File Drawers on Each Side.
Upper Storage with Open Bookcases on each end and Closed Center
Storage with Metal Grille Doors, 18-7/8"d x 89-1/4"w x 81-3/4"h NO BID 4816.32 NO BID 4886.85 NO BID 5518.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(Kimball PR15110CPCFI, PR3648BC0(2), PR2411WSS,
PR2236PUBBF(2), PR2236PUH, PR3648BCHM, PR23109CPB)
SECTION F: BOOKCASES -- WOOD
_, |Bookcase, Four (4) Shelves, Contemporary Radius Edge,
F-1 36'w x 13"d x 72"h (Kimball B-5B-3672) NO BID 699.49 NO BID 638.14 NO BID 1027.89 NO BID 732.58 NO BID
., |Bookcase, Five (5) Shelves, [Three (3) Adjustable & Two (2) Fixed
F-2 Shelves], Wood Veneer, 36'w x 13"d x 84'h (Kimball B-6B-3684) NO BID 789.43 NO BID 728.08 NO BID 1117.89 NO BID 732.58 NO BID
F3 |Bookcase, Two (2) Shelves, 36w x 13-1/8"d x 29-5/8° 394.13 486.98 NO BID NO BID 416.86 407.38 NO BID 419.98 500.10
(Hon 92752)
F.4 |BOOkcase, Three (3) Shelves, 36"w x 13-1/8"d x 43-3/8"h 456.64 551.00 NO BID 376.88 459.91 469.56 NO BID 530.26 573.71
(Hon 92753)
F5 |Bookcase, Four (4) Shelves, 36"w x 13-1/8"d x 57-1/8"h 509.63 605.27 NO BID 475.55 562.65 522.28 NO BID 616.07 636.11
(Hon 92754)
F-6 |Bookcase, Five (5) Shelves, 36"w x 13-1/8"d x 71"h (Hon 92755) 598.64 696.43 NO BID NO BID 946.36 610.82 NO BID 732.58 740.93
F7 |Bookcase, Five (5) Shelves, 36"wX68"H NO BID 366.79 NO BID 294.20 373.82 330.78 NO BID 311.24 361.88

(National Waveworks WWW3668BCOFL)




RFB NO. 2009-056 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS FURNITURE

. BKM
Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
SECTION G: BOOKCASES -- WOODGRAIN LAMINATE
-1 |Bookease, Two (2) Shelves, 36"w x 13'd x 29°h, Radius Edge 184.23|  272.01 NO BID NO BID 291.75 198.58 NO BID NO BID 252.94
(Hon 10752)
G- |Bookease, Three (3) Shelves, 36"w x 13'd x 43'h, Radius Edge 227.29 316.11 NO BID NO BID 338.08 241.41 NO BID 256.38 303.64
(Hon 10753)
G-3 |Bookease, Four (4) Shelves, 36"w x 13'd x 57°h, Radius Edge 256.27 345.79 NO BID NO BID 376.25 270.24 NO BID 293.39 337.76
(Hon 10754)
G-4 |Bookease, Five (5) Shelves, 36"w x 13'd x 71%h, Radius Edge 305.95 396.67 NO BID NO BID 1610.17 319.66 NO BID 316.26 396.26
(Hon 10755)
SECTION H: BOOKCASES -- STEEL
H-1 Bookcase, Two (2) Shelves, One (1) Adjustable Shelf, Heavy-Gauge
Steel with Baked Enamel Finish, 34-1/2"w x 12-5/8"d x 29"h 70.38 155.41 NO BID 122.62 280.41 85.33 339.00 129.34 118.88
(Hon HONS30ABC)
H-2 Bookcase, Two (2) Shelves, Two (2) Adjustable Shelves, Heavy-
Gauge Steel with Baked Enamel Finish, 34-1/2"w x 12-5/8"d x 41"h 84.46 169.83 NO BID 135.07 280.41 99.33 369.00 142.59 135.45
(Hon HONS42ABC)
H-3 Bookcase, Four (4) Shelves, Three (3) Adjustable Shelves, Heavy-
Gauge Steel with Baked Enamel Finish, 34-1/2"w x 12-5/8"d x 47"h 106.81 192.72 NO BID 175.19 344.17 121.57 389.00 183.32 161.78
(Hon HONS48ABC)
H-4 Bookcase, Four (4) Shelves, Four (4) Adjustable Shelves, Heavy-
Gauge Steel with Baked Enamel Finish, 34-1/2"w x 12-5/8"d x 59"h 127.93 214.35 NO BID NO BID 344.17 142.57 NO BID NO BID 186.64
(Hon HONS60ABC)
H-5 Bookcase, Four (4) Shelves, Four (4) Adjustable Shelves, Heavy-
Gauge Steel with Baked Enamel Finish, 34-1/2"w x 12-5/8"d x 71"h 146.14 233.00 NO BID 212.88 344.17 160.69 419.00 221.58 208.09
(Hon HONS72ABC)
H-6 Bookcase, Six (6) Shelves, Four (4) Adjustable Shelves, Heavy-
Gauge Steel with Baked Enamel Finish, 34-1/2"w x 12-5/8"d x 81-1/2"h 200.38 288.55 NO BID 321.63 318.38 214.65 439.00 259.37 271.95

(Hon HONS82ABC)




RFB NO. 2009-056 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS FURNITURE

. BKM
Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
SECTION |: LATERAL FILES
I-1 |File Cabinet, Lateral, Two (2) Drawers with Lock, Recessed Pulls,
36'w x 19d x 28'h (Hon 682L) 242.14 347.06 NO BID 313.89 8613.97 257.43 354.00 324.14 339.23
-2 |File Cabinet, Lateral, Four (4) Drawers with Lock, Recessed Pulls,
36"w x 19'd x 53'h (Hon 684L) 421.22 542.10 NO BID 509.63 11513.57 444.15 541.00 522.86 563.48
13 File Cabinet, Lateral, Five (5) Drawers with Lock, Recessed Pulls,
Top Roll-Out Shelf and Posting Shelf, 36"w x 19"d x 66"h 548.13 680.32 NO BID 666.70 14778.57 571.04 662.00 651.40 722.40
(Hon 685L)
I-4 |File Cabinet, Lateral, Five (5) Drawers with Roll-Out Shelves and Lock,
Recessed Pulls, 36"w x 19'd x 66'h (Hon 655L) 691.79 836.78 NO BID 761.91 3694.54 714.68 754.00 748.06 902.24
I-5 |Drawer Divider for Lateral File Cabinets, Metal, (Hon 515704) 37.67 121.91 NO BID 13.80/ Global NO BID 42.58| 12.00/ Global 1.18/ Global 80.36
-6 |File Cabinet, Lateral, Two (2) Drawers, Woodgrain Laminate,
36"w x 20"d x 29-5/8"h (Hon 10762) 345.69 437.37 NO BID NO BID 407.52 359.19 NO BID 374.82 443.06
I-7 |File Cabinet, Lateral, Two (2) Drawers, Wood Veneer,
36"'w x 20'd x 29-5/8"h (Hon 92762) 529.51 625.63 NO BID NO BID 571.18 542.04 NO BID 709.45 659.51
SECTION J: VERTICAL FILES -- METAL
J-1 |File Cabinet, Two (2) Drawers, Legal Size with Lock,
18'w x 28'd x 29'h (Hon 212CP) 228.52 336.82 NO BID 271.85 366.90 243.81 242.00 281.46 332.16
J-2 |File Cabinet, Two (2) Drawers, Letter Size with Lock,
15"w x 28-1/2"d x 29"h (Hon 212P) 200.10 301.27 NO BID 250.58 332.52 215.39 216.00 259.86 286.58
J-3 |File Cabinet, Four (4) Drawers, Letter Size with Lock,
15"w x 28-1/2"d x 52"h (Hon 214P) 260.05 366.56 NO BID 371.41 1784.34 283.00 266.00 382.53 361.65
J-4 |File Cabinet, Four (4) Drawers, Legal Size with Lock,
18'w x 28-1/2"d x 52"h (Hon 214CP) 291.20 400.48 NO BID 393.15 442,75 314.14 297.00 404.60 400.65
J-5 |File Cabinet, Five (5) Drawers, Legal Size with Lock,
18'w x 28-1/2'd x 60"h (Hon 215CP) 389.30 507.33 NO BID NO BID 2566.39 412.24 393.00 476.73 523.50
J-6|File Cabinet, Five (5) Drawers, Letter Size with Lock, 348.81 463.23 NO BID NO BID 9285.57 371.75 352.00 455.14 472.80

15"w x 28-1/2"d x 60"h (Hon 215P)
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. BKM
Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
SECTION K: COMPUTER WORKSTATIONS
K-1 Extra Wide Computer Workstation, Adjustable Height, Mobile of Four
(4) Casters [Two (2) Locking], 48"w x 25"d x 28" to 40"h, Cherry/Black NO BID NO BID NO BID 343.06 556.74 351.78 448.00 365.55 NO BID
(Safco SAF1928CY)
Computer Stand, 33"w x 24"d with Standard Levelers and Casters
K-2 (High Point Furniture Industries G_324S) NO BID 446.78 NO BID 383.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
K-3 [Workstation, 36"w x 19"d x 50"h, (Tiffany 8350 MR) NO BID 307.32 NO BID 232.53 365.83 NO BID 317.00 NO BID NO BID
K-4 |PC Station, 47-1/4"w x 24"d x 29-1/2"h, (Tiffany 8000DU) NO BID 307.32 NO BID 232.53 NO BID NO BID 317.00 NO BID NO BID
Printer/Computer Table, Traditional Style, Wood Veneer, .
K-5 30-1/2'w x 25'd x 39'h (Kimball TVP-2530W) NO BID 682.61 NO BID 619.29 NO BID 954.43 No Bid 484.67 NO BID
Mini-Tower Workstation, Adjustable Height,
K-6 |35-1/2"w x 22"d x 29" to 34"h (Safco SAF1927GR, SFA1927MO, or NO BID NO BID NO BID 275.40 404.48 345.28 379.00 290.55 NO BID
SAF1927CY)
Computer Workstation, Adjustable Height,
K-7 |[35-1/2"w x 22"d x 29" to 34"h (Safco SF1926GR, SAF1926MO, or NO BID NO BID NO BID 268.96 395.70 327.44 372.00 283.33 NO BID
SAF1926CY)
K-8 |[Computer Stand ( National Waveworks 35N2451CTW) NO BID 523.51 NO BID 465.48 517.58 525.54 No Bid 460.55 527.15
SECTION L: TABLES
L1 ggg;‘g Table, Melamine Top, Metal Legs, 60"l x 30"w (ABCO FTS NOBID|  NOBID 84.76 NO BID 178.42 86.26 NO BID 87.40 NO BID
Folding Table, Melamine Top, Metal Legs, 72" x 30"w, 2 per carton
L-2 (ABCO FTS 3072) NO BID NO BID 86.08 NO BID 179.39 87.24 NO BID 88.74 NO BID
Folding Table, Melamine Top, Metal Legs, 72"l x 24"w, 2 per carton
L-3 (ABCO FTS2472) NO BID NO BID 88.11 NO BID 545.60 89.71 NO BID 90.98 NO BID
L4 Conference Table, Woodgrain Veneer, 96"l x 42"w x 29-1/2"h (Hon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1840.43 NO BID

95235)

OFS
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ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
L5 Conference Table, Woodgrain Veneer, 120"l x 48"w x 29"h (Hon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2688.41 NO BID
95265) OFS
Conference Table, Rectangular with three (3) ea Panel Base, Wood
L-6 |Veneer, 144"l x 48"w Top (Kimball TT3-48144W); Base -3 ea. NO BID 2713.62 NO BID 2656.63 NO BID 4251.11 NO BID 2928.96 NO BID
(Kimball TB1-2530W)
L-7 |Folding Table, 3/4" Thick Plywood Top, 96"l x 30"w (Virco 623096) NO BID NO BID NO BID 233.98 247.00 NO BID NO BID| 125.92/Global NO BID
L-8 |Folding Table, 3/4" Thick Plywood Top 72"l x 30"w (Virco 623072) NO BID NO BID NO BID 220.48 237.03 NO BID NO BID| 110.23/Global NO BID
L-9 |Folding Table, 96" x 18"w (Virco Core-A-Gator 611896) NO BID NO BID NO BID 401.98 359.08 NO BID NO BID No Bid NO BID
L-10 |Folding Table, 96"l x 30"w (Virco Core-A-Gator 613096) NO BID NO BID NO BID 437.98 3030.36 NO BID NO BID 129.85 NO BID
Training Table, Flip Top Nesting Tables on Casters,
L-11 |24"d x 60"w x 28-1/5"h, 1" Thick Laminate Top, Vinyl Edge (Vecta NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 605.70 612.79 NO BID 532.84 897.25
TN6024C)
Conference Table, Traditional Style, Round, Wood Top, Queen Ann
L-12 Wood Base, 48" Diameter (Kimball TT2-48W and TB1-4W) NO BID 1810.35 NO BID 1765.49 NO BID 2058.64 NO BID 1390.35 NO BID
Conference Table, Racetrack Oval, Wood Veneer, 144" x 40"w
L-13 Table: (Hon 90714G); Base: (Hon 91217) 2063.79 2302.51 NO BID NO BID 2709.94 2236.56 NO BID 4069.09 2502.20
Conference Table, Racetrack Oval, Wood Veneer, 120"l x 40"w
L-14 Table: (Hon 90712G); Base: (Hon 91213) 1844.37 2055.57 NO BID NO BID 2400.00 2018.56 NO BID 3562.63 2243.82
Utility/Training Table, Wood Laminate Top, 60"l x 18"w x 30"h
L-15 (Barrick UT1860) NO BID NO BID NO BID 181.69 221.08 220.33 NO BID 288.19 NO BID
Utility/Training Table, Wood Laminate Top, 72"l x 18"w x 30"h
L-16 (Barrick UT1872) NO BID NO BID NO BID 193.69 NO BID 232.50 NO BID 289.79 NO BID
Utility/Training Table, Wood Laminate Top, 60"l x 2418"w x 30"h
L-17 (Barrick UT2460) NO BID NO BID NO BID 197.69 NO BID 234.59 NO BID 297.41 NO BID
L-1g |Vllity/Training Table, Wood Laminate Top, 72°l x 24w x 30%h NOBID| NOBID NO BID 207.69 NO BID 244.67 NO BID 317.88 NO BID

(Barrick UT2472)
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Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB-YES | HUB - YES YES

Utility/Training Table, Wood Laminate Top, 36"l x 24"w x 30"h .

L-19 (Barrick UT2436) NO BID NO BID NO BID 177.69 NO BID 206.36 NO BID No Bid NO BID
Utility/Training Table, Wood Laminate Top, 48"l x 30"w x 30"h

L-20 (Barrick RF3048) NO BID NO BID NO BID 197.69 NO BID 292.99 NO BID 313.86 NO BID
Folding Table, C-Leg Rectangle, 29"h x 53-1/2"w x 27"d

L-21 (Bretford CR8500-CY or CR8500-GM) NO BID NO BID 356.00 278.45 420.40 NO BID 343.00 482.28 320.63
Folding Table, Quarter Round Table, 29"h x 63"w x 27"d .

L-22 (Bretford CR8506-CY or CR8506-GM) NO BID NO BID 429.50 354.16 467.85 NO BID 416.00 No Bid 398.81
Folding Table, Radius Edge, 24"w x 48"d x 29"h 88.06

L-23 (Iceberg 65203 Platinum: 65207 Charcoal) NO BID NO BID NO BID 206.55 Regency NO BID| 93.54/ Global NO BID

L-24 |FOlding Table, Radius Edge, 30"w x 60"d x 29"h NOBID| NOBID NO BID 138.48 1066.45 91.94 NO BID|111.70 / Global NO BID
(Iceberg 65213 Platinum; 65217 Charcoal) Regency

L-p5 |Folding Table, Radius Edge, 30"w x 72"d x 29"h NOBID| NOBID NO BID 153.48 292.95 99.72 NO BID|120.53 / Global NO BID
(Iceberg 65223 Platinum; 65227 Charcoal) Regency

L-26 |0lding Table, Radius Edge, 30"w x 96"d x 29"h NOBID| NOBID NO BID 184.48 302.75 138.61 NO BID|160.27 / Global NO BID
(Iceberg 65233 Platinum; 65237 Charcoal) Regency

L-27 |Round Table Top, 42" diameter (HON LD42F) 134.55 221.13 NO BID NO BID 254.02 164.35 NO BID 190.13 194.44

L-28 |Round Table Top, 48" diameter (HON LD48F) 150.28 237.24 NO BID NO BID 277.98 172.47 NO BID 213.21 212.96

L-29 |Conference Table Top, Racetrack Oval, 48"w x 96"l (Hon LA4896F) 255.02 405.61 NO BID NO BID 373.41 345.61 NO BID 313.68 336.30

L-30 |Conference Table Top, Racetrack Oval, 48"w x 120"l (Hon LA48120F) 319.19 493.55 NO BID NO BID 712.17 409.45 NO BID 496.46 411.86

L-31 |Conference Table Top, Racetrack Oval, 48"w x 144"| (Hon LA48144F) 384.80 552.24 NO BID NO BID 858.92 460.22 NO BID 560.04 453.79
Conference Table Top, Racetrack Oval, 48"w x 240"|

L-32 (Nucraft FO-240-3FP) NOBID|  7777.24 7649.49 7719.29 NO BID NO BID 8455.00 6228.24| 6032.82

L-33 |Cylinder Table Base, 18" diameter x 28"h (Hon BLCY02) 182.99 272.20 NO BID NO BID 310.87 197.34 NO BID 307.69 251.41




RFB NO. 2009-056 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS FURNITURE

. . BKM
IL%M DESCRIPTION P:flgﬁfil;e Cg:ﬁge GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson lmilr'%ergt Spencer Co | Dallas, TX
: HUB - NO | Dallas, TX Fort Worth, TX | Fort Worth, TX | Garland, TX | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB-YES | HUB - YES YES
L-34 |Panel Table Base, 28"w x98"l x 28"h ( Hon BLS02) 170.15 257.59 NO BID NO BID 902.56 254.87 NO BID 342.74 236.36
L-35 |Folding Table, 18"wx 72"L ( Virco 611872) NOBID|  NOBID NO BID 109.00 187.05 NO BID NO BID *87.40 NO BID
L-36 |Folding Table, 30"w x 60"l (Virco 613060) NOBID|  NOBID NO BID 109.00 187.05 NO BID NO BID *87.40 NO BID
L-37 |Folding Table , 30"w x 72"l ( Virco 613072) NOBID|  NOBID NO BID 112.07 190.46 NO BID NO BID *88.74 NO BID
SECTION M: EXECUTIVE CHAIRS
M-1 Exse;lcf,vﬁa%?@i;rbT;%Z?S?lfLaF.iZ?BE;Ogglitsa)r Wood Base, Fabric Seat NO BID 463.35 NO BID 338.89 414.83 368.44 469.00| 301.09/Global NO BID
M-2 EXBES‘CJE,"EEE)?iaCif'C;"rg‘(’j";?,ka(L';i_‘fBPJ;gngég; Wood Base, Fabric Seat NO BID 445.48 NO BID 320.86 403.06 355.70 449.00| 280.98/Global NO BID
M-3 [Executive Chair, High Back, Leather (Boss B7501) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 331.18| 262.91 Result NO BID 291.77 NO BID
M-4 E;‘;Z‘fﬂ‘;gga&a’\g:ﬁﬁ?ﬁ'ﬁ)‘nsé’vgi‘é;') Tilt, Star Wood Base, Wood Arms & 221.08 309.75 NO BID NO BID 403.06 22758 NO BID 262.86 296.33
M-5 5;‘;‘;‘:;‘;?6?::%2ilgzg'b%i‘?k(’zzvé’z’?l'l T("Ft"(;ivz‘zgf)’”g Star Wood Base, 247.99 337.31 NO BID NO BID 414.83 254.34 NO BID 382.04 328.01
M-6 Eﬁggit\;?e%h:ri%siggb%iegké21V52/?|2T"(t|'_§.i§52$38 lsztg)r Wood Base, NOBID| 49338 NO BID 368.93 414.83| 368.44/National 505.00 687.73|  NOBID
M-7 Eéiglféizieih::;}gfilg:gb%ifg2gZ?LI!!t'(Ezi.gg;%§fg;¥v ood Base, NOBID| 60553 NO BID 481.09| *414.83/Fabric 599.92 637.00 937.96)  NOBID
M-8 |Executive Chair, High-Back, Fabric: Grade L (Hon 2091) 206.59 294.91 NO BID NO BID 24472.86 212.31 NO BID 291.77 279.26
M-9 El’ég;‘f)v e Chair, Wood Base, Fabric: Grade 6 Leather (National NO BID 701.41 NO BID 602.36 1612.36 694.68 NO BID 629.19 746.59
M-10 |Executive Chair, High-Back, Fabric: Grade Il (Hon 4701) 223.15 311.87 NO BID 375.00 344.29 229.63 NO BID 217.68 298.76
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. BKM
Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
M-11 |Executive Chair, High-Back, Fabric: Grade L (Hon 4701) 357.28 449.24 NO BID 375.00 496.93 363.08 NO BID 366.35 456.71
M-12 |Executive Chair with Arms, High-Back, Fabric: Grade Il (Hon 3501) 32251 413.63 NO BID 482.64 457.36 328.47 NO BID 232.89 415.76
Executive Task Chair, High Back, with Headrest, Fabric Grade 1
M-13 (Humanscale Freedom F211) NO BID 642.73 544.65 588.51 636.49 NO BID 695.00 582.19 NO BID
M-14 |Executive Chair, Swivel Tilt, Leather (Eurotech Louisville LES8505) NO BID 283.97 NO BID 219.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID 291.77 NO BID
M-15 |Executive Transitional Chair, Leather (LE9403) NO BID 363.80 NO BID 303.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID 769.67 NO BID
M-16 |Chair, High-Back, Fabric: Grade Il (Hon 6212) 305.95 396.67 NO BID NO BID 438.52 312.00 NO BID 354.57 396.26
M-17 |Chair, Mid-Back, Fabric: Grade Ill (Hon 6213) 289.39 379.71 NO BID NO BID 419.67 295.53 NO BID 322.19 376.76
Chair, Management Mid-Back, Vinyl, 26"w x 26"d x 38 - 42-1/4"h
M-18 (Cromecraft, Solas Series X 383 770 01) 488.00 500.94 412.36 426.38 484.28 445.70 435.00 434.05 NO BID
Chair, Executive High-Back, Vinyl, .
M-19 (Cromecraft, Solas Series X 381 770 01) 516.00 525.15 436.57 450.60(431.38/National 455.56 529.00 460.06 NO BID
Desk Chair, Aluminum Base, Seat Topper, No Back Topper,
M-20 Fabric: Grade A (Knoll Life KSS55H34A5KGHBSF) NO BID NO BID 588.93 NO BID NO BID 692.81 NO BID 360.46 NO BID
Chair, Mid-Back with Arms, Adjustable Seat Height and Tension .
M-21 (NeutralPosture® EMB112K) NO BID NO BID NO BID 405.34 517.58 448.53 512.00 No Bid NO BID
M-22 |Chair, High-Back with Arms, Adjustable Seat Height and Tension NOBID|  NOBID NO BID 458.64 455.85 507.76 569.00 NoBid|  NOBID

(NeutralPosture® EMM2106-S)
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Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
SECTION N: TASK CHAIRS
N-1 [Executive Posture Chair, High-Back, Fabric: Grade Il (Hon 6003) 225.63 314.41 NO BID NO BID 4032.12 232.11 NO BID 336.42 301.70
N-p [Arms for M-1, Adjustable, Non-Upholstered. To be available as an 41.40 125.73 NO BID NO BID 591.58 48.85 NO BID NO BID 84.75
option. (Hon 6093)
Management Task Chair, with Arms, Fabric: Grade 2 - High
N-3 Performance (United SVX-11) NO BID 367.60 NO BID 258.06 5693.52 NO BID 352.00 NO BID NO BID
N-4 [Multi-Task Chair, Without Arms, Fabric: Grade Ill (Hon 7703) 151.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID 262.32 NO BID NO BID 153.40 NO BID
N-5 [Task Chair, with Arms, Mesh Back, Fabric: Grade B (Boss 6207) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Task Stool with Swivel, Pneumatic Seat Height Adjustment, Adjustable
N-6 Seat Back Height, Fabric: Grade Il (Hon 7705) 161.05 248.27 NO BID NO BID 1006.71 167.86 NO BID 174.01 NO BID
Task Chair, Without Arms, Pneumatic Height Adjustment, Five Prong
N-7 Star Base, Fabric Seat and Back, Fabric: Grade Il (Hon 7901) 86.53 171.95 NO BID NO BID 188.83 93.73 NO BID 133.78 137.89
Task Chair, with Arms, Mesh Back, Fabric: Grade 1
N-8 (Humanscale Liberty L111) NO BID 590.20 492.12 501.87 553.61 NO BID 554.00 495.52 NO BID
N-9 24-Hour Task Chair, Without Arms, Pneumatic Seat Height
Adjustment, 262.48 352.15 NO BID NO BID 3107.38 268.82 NO BID NO BID 345.08
Adjustable Back Height, Swivel, Fabric: Grade Ill (Hon 7754)
24-Hour Task Chair, With Arms, Pneumatic Seat Height Adjustment,
N-10 Adjustable Back Height, Swivel, Fabric: Grade Il (Hon 7734) 316.30 407.27 NO BID NO BID 3719.78 322.30 NO BID NO BID 408.45
N-11 |Task Chair, High-Back, with Arms, Fabric: Grade Ill (Hon 7803) 209.07 297.45 NO BID NO BID 12377.43 215.18 NO BID 366.35 282.20
N-12 |Task Chair with Arms, High-Back, Fabric: Grade Il (Hon 7604) 310.09 400.91 NO BID NO BID 12772.14 316.13 NO BID 319.24 401.44
N-13 |Task Chair with Arms, Mid-Back, Fabric: Grade IIl (Hon 7624) 289.39 397.71 NO BID NO BID 419.67 295.53 NO BID 330.52 376.76
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IL%M DESCRIPTION PL:)alr;ﬁ()O’q‘_l;e ngﬁgaete GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson Imicsﬁgt Spencer Co | Dallas, TX

: HUB - NO | Dallas, TX Fort Worth, TX | Fort Worth, TX | Garland, TX | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -

HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES

N-14 (Sl\tl(;(;L)rl;;)IWG%?gEaAl\\?égség%()e Arms, Fabric: Grade 2 385.76 476.61 403.52 377.06 396.97 NO BID 480.00 384.99 400.33
N-15 (Téisgycbﬁta:{’zgggg)e Height-Adjustable Backrest, Fabric: Grade 1 801.00 NOBID NO BID 680.02 723.47 709.40 NO BID NOBID|  NOBID
N-16 |Task Chair, Without Arms, High-Back, Fabric: Grade 2 (Sit On It TR2) NO BID 240.85 170.17 166.31 329.96 NO BID 253.00 NO BID NO BID
N-17 g?:gfﬂf’(i&”\s’\t’gzlASrS“,jl'_g\iE;"BaCk' Standard Upholstery, Black Finish 458.000 NOBID NO BID NO BID 437.58 452.42 NO BID| 401.68/Globall ~ NOBID
N-18 ﬁ;:?gggg ikziiﬁ's:’:mﬁggupsetfgﬁ_ﬁmsHigh'BaCk’ 396.00/  NOBID NO BID NO BID 1923.91 347.33 NO BID 588.61  NOBID
N-19 l:ﬁ'r‘lccrg:; d\giﬁ:m(ﬁ cﬁ]”z;;")id'BaCk’ Pneumatic, Swivel, Tilt Lock 130.41|  216.89 NO BID NO BID 387.63 137.39 NO BID 234.36 189.56
N-20 Iﬁftoccﬂa'éa\é\::ih gi;‘aedde'?ﬁig(gto:]'ﬁg;‘%’ Mid-Back, Pneumatic, Swivel, 155.25 242.33 NO BID NO BID 444.89 162.10 NO BID 277.05 218.86
N-21 l:;lr(.ccrg:; d\giﬁT (ﬂﬁidﬁg)s' Mid-Back, Pneumatic, Swivel, 183.82 271.59 NO BID NO BID 299.54 190.52 NO BID 247.12 252.45
N-22 l:;':l CStg?; d";’im‘zﬁoﬁrﬁdgne”maﬂc' Swivel, Foot Rest, 190.44| 29279 NO BID NO BID 323.09 211.11 NO BID 318.27 276.83
N-23 l:;':l CStg?; d";’im (FA’;end glrg?' Pneumatic, Swivel, Foot Rest, 221.08|  309.75 NO BID NO BID 341.94 227.58 NO BID 364.39 296.33
N-24 ﬁaeg:gagf;d?DV\(’msggzI_S,\t/lazkc':”g ‘F’Q"glr;t%;’ho'smred Seat and Back 24800/ NOBID NO BID NO BID 1399.68 250.91 NO BID 253.98|  NOBID
N-25 l:;':iccgfga;’vfi(%‘;tgﬁgg‘;%:E;Osfggégzé)seat Width 23° NOBID| NOBID NO BID NO BID 316555  711.38/Fuel NO BID NOBID|  954.53
N-26 |Task Chair, Intensive Use (Raynor Eurotech 24/7) NO BID 325.38 NO Bid 263.46 2492.46 541.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID
N-27 (T;‘:r‘;ocr:gg gggmﬁ;’k Deep Seat, Seat Width: 21" Fabric: Grade A NOBID|  585.11 NO Bid 510.57 409.15| 362.12/National 586.00 513.00]  NOBID
N-2g | Fask Chair, High-Back, Seat Width: 20" Fabric: Grade A NOBID|  564.07 NO Bid 489.52 409.15| 362.12/National 565.00 49195  NOBID

(Performa3 3024 MU)
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Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
) Task Chair, Full-Back, Height/Width Adjustable T-Arms, . .
N-29 Fabric: Grade 1(Turnstone® Crew™ TS30822U) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID}407.12/National 359.87/National NO BID| 390.39/Global 41450
H Tl - - ™
N-30 %Z'Blcé‘g‘l:ﬂr) Square H Back, Fabric: Grade 1(Tumnstone® A-La-Carte NOBID| NOBID NO BID NO BID}407.12/National|  359.87/National NO BID NOBID|  278.50
N-31 Igikp\clg‘;‘"’ Adjustable Seat, Fabric: Grade 1(Leap by Steelcase NOBID| NOBID NO Bid NO BID| 441.64/ Fuel 398.22/Fuel NO BID| 510.11/Global 699.53
Task Chair, High-Back, with Arms, Fabric: Grade 1(Criterion by .
N-32 Steelcase 4535331DW) NO BID NO BID NO Bid NO BID 441.64/Fuel 398.22/Fuel NO BID| 511.59/Global 715.46
SECTION O: GUEST CHAIRS
uest Chair, Side Arms, Wood Frame and Arms, Fabric Seat an
O-1 (Back, 202.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1242.26 209.04 NO BID 315.81 274.39
Eabric: Price Code Ill__(Hon 2304)
Guest Chair, Side Arms, Metal Frame, Fabric Seat, Vinyl Back,
0-2 Fabric: Grade Four (United S-32) NO BID 296.07 NO BID 186.52 214.22 NO BID 275.00 NO BID NO BID
0-3 |[Stack Chair, Four (4) per Carton (Hon 4031) 173.88 261.41 NO BID NO BID 6514.41 183.18 NO BID 324.46 240.75
Guest Chair, Side Arms, Sled Base, Wood Frame, Fabric Seat and
0-4 Back, Fabric: Grade 11l (Hon 2903) 190.03 277.95 NO BID NO BID 4445.28 196.69 NO BID| 182.35/Global 259.76
Guest Chair, Stack Arm, Fabric Seat and Back, Fabric: Grade Il
0-5 (Hon 4071) [Note: Please bid price per carton.(Set of two)] 211.14 299.57 NO BID NO BID 5046.36 220.25 NO BID 254.80 284.63
Guest Side Arm Chair, Metal Frame, Fabric Seat and Back,
0-6 Fabric: Grade lll (Hon 4003) 93.15 178.73 NO BID NO BID 5781.93 100.32 NO BID 130.84 145.69
Guest Side Arm Chair, Metal Frame with Sled Base, Fabric Seat and
O-7 Back, Fabric: Grade |1l (Hon 6008) 144.90 231.73 NO BID NO BID 4423.45 151.81 NO BID 98.48/Global 206.63
0-8 [Guest Chair, Fabric: Grade L (Hon 2093) 181.75 269.47 NO BID NO BID 12987.51 188.00 NO BID 248.09 250.01
0-9 ﬁgg?gha‘r' Fabric Seat and Back, Fabric: Grade 6 (National NOBID|  491.46 NO BID 400.74 498.49 461.40 NO BID 419.24 505.21
0-10 |Guest Chair, Wood Arms, Fabric Seat and Back, Fabric: Grade Il 175.95 263.53 NO BID 273.21 2122.68 182.69 NO BID 336.91 243.19

(Hon 2111)
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Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
0-11 (Guest Chair, Sled Base, Fabric: Grade A (Performa3 3032) NO BID 307.59 NO BID 233.09 347.83 240.74 308.00| 199.03/Global NO BID
0-12 |Stack Chair, Armless, Fabric: Grade A (Izzy Designs Escort 934 NO BID 199.71 122.91 119.71 198.38 NO BID 198.00 129.36 NO BID
SECTION P: MISCELLANEOQUS
Machine Stand with Laminate Top, 30" x 22", Metal Lower Shelf
P-1 (Tiffany 2140CA) NO BID 189.82 NO BID 121.41 213.08 NO BID 186.00 109.90 NO BID
P-2 |Metal Storage Cabinet, Locking, 4 Adjustable Shelves (Hon SC1872) 276.14 366.14 NO BID NO BID 5255.62 297.68 313.00 309.41 361.16
P-3 (EﬁgnTSafg%’)WOOd Veneer Top, Solid Wood Legs, 24'w x 20"d x 20%h 144.07 356.45 NO BID NO BID 632.36 220.66 NO BID 423.20 NO BID
Metal Storage Cabinet, Two-Door with Lock, Two Adjustable Shelves,
P-4 36w x 18'd x 42'h (Hon SC1842) 232.67 321.62 NO BID NO BID 1504.57 254.43 267.00 260.85 309.98
Multi-Compartment Fax Stand, 30"w x 20"d, Top Section with Four
P-5 |Open Shelves and Moveable Dividers, 28"w x 19"d, Lower Locking NO BID NO BID 508.50 458.88 NO BID NO BID 537.00 398.66 501.19
Storage, Casters (Bretford Fax2)
P-6 |Utility Cabinet (Tiffany, Model 2110MU) NO BID 247.36 NO BID 188.08 NO BID NO BID 265.00 NO BID NO BID
P-7 |Corner Unit (Hon 107811) 350.66 442.46 NO BID NO BID 489.39 371.81 NO BIDP80.88/LaCasse 448.91
P-8 |Task Light (Hon H870960) 81.56 166.86 NO BID NO BID 183.17 91.34 NO BID 119.97 132.04
P-9 |Printer Stand, Two Level, 23-1/2"w x 20"d x 15"h (Safco 1880) NO BID NO BID NO BID 143.47 NO BID 164.39 247.00 156.11 NO BID
p-10 |\iobile Machine Stand with Sorter, 28-1/8"w x 19-3/4"d x 30-1/4h NOBID|  NOBID NO BID 321.86 443.02 372.78 423.00 322.22|  NOBID
(Safco 1851)
P-11 |Mobile Machine Stand, 32"w x 24-1/4"d x 30-1/4"h (Safco 1872BL) NO BID NO BID NO BID 299.08 415.30 347.78 400.00 299.44 NO BID
P-12 [Mobile File, Letter Size, 14"w x 26"d x 27"h (Mayline 9P610) NO BID NO BID 111.64 101.88 NO BID NO BID 176.00 200.37 NO BID
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Plano Office | corporate . Intelligent
ITEM DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Source GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson interiors | SPencer Co | Dallas, TX
NO. HUB - NO | Dallas, Tx | Fort Worth, TX| Fort Worth, TX | Garland, Tx | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES

P-13 |Mobile File, Legal Size, 17"w x 26"d x 27"h (Mayline 9P611) NO BID 174.04 120.49 112.69 NO BID NO BID 190.00 102.04 NO BID
Mobile File, 2-Drawer, Letter Size, 14-3/4"w x 26"d x 27"h

P-14 (Mayline 9P620) NO BID 219.63 162.20 158.28 NO BID NO BID 243.00 139.36 NO BID
Mobile File, 2-Drawer, Legal Size, 17-3/4"w x 26"d x 27"h

P-15 (Mayline 9P621) NO BID 237.49 178.54 176.14 NO BID NO BID 264.00 153.98 NO BID
Mobile Machine Stand with 8" Drop Leaves,

P-16 20" to 36"w x 18"d x 26-3/4"h (Safco 1876) NO BID NO BID NO BID 115.31 205.06 141.67 229.00 126.66 NO BID
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Plano Office| Corporate . Intelligent
IL%M DESCRIPTION Plano, TX Soﬁjrce GL Seaman |Royer & Schutts |4, Workspace Wilson InFerﬁ)rs Spencer Co | Dallas, TX
: HUB - NO | Dallas, TX Fort Worth, TX | Fort Worth, TX | Garland, TX | Carrollton, TX| addison, Tx | Dallas, TX HUB -
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - YES | HUB - YES YES
*Did not
Discount Off Other Products Not Already Specified in this Bid: include
install
ABCO 40% 54% 25% 50%
ALLSTEEL 57.1% 60 to 66.4%
ANATOME 61.5% 51%/Workrite
BARRICK 0% 30% 7%
BODYBILT 56.1% 0% 5000%
BOSS
BRETFORD 40% 49.5% 25% 50% 45%
CHROMECRAFT 55.1% 40% 38.5% 54%
EUROTECH 54.5%
GLOBAL 51.1% 40% 50.5% 46.5%
HIGHPOINT 30.0% 47.5% 50%
HON 61.1% 40% 58.9%
HUMANSCALE 40% 55.5% 30% 50% 52.5%
ICEBURG 49.5% 25%
1zzY 40% 55% 50% 51%
KIMBALL 57% 59.5/Gunlocke
KNOLL 40%
LA-Z-BOY 60.5% 47%
MAYLINE 40% 40% 52.5% 25% 55% 50%
NATIONAL 60.5% 40% 55%
NEUTRAL POSTURE 57.5% 50% 48.5%
NUCRAFT 40% 51.50% 41%
SAFCO 44% 25% 50% 33%
SITONIT 40% 64% 50% 55%
STEELCASE
TIFFANY 54.5% 25% 51.5%
TURNSTONE
UNITED 56.5% 47.5%
VECTA
VIRCO 47.5% 25%

* Note: These item were not considered acceptable alternates.
All awards were made by product manufacture.




