BID 2009-051

PURCHASE OF FURNITURE FOR TARRANT COUNTY MILLER AVENUE SUB-COURTHOUSE PHASE 2

CORPORATE ROYER & WORKSPACE INTELLIGENT

SOURCE SCHUTTS | | seaman | S.R. ANDERSON| soLuTions | INTERIORS

Dallas, TX | Fort Worth, TX'| Fort Worth, TX | Double Oak, TX | San Antonio, TX| Addison, TX

HUB-Yes HUB- Yes HUB-No HUB-Yes HUB-No HUB-Yes
Summary
1. CASEGOODS $ 20,509.19 | $ 19,020.61 | $ 13,408.49 No Bid | $ 13,891.47 | $ 12,570.00
2. SEATING $ 56,534.07 | $ 54,309.93 | $ 64,379.25 *** 18,931 *** 33,910.18 | $ 56,298.00
3. TABLES $ 1452323 $ 13,659.41 | $ 14,225.79 No Bid **12845.7 | $ 13,313.00
4. FILES & STORAGE *»*8091.95| $ 22,383.44 | $ 24,850.10 No Bid | $ 2437710 | $ 30,617.00
5. MISCELLANEOUS **8381.73 | $ 17,488.05 | $ 17,988.06 **k 4,278 *x 8 130.56 | $ 18,965.00
D-1 2202.20 2097.72 1332.61 No Bid 1180.18 1249.00
D-2 2202.20 2097.72 1332.61 No Bid 1180.18 1205.00
D-3 1399.19 1317.74 756.14 No Bid 1383.07 715.00
F1 1261.70 1153.00 754.26 No Bid 551.38 709.00
F-2 814.96 724.00 426.98 No Bid 267.17 392.00
F-3 320.80 296.48 213.98 No Bid 205.60 194.00
BC-1 307.77 236.89 381.83 No Bid 202.51 345.00
BC-2 327.46 294.22 410.28 No Bid 582.34 516.00
C-1 511.95 383.15 510.54 384.50 509.22 388.00
C-2 573.39 372.58 565.97 382.50 520.61 424.00
C-3 159.17 150.97 152.86 226.00 292.50 152.00
C-4 201.57 187.87 195.03 246.00 255.27 189.00
C-5 319.64 322.68 326.23 No Bid 318.21 318.00
C-6 725.02 704.63 669.55 294.50 273.76 709.00
C-7 201.57 187.87 192.22 246.00 269.90 189.00
C-8 274.31 25893.34 287.23 No Bid No Bid 26610.00
C-9 675.19 565.72 629.50 No Bid No Bid 499.00
C-10 347.15 233.20 344.24 416.50 350.87 235.00
C-1 No Bid 70.09 68.95 No Bid 62.49 68.00
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HUB-Yes HUB- Yes HUB-No HUB-Yes HUB-No HUB-Yes
C-12 No Bid 167.05 237.59 No Bid 242.86 163.00
T-1 278.96 269.95 291.98 No Bid 256.93 271.00
T-2 509.46 522.96 543.15 No Bid 514.87 518.00
T-3 283.86 288.86 311.15 No Bid 292.22 290.00
T-4 781.69 629.79 651.59 No Bid 533.17 625.00
F-4A No Bid 1525.06 1698.57 No Bid 1576.99 1817.00
F-4B No Bid 1405.21 1576.90 No Bid 1729.44 1817.00
F-5 736.66 694.79 760.53 No Bid 862.47 801.00
SC-1 296.77 264.26 291.83 No Bid 296.10 291.00
SC-2 No Bid 1446.78 1569.93 No Bid 1356.67 1442.00
SS-1 271.23 286.72 314.36 No Bid 205.96 549.00
SS-2 242.00 257.50 284.70 No Bid 180.07 549.00
SS-3 287.84 303.34 331.24 No Bid 219.20 549.00
SC-4 260.34 275.84 303.32 No Bid 195.03 549.00
CD-1 132.33 107.83 111.24 No Bid 132.03 108.00
MS-1 1855.00 1682.50 1650.36 No Bid 1967.76 1856.00
R-1 No Bid 1394.14 1545.76 No Bid No Bid 1425.00
TR-1 No Bid 540.48 492.23 No Bid No Bid 575.00
TR-2 No Bid 1125.30 1086.17 No Bid No Bid 1326.00
C-13 No Bid 2086.61 2231.07 No Bid No Bid 2415.00
K-1 176.39 168.99 178.10 138.00 167.83 169.50
Note:

* The bid received from O.M. Workspace/Officemax was rejected because the bid proposal did not include deliver & installation in unit price
** The bid received from Workspace Solutions under section 3 (Tables) was not an approved equal.

*** The total price does not represent a bid on all items in this category. Several lines were "No Bids".
*ex A bid was received from FBW Web, this bid was rejected because it did not include the signed addendum.




