
ITEM 
NO. DESCRIPTION

IKON
Houston, TX

The Tree 
House
Newton 

Centre, MA

Advantage 
Office 

Supplies
Benbrook, TX

CVR 
Computer 
Supplies

Cherry Hill, 
NJ

MCPC 
Cleveland, 

OH

Worldwide 
Imaging 
Supplies

San Antonio, 
TX

Accurate 
Forms and 
Supplies
Hurst, TX

H.U.B. - NO H.U.B. - NO H.U.B. - NO H.U.B. - NO H.U.B. - NO H.U.B. - YES H.U.B. - NO
1 HP CB335WN HP No. 74 Black $12.57 $12.20 $13.97 $11.00 $13.07 No Bid $12.52
2 HP CB337WN HP No. 75 Tricolor $15.34 $23.60 $17.54 $15.00 $15.56 No Bid $15.91
3 HP C4841A - cyan $29.53 $27.90 $33.32 $24.00 $29.01 No Bid $30.62
4 HP C4842A - yellow $29.53 $27.90 $33.32 $24.00 $29.01 No Bid $30.62
5 HP C4843A - magenta $29.53 $27.90 $33.32 $26.00 $29.01 No Bid $30.62
6 HP C4844A - black $28.23 $27.90 $30.94 $24.00 $28.42 No Bid $30.28
7 HP C4911A - cyan $31.75 $31.40 $35.51 $28.00 $33.70 No Bid $33.07
8 HP C4912A - magenta $31.75 $31.40 $35.51 $26.00 $33.70 No Bid $33.07
9 HP C4913A - yellow $31.75 $31.40 $35.51 $26.00 $33.70 No Bid $33.07
10 HP CP4930A $172.34 $172.00 $195.79 $162.00 $175.36 No Bid $180.35
11 HP C4931A $173.16 $171.00 $195.79 $161.00 $175.36 No Bid $180.35
12 HP C4932A $173.16 $171.00 $195.79 $166.00 $175.36 No Bid $180.35
13 HP C4933A $173.16 $171.00 $195.79 $163.00 $175.36 No Bid $180.35
14 HP C4934A $173.16 $171.00 $195.79 $163.00 $175.36 No Bid $180.35
15 HP C4935A $173.16 $171.00 $195.79 $166.00 $175.36 No Bid $180.35
16 HP 51645A CARTRIDGE $26.44 $26.90 $28.86 $23.00 $25.89 No Bid $28.56
17 HP C6578DN CARTRIDGE $29.84 $29.20 $32.77 $26.20 $29.67 No Bid $30.94
18 HP C6656AN BLACK CARTRIDGE $18.09 $18.30 $19.97 $15.70 $18.02 No Bid $19.34
19 HP C6657AN TRI-COLOR CART. $29.84 $29.45 $32.77 $26.20 $29.84 No Bid $30.94
20 HEW C5010DN $26.26 $25.90 $27.97 $25.60 $26.00 No Bid $27.42
21 HEW C5011DN $19.61 $19.30 $20.81 $20.00 $19.61 No Bid $20.34
22 Epson T042220  C82- Cyan $9.83 $10.50 $10.75 $8.00 $9.26 No Bid $10.52
23 Epson T042320 - Magenta $9.83 $10.50 $10.75 $8.00 $9.26 No Bid $10.52
24 Epson T042420 - Yellow $9.83 $10.50 $10.75 $8.00 $9.26 No Bid $10.52
25 Epson T032120 - Black $27.84 $24.40 $29.25 $22.00 $24.20 No Bid $28.20

RFB 2009-046 Annual Contract for Toner Cartridges for Ink Jet and Laser Printers

VENDOR INFORMATION

*The bid received from Xerox on item 59A has been withdrawn due to a clerical error. Ikon did not agree to accept a secondary award.
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26 Epson T003011 -  Color 900 $27.36 $22.95 $26.94 $19.00 $23.84 No Bid $26.59
27 Epson T003012 - Black $41.36 $38.80 $44.81 $19.00 $42.16 No Bid $44.21
28 Epson T005011 - Color $29.77 $27.92 $32.59 $26.00 $30.48 No Bid $32.15
29 Lexmark 265 Black, 18L0032 $28.49 $25.70 $29.73 $24.00 $25.47 No Bid $29.18
30 Lexmark 265 Color, 18L0042 $34.92 $32.10 $35.78 $26.00 $29.49 No Bid $37.40
31 Epson 78 Claria - Black - T078120 $14.82 $13.05 $14.81 $14.00 $14.03 No Bid $14.71
32 Epson 78 Claria - Cyan - T078220 $11.85 $10.05 $11.64 $12.00 $10.59 No Bid $11.26
33 Epson 78 Claria - Magenta - T078320 $11.85 $10.05 $11.64 $12.00 $10.59 No Bid $11.26
34 Epson 78 Claria - Yellow - T078420 $11.85 $10.05 $11.64 $12.00 $10.59 No Bid $11.26
35 Epson 78 Claria - Light Cyan  T078520 $11.85 $10.05 $11.64 $12.00 $10.59 No Bid $11.26
36 Epson 78 Claria - Lt Magenta T078620 $11.85 $10.05 $11.64 $12.00 $10.59 No Bid $11.26

37A HP CC364A $132.74 $138.00 $159.07 $128.00 $140.00 No Bid $139.04
37B HP REMAN CC364A No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
38A HP CB436A $60.16 $63.00 $66.58 $60.00 $63.55 No Bid $62.91
38B HP REMAN CB436A No Bid $42.00 No Bid $26.00 $54.88 $79.95 $36.14
39A HP C9731A $270.71 $270.00 $296.29 $249.00 $272.36 No Bid $282.99
39B HP REMAN C9731A $134.00 $98.00 $211.06 $80.00 $157.17 $180.00 $102.11
40A HP C9732A $270.71 $270.00 $296.29 $252.00 $272.94 No Bid $282.99
40B HP REMAN C9732A $134.00 $98.00 $211.06 $90.00 $157.17 $180.00 $102.11
41A HP C9733A $270.71 $270.00 $296.29 $260.00 $272.94 No Bid $282.99
41B HP REMAN C9733A $134.00 $98.00 $211.06 $80.00 $157.17 $180.00 $102.11
42A HP C4096A $86.32 $86.00 $93.55 $79.00 $86.49 No Bid $90.01
42B HP REMAN C4096A $63.99 $36.00 $57.70 $29.00 $45.23 $49.95 $26.55
43A HP Q2671A $113.13 $113.00 $124.87 $112.00 $115.14 No Bid $121.76
43B HP REMAN Q2671A $89.99 $82.00 $108.62 $40.00 $93.42 $110.00 $73.75
44A HP Q2672A $113.13 $113.00 $124.87 $114.00 $115.14 No Bid $118.43
44B HP REMAN Q2672A $81.99 $82.00 $108.62 $40.00 $93.42 $110.00 $73.75

*The bid received from Xerox on item 59A has been withdrawn due to a clerical error. Ikon did not agree to accept a secondary award.
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45A HP Q2673A $113.13 $113.00 $124.87 $114.00 $115.14 No Bid $118.43
45B HP REMAN Q2673A $81.99 $82.00 $108.62 $46.00 $93.42 $110.00 $73.75
46A HP Q2670A $113.78 $113.00 $124.62 $110.00 $115.14 No Bid $118.82
46B HP REMAN Q2670A $82.99 $82.00 $109.76 $36.00 $93.42 $99.99 $78.02
47A HP Q2612A $60.16 $60.00 $65.56 $57.00 $59.07 No Bid $72.91
47B HP REMAN Q2612A $46.99 $31.00 $54.76 $29.00 $44.10 $45.00 $23.00
48A HP C8061X $109.85 $110.00 $120.26 $97.89 $110.04 No Bid $115.07
48B HP REMAN C8061X $85.99 $38.00 $60.33 $29.00 $60.44 $69.00 $28.42
49A HP Q1338A $131.81 $131.00 $143.40 $122.00 $133.45 No Bid $138.07
49B HP REMAN Q1338A $103.99 $59.00 $112.36 $36.00 $86.82 $99.99 $46.04
50A HP Q2613A $61.46 $62.00 $67.50 $57.00 $61.47 No Bid $64.09
50B HP REMAN Q2613A $46.99 $33.00 $56.18 $27.00 $49.94 $55.00 $24.09
51A HP Q2610A $103.31 $103.00 $113.12 $94.00 $103.55 No Bid $108.27
51B HP REMAN Q2610A $79.99 $43.00 $77.46 $37.00 $67.93 $69.95 $31.71
52A HP Q1339A $175.23 $173.00 $191.81 $158.00 $176.78 No Bid $182.81
52B HP REMAN Q1339A $141.99 $65.00 $125.91 $46.00 $114.94 $119.00 $46.04
53A HP Q5942A $128.16 $128.00 $140.74 $124.00 $129.30 No Bid $133.89
53B HP REMAN Q5942A $106.99 $63.00 $134.61 $38.00 $85.86 $110.00 $46.04
54A HP Q5949A $61.46 $62.00 $66.62 $60.00 $61.86 No Bid $64.09
54B HP REMAN Q5949A $45.99 $40.00 $45.68 $29.00 $52.45 $69.95 $33.12
55A HP Q6000A $65.39 $65.00 $70.50 $62.00 $66.83 No Bid $67.92
55B HP REMAN Q6000A $50.99 $52.00 $68.74 $29.00 $61.46 $60.00 $58.10
56A HP Q6001A $71.27 $71.00 $78.67 $65.00 $72.73 No Bid $74.13
56B HP REMAN Q6001A $60.99 $54.00 $72.28 $29.00 $67.93 $60.00 $58.10

*The bid received from Xerox on item 59A has been withdrawn due to a clerical error. Ikon did not agree to accept a secondary award.
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57A HP Q6002A $71.27 $71.00 $78.67 $69.00 $72.73 No Bid $74.13
57B HP REMAN Q6002A $60.99 $54.00 $72.28 $28.00 $67.93 $60.00 $58.10
58A HP Q6003A $71.27 $71.00 $78.67 $69.00 $72.73 No Bid $74.13
58B HP REMAN Q6003A $60.99 $54.00 $72.28 $28.00 $67.93 $60.00 $58.10
59A HEWC7115A *$52.97 $54.00 $57.88 $69.00 $54.06 No Bid $55.04
59B HP REMAN HEWC7115A $43.99 $31.00 $47.71 $29.00 $42.89 $45.00 $10.96
60A HEWC9730A $192.89 $191.00 $212.95 $186.00 $193.82 No Bid $201.85
60B HP REMAN HEWC9730A $126.11 $97.00 $136.05 $60.00 $126.66 $170.00 $98.55
61A HEWQ3960A $71.27 $71.00 $78.67 $70.00 $72.54 No Bid $74.13
61B HP REMAN HEWQ3960A $62.99 $45.00 $74.05 $29.00 $61.82 $94.00 $46.49
62A HEWQ3971A $63.42 $63.00 $70.25 $64.00 $63.68 No Bid $65.96
62B HP REMAN HEWQ3971A $53.21 $45.00 No Bid $28.00 No Bid $99.00 $48.40
63A HEWQ3972A $63.42 $63.00 $70.25 $64.00 $63.68 No Bid $65.96
63B HP REMAN HEWQ3972A $53.21 $45.00 No Bid $29.00 No Bid $99.00 $48.40
64A HEWQ3973A $63.42 $63.00 $70.25 $62.00 $63.68 No Bid $65.96
64B HP REMAN HEWQ3973A $53.21 $45.00 No Bid $29.00 No Bid $99.00 $48.40
65A HEWC9720A $133.39 $133.00 $146.42 $119.00 $135.44 No Bid $139.63
65B HP REMAN HEWC9720A $87.17 $64.00 $117.75 $49.00 $108.69 $99.99 $67.90
66A HEWC9721A $180.46 $180.00 $198.70 $164.00 $182.67 No Bid $188.62
66B HP REMAN HEWC9721A $115.95 $64.00 $131.20 $49.00 $112.77 $110.00 $67.90
67A HEWC9722A $180.46 $180.00 $198.70 $164.00 $182.67 No Bid $188.62
67B HP REMAN HEWC9722A $115.95 $64.00 $131.20 $49.00 $112.77 $110.00 $67.90
68A HEWC9723A $180.46 $180.00 $198.70 $159.00 $182.67 No Bid $188.62
68B HP REMAN HEWC9723A $115.95 $64.00 $131.20 $69.00 $112.77 $110.00 $67.90
69A HEWQ6511A $106.58 $107.00 $114.94 $106.00 $107.16 No Bid $111.32
69B HP REMAN HEWQ6511A $87.99 $55.00 $96.37 $42.00 $78.80 $59.95 $45.56

*The bid received from Xerox on item 59A has been withdrawn due to a clerical error. Ikon did not agree to accept a secondary award.
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70A HEWQ5950A $153.01 $152.00 $168.92 $149.00 $155.01 No Bid $159.63
70B HP REMAN HEWQ5950A $113.99 $92.00 $132.52 $62.00 $113.04 $170.00 $94.39
71A HEWQ5951A $217.08 $216.00 $239.65 $197.00 $219.15 No Bid $226.98
71B HP REMAN HEWQ5951A $132.99 $95.00 $175.71 $45.00 $163.40 $190.00 $90.89
72A HEWQ5952A $217.08 $216.00 $239.65 $196.00 $219.15 No Bid $226.98
72B HP REMAN HEWQ5952A $132.99 $95.00 $175.71 $62.00 $163.40 $190.00 $90.89
73A HEWQ5953A $217.08 $216.00 $239.65 $196.00 $219.15 No Bid $226.98
73B HP REMAN HEWQ5953A $132.99 $95.00 $175.71 $66.00 $163.40 $190.00 $90.89
74A HP LASER CARTRIDGE DISCOUNT 10.0% 40.0% 25.0% 40.6% 30.0% No Bid 30.0%
74B HP INK JET CARTRIDGE DISCOUNT 10.0% 30.0% 25.0% 31.5% 30.0% No Bid 30.0%
75A HP FUSER KIT DISCOUNT 10.0% 30.0% 25.0% 35.0% 18.0% No Bid 30.0%
75B HP DRUM DISCOUNT 10.0% 40.0% 25.0% 35.0% 20.0% No Bid 30.0%

Award recommendation: Low bidders meeting specifications per unit cost.
Primary Vendors: Secondary Vendors Continued:
CVR Computer Supplies 84 of 112 Items CVR Computer Supplies 11 of 112 Items
Supplies Now 17 of 112 Items FPC  8 of 112 Items
The Tree House  6 of 112 Items Corporate Express Imaging  7 of 112 Items
Accurate Forms & Supplies  4 of 112 Items MCPC  7 of 112 Items
FPC  1 of 112 Items 1st Source America  4 of 112 Items

Accurate Forms & Supplies  1 of 112 Items
Secondary Vendors: Global Government Education  1 of 112 Items
Supplies Now 60 of 112 Items US Tech 1 of 112 Items
The Tree House 12 of 112 Items

*Tie bids were received for items 44A, 45A and 47A.  The award recommendation was determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order #60616,
  procedure for awarding tie bids.

*The bid received from Xerox on item 59A has been withdrawn due to a clerical error. Ikon did not agree to accept a secondary award.


