RFB No. 2009-035

Tarrant County Miller Avenue Expansion - Phase 2 Security System

Award Recommendation: 2nd low bidder, Access Technology Systems, at $89,890.00
Requisition N0.:1500005460; G/L Account: 569011; Cost Center: 3110213000; Fund: 45100-2009

Having read and
understood instructions

Access Technology
Systems

911 Security
Cameras

Simplex Grinnell, LP
800 Railhead Rd

EMC Integrated
Systems Group

Ingersol Rand
5200 Tennyson

to bidders & specs, 4309 Reeder Drive |10878 Plano Rd, #F | Fort Worth,TX 76106 | 121 Central Ave Ste.200| Plano, TX
the following bids are Carrollton, TX 75010 Dallas TX 75238 Grapevine, TX
submitted as follows: HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No
(*) please see
court communication
Materials $58,504.00 $62,350.00 $65,565.48 $59,039.00 No Bid
Services $31,386.00 $31,250.00 $34,329.52 $9,915.00 No Bid
Required Bonds (*) included in price $2,250.00 $100.00 $966.00 No Bid
Total $89,890.00 $95,850.00 $99,995.00 (*) $69,920.00 No Bid
Earliest Start Date 04-Feb-09 failed to advise 30 days aro 10 days aro No Bid
Days To Complete 45 days failed to advise 70 days (*) 5 days No Bid
DBE/HUB WBE Certified No No WBE certified No Bid
Addenda acknowledged/ Yes Yes Yes (*) Addendum No. 1 No Bid

confirmed in bid ?

is not included in bid




