
RFB 2009-015 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FOOD SERVING EQUIPMENT

Item 
No. Description

Buller Fixture 
Omaha, NE  
HUB - No

National 
Restaurant 

Supply      
El Paso, TX  
HUB - No

Ace Mart    
San Antonio, 

TX         
HUB - No

Federal 
Supply USA  
Waukegan, 

IL          
HUB - No

Texas Hotel 
and 

Restaurant 
Equipment   

Ft. Worth, TX 
HUB - No

Kitchen 
Resources 

L.P.        
Harlingen, 

TX         
HUB - Yes

Pasco 
Brokerage, 

Inc.         
Plano, TX    
HUB - Yes

ICS         
Waco, TX    
HUB - No

1. Rubber Spatula, 9-1/2" $0.92 $0.86 $0.61 $1.02 $2.00 $1.05 $0.90** No Bid

2. Utility Spring Tongs, Stainless Steel , 9-1/2" $0.87 $3.07 $1.68 $1.91 $1.22 $2.45 $1.60** No Bid

3. Utility Spring Tongs, Stainless Steel , 12" $1.06 $3.79 $2.00 $1.98 $1.47 $2.88 $1.90** No Bid

4. Utility Spring Tongs, Stainless Steel, 16" $1.21 $5.05 $2.33 $3.42 $1.65 $3.33 $2.15** No Bid

5. Bowl, 12-1/2 oz., Camwear® Polycarbonate, Color: Beige (133) $1.48 $1.53 $1.40 $1.68 $1.76 $1.71 $1.35** $1.82

6. Bowl, 5oz, Camwear® Polycarbonate, Color: Beige (133) $1.44 $1.51 $1.38 $1.66 $1.73 $1.67 $1.30** $1.84

7. Mug, 9.6oz, Camwear® Polycarbonate,  Color: Slate Blue (401) $2.12 $2.26 $2.13 $2.29 $2.67 $2.50 $2.00** $2.85

8. Plate, 10", Camwear® Polycarbonate,  Color: Beige (133) $3.29 $3.59 $3.46 $3.40 $4.32 $4.15 $3.25** $4.65

9. Plate, 5-1/2", Camwear® Polycarbonate,  Color: Beige (133) $1.44 $1.51 $1.38 $1.66 $1.73 $1.69 $1.30** $1.84

10. Plate, 9", Camwear® Polycarbonate,  Color: Beige (133) $2.44 $2.63 $2.51 $2.61 $3.14 $3.00 $2.35** $3.38

11. Juice Container 5-1/4 Gallon, Cambro $146.88 $152.07 $151.20 $149.00 $189.00 $177.04 $141.65** $210.00

12. Measuring Cup, 1 Cup $3.18 $3.29 $3.27 $3.65 $4.08 $4.15 $3.10** $4.30

13. Measuring Cup, 2 Pint $5.77 $6.14 $6.10 $6.61 $7.64 $7.14 $5.75** $8.06

14. Measuring Cup, 2 Quart $6.49 $6.91 $6.86 $7.39 $8.58 $8.11 $6.45** $9.08

15. Measuring Cup, 4 Quart $10.22 $10.32 $10.26 $10.94 $12.83 $19.46 $9.65** $13.60



RFB 2009-015 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FOOD SERVING EQUIPMENT

Item 
No. Description

Buller Fixture 
Omaha, NE  
HUB - No

National 
Restaurant 

Supply      
El Paso, TX  
HUB - No

Ace Mart    
San Antonio, 

TX         
HUB - No

Federal 
Supply USA  
Waukegan, 

IL          
HUB - No

Texas Hotel 
and 

Restaurant 
Equipment   

Ft. Worth, TX 
HUB - No

Kitchen 
Resources 

L.P.        
Harlingen, 

TX         
HUB - Yes

Pasco 
Brokerage, 

Inc.         
Plano, TX    
HUB - Yes

ICS         
Waco, TX    
HUB - No

16. Disher, 3 oz.,  Stainless Steel $6.00 No Bid $7.51 $11.44 $9.75 $18.24 $6.65** No Bid

17. Roast Pan, 13 Qt., 14 Gauge, 25-3/4" x 17-3/4" x 2-3/16" $29.33 $29.71 $26.53 $44.84 $52.31 $56.15 $36.65** No Bid

18. Plastic Tongs, 6" $1.19 $1.10 $1.15 $1.39 $1.44 $1.93 $1.05** No Bid

19. Steam Table Pan, Full Size, 2-1'2" Deep $14.78 $16.78 $12.71* $20.38 $23.60 $32.06 $16.55** No Bid

20. Steam Table Pan, Full Size, 4" Deep $19.86 $21.83 $16.28* $26.04 $30.68 $41.33 $21.50** No Bid

21. Steam Table Pan, Full size, 6" Deep $25.68 $28.06 $22.19* $33.04 $39.42 $52.41 $27.60** No Bid

22. Steam Table Pan, Half Size, 2-1/2" Deep $8.95 $10.95 $7.92* $13.81 $15.39 $21.02 $10.80** No Bid

23. Steam Table Pan, Half Size, 4" Deep $11.87 $13.93 $9.86* $17.16 $19.58 $26.49 $13.75** No Bid

24. Steam Table Pan, Half Size, 6" Deep $16.98 $20.91 $15.49* $25.01 $29.39 $39.13 $20.60** No Bid

25. Potato Peeler, Swivel, Stainless Steel $0.69* $2.13 $2.12 $3.58 $3.99 $5.14 $2.80** No Bid

26. Tumbler, 5 oz., Plastic, Color: Clear $0.53 $0.310 $0.312 $0.65 $0.48 $0.69 $0.45** No Bid

27. Tumbler, 12 oz., Plastic, Color: Clear $0.79 $0.48 $0.46 $0.85 $0.72 $0.99 $0.60** No Bid

28. Tumbler, 20 oz., Plastic, Color: Clear $1.37 $1.48 $0.67 $1.38 $1.35 $1.77 $1.00** No Bid

29. Boning Knife, 6" $10.79 $11.25 $11.39 $12.12 $15.83 $14.77 $12.45 No Bid

30. Butcher Knife, 12" $17.40 $24.83 $18.55 $19.05 $25.75 $23.42 $20.30 No Bid

31. Cooks Knife, 8" $16.76 $18.43 $18.31 $18.81 $24.43 $23.21 $20.00 No Bid



RFB 2009-015 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FOOD SERVING EQUIPMENT

Item 
No. Description

Buller Fixture 
Omaha, NE  
HUB - No

National 
Restaurant 

Supply      
El Paso, TX  
HUB - No

Ace Mart    
San Antonio, 

TX         
HUB - No

Federal 
Supply USA  
Waukegan, 

IL          
HUB - No

Texas Hotel 
and 

Restaurant 
Equipment   

Ft. Worth, TX 
HUB - No

Kitchen 
Resources 

L.P.        
Harlingen, 

TX         
HUB - Yes

Pasco 
Brokerage, 

Inc.         
Plano, TX    
HUB - Yes

ICS         
Waco, TX    
HUB - No

32. Food Turner, 2-1/2" $6.32 $6.66 $6.61 $7.39 $9.20 $9.20 $7.70 No Bid

33. Food Turner, 8" x 3" $14.68 $15.85 $16.06 $17.23 $22.32 $20.34 $17.60 No Bid

34. Paring Knife, 3-1/4" $3.87 $4.07 $4.05 $4.47 $5.63 $6.04 $4.75 No Bid

35. Scalloped Knife, 6" $7.97 $8.66 $8.61 $9.22 $11.97 $11.53 $10.00 No Bid

36. Dessert Spoon, Medium Weight $1.60/Dz. 1.52/Dz. 1.56/Dz. $2.65/Dz. $6.09/Dz. 6.15/Dz. 2.65/Dz. No Bid

37. Dinner Fork, Medium Weight $1.60/Dz. 1.37/Dz. 1.56/Dz. $2.65/Dz. $6.09/Dz. 6.15/Dz. 2.65/Dz. No Bid

38. Dinner Knife, Medium Weight $2.69/Dz. 3.17/Dz. 2.76/Dz. $4.55/Dz. $12.30/Dz. 8.42/Dz. 5.55/Dz. No Bid

39. Salad Bowl, 10 oz., Color: Blue $0.69 $2.32 $2.23 $25.86 $2.94 $2.57 $2.50 No Bid

40. Utility Cart, 2-Shelf $466.00 $515.79 $456.84 $528.56 $735.00 $511.74 $440.00** No Bid

41. Utility Cart, 3-Shelf $506.00 $573.86 $505.44 $576.90 $802.00 $566.59 $487.60** No Bid

42. Stock Pot, 10 Qt., Aluminum $27.74 $18.46 $15.04* $26.99 $32.20 $36.24 $19.15** No Bid

43. Stock Pot, 16 Qt., Aluminum $35.96 $25.18 $37.76* $36.41 $43.95 $46.57 $26.20** No Bid

44. Lid for 10Qt., Stock Pot, Aluminum $9.98 $6.23 $3.24* $9.81 $15.30 $10.75 $6.50** No Bid

45. Sheet Pan, Full Size, 12 Gauge, 18" x 26" x 1-1/4" $26.29 $18.97 $22.95 $32.53 $40.80 $37.10 $28.60** No Bid

46. Sheet Pan, Half Size, 12 Gauge, 18" x 13" x 1-1/4" $6.09 $6.52 $6.31 $13.10 $15.45 $14.49 $10.85** No Bid



RFB 2009-015 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FOOD SERVING EQUIPMENT

Item 
No. Description

Buller Fixture 
Omaha, NE  
HUB - No

National 
Restaurant 

Supply      
El Paso, TX  
HUB - No

Ace Mart    
San Antonio, 

TX         
HUB - No

Federal 
Supply USA  
Waukegan, 

IL          
HUB - No

Texas Hotel 
and 

Restaurant 
Equipment   

Ft. Worth, TX 
HUB - No

Kitchen 
Resources 

L.P.        
Harlingen, 

TX         
HUB - Yes

Pasco 
Brokerage, 

Inc.         
Plano, TX    
HUB - Yes

ICS         
Waco, TX    
HUB - No

47. Spatula, High Heat $6.58 $5.33 $6.38 $5.84 $6.08 $7.86 $7.40 No Bid

48. Measuring Cup, 4 Qt. $10.07 $10.32 No Bid $10.51 $12.83 $11.47 $11.40 No Bid

49. Measuring/Utility Scoop, 32 oz. $6.05 $6.26 $5.36 $6.79 $5.60 $8.26 $6.50 No Bid

50. Disher, 1 oz., Size 30 $6.39 $6.83 $7.13 $7.38 $8.91 $8.28 $6.25** No Bid

51. Disher, 7/8 oz., Size 40 $6.76 $7.20 $7.51 $7.76 $9.39 $8.68 $6.60** No Bid

52. Disher, 4 oz., Size 8 $6.39 $6.83 $7.13 $6.84 $8.91 $8.34 $6.25** No Bid

53. Disher, 4 oz., Size 8, Stainless Steel $6.76 $7.20 $7.51 $7.76 $9.39 $8.74 $6.60** No Bid

54. French Whip, 12" $6.42 $6.31 $6.59 $6.84 $8.24 $7.75 $5.80** No Bid

55. Spoodle® Utensil, Solid Oval, 2 oz. $6.29 $6.41 $6.70 $6.95 $9.30 $7.83 $5.90** No Bid

56. Spoodle® Utensil, Solid Oval, 4 oz. $6.38 $6.62 $6.91 $7.16 $9.60 $8.09 $6.05** No Bid

57. Spoodle® Utensil, Perforated, Round, 4 oz. $6.39 $6.78 $7.07 $7.32 $8.85 $8.20 $6.20** No Bid

58. Spoodle® Utensil, Solid Round, 8 oz. $6.86 $7.24 $7.56 $7.81 $9.45 $8.74 $6.65** No Bid

59. Steam Pan Lid, Full Size $21.15 $21.57 $22.52 $23.52 $28.16 $25.71 $19.75** No Bid

60. Steam Pan Lid, Half Size $10.43 $10.45 $10.91 $12.36 $13.64 $13.20 $9.55** No Bid

61. Transport Pans, 4" Deep $42.49 $44.30 $46.01 $48.01 $57.51 $51.42 $40.30** No Bid

62. Windsor Dinner Fork, Medium Weigh 1.60/Dz. 1.37/Dz. 1.56/Dz. $2.40/Dz. $6.09/Dz. 6.40/Dz. 2.30/Dz. No Bid



RFB 2009-015 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR FOOD SERVING EQUIPMENT

Item 
No. Description

Buller Fixture 
Omaha, NE  
HUB - No

National 
Restaurant 

Supply      
El Paso, TX  
HUB - No

Ace Mart    
San Antonio, 

TX         
HUB - No

Federal 
Supply USA  
Waukegan, 

IL          
HUB - No

Texas Hotel 
and 

Restaurant 
Equipment   

Ft. Worth, TX 
HUB - No

Kitchen 
Resources 

L.P.        
Harlingen, 

TX         
HUB - Yes

Pasco 
Brokerage, 

Inc.         
Plano, TX    
HUB - Yes

ICS         
Waco, TX    
HUB - No

63. Windsor Dinner Knife, Medium Weight 2.69/Dz. 3.17/Dz. 2.76/Dz. $3.75/Dz. $12.30/Dz. 9.17/Dz. 5.00/Dz. No Bid

64. Windsor Iced Tea Spoon, Medium Weight 1.60/Dz. 1.32/Dz. 1.40/Dz. $2.40/Dz. $4.61/Dz. 6.40/Dz. 2.30/Dz. No Bid

65. Windsor Tablespoon, Medium Weight 3.17/Dz. 3.31/Dz. 2.63/Dz. $4.15/Dz. $10.34/Dz. 8.42/Dz. 4.20/Dz. No Bid

66. Windsor Teaspoon, Medium Weight 1.04/Dz. .80/Dz. .95/Dz. $1.90/Dz. $4.49/Dz. 5.58/Dz. 1.55/Dz. No Bid

* Item failed to meet bid specifications
Items 19-24 Vendor bid 24 gauge Stainless Steel pans and 22 gauge was specified
Item 25 Vendor bid a potato peeler with a plastic handle - all stainless steel was specified
Item 42-44 Vendor  bid a lower quality of Aluminum than what was specified

**Minimum order requirements bid by Pasco Brokerage, Inc. for the following manufacturer's lines can not be met by Tarrant County  
Items 5-15 Minimum order of Cambro products $3,375.00
Items 17-28 Minimum order of Carlisle products $3,150.00
Item 40-41 Minimum order of Lakeside Carts - 5 Cart Minimum
Item 42-46 Minimum order of Lincoln products $1,900.00
Items 1-4,16, and 50-61 Minimum order of Vollrath products $1,900.00

Great Lakes Hotel Supply Company

PRIMARY AWARD RECOMMENDATION
SECONDARY AWARD RECOMMENDATION

The following vendors submitted No Bids:

ISI Commercial Refrigeration, Inc.
Hobart Service


