RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
1 |Bond Paper, 201b., 8-1/2x 11, White over84| g No Bid $6.11 $6.25 $5.84 $5.56 No Bid
Briteness
Bond Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, White, . . .
la Springhill, Truckload, 1 Delivery No Bid No Bid $6.15 $6.15 $5.57 $5.56 No Bid
Recycled Paper, 8 1/2 x 11, Letter . . . . .
2 100% Post Consumer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.37 $8.00 No Bid
3 |Bond Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Color, No Bid No Bid $7.66 $7.25 $7.10 No Bid No Bid
Springhill
4 |Bond Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, White No Bid No Bid $9.27 $8.32 $8.12 $8.10 No Bid
4a |Bond Paper, 20 |b., 8-1/2 x 14, White, No Bid No Bid $9.27 $8.32 $8.12 No Bid No Bid
Springhill
5 |Recycled Paper, 8 1/2x 14, Legal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.94 $10.75 No Bid

100% Post Consumer"

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
g |Bond Paper, 20lb., 8-1/2x 14, Color, No Bid No Bid $10.36 $10.30 $9.60 No Bid No Bid
Springhill
7 |Bond Paper, 20 Ib., 11 x 17, White, Springhill No Bid No Bid $14.60 $13.20 $12.76 No Bid No Bid
8 |Bond Paper, 20 Ib., 11 x 17, Color, Springhill No Bid No Bid $16.30 $16.00 $15.08 No Bid No Bid
Paper, 20 Ib., Writing, 8-1/2 x 11 Capitol
Bond, 25% Cotton Bright White, Recycled . . . . .
9 with Tarrant County Watermark, Light Cockle No Bid No Bid $20.15 $19.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Finish
10 |Paper, 24/601b., 8-1/2 x 11, White, Accent No Bid No Bid $9.24 $8.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Opaque, Hammermill, No Exceptions
11 |Paper 601b., 8-1/2x 11, Assorted Colors, No Bid No Bid $13.86 $11.56 $11.82 $12.70 No Bid
Text, Hopper Hots or Astro Brites
1o |Paper, 601b., 8-1/2 x 14, Assorted Colors, No Bid No Bid $18.33 $14.78 $15.05 $16.78 No Bid

Text, Hopper Hots or Astro Brites

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
Paper, 60 Ib., 8-3/4 x 6-5/8, Yellow, Hopper . . . . . .
13 || ots o Astro Brites No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 |Paper, 601b.,8-1/2 x 11, Colors and White, No Bid No Bid $17.78 $18.00 $16.17 $15.92 No Bid
Text, Astroparch, or French's Parchtone only.
15 |Paper, 601b., Metro Pressure Sensitive, No Bid No Bid $75.60 $85.00 $97.20 | $67.50 | No Bid
Uncoated crack and peel.
Paper, 60 Ib., Metro Pressure Sensitive, . . .
16 Colors, Uncoated crack and peel. Hot Colors No Bid No Bid $120.33 $115.00 $129.00 $177.20 No Bid
17 |Paper, Cover, 651b,, 8-1/2x11, Colors, No Bid No Bid $29.04 $23.64 $23.42 $25.16 No Bid
Hopper Hots or Asrobrites.
18 |Paper, Vellum Cover, 67 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, White No Bid No Bid $16.58 $14.31 $14.46 $13.66 No Bid
19 [Paper, Vellum Cover, 67 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Color No Bid No Bid $16.99 $15.68 $15.32 $14.45 No Bid
o |Paper, Vellum Cover, 67 Ib., parent sheet No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.00 | $132.90 | $117.44 | No Bid

23x35

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
o1 |Bond Paper, 701b., 11 x 17, White, Accent No Bid No Bid $22.87 $21.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Opaque, Hammermill, No Exceptions
2o |Paper, 701b., 8 1/2 x 11, White, Accent No Bid No Bid $10.78 $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Opaque, Hammermill, No Exceptions
23 |Paper, 70 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Color, Text No Bid No Bid $11.51 $10.20 $10.18 $9.12 No Bid
24 |Paper, 70 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, Color, Text No Bid No Bid $15.32 $19.44 $13.75 $12.32 No Bid
25 |Paper, 70 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Color, Linen, Text No Bid No Bid $22.01 $21.35 $18.55 $16.88 No Bid
o6 |Paper, 701b., 8-1/2 x 14, White Accent No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Opaque
27 |Paper, 80 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Color, Linen, Text No Bid No Bid $44.12 $66.80 $38.73 $35.24 No Bid
28 |Paper, 80 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, White, Linen, Text No Bid No Bid $44.12 $48.00 $38.73 $16.19 No Bid

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
og |Paper, 1001b., 19 x 25, Long Grain, Anthem No Bid No Bid No Bid $126.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Matte Text, Preferred
Paper, 100 Ib., 19 x 25, Long Grain, . . . . .
30 Equivalent to Anthem Matte Text No Bid No Bid $71.82 $97.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Paper, Card Cover, 80 Ib., 3-1/2 x 8-1/2, . . . . . .
31 Hi Bulk-vellum Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Paper, Index, 90 Ib., 22-1/2 x 35, Assorted . . .
32 Colors, Wrapped 500/box No Bid No Bid $157.92 $162.00 $144.96 $131.92 No Bid
33 |Paper, Index, 90 Ib., 22-1/2 x 35, White, No Bid No Bid $149.14 $160.00 $136.88 | $124.56 | No Bid
Wrapped 500/box
0, -
34 |Paper, 201b., 25% Cotton, 8-1/2 x 11, No Bid No Bid $13.24 $15.75 $12.38 | $1424 | NoBid
Nekoosa
Envelope, #10, 24 Ib., White, Executive Flap, . . . . .
35 or Pointed Flap, 500/bx. 4-1/8 x 9-1/2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00 $13.92 No Bid No Bid
36 |ENvelope, #14, 28 Ib., No Window, Brown No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.30 $53.48 No Bid No Bid

Kraft

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
37 |Envelope, #10, 24 Ib., Window, White, 500/bx $18.20 No Bid No Bid $17.93 $15.94 No Bid No Bid
38 |Envelope, #10, 24 Ib., Brown Kraft No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.20 $20.02 No Bid No Bid
39 |Envelope, #10, 24 Ib., Colors No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.55 $22.32 No Bid No Bid
40 |[Envelope, #9, 24 Ib., Colors No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.55 $22.32 No Bid No Bid
41 |CAtalog Envelope, #1, 241, 6 x 9, Open End | 5y No Bid No Bid $28.45 $27.12 No Bid No Bid
Brown Kraft, No Clasp
42 |ENvelope, #9, 24lb., White, No Window, $15.23 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $13.34 | NoBid No Bid
3-7/8 x 8-7/8
43 |ENvelope, #9, 24Ib., Hot Colors, No Window, No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $46.00 No Bid No Bid
3-7/8 x 8-7/8
a4 |ENVElope, #10, 24lb., Hot Colors, No Window, | -\ gjq No Bid No Bid $46.50 $46.00 No Bid No Bid

4-1/8 x 9-1/2

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
Catalog Envelope, #12-1/2, 28lb.,Open End . . . . .
45 Peel & Seal, Brown Kraft, 9 /2 x 12-1/2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $114.50 $84.08 No Bid No Bid
46 |C@log Envelope, 24ib.,Open End No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.20 $43.58 No Bid No Bid
White, Gummed Flap
47 |Cards, Baronial 5-1/2" Folding Panel No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cards,lvory, Lewed only, No Exceptions
ag |Cards, Baronial 6" Folding Panel Cards, Ivory,| ., gjq No Bid No Bid $62.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lewed only, No Exceptions
a9 |ENvelopes, Baronial 5-1/2" Envelopes, Ivory, No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lewed only, No Exceptions
5o |Envelopes, Baronial 6" Envelopes, Ivory, No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lewed only, No Exceptions
51 |Fan Apart Adhesive for NCR Paper No Bid No Bid $34.10 $12.50 $22.15 $21.04 No Bid
52 |NCRPaper, 201b., 8-1/2x 11, 2 Pt, Black Ink| g4 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.60 $9.73 No Bid

Transfer only, Reverse, Imation Only

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, X Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
53 |NCR Paper, 201b., 8-1/2x 11, 2 Pt, Black Ink] ) b0 No Bid $10.28 $10.92 No Bid $10.00 No Bid
Transfer only, Reverse, Equivalent to Imation
54 |NCR Paper,201b., 8-1/2x 11,3 Pt, Black Ink] ) 514 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.94 $10.96 No Bid
Transfer only, Reverse, Imation Only
55 |NCRPaper, 201b., 8-1/2x 11, 3 Pt, Black Ink| ) g4 No Bid $11.56 $12.33 No Bid $11.25 No Bid
Transfer only, Reverse, Equivalent to Imation
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, 4 Pt., Black Ink
56 |Transfer only, Reverse Sequence, Imation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.75 $11.59 No Bid
Only
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, 4 Pt., Black Ink
57 |Transfer only, Reverse Sequence, = to No Bid No Bid $12.36 $13.19 No Bid $11.88 No Bid
Imation
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, 2 Pt., Black Ink
58 |Transfer only, Reverse Sequence, Imation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.48 $12.38 No Bid
Only
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, 2 Pt., Black Ink
59 |Transfer only, Reverse Sequence, = to No Bid No Bid $13.07 $13.98 No Bid $12.67 No Bid
Imation
g0 |NCRPaper, 201b., 8-1/2x 14, 3 Pt., BlackInk| g4 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.21 $13.95 No Bid

Transfer only, Reverse, Imation Only

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, 3 Pt., Black Ink . . . .
61 |t ansfor only. Reverse, Equivalent o Imation No Bid No Bid $14.69 $15.79 No Bid $13.95 No Bid
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, 4 Pt., Black Ink . . . . .
62 | nsfor only, Reverse, Imation Only No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.24 $14.91 No Bid
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, 4 Pt., Black Ink . . . .
63 |1 ansfor only, Reverse, Equivalent o Imation No Bid No Bid $15.71 $16.88 No Bid $14.91 No Bid
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, 1 Pt., White Coated . . . . .
64 |5 only, Black Ink Transer, Imation Only No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.84 $11.00 No Bid
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, 1 Pt., White Coated . . . .
65 |5ack only, Black Ink Transer, = to Imation No Bid No Bid $13.52 $12.31 No Bid $11.00 No Bid
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Black Ink Transfer
66 |only, Coated Front and Back, Colors: Yellow, Pink, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.50 $13.30 No Bid
Blue, Green, Goldenrod, Imation Only
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Black Ink Transfer
67 |only, Coated Front and Back, Colors: Yellow, Pink, No Bid No Bid $16.61 $15.06 No Bid $13.30 No Bid

Blue, Green, Goldenrod, Equal to Imation

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Black Ink
Transfer only, Coated Front or Back, Colors: . . . . .
68 Yellow, Pink. Blue, Green. Goldenrod, Imation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.34 $8.56 No Bid
Only
NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Black Ink
Transfer only, Coated Front or Back, Colors: . . . .
69 Yellow, Pink. Blue, Green. Goldenrod, = to No Bid No Bid $16.46 $15.05 No Bid $8.56 No Bid
Imation
NCR Manilla Card, 90 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Black . . . .
70 Ink Transfer only, Coated on Front No Bid No Bid $31.63 $26.41 $27.56 No Bid No Bid
Paper, 20 Ib., 9-1/2 x 11, 1-Part Continuous,
71 |Bright White, Laser Bond, 1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.22 $9.00 No Bid No Bid
each side, Delivered apprx 3,000 per case
NCR Paper, 9-17Z X 11, Z-Part Conunuous
Form, Bright White CB, White CF, Laser
72 |Bond, No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.14 $31.00 No Bid No Bid
1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs each side, Carbonless,
Nelivared annravy 1 QNN nar cacao
NCR Paper, 9-1/2 X 11, s-Part Continous
Form, Bright White CB, White CFB, White
73 |CF, Laser Bond, 1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs each No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 $51.55 No Bid No Bid

side, Carbonless, Delivered approx 1,200 per
cAaSse

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
NCR Paper, 19 Ib., 9-1/2 x 11, 3-Part . . . . .
74 Continuous Form. W/C/P. Black Ink Transfer No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.00 $37.00 No Bid No Bid
Labels, 2-Up, Cut-Sheet, Bright White, Laser
Quiality, 4" W x 1-7/16" L, 1000 Sheets Per
75 |Carton, 14 Labels Per Sheet, Individually $90.00/Box No Bid No Bid | $80.00/Box No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wrapped, Four (4) 250-Sheet Packets Per
Carton
Labels, 2-Up, Cut-Sheet, Bright White, Laser
Quality 3-1/2" W x 3/4" L, 1000 Sheets, Per
76 [Carton, 28 Labels Per Sheet, Individually $96.00/Box No Bid No Bid | $92.00/Box No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wrapped, Four (4) 250-Sheet Packets Per
Carton
Computer Labels, 4-up, Continuous Pin Feed,
77 |3.3"x 15/16", 20,000 Per Box, 48 Labels Per | $55.00/Box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sheet
Card Stock, 8-1/2" W x 10" L, 2 each 8"W x 5"
L, Cards Per Sheet, 1/2" Tear-Off Strip Along
One Side of the 10" L, 1" Tear-Off Strip Along
7g |One Side of the 8-1/2" W, Separation Perf | ¢/3 ge/miy | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Between the 2 cards, Cut-Sheet, Bright White,
Laser Quality, 1000 Sheets Per Carton,
Individually Wrapped, Four (4) 250-Sheet
Packets Per Carton

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

Executive
Forms and
Supplies
OKC, OK
Hub No

Vanderburg
Drafting
Supply, Inc
Dallas, TX
Hub No

Olmsted
Kirk Paper
Company
Fort Worth,

TX

Hub No

FasClampitt
Fort Worth,
TX
Hub No

Western
Paper
Company
Grand
Prairie, TX
Hub Yes

RIS Paper
Fort Worth,
TX
Hub No

Global Gov't
Education
Solutions

Fletcher, OH

Hub No

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
Engineering Bond, 20 Ib., 24" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . . .
79 CR. OCE Only No Bid $20.34/Roll| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineering Bond, 20 Ib., 24" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . .
80 CR. Equivalent to OCE No Bid $15.39/Roll| No Bid No Bid $15.60/Roll No Bid No Bid
Engineering Bond, 20 Ib., 36" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . . .
81 CR. OCE Only No Bid $30.49/Roll| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineering Bond, 20 Ib., 36" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . .
82 CR. Equivalent to OCE No Bid $22.64/Roll| No Bid No Bid $23.35/Roll No Bid No Bid
Engineering Bond, 24 Ib., 18" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . . . .
83 CR, OCE Only No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineering Bond, 24 Ib., 18" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . . .
84 CR. Equivalent to OCE No Bid $26.75/Roll| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
gs |Engineering Bond, 24 Ib., 24" x 500" Roll, 3 NoBid [$53.52/Roll| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CR, OCE Only

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
Engineering Bond, 24 Ib., 24" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . . .
86 CR. Equivalent to OCE No Bid $26.68/Roll| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineering Bond, 24 Ib., 30" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . . .
87 CR. OCE Only No Bid $70.23/Roll| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineering Bond, 24 Ib., 30" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . . .
88 CR. Equivalent to OCE No Bid $33.69/Roll| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineering Bond, 24 Ib., 36" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . . .
89 CR. OCE Only No Bid $80.28/Roll| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineering Bond, 24 Ib., 36" x 500' Roll, 3" . . . . . .
90 CR. Equivalent to OCE No Bid $40.00/Roll| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
01 'F:"gflets,?ggd’ Bright White 24 [b., 36" x 300 NoBid |$23.64/Roll| NoBid NoBid |$91.82/Roll | No Bid No Bid
92 'F:"gflets,?ggd’ Bright White 24 Ib., 42" x 300 NoBid |$32.39/Roll| NoBid NoBid  [$106.42/Roll| No Bid No Bid
o3 |INkiet Bond, Bright White 36 Ib., 36" x 300 NoBid |$45.59/Roll| No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid

Roll, 3" CR

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.




RFB NO. 2009-011 CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER AND STOCK COMPUTER FORMS

VENDOR INFORMATION AND LOCATION

Executive Vanderburg lested . Western Global Gov't
. Kirk Paper | FasClampitt Paper RIS Paper .
Forms and Drafting Education
ITEM . Company | Fort Worth, Company | Fort Worth, .
DESCRIPTION Supplies Supply, Inc Solutions
NO. Fort Worth, TX Grand TX
OKC, OK Dallas, TX . Fletcher, OH
Hub No Hub No TX Hub No Prairie, TX Hub No Hub No
Hub No Hub Yes
g4 |INKiet Bond, Bright White 36 Ib., 42" x 300 NoBid |$58.88/Roll| No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Roll, 3" CR
o5 |ShiPping Tags, 10 Pt#4 Plain, 4 1/4 x 2 1/8, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manila, 1000/Box

All prices are per thousand unless otherwise noted.

There are no recommendations for secondary award for items 13,26,29,31,47,48,49,50,77,78,79,81,84-90,93,and 94 due to there being only one

acceptable bid received for those items.

Items 83 and 95 are not being recommended for award due to no bids received for those items.

Primary Award to low vendors meeting specifications

RIS Paper

Fasclampitt

Western Paper Company
Vanderburg Drafting Supply, Inc.
Executive Forms and Supplies
Olmsted Kirk Paper Company

35 of 95 Items
22 of 95 Items
20 of 95 Items
15 of 95 Items
2 of 95 Items
1 of 95 Items

Secondary Award to low vendors meeting specifications
Western Paper Company 34 of 95 Items
Fasclampitt 24 of 95 Items
Olmsted Kirk Paper Company 13 of 95 Items
Executive Forms and Supplies 2 of 95 ltems
RIS Paper 1 of 95 Items



