RFB 2008-186

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LANDSCAPE SUPPLIES & SERVICES

AWARD RECOMMENDATION: LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

PRIMARY: PHILLIPS LAWN SPRINKLER CO. INC.
TRUGREEN LANDCARE
C. GREEN SCAPING LP
SECONDARY: C. GREEN SCAPING LP
TRUGREEN LANDCARE

SECTION: |
SECTION: Il

SECTIONS: Ill, IV, V-AV-B,

SECTION: Il

SECTIONS: |, lll,IV,V-A, V-B

ALTERNATE:: C. GREEN SCAPING LP SECTION: |

SERVICES TO BE ORDERED ON AS REQUIRED BASIS

SECTION I - IRRIGATION SERVICES PER SPECS PARTS 8 AM -5 PM RATE 5 PM - 8 AM RATE HOLIDAY/WEEKEND RATE
HOURLY RATE PLUS PARTS MARK UP MARK-UP IRRIGATOR HELPER IRRIGATOR HELPER IRRIGATOR HELPER
TRUGREEN LANDCARE HUB - NO - SECONDARY AWARD 30% $51.00 $35.00 $76.50 $52.50 $102.00 $70.00
C. GREEN SCAPING LP - HUB- YES -ALTERNATE AWARD 15% $54.00 $42.00 $68.00 $50.00 $82.00 $58.00
PHILLIPS LAWN SPRINKLER CO. - HUB - NO - PRIMARY AWARD 30% $55.00 $27.50 $82.50 $41.25 $110.00 $55.00
COLE CONSTRUCTION,, INC - HUB - NO 45% $80.00 $30.00 $110.00 $40.00 $130.00 $48.00
SECTION I - IRRIGATION SERVICES PER SPECS PARTS 8 AM - 5 PM RATE 5PM - 8 AM RATE HOLIDAY/WEEKEND RATE
HOURLY RATE PLUS PARTS MARK UP MARK-UP INSTALLER HELPER INSTALLER HELPER INSTALLER HELPER
TRUGREEN LANDCARE HUB - NO - SECONDARY AWARD 30% $51.00 $35.00 $76.50 $52.50 $102.00 $70.00
C. GREEN SCAPING LP - HUB- YES -ALTERNATE AWARD 15% $54.00 $42.00 $68.00 $50.00 $82.00 $58.00
PHILLIPS LAWN SPRINKLER CO. - HUB - NO - PRIMARY AWARD 30% $55.00 $27.50 $82.50 $41.25 $110.00 $55.00
COLE CONSTRUCTION,, INC - HUB - NO 45% $80.00 $30.00 $110.00 $40.00 $130.00 $48.00
SECTION Il - LANDSCAPING SERVICES PER SPECS PARTS 8 AM -5 PM RATE 5PM - 8 AM RATE HOLIDAY/WEEKEND RATE
HOURLY RATE PLUS PARTS MARK UP MARK-UP SUPERVISOR HELPER SUPERVISOR HELPER SUPERVISOR HELPER
TRUGREEN LANDCARE HUB - NO - PRIMARY AWARD 35% $38.00 $28.00 $57.00 $42.00 $76.00 $56.00
C. GREEN SCAPING LP - SECONDARY AWARD 15% $46.00 $28.00 $56.00 $36.00 $66.00 $44.00
PHILLIPS LAWN SPRINKLER CO. - HUB - NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COLE CONSTRUCTION,, INC - HUB - NO 45% $70.00 $24.00 $95.00 $36.00 $105.00 $42.00
SECTION IIl - ARBOR SERVICES PER SPECS MINIMUM 8 AM - 5 PM RATE 5 PM - 8 AM RATE HOLIDAY/WEEKEND RATE
HOURLY RATE PLUS MINIMUM CHARGE PER VISIT CHARGE/VISIT | SUPERVISOR HELPER SUPERVISOR HELPER SUPERVISOR HELPER
*TRUGREEN LANDCARE HUB - NO -SECONDARY AWARD $768.00 $107.00 $85.00 $130.00 $107.00 $180.00 $130.00
C. GREEN SCAPING LP - HUB- YES -PRIMARY AWARD $180.00 $90.00 $28.00 $135.00 $36.00 $180.00 $44.00
COLE CONSTRUCTION,, INC - HUB - NO $1,000.00 $220.00 $48.00 $280.00 $60.00 $320.00 $68.00
PHILLIPS LAWN SPRINKLER CO. - HUB - NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

* MINIMUM CHARGE - $768.009 (8:00 AM- 5:00 PM); $948.00 (5:00 PM to 8:00 AM); $1240.00 (HOLIDAY RATE)




