BID 2008-169 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR GRAPHIC & PHOTOGRAPHIC SUPPLIES & VIDEO TAPES

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Vendor Information
. . . Southwest Global
Archive Supplies Ace Graphlp & Wolf Camera B&H Photo Arlington Va}nderburg. Camera Bogthue Plastics HPI International Presstek, Inc. Government
Cad Supplies Camera Drafting Supplies | San Francisco, . .
Dallas, TX Dallas. TX Dallas, TX New York, NY Arlington, TX Dallas. TX CA Maryland Brooklyn, NY Des Plaines, IL Education
HUB - NO . HUB - NO HUB - NO ' ' Heights, MO HUB - NO HUB - NO Fletcher, OH
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO

Section A
A-1 Gloss Powder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.97 No Bid
A-2 Handi Pads No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $79.80 No Bid
A-3 Shop Cloths No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.82 No Bid
A-4 Wipes No Bid No Bid $150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $120.02 No Bid
A-5 SuperKlene No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
A-6 Cleaner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $0.00 $0.00 $150.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $297.61 $0.00

Section B
B-1 Binding Combs 3/16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.85 No Bid $4.65 No Bid
B-2 Binding Combs 5/16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.44 No Bid $4.96 No Bid
B-3 Binding Combs 1/4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.85 No Bid $4.42 No Bid
B-4 Binding Combs 3/4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.33 No Bid $13.64 No Bid
B-5 Binding Combs 3/8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.03 No Bid $5.34 No Bid
B-6 Binding Combs 5/8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.33 No Bid $11.34 No Bid




BID 2008-169 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR GRAPHIC & PHOTOGRAPHIC SUPPLIES & VIDEO TAPES

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Vendor Information

. . . Southwest Global
Archive Supplies Ace Graphlp & Wolf Camera B&H Photo Arlington Va}nderburg. Camera Bogthue Plastics HPI International Presstek, Inc. Government
Cad Supplies Camera Drafting Supplies | San Francisco, . .
Dallas, TX Dallas. TX Dallas, TX New York, NY Arlington, TX Dallas. TX CA Maryland Brooklyn, NY Des Plaines, IL Education
HUB - NO : HUB - NO HUB - NO ' ' Heights, MO HUB - NO HUB - NO Fletcher, OH
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO
B-7 Binding Combs 7/8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.18 No Bid $16.50 No Bid
B-8 Binding Combs 7/16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.16 No Bid $6.91 No Bid
B-9 Binding Combs 1/2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.98 No Bid $7.33 No Bid
B-10 Binding Combs 1 1/4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.82 No Bid $24.31 No Bid
B-11 Binding Combs 1 1/2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.96 No Bid $26.73 No Bid
B-12 Binding Combs 1 3/4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.32 No Bid $14.51 No Bid
B-13 Binding Combs 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.34 No Bid $15.24 No Bid
Total $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $99.59 $0.00 $155.88 $0.00
Section C

c-1 ;;',,”tx'v'z%%r,‘t Adhesive $179.00 $350.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c-2 Zg‘,,”tx'v'z%%r,‘t Adhesive $309.00 $505.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c-3 ZZT)’(”;S'(;‘,Q Film $99.00 $185.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c-4 Iég‘r'n)l(n;égg Film $29.99 $82.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $616.99 $1,214.33 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00




BID 2008-169 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR GRAPHIC & PHOTOGRAPHIC SUPPLIES & VIDEO TAPES

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Vendor Information
. . . Southwest Global
Archive Supplies Ace Graphlp & Wolf Camera B&H Photo Arlington Va}nderburg. Camera Bogthue Plastics HPI International Presstek, Inc. Government
Cad Supplies Camera Drafting Supplies | San Francisco, . .
Dallas, TX Dallas. TX Dallas, TX New York, NY Arlington, TX Dallas. TX CA Maryland Brooklyn, NY Des Plaines, IL Education
HUB - NO : HUB - NO HUB - NO ’ ’ Heights, MO HUB - NO HUB - NO Fletcher, OH
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO

Section D
D-1 Tr"]"igcore Board 3/16 $109.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $156.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D-2 Z?:g(core Board 3/16 $147.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $206.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D-3 E&i?core Board 1/2 $93.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $343.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D-4 Z"Za,,ttxe 1%%5,'ter Paper $53.69 $70.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D-5 g"f,,ttxe 1%%5,'ter Paper $32.19 $40.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $436.02 $110.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $705.70 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Section E
E-1 Oce Brand Toner $219.00 $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $205.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
E-1A  |Equivalent Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
E-2 Oce Brand Developer $349.00 $400.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $341.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
E-2A  |Equivalent Developer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $568.00 $640.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $626.88 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00




BID 2008-169 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR GRAPHIC & PHOTOGRAPHIC SUPPLIES & VIDEO TAPES

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Vendor Information

. . . Southwest Global

Archive Supplies Ace Graphlp & Wolf Camera B&H Photo Arlington Va}nderburg. Camera Bogthue Plastics HPI International Presstek, Inc. Government
Cad Supplies Camera Drafting Supplies | San Francisco, . .
Dallas, TX Dallas. TX Dallas, TX New York, NY Arlington, TX Dallas. TX CA Maryland Brooklyn, NY Des Plaines, IL Education
HUB - NO : HUB - NO HUB - NO ’ ’ Heights, MO HUB - NO HUB - NO Fletcher, OH
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO
Section F
F-1 Canon Powershot A590 No Bid No Bid $163.00 $149.95 $170.00 No Bid $179.88 No Bid $136.80 No Bid $161.85
F-2 ggqig(f owershot No Bid No Bid $228.00 $204.95 $235.00 No Bid $249.88 No Bid $199.99 No Bid $224.27
F-3 ggg‘;g Powershot No Bid No Bid $278.00 $234.90 $276.00 No Bid $279.88 No Bid $257.89 No Bid $251.77
F-4 Casio Exllim EX-Z80 No Bid No Bid $138.00 $154.90 No Bid No Bid $175.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F-5 Fujifilm FinePix J10 No Bid No Bid $120.00 $109.90 $125.00 No Bid $125.88 No Bid $124.46 No Bid $115.29
F-6 Fujifilm FinePix Z100fd No Bid No Bid $197.00 $168.90 $190.00 No Bid $193.88 No Bid $207.46 No Bid $173.95
F-7 Kodak EasyShare M863 No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.90 $145.00 No Bid $149.88 No Bid $130.99 No Bid $131.50
F-8 Nikon COOIpiX S210 No Bid No Bid $167.20 $146.90 $179.00 No Bid $172.88 No Bid $144.20 No Bid $160.00
F-9 Olympus FE-310 No Bid No Bid $108.00 $104.90 $118.00 No Bid $126.88 No Bid $107.37 No Bid $120.25
F-10 Olympus FE-340 No Bid No Bid $151.00 $146.90 $229.00 No Bid $174.88 No Bid $165.19 No Bid $163.00
Fg | Sony Cyber-Shot No Bid No Bid $138.00 $161.90 $168.00 No Bid $179.88 No Bid $142.10 No Bid $167.53
DSC-S780

Fqp |Sandisk Extreme il No Bid No Bid $23.00 $27.90 $35.00 No Bid $36.88 No Bid $14.63 No Bid $27.60

2GB SD Card




BID 2008-169 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR GRAPHIC & PHOTOGRAPHIC SUPPLIES & VIDEO TAPES

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Vendor Information
. . . Southwest Global
Archive Supplies Ace Graphlp & Wolf Camera B&H Photo Arlington Va}nderburg. Camera Bogthue Plastics HPI International Presstek, Inc. Government
Cad Supplies Camera Drafting Supplies | San Francisco, . .
Dallas, TX Dallas. TX Dallas, TX New York, NY Arlington, TX Dallas. TX CA Maryland Brooklyn, NY Des Plaines, IL Education
HUB - NO : HUB - NO HUB - NO ' ' Heights, MO HUB - NO HUB - NO Fletcher, OH
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO
Sandisk Ultra Il . . . . .
F-13 2 GB SD Card No Bid No Bid $15.00 $22.50 $15.00 No Bid $28.88 No Bid $14.63 No Bid $23.15
F1q  |FUifim 2 GB No Bid No Bid $28.00 $37.90 $35.00 No Bid $39.88 No Bid $43.58 No Bid $39.46
xD Picture Card Type M
F-15 Kingston 2GB SD Card No Bid No Bid $19.00 $8.25 $15.00 No Bid $12.88 No Bid $9.75 No Bid $9.00
F1e |Oympus2GB No Bid No Bid $24.85 $25.90 $35.00 No Bid $38.88 No Bid $25.84 No Bid $28.56
xD Picture Card Type M
Total $0.00 $0.00 $1,798.05 | $1,834.45 | $1,970.00 $0.00 $2,167.08 $0.00 $1,724.88 $0.00 $1,797.18
Section G
Mount Board, Double . . . . . . . .
G-1 Weight 16x20 No Bid No Bid $135.00 No Bid $153.75 $70_OO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mount Board, Double . . . . . . . .
G-2 Weight, 11X14 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $1.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid
PMA 568 16" X 50' . . . . . . . .
G-3 20-00060-6265-0 No Bid No Bid $53.00 No Bid $69.00 $86.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PMA 568 24" X 50' . . . . . . . .
G-4 70-0700-5943-4 No Bid No Bid $83.00 No Bid $105.00 $57.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dust Off XL . . . . . . . .
G-5 DPSXLCN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.28 No Bid $36.00
VHS Tape T-160 . . . . . . . . .
G-6 WITH BOX No Bid No Bid $2.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.52 No Bid No Bid
VHS Tape, High Quality T- . . . . . . . .
G-7 120 "S-VHS" W/BOX No Bid No Bid $5.65 No Bid $149.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.09 No Bid No Bid




BID 2008-169 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR GRAPHIC & PHOTOGRAPHIC SUPPLIES & VIDEO TAPES

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Vendor Information
. . . Southwest Global
Archive Supplies Ace Graphlp & Wolf Camera B&H Photo Arlington Va}nderburg. Camera Bogthue Plastics HPI International Presstek, Inc. Government
Cad Supplies Camera Drafting Supplies | San Francisco, . .
Dallas, TX Dallas. TX Dallas, TX New York, NY Arlington, TX Dallas. TX CA Maryland Brooklyn, NY Des Plaines, IL Education
HUB - NO . HUB - NO HUB - NO ' ' Heights, MO HUB - NO HUB - NO Fletcher, OH
HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO
G-8 'FnjjtiaFn; fggnc No Bid No Bid $14.50 $9.99 $15.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.60 No Bid No Bid
G-9 ExlIfilm Shrink Wrap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
G-10 Glue Pellets No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $0.00 $0.00 $294.60 $9.99 $578.25 $214.44 $0.00 $0.00 $154.14 $0.00 $36.00

Bid award recommendation for Sections A-F per section and Section G per line item for miscellaneous items
Section A: Presstek, Inc. There will be no award for Iltems A5 & A6 due to no bids received

Section B: Southwest Plastics

Section C & D: Archive Supplies
Section E: Vanderburg Drafting Supplies. There will be no award for Item E2A due to no bids received

Section F: B & H Photo

Section: G, items G1 & G4 to Vanderburg Drafting Supplies, Items G2 & G3 to Wolf Camera, Item G5 to Global Government Education and
ltems G6, G7, and G8 to HPI International. There will be no award for items G9 & G10 due to no bids received.




