Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans
Bid Award Recommendations (P)=Primary (S)=Secondary (A)=Alternate (Rej)= Reject

Allen Samuels Caldwell Country Sam Pack's Five Vandergriff
) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
Chevrolet Aveo LT, 2WD, 4-Door, 1TD69
! ’ ! ! 11,993.18 11,982.00 12,132.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12,263.00
1.6L Eng MPG 23/32
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel 212.50 212.00 213.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 240.00
Option C: Power Windows & Locks 361.25 361.00 362.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 397.00
Make and Model Chevrolet Aveo Chevrolet Aveo Chevrolet Aero No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Chevrolet Aero
Delivery Time 90 Days 120 Days 90 - 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 - 8 Weeks
Warranty 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles 3 YrM/_?G’OOO 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles
11es
TOTAL ITEM 1:| (S)12,566.93 | (P) 12,555.00| (A)12,707.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12,900.00
Chevrolet Cobalt 1LT, 2WD, 4-Door Sedan
o ' 13,465.15 13,387.00 13,569.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13,480.00
Model 1AL69, 2.2L Engine MPG 25/36
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel 233.75 234.00 234.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 257.00
Option C: Power Windows & Locks Included Included Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included
Make and Model Chevrolet Cobalt Cge\golltet Chevrolet Cobalt LT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Chevrolet Cobalt
opa
Delivery Time 70 Days 120 Days 90 - 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 - 8 Weeks
3Yr /36,000
Warranty 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles Mil 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles
11es
TOTAL ITEM 2:] (S) 13,698.90 (P) 13,621.00( (A)13,803.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13,737.00




(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary (Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
Forql Focus SE, 4-Door Sedan, 2WD, 2.0L No Bid No Bid No Bid 11,974.00 13,439.00 13,187.00 13,368.00 No Bid
Engine, MPG 24/35
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included Included Included No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid 198.00 182.00 187.00 Included No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included Included Included No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid Ford Focus SE Ford Focus SE Ford Focus SE Ford Focus No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid 60 - 120 Days 60 - 90 Days 120 Days 45 - 90 Days No Bid
3Yr /36,000
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid 3Yr /36,000 Miles | 3Yr/36,000 Miles | 3Yr/36,000 Miles Mil No Bid
11es
TOTAL ITEM 3: No Bid No Bid No Bid (Rej) 12,172.00 | (A) 13,621.00 (S) 13,374.00 | (P) 13,368.00 No Bid
Honda Civic DX, 2WD, 1.8L Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MPG 26/34
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 4: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

For Item 3, the apparent low bid received from Grand Prairie Ford failed to meet specifications because vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as required in the bid specifications.




(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary (Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
Honda Fit (base), 2WD, 1.5L Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MPG 28/34
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 5: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hyundai Accent GS, 3-Door, 2WD, 1.6L Engine, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13,019.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MPG 27/32
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 372.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HyundglsAccent No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45 - 75 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
3Yr /36,000
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid . No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miles
TOTAL ITEM 6: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (P) 13,391.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans
Bid Award Recommendations (P)=Primary (S)=Secondary (A)=Alternate (Rej)= Reject

Allen Samuels Caldwell Country Sam Pack's Five Vandergriff
) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
7 |Hyundai Accent Hatchback, GLS, 4-Door, 2WD
. ' ! ’ ' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13,915.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.6L Engine, MPG 27/32
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 372.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HyundalBAccent No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45 - 75 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3vr /_36’000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miles
TOTAL ITEM 7: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (P) 14,287.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 |Hyundai Elantra GLS, 2WD, 2.0L Engine MPG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15,938.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24/33
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Hyundai Elantra No Bid No Bid No Bid
GLS
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45 - 75 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3vr /_36’000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miles
TOTAL ITEM 8: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (P) 15,938.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
9 - . -
Hyundai Elantra SE, 2WD, 2.0L Engine MPG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 18,273.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24/33
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HyundglEElantl’a No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45 - 75 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
3Yr /36,000
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid . No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miles
TOTAL ITEM 9: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (P) 18,273.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 |Kia Rio, 2WD, 1.599cc Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MPG 27/32
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 10: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX

as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
1 sig(?iggll?:;(’ 2WD, 1.599cc Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 11: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 sg(?gz(;gg LX, 2WD, 2.0L Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 12: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
13 |Kia Spectra 5, 2WD, 2.0L Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MPG 23/30
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 13: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 |Mazda 3, 4-Door, 2WD, 2.0L Engine , . . . . . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MPG 24/32
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 14: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX

as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
15 2szl;bi8hi Lancer DE, 2WD, 2.0L Engine MPG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 15: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 Nissan Sentra 2.0, 2WD, 2.0L Engine MPG 25/33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 16: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX

as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
1 Tlgiagn\g/ﬁ]rgal\mf‘gg%?;f 1.8S,2WD, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 17: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 T.igiaEnn\g/ﬁ]rZaMssga‘SG}éisy 2WD, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 18: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
19 (Scion xD, 2WD, 1.8L Engine MPG 27/33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 19: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Loggt;;/:g;olla S, 2WD, 1.8L Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16,620.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Toyota Crolla S No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 90 - 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3vr /_36’000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miles

TOTAL ITEM 20: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (P) 16,620.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX

as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
21 ;(g)xgoeta Yaris Sedan, 2WD, 1.5L Engine MPG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 21: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 ;(g)xgoeta Yaris Liftback, 2WD, 1.5L Engine MPG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 22: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
23 Cheyrolet Aveo 5 1LT, 2WD, Model 1TD48, 1.6L 11,993.18 11,982.00 12,132.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12,263.00
Engine MPG 23/32
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel 212.50 212.00 213.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 240.00
Option C: Power Windows & Locks 361.25 361.00 362.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 397.00
Make and Model Chevrolet Aveo 5 Chevrol\l__)et Aveo Chevrolet Aveo 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Chevrolet Aveo 5
Delivery Time 90 Days 120 Days 90 - 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 - 8 Weeks
Warranty 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles 3 YrM/_?G’OOO 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles
11es
TOTAL ITEM 23:| (S) 12,566.93 | (P) 12,555.00| (A)12,707.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12,900.00
24 |Chevrolet Cobalt LT, 2WD, 2-Door Coupe, Model
L ! ! 13,465.15 13,387.00 13,335.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13,621.00
1AL37, 2.2L Engine MPG 22/31
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel 233.75 234.00 234.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 257.00
Option C: Power Windows & Locks Included Included Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included
Make and Model Chevrolet Cobalt Chevrolet Cobalt Chevrolet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Chevrolet Cobalt
Cobalt LT
Delivery Time 70 Days 120 Days 90 - 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 - 8 Weeks
3Yr /36,000
Warranty 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles | 3Yr/36,000 Miles Mil No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles
11es
TOTAL ITEM 24:] (A) 13,698.90 (S) 13,621.00 (P) 13,569.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 13,878.00




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
25 |Chevrolet HHR LS, 2WD, Model 1AT46
. ' ' ' 14,984.45 14,991.00 15,234.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15,220.00
2.0L Engine MPG 19/28
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel Included Included Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included
Option C: Power Windows & Locks Included Included Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included
Make and Model Chevrolet HHR Chevrolet HHR Chevrolet HHR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Chevrolet HHR
Delivery Time 70 Days 120 Days 90 - 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 - 8 Weeks
Warranty 3 YrM/_?G’OOO 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles | 3Yr/36,000 Miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles
11es
TOTAL ITEM 25:| (P) 14,984.45| (S) 14,991.00 15,234.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (A) 15,220.00
26 i . i
Ford Fiesta, ,ZWD’ 1.2L Engine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17,550.00 16,861.00 No Bid
MPG Unavailable
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ford Fiesta Ford Fiesta No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 120 Days 90 - 280 Days No Bid
3 Yr /36,000
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles Mil No Bid
11es
TOTAL ITEM 26: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (S) 17,550.00 | (P) 16,861.00 No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
27 |Ford Focus, 2WD, 2-Door Coupe
L ! ! No Bid No Bid No Bid 13,599.00 13,450.00 13,187.00 13,368.00 No Bid
2.0L Engine MPG 24/35
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included Included Included No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid 199.00 Included 187.00 Included No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included Included Included No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid Ford Focus SE Ford Focus Ford Focus Coupe Ford Focus No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid 60 - 120 Days 60 - 90 Days 120 Days 90 - 180 Days No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles | 3Yr/36,000 Miles | 3Yr/36,000 Miles 3 YrM/_?G’OOO No Bid
11es
TOTAL ITEM 27: No Bid No Bid No Bid 13,798.00 (A) 13,450.00 | (S)13,374.00 | (P) 13,368.00 No Bid
28 |Ford Fusion, 2WD, 2.3L Engine MPG 20/28 No Bid No Bid No Bid 14,753.00 14,988.00 14,721.00 14,965.00 No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included Included Included No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included Included Included No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid Included Included Included Included No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid Ford Fusion Ford Fusion Ford Fusion Ford Fusion No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid 60 - 120 Days 60 - 90 Days 120 Days 45 - 90 Days No Bid
3 Yr /36,000
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid 3Yr /36,000 Miles | 3Yr/36,000 Miles Mil 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles No Bid
11es

TOTAL ITEM 28: No Bid No Bid No Bid (Rej) 14,753.00 (A) 14,988.00 (P) 14,721.00 | (S) 14,965.00 No Bid

For Item 28, the apparent second low bid received from Grand Prairie Ford failed to meet specifications because vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as required in the bid
specifications.




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
29 |Pontiac G5 Coupe, 2WD, Model 2AL37
. ' ' ’ No Bid 13,840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.2L Engine MPG 22/31
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid Pontiac G5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Coupe
Delivery Time No Bid 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid 3vr /_36’000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miles
TOTAL ITEM 29: No Bid (P) 13,840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 |Pontiac G6 Sedan, 2WD, Model 2Z2G69
. ' ' ' No Bid 14,987.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.4L Engine MPG 22/30
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid 704.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid Pontiac G6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sedan
Delivery Time No Bid 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid 3vr /_36’000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miles
TOTAL ITEM 30: No Bid (P) 15,691.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
31 E.%Tigf];:]bee"\i\évg’zgggel 25L.26, No Bid 13,947.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid 886.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid Pontiac Vibe No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid 3vr /_36’000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miles

TOTAL ITEM 31: No Bid (P) 14,833.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 f.?frgngzgaM;(g,Zigg), 5-Door Model ZAR48, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL ITEM 32: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2008-160, Annual Contract for Purchase of Compact Sedans

Bid Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

(Rej) = Reject

Allen Samuels

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five

Vandergriff

) . . Chevrolet Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Grand Prairie Ford Philpott Ford Planet Ford Star Ford Chevrolet
Note: The estimated MPG for each vehicle is shown Waco, TX Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX | Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Carrollton, TX Arlingon, TX
as City XX / Highway XX HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
33 |Toyota Matrix, 2WD, 4-Door, 1.8L Engine
! ' ’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16,830.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MPG 26/32
Option A: Air Conditioning No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option B: Cruse & Tilt Wheel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Option C: Power Windows & Locks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make and Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Toyota Matrix No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery Time No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 90 - 120 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
3Yr /36,000
Warranty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid . No Bid No Bid No Bid
Miles
TOTAL ITEM 33: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (P) 16,830.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




