BID

NO. 2008-153

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SIGN POST AND ANCHOR MATERIAL BREAKAWAY STYLE

Award Recommendation: Allied Tube and Conduit Corporation

Allied Tube and Conduit

Corp. Decatur Electronics

Harvey, IL Decatur, IL

HUB - No HUB - No

ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY| UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE [UNIT PRICE| EXT. PRICE

1 |Sign Post13/4" X 13/4"X 14 GA. 15Ft.| 100 23.10 2,310.00 No Bid
2 |[Sign Post13/4" X 1 3/4" X 14 GA. 14 Ft.| 100 21.56 2,156.00 No Bid
3 |Sign Post13/4" X 13/4" X 14 GA. 13 Ft.[ 100 20.02 2,002.00 No Bid
4 |Sign Post 1 3/4" X 1 3/4" X 14 GA. 12 Ft.| 100 18.48 1,848.00 No Bid
5 |Sign Post13/4" X 13/4" X 14 GA. 10 Ft.| 1,500 15.40 23,100.00 No Bid
6 |[Sign Post2" X 2" X 14 GA. 10 Ft. 125 17.96 2,245.00 No Bid
7 |Sign Post2" X 2" X 14 GA. 14 Ft. 100 25.14 2,514.00 No Bid
8 [Anchor 2 1/4" X 12 GA. 100 7.85 785.00 No Bid
9 |Anchor 2" X 2" X 12 GA. 1,500 7.32 10,980.00 No Bid
10 [Sleeve 2 1/2" X 12 GA. 100 4.59 459.00 No Bid
11 |Sleeve 2 1/4" X 2 1/4" 12 GA. 1,500 4.25 6,375.00 No Bid
12 |Corner Bolt 2,000 0.40 800.00 No Bid
13 |Drive Rivet 1,000 0.50 500.00 No Bid
14 [Jam Nut 150 0.10 15.00 No Bid
15 [Square Post Cap Bracket 1 /34" 25 4.20 105.00 No Bid
16 |Square Post Cap Bracket 2" 25 4.20 105.00 No Bid
17 |Drive Cap, Manual 2" 1 145.00 145.00 No Bid
18 |Drive Cap, Manual 2 1/4" 1 145.00 145.00 No Bid
19 |Flanged Washer Nut 150 0.10 15.00 No Bid
20 |Nylon Washer 150 0.06 9.00 No Bid
21 |Deg. Cross 25 3.95 98.75 No Bid
Total Amount of Bid: 56,711.75 No Bid
Discount for Items Not Listed: 61% No Bid




