
RFB 2008-152
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LAWN MAINTENANCE

AWARD RECOMMENDATION: GROUPS 1 & 2  LOCATIONS
EWING LANDSCAPE COMPANY

CEV

EWING LANDSCAPE NAVCO LAWN SVC. PALUMBO

FORT WORTH TX FORT WORTH TX HASLET TX

GROUP 1 HUB-NO HUB-YES HUB-NO

$300.00/mo NO BID NO BID
$3600.00/yr NO BID NO BID

$450.00/mo NO BID NO BID

$5400.00/yr NO BID NO BID

$250.00/mo NO BID NO BID

$3000.00/yr NO BID NO BID

$270.00/mo NO BID NO BID

$3240.00/yr NO BID NO BID

$260.00/mo NO BID NO BID

$3120.00/yr NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 1 (PER MONTH) $1,530.00 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 1 (PER YEAR) $18,360.00 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 2
$250.00/mo NO BID NO BID
$3000.00/yr NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 2 (PER MONTH) $250.00 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 2 (PER YEAR) $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 3-OPTIONAL LOCATIONS
$3550.00/mo NO BID NO BID
$42,600.00/yr NO BID NO BID

$1780.00/mo NO BID NO BID
21360 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 3(PER MONTH) $5,330.00 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 3 (PER YEAR) $63,960.00 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUPS 1 & 2 (PER MONTH) $1,780.00
TOTAL GROUPS 1 & 2 (PER YEAR) $21,360.00

TOTAL GROUPS 1,2,3 (PER MONTH) $7,110.00 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUPS 1,2,3 (PER YEAR) $85,320.00 NO BID NO BID

PARKING GARAGE

M.E. FACILITY

MANSFIELD SUBCOURTHOUSE

SOUTHEAST SUBCOURTHOUSE

ADMINISTRATION  BLDG

1895 COURTHOUSE 

CIVIL COURTS BLDG

CRIMINAL JUSTICE BLDG


