
 

RFB NO. 2008-146  ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR KITCHEN EQUIPMENT PARTS

Heritage Food Service 
Equipment, Inc.             

Ft. Wayne, IN               
HUB - No

ISI Commercial
Refrigeration, Inc. 

 Dallas, TX
 HUB - No

Section No. Brand / Manufacturer Percentage Discount Offered Percentage Discount
 Offered

1. Carter Hoffman 31.00% No Bid

2. Red Goat 31.00% No Bid

3. Groen 31.00% No Bid

4. Victory Manufacturing 31.00% No Bid

5. True 31.00% 25.00%

6. Vulcan Hart 15.00% No Bid

7. Cres-Cor 31.00% No Bid

8. Anets 31.00% No Bid

9. Edlund 31.00% No Bid

10. Bunn-O-Matic 31.00% No Bid

11. Duke 31.00% No Bid

12. Manitowoc 31.00% No Bid

13. Dormont 45.00% No Bid

14. Asco 10.00% No Bid

15. Caddy 10.00% No Bid

16. Cambro 31.00% No Bid

Notes: 

Award Recommendation:
Primary - Heritage Food Services Equipment, Inc. Sections 1 - 16

Ecolab/GCS Service, Inc.:  Bid Rejected because they failed to include freight in their pricing and they failed to 
include the manufacturer's catalogs and/or price list as the specifications required.

Hobart Services:   Bid Rejected because they failed to include the manufacturer's catalog and/or price list as 
the specifications required.



 

Secondary - ISI Commercial Refrigeration, Inc. Section 5


