RFB 2008-142
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INMATE HYGIENE SUPPLIES

AWARD RECOMMENDATION: LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

(P) PRIMARY (S) SECONDARY
BOB BARKER 6 OF 20 ITEMS AMERICAN HOTEL 5 OF 20 ITEMS
CHARM TEX 6 OF 20 ITEMS CHARM TEX 5 OF 20 ITEMS
ICS 6 OF 20 ITEMS ICS 4 OF 20 ITEMS
AMERICAN HOTEL 2 OF 20 ITEMS BOB BARKER 3 OF 20 ITEMS
ACME SUPPLY 1 OF 20 ITEMS
cev
ACME SUPPLY | AMERICAN HOTEL | BOB BARKER CHARM TEX ICS
ITEM EST GLEN COVE NY | VERNON HILLS IL FUQUAY NC BROOKLYN NY WACO TX
NO |DESCRIPTION QTY HUB-NO HUB-NO HUB-NO HUB-NO HUB-NO
1 |RAZOR,SINGLE EDGE, BIC 160-200 CS NO BID 0.15/EA 0.078/EA (S)0.07654/EA (P)0.074/EA
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%
2 |SOAP, BAR 3.0 0Z BULK 80,000- 0.30/ EA 0.22/EA (P)0.188/EA *0.1545/EA (S)0.195/EA
per bid specs 130,000 EA
min % discount sim items N/A N/A 5% N/A 10%
3 [BLANKET, THERMAL 2.5# 1,500-4,500 **5 00/ EA 7.98/EA (P)6.18/EA **5 54/EA **6.18/EA
per bid specs EA
min % discount sim items N/A N/A 5% N/A 10%
4 |TOOTHBRUSH, 30 TUFT 10,000- NO BID 0.05/EA (S)0.039/EA 0.0415/EA (P)0.037/EA
per bid specs 20,000 EA
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%
5 |TOOTHPASTE, 2.75 OZ 200-300 CS| NO BID 47.78/CS (P)0.238/EA 0.3345/EA (S)42.00/CS
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%
6 |COMB, POCKET, 5" 8,000- NO BID 0.07/EA 0.16/EA (S)0.0152/EA (P)0.015/ea
per bid specs 10,000 EA
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%

* Vendor does not meet specifications for size & packaging. Reference Sheriff's Department letter dated 8-01-08
** VVendors do not meet specifications for warmth and comfort. Bid specificatios require a "tight" weave not " loose".
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7 |TOWEL, BATH, 20 X 40 5# 900- (S)9.75/Dz2 9.89/DZ (P)9.72/Dz 9.99/dz
per bid specs 1000 DZ
min % discount sim items N/A N/A 5% N/A 10%
8 |CANVAS SHOES, LOW TOP 2,000- NO BID NO BID (S)6.15/PR ***5 36/PR (P)5.57/pr
per bid specs 2,500 PR
min % discount sim items NO BID NO BID 5% N/A 10%
9 [SANDALS, SLIP ON, PVC 1,375 - 3.95/PR NO BID (S)1.58/PR (P)1.28/PR 1.96/pr
per bid specs 4,500 PR
min % discount sim items N/A NO BID 55% N/A 10%
10 |MATTRESS COVERS 1,500 - 10.00/EA 19.98/EA NO BID ***xx5 90/EA (P)7.12/ea
per bid specs 4,500 EA
min % discount sim items N/A N/A NO BID N/A 10%
11 |RUBBER BOOTS,BLACK, 16" 300 PR NO BID NO BID (P)10.15/PR 13.36/PR (S)13.10/pr
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID NO BID 5% N/A 1000%
12 |BOUFFANT CAPS, B1400 150 CS NO BID (P)32.98/CS **xx%34 .89/CS 41.18/CS (S)35.90/cs
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%
13 |DISPOSABLE APRONS 800 BX NO BID 42.98/BX (P)3.85/BX (S)4.50/BX 5.22/bx
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%

*** \Vendor does not meet specifications for cushion insole, Reference Sheriff's Department letter dated 8-1-08
*++ \Vendor does not meet specification for strengh & durability. Reference Sheriff's Department letter dated 8-01-08
*rxxk Vendor bid case size of 100, Bid specifications require case size of 1000
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14 |SCRUB SHIRT, DISPOSABLE, XL 60 CS NO BID (S)39.98/CS 53.33/CS (P)39.90/CS 39.50/cs
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%
15 |SCRUB SHIRT, DISPOSABLE, XXL 60 CS NO BID (S)41.98/CS 53.33/CS (P)39.90/CS 46.30/cs
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%
16 |SCRUB PANT, DISPOSABLE, XL 60 CS NO BID (S)47.98/CS 53.33/CS (P)49.90/CS 49.00/cs
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%
17 |SCRUB PANT, DISPOSABLE, XXL 60 CS NO BID (S)49.98/CS 53.33/CS (P)49.90/CS 59.20/cs
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%
18 |CUP, 7 1/2 OZ, SC-7, TEAL 60 CS NO BID 85.98/CS NO BID (S)68.90/CS (P)59.90/cs
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A NO BID N/A 10%
19 |SHOWER & TUB SAFETY MAT 288EA NO BID (S)4.38/EA (P)3.52/EA 7 .54/EA 9.90/ea
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A 5% N/A 10%
20 [SHOWER CURTAIN 9 GA VINYL 576 EA NO BID (P)4.98/EA NO BID (S)7.36/EA NO BID
per bid specs
min % discount sim items NO BID N/A NO BID N/A NO BID

Note: items 14,15,16, 17 were evaluated and computed on cost of complete sets of sizes XL & XXL.




