Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans
Award Recommendations (P) =Primary (S) = Secondary (A) = Alternate

Caldwell Country Sam Pack's Five Star
Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
1 Mini Van, 7 Passenger, 2WD 19,714.00 26,805.00 22,496.00 21,715.00 No Bid 22,292.00
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included Included No Bid Included
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel 250.00 Included Included Included No Bid Included
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks Included Included Included Included No Bid Included
Brand and Model Chevrolet Uplander | Chevrolet Traverse Ford Taurus X K02 | o0 o v No. KO2 NG Bid Ford Taurus X
C412216 CR14526 Body '
Delivery 90-120 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 90-120 Days No Bid 50-75 Days
Warranty 3Yrs /36,000 Miles | 3Yrs/36,000 Miles 3 Yrs / 36,000 Miles 3 Yrs /36,000 Miles No Bid 3 Yrs /36,000 Miles

Total Bid Amount for Item 1: (P) 19,964.00 26,805.00 22,496.00 (S) 21,715.00 No Bid (A) 22,292.00




Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans
(A) = Alternate

Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five Star

Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
2 Mini Cargo Van, 2WD 14,927.00 15,753.00 No Bid 17,929.00 15,263.10 No Bid
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included No Bid Included Included No Bid
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel Included Included No Bid Included Included No Bid
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks Included Included No Bid Included Included No Bid
Chevrolet HHR Chevrolet HHR Panel : Chevrolet HHR Panel .
Brand and Model Panel 1AT26 1AT26 No Bid Ford E-150 Wagon E11 1AT26 No Bid
Delivery 90-120 Days 90-120 Days No Bid 90-120 Days 60-90 Days No Bid
Warranty 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3 Yr/ 36,000 Miles No Bid 3 Yr /36,000 Miles 3 Yr/ 36,000 Miles No Bid
Total Bid Amount for Iltem 2: (P) 14,927.00 (A) 15,753.00 No Bid 17,929.00 (S) 15,263.10 No Bid




Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans
(A) = Alternate

Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five Star

Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
3 Full Size, 8 Passenger Van, 2WD 18,340.00 19,345.00 18,141.00 20,152.00 18,508.20 17,914.00
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included Included Included Included
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel 116.00 395.00 199.00 42.00 315.00 192.00
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks 180.00 475.00 411.00 Included 379.00 342.00

Brand and Model

Chevrolet Express

Chevrolet Express

Ford 8-Passenger

Ford E-350 Wagon E31

Chevrolet Express

Ford E-150 Club

CG13406 CG13406 Wagon E11 CG13406 Wagon
Delivery 90-120 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 60-85 Days
Warranty 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles |3 Yr /36,000 Miles

Total Bid Amount for Item 3:

(S) 18,636.00

20,215.00

(A) 18,751.00

20,194.00

19,202.20

(P) 18,448.00




Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans
(S) = Secondary

Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(A) = Alternate

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five Star

Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
4 Full Size, 12 Passenger Van, 2WD 19,519.00 20,280.00 18,271.00 No Bid 21,523.84 19,600.00
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included No Bid Included Included
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel 76.00 395.00 199.00 No Bid Included 192.00
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks 180.00 475.00 411.00 No Bid 379.00 342.00
Chevrolet Express Chevrolet Express Ford Econoline . Chevrolet Express Ford E-350 Club
Brand and Model No Bid
CG23406 CG23406 Wagon E31 3500 CG33406 Wagon
Delivery 90-120 Days 90-120 Days 75-90 Days No Bid 60-90 Days 60-85 Days
Warranty 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles 3Yr/36,000 Miles |3 Yr /36,000 Miles No Bid 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles
Total Bid Amount for Iltem 4: (S) 19,775.00 21,150.00 (P) 18,881.00 No Bid 21,902.84 (A) 20,134.00




Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans
(S) = Secondary

Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(A) = Alternate

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five Star

Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
5 Full Size, 15 Passenger Van, Extended, 23,270.00 24,435.00 22,261.00 22,160.00 23,571.87 22,110.00
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included Included Included Included
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel 76.00 Included 199.00 42.00 Included 192.00
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks 180.00 475.00 411.00 Included 379.00 342.00

Chevrolet Express

Chevrolet Express

Ford 15-Passenger

Ford F-350 Wagon

Chevrolet Express

Ford E-350 Club

Brand and Model CG33706 CG33706 Extended Wagon S31 331 3500 CG33706 Wagon
Delivery 90-120 Days 90-120 Days 75-90 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 60-85 Days
Warranty 3 Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr/36,000 Miles |3 Yr /36,000 Miles| 3Yr/36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles

Total Bid Amount for Iltem 5:

23,526.00

24,910.00

(A) 22,871.00

(P) 22,202.00

23,950.87

(S) 22,644.00




Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans
(S) = Secondary

Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(A) = Alternate

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five Star

Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
6 1/2 Ton, Cargo Van, 2WD 15,996.00 17,450.00 16,087.00 16,061.00 17,487.11 15,980.00
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included Included Included Included
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel 76.00 395.00 199.00 42.00 315.00 192.00
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks 180.00 475.00 556.00 -460.00 379.00 48.00
Ford Cargo
Chevrolet Express Cargo | Chevrolet Express . Ford E-150 Cargo | Chevrolet Express
Brand and Model CG13405 CG13405 Comme_rC|aI Van E- E14 Cargo CG13405 Ford E-150 Cargo Van
Series E14
Delivery 90-120 Days 90-120 Day 75-90 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 60-85 Days
Warranty 3 Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr/36,000 Miles |3 Yr /36,000 Miles| 3Yr/36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles

Total Bid Amount for Iltem 6:

(A) 16,252.00

18,320.00

16,842.00

(P) 15,643.00

18,181.11

(S) 16,220.00




Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans
(S) = Secondary

Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(A) = Alternate

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five Star

Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
7 3/4Ton, Cargo Van, 2WD 15,826.00 16,155.00 16,883.00 16,831.00 16,142.08 16,681.00
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included Included Included Included
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel 176.00 395.00 199.00 42.00 315.00 192.00
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks 180.00 475.00 556.00 -460.00 379.00 48.00

Chevrolet Express

Chevrolet Express

Ford E-250 Regular

Ford E-250 Cargo Van

Chevrolet Express

Ford E-250 Cargo Van

Brand and Model Cargo CG23405 CG23405 Length Cargo Van E24 E24 Cargo 2500
Delivery 90-120 Days 90-120 Days 75-90 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 60-85 Days
Warranty 3 Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles 3Yr/ 36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles

Total Bid Amount for Item 7:

(P) 16,182.00

17,025.00

17,638.00

(S) 16,413.00

(A) 16,836.08

16,921.00




Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans
(S) = Secondary

Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(A) = Alternate

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five Star

Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
8 3/4 Ton, Cargo Van, Extended, 2WD 17,467.00 17,800.00 17,799.00 17,116.00 17,786.55 17,795.00
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included Included Included Included
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel 76.00 395.00 199.00 42.00 315.00 192.00
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks 180.00 475.00 556.00 Included 379.00 48.00
- Ford E-250
Brand and Model Chevrolet Express Chevrolet Express Ci)(:]?niri;?g;egd\?;jn Extended Car Chevrolet Express Ford Econoline 250
Extended CG23705 CG23705 9 xtended L.argo Cargo CG23705
S24 S24

Delivery 90-120 Days 90-120 Days 75-90 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 60-85 Days
Warranty 3 Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr/36,000 Miles |3 Yr /36,000 Miles| 3Yr/36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles

Total Bid Amount for Item 8:

(S) 17,723.00

18,670.00

18,554.00

(P) 17,158.00

18,480.55

(A) 18,035.00




Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans
(A) = Alternate

Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five Star

Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
9 One Ton, Cargo Van, 2WD 18,254.00 18,710.00 18,899.00 18,192.00 18,675.90 18,772.00
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included Included Included Included
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel 76.00 395.00 199.00 Included 315.00 192.00
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks 180.00 475.00 556.00 Included 379.00 48.00
Brand and Model Chevrolet Express Cargo | Chevrolet Express Ford E—3_’50 cargo | Ford E-350 Cargo| Chevrolet Express Ford E-350
CG33405 CG33405 Commercial Van E34 E34 Cargo CG33405
Delivery 90-120 Days 90-120 Days 75-90 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 85-95 Days
Warranty 3 Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr/36,000 Miles |3 Yr /36,000 Miles| 3Yr/36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles

Total Bid Amount for Iltem 9:

(S) 18,510.00

19,580.00

19,654.00

(P) 18,192.00

19,369.90

(A) 19,012.00




Bid No. 2008-138, Annual Contract for Purchase of Vans

Award Recommendations (P) = Primary

(S) = Secondary

(A) = Alternate

Caldwell Country

Sam Pack's Five Star

Chevrolet Graff Chevrolet Philpott Ford Planet Ford Reliable Chevrolet Ford
Caldwell, TX Grand Prairie, TX Nederland, TX Spring, TX Richardson, TX Carrollton, TX
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
10 One Ton, Cargo Van, Extended, 2WD 18,997.00 19,550.00 19,757.00 18,962.00 19,457.15 19,554.00
Option A: Air Conditioning Included Included Included Included Included Included
Option B: Cruise & Tilt Wheel 176.00 395.00 199.00 Included 315.00 192.00
Option C: Power Windows and Power Locks 180.00 475.00 556.00 Included 379.00 48.00
- Ford E-350
Brand and Model Chevrolet Express Chevrolet Express Fferg Ifh%ﬂrﬁéirnc?zld Extended Car Chevrolet Express Ford E-350
Extended CG33705 CG33705 9 xtended L.argo Cargo CG33705
Cargo Van S34 S34

Delivery 90-120 Days 90--120 Days 75-90 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 85-95 Days
Warranty 3 Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles 3Yr/36,000 Miles |3 Yr /36,000 Miles| 3Yr/36,000 Miles 3Yr /36,000 Miles

Total Bid Amount for Item 10:

(S) 19,353.00

20,420.00

20,512.00

(P) 18,962.00

20,151.15

(A) 19,794.00




