
Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

1A Class 4, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Regular 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

31,600.00 27,738.00 29,337.00 28,286.00 28,299.00 45,950.02

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 699.00 850.00 Included Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 1A: 32,325.00 (A) 28,437.00 30,187.00 (P) 28,286.00 (S) 28,299.00 46,725.02

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-4500 Ford F-450 Dodge Ram 4500 Ford F-450 Ford F-450 International 4100 
4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days 90-120 Days 120 Days 120 Days 90 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yr / Unlimited 
Miles 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 Included with bid

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

1B  Class 4, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Extended 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

No Bid 29,922.00 31,446.00 30,341.00 30,592.00 48,082.82

Option A:  Air Conditioning No Bid 699.00 850.00 Included Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 1B: No Bid (A) 30,621.00 32,296.00 (P) 30,341.00 (S) 30,592.00 48,857.82

Brand/Model Bid: No Bid Ford F-450 Dodge Ram 4500 Ford F-450 Ford F-450 International 4100 
4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: No Bid 90-120 Days 120 Days 120 Days 60-75 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: No Bid 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 Included with bid

1C   Class 4, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Crew 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

34,520.00 30,779.00 32,280.00 31,337.00 31,559.00 52,896.42



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM
Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 699.00 850.00 Included Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 1C: 35,245.00 (S) 31,478.00 33,130.00 (P) 31,337.00 (A) 31,559.00 53,671.42

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-4500 Ford F-450 Dodge Ram 4500 Ford F-450 Ford F-450 International 4100 
4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days 90-120 Days 120 Days 120 Days 60-75 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 Included with bid



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

2A Class 5, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Regular 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

33,729.00 29,248.00 30,887.00 29,642.00 29,828.00 45,986.02

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 699.00 850.00 Included Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 2A: 34,454.00 (A) 29,947.00 31,737.00 (P) 29,642.00 (S) 29,828.00 46,761.02

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-5500 Ford F-550 Dodge Ram 5500 Ford F-550 Ford F-550 International 4100 
4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: Not Provided 90 - 120 Days 120 Days 120 Days 60-75 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 Included with bid



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

2A Class 5, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Extended 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

No Bid 31,336.00 32,660.00 31,776.00 31,886.00 48,483.62

Option A:  Air Conditioning No Bid 699.00 850.00 Included Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 2B: No Bid (A) 32,035.00 33,510.00 (P) 31,776.00 (S) 31,886.00 49,258.62

Brand/Model Bid: No Bid Ford F-550 Dodge Ram 5500 Ford F-550 Ford F-550 International 4100 
4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: No Bid 90-120 Days 120 Days 120 Days 60-75 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: No Bid 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 Included with bid



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

2C Class 5, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Crew Cab, 
2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

37,245.00 32,132.00 33,330.00 32,490.00 32,586.00 53,297.22

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 699.00 850.00 Included Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 2C: 37,970.00 (A) 32,831.00 34,180.00 (P) 32,490.00 (S) 32,586.00 54,072.22

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-5500 Ford F-550 Dodge Ram 5500 Ford F-550 Ford F-550 International 4100 
4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days 90-120 Days 120 Days 120 Days 60-75 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 3 Yrs / 36,000 Included with bid



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

3A Class 6, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Regular 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

43,530.00 39,556.00 No Bid No Bid 38,495.00 45,900.60

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 299.00 No Bid No Bid Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 3A: (Rej) 44,255.00 (S) 39,855.00 No Bid No Bid (P) 38,495.00 (A) 46,675.60

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-6500 Ford F-650 No Bid No Bid Ford F-650 International 4300 
M7 4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days 90-120 Days No Bid No Bid 60-120 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles

2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles No Bid No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles Included with bid

For Item 3A, the apparent third low bid received from Graff Chevrolet failed to meet specifications because the vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as 
required in the bid specifications.



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

3B Class 6, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Extended 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

No Bid 40,471.00 No Bid No Bid 39,647.00 47,401.72

Option A:  Air Conditioning No Bid 299.00 No Bid No Bid Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 3B: No Bid (S) 40,770.00 No Bid No Bid (P) 39,647.00 (A) 48,176.72

Brand/Model Bid: No Bid Ford F-650 No Bid No Bid Ford F-650 International 4300 
M7 4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: No Bid 90-120 Days No Bid No Bid 60-120 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles No Bid No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles Included with bid



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

3C Class 6, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Crew Cab, 
2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

47,615.00 42,181.00 No Bid No Bid 41,486.00 51,195.73

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 299.00 No Bid No Bid Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 3C: (Rej) 48,340.00 (S) 42,480.00 No Bid No Bid (P) 41,486.00 (A) 51,970.73

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-6500 Ford F-650 No Bid No Bid Ford F-650 International 4300 
M7 4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days 90-120 Days No Bid No Bid 60-120 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles

2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles No Bid No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles Included with bid

For Item 3C, the apparent third low bid received from Graff Chevrolet failed to meet specifications because the vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as 
required in the bid specifications.



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

4A Class 7, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Regular 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

43,989.00 39,606.00 No Bid No Bid 40,432.00 49,656.28

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 299.00 No Bid No Bid Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 4A: (Rej) 44,714.00 (P) 39,905.00 No Bid No Bid (Rej) 40,432.00 (S) 50,431.28

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-6500 Ford F-750 No Bid No Bid Ford F-650 International 4300 
4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days 90-120 Days No Bid No Bid 60-120 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles

2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles No Bid No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles Included with bid

For Item 4A, the apparent second low bid received from Sam Pack's Five Star Ford failed to meet specifications because the vendor bid a truck that does not meet the bid 
specifications.

The apparent third low bid received from Graff Chevrolet failed to meet specifications because the vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as required in the bid 
specifications.
There is no recommendation for alternate award.



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

4B Class 7, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Extended 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

No Bid 40,621.00 No Bid No Bid 41,347.00 51,180.00

Option A:  Air Conditioning No Bid 299.00 No Bid No Bid Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 4B: No Bid (P) 40,920.00 No Bid No Bid (Rej) 41,347.00 (S) 51,955.00

Brand/Model Bid: No Bid Ford F-750 No Bid No Bid Ford F-650 International 4300 
4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: No Bid 90-120 Days No Bid No Bid 60-120 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles No Bid No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles Included with bid

There is no recommendation for alternate award.

For Item 4B, the apparent second low bid received from Sam Pack's Five Star Ford failed to meet specifications because the vendor bid a truck that does not meet the bid 
specifications.



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

4C Class 7, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Crew Cab, 
2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

47,611.00 42,231.00 No Bid No Bid 41,867.00 54,968.03

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 299.00 No Bid No Bid Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 4C: (Rej) 48,336.00 (S) 42,530.00 No Bid No Bid (P) 41,867.00 (A) 55,743.03

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-6500 Ford F-750 No Bid No Bid Ford F-750 International 4300 
SBA 4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days 90-120 Days No Bid No Bid 60-120 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles

2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles No Bid No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles Included with bid

For Item 4C, the apparent third low bid received from Graff Chevrolet failed to meet specifications because the vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as 
required in the bid specifications.



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

5A Class 8, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Regular 
Cab, 2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

49,799.00 39,606.00 No Bid No Bid 39,742.00 53,688.69

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 299.00 No Bid No Bid Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 5A: (Rej) 50,524.00 (S) 39,905.00 No Bid No Bid (P) 39,742.00 (A) 54,463.69

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-7500 Ford F-750 No Bid No Bid Ford F-750 International 4400 
SBA 4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days 90-120 Days No Bid No Bid 60-120 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles

2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles No Bid No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles Included with bid

For Item 5A, the apparent third low bid received from Graff Chevrolet failed to meet specifications because vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as required in 
the bid specifications.



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

5B Class 8, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, Crew Cab, 
2WD, Dual Rear Wheels

53,997.00 42,791.00 No Bid No Bid 41,867.00 59,907.23

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 299.00 No Bid No Bid Included 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 5B: (Rej) 54,722.00 (S) 43,090.00 No Bid No Bid (P) 41,867.00 (A) 60,682.23

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-7500 Ford F-750 No Bid No Bid Ford F-750 International 4400 
SBA 4X2

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days 90-120 Days No Bid No Bid 60-120 Days 60-90 Days

Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles

2 Yrs / Unlimited 
Miles No Bid No Bid 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles Included with bid

For Item 5B, the apparent third low bid received from Graff Chevrolet failed to meet specifications because vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as required in 
the bid specifications.



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

6A Class 8 Tandem, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, 
Regular Cab, 2WD

56,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60,977.14

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 6A: (Rej) 57,375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (P) 61,752.14

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-8500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
International 

7400 SBA 6X4

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60-90 Days
Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included with bid

For Item 6A, the apparent low bid received from Graff Chevrolet failed to meet specifications because vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as required in the 
bid specifications.
There are no recommendations for secondary or alternate awards.



Bid No. 2008-137 Annual Contract for Purchase of Class 4 Through Class 8 Cab and Chassis Trucks

Award Recommendation

Graff Chevrolet 
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No

Philpott Ford
Nederland, TX

HUB - No

Planet Dodge
Humble, TX
HUB - No

Planet Ford
Spring, TX
HUB - No

Sam Pack's Five 
Star Ford

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No

Southwest 
International 

Trucks
 Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

(P) = Primary          (S) = Secondary          (A) = Alternate          (Rej) = Reject

ITEM

6B Class 8 Tandem, Cab & Chassis, Heavy Duty, 
Crew Cab, 2WD

60,462.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 66,413.88

Option A:  Air Conditioning 725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 775.00

TOTAL ITEM 6B: (Rej) 61,187.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (P) 67,188.88

Brand/Model Bid: Chevrolet C-8500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
International 

7400 SBA 6X4

Delivery Time After Receipt of Order: 120-180 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60-90 Days
Warranty: 2 Yrs / Unlimited 

Miles No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Included with bid

For Item 6B, the apparent low bid received from Graff Chevrolet failed to meet specifications because vendor did not include their complete list of optional items as required in the 
bid specifications.
There are no recommendations for secondary or alternate awards.


