Bid No. 2008-114 Annual Contract for Tire Repairs and Service

Bid Award Recommendation

Section 1A On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Area 1 (Southwest Tarrant County)
Primary: Southern Tire Mart
Secondary: Ace Tire Service
Alternate: GCR Tire Center

Secondary Alternate Primary
Ace Tire Service GCR Tire Center Southern Tire Mart
Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX
Item Description HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
1 |Flat Repair, Tube Type Pneu. Roller and Aircraft Front Tires 20.00 25.00 15.00
2 F!at Repair, 16.9" thru 19.5/24 Rear Backhoe and Rear Mower 4500 55.00 35.00
Tires
3 |Mount/Dismount Truck Tires 17.5" and 22.5" 18.00 25.00 18.00
4 |Flat Repair 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 25.00 7.00
5 |Mount/Dismount Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 25.00 7.00
6 |Service Call (per visit, per location) 35.00 35.00 30.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID THIS SECTION 148.00 190.00 112.00
Percent Discount (for items not listed) 10% 0% 0%
Normal Response Time 1 Hour 2 Hours 1 Hour

Normal Hours of Operations

7:00 a.m. - 5:30 p.m. M-F

7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. M-F

6:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. M-F

Offers Twenty-Four (24) On-Site Service Yes Yes Yes
Offers On-Site Service on Weekends/Holidays Yes Yes Yes
Charges for service after normal working hours 65.00 72.00 Service Call 42.50 per hour




Bid No. 2008-114 Annual Contract for Tire Repairs and Service
Bid Award Recommendation

Section 1B In Store Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Area 1 (Southwest Tarrant County)

No award recommendation for this section

Ace Tire Service GCR Tire Center Southern Tire Mart

Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX

Item Description HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
1 |Flat Repair, Tube Type Pneu. Roller and Aircraft Front Tires No Bid No Bid 15.00
2 F!at Repair, 16.9" thru 19.5/24 Rear Backhoe and Rear Mower No Bid No Bid 35.00

Tires

3 |Mount/Dismount Truck Tires 17.5" and 22.5" No Bid No Bid 15.00
4 |Flat Repair 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires No Bid No Bid 6.50
5 [Mount/Dismount Passenger and Light Truck Tires No Bid No Bid 6.50
6 [Balance 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires No Bid No Bid 6.50

TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID THIS SECTION No Bid No Bid (*) 84.50
Percent Discount (for items not listed) No Bid No Bid 0%

(*) Bid Received from Southern Tire Mart should be rejected because vendor is not physically located within Area 1 as required in the bid specifications




Bid No. 2008-114 Annual Contract for Tire Repairs and Service

Bid Award Recommendation

Section 2A On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Area 2 (Southeast Tarrant County)
Primary: Southern Tire Mart
Secondary: Ace Tire Service
Alternate: GCR Tire Center

Secondary Alternate Primary
Ace Tire Service GCR Tire Center Southern Tire Mart
Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX
Item Description HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
1 |Flat Repair, Tube Type Pneu. Roller and Aircraft Front Tires 20.00 25.00 15.00
5 F!at Repair, 16.9" thru 19.5/24 Rear Backhoe and Rear Mower 45.00 55.00 35.00
Tires
3 |Mount/Dismount Truck Tires 17.5" and 22.5" 18.00 25.00 18.00
4  |Flat Repair 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 25.00 7.00
5 |Mount/Dismount Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 25.00 7.00
6 |Service Call (per visit, per location) 35.00 35.00 30.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID THIS SECTION 148.00 190.00 112.00
Percent Discount (for items not listed) 10% 0% 0%
Normal Response Time 1 Hour 2 Hours 1 Hour

Normal Hours of Operations

7:00 a.m. - 5:30 p.m. M-F

7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. M-F

6:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. M-F

Offers Twenty-Four (24) On-Site Service Yes Yes Yes
Offers On-Site Service on Weekends/Holidays Yes Yes Yes
Charges for service after normal working hours 65.00 72.00 Service Call 42.50 per hour




Bid No. 2008-114 Annual Contract for Tire Repairs and Service
Bid Award Recommendation

Section 2B In Store Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Area 2 (Southeast Tarrant County)

No award recommendation for this section

Ace Tire Service GCR Tire Center Southern Tire Mart

Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX

Iltem Description HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
1 |Flat Repair, Tube Type Pneu. Roller and Aircraft Front Tires No Bid No Bid 15.00
5 F!at Repair, 16.9" thru 19.5/24 Rear Backhoe and Rear Mower No Bid No Bid 35.00

Tires

3 |Mount/Dismount Truck Tires 17.5" and 22.5" No Bid No Bid 15.00
4  |Flat Repair 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires No Bid No Bid 6.50
5 [Mount/Dismount Passenger and Light Truck Tires No Bid No Bid 6.50
6 [Balance 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires No Bid No Bid 6.50

TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID THIS SECTION No Bid No Bid (*) 84.50
Percent Discount (for items not listed) No Bid No Bid 0%

(*) Bid Received from Southern Tire Mart should be rejected because vendor is not physically located within Area 2 as required in the bid specifications




Bid No. 2008-114 Annual Contract for Tire Repairs and Service

Bid Award Recommendation

Section 3A On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Area 3 (Northeast Tarrant County)
Primary: Southern Tire Mart
Secondary: Ace Tire Service
Alternate: GCR Tire Center

Secondary

Alternate

Primary

Ace Tire Service

GCR Tire Center

Southern Tire Mart

Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX
Iltem Description HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
1 |Flat Repair, Tube Type Pneu. Roller and Aircraft Front Tires 20.00 25.00 15.00
5 _II:_:?etsRepair, 16.9" thru 19.5/24 Rear Backhoe and Rear Mower 45.00 55.00 35.00
3 |Mount/Dismount Truck Tires 17.5" and 22.5" 18.00 25.00 18.00
4 |Flat Repair 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 25.00 7.00
5 |Mount/Dismount Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 25.00 7.00
6 |Service Call (per visit, per location) 35.00 35.00 30.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID THIS SECTION 148.00 190.00 112.00
Percent Discount (for items not listed) 10% 0% 0%
Normal Response Time 1 Hour 2 Hours 1 Hour

Normal Hours of Operations

7:00 a.m. - 5:30 p.m. M-F

7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. M-F

6:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. M-F

Offers Twenty-Four (24) On-Site Service Yes Yes Yes
Offers On-Site Service on Weekends/Holidays Yes Yes Yes
Charges for service after normal working hours 65.00 72.00 Service Call 42.50 per hour




Bid No. 2008-114 Annual Contract for Tire Repairs and Service

Bid Award Recommendation

Section 3B In Store Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Area 3 (Northeast Tarrant County)
Primary: Ace Tire Service
Secondary: GCR Tire Center

Primary

Secondary

Ace Tire Service

GCR Tire Center

Southern Tire Mart

Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX

Iltem Description HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
1 |Flat Repair, Tube Type Pneu. Roller and Aircraft Front Tires 20.00 25.00 15.00
5 _II:_:?etsRepair, 16.9" thru 19.5/24 Rear Backhoe and Rear Mower 45 00 55.00 35.00
3 |Mount/Dismount Truck Tires 17.5" and 22.5" 18.00 25.00 15.00
4  |Flat Repair 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 12.50 6.50
5 |Mount/Dismount Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 12.50 6.50
6 |Balance 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires 5.00 12.00 6.50

TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID THIS SECTION 118.00 142.00 (*) 84.50
Percent Discount (for items not listed) 10% 0% 0%

(*) Bid Received from Southern Tire Mart should be rejected because vendor is not physically located within Area 3 as required in the bid specifications




Bid No. 2008-114 Annual Contract for Tire Repairs and Service

Bid Award Recommendation

Section 4A On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Area 4 (Northwest Tarrant County)
Primary: Southern Tire Mart
Secondary: Ace Tire Service
Alternate: GCR Tire Center

Secondary Alternate Primary
Ace Tire Service GCR Tire Center Southern Tire Mart
Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX
Iltem Description HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
1 |Flat Repair, Tube Type Pneu. Roller and Aircraft Front Tires 20.00 25.00 15.00
5 F!at Repair, 16.9" thru 19.5/24 Rear Backhoe and Rear Mower 45.00 55.00 35.00
Tires
3 |Mount/Dismount Truck Tires 17.5" and 22.5" 18.00 25.00 18.00
4 |Flat Repair 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 25.00 7.00
5 |Mount/Dismount Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 25.00 7.00
6 |Service Call (per visit, per location) 35.00 35.00 30.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID THIS SECTION 148.00 190.00 112.00
Percent Discount (for items not listed) 10% 0% 0%
Normal Response Time 1 Hour 2 Hours 1 Hour

Normal Hours of Operations

7:00 a.m. - 5:30 p.m. M-F

7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. M-F

6:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. M-F

Offers Twenty-Four (24) On-Site Service Yes Yes Yes
Offers On-Site Service on Weekends/Holidays Yes Yes Yes
Charges for service after normal working hours 65.00 72.00 Service Call 42.50 per hour




Bid No. 2008-114 Annual Contract for Tire Repairs and Service
Bid Award Recommendation

Section 4B In Store Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Area 4 (Northwest Tarrant County)

Primary: Southern Tire Mart (Service center is located at 1833 Mony Street, Fort Worth, TX 76102)

Primary
Ace Tire Service GCR Tire Center Southern Tire Mart

Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX

Iltem Description HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
1 |Flat Repair, Tube Type Pneu. Roller and Aircraft Front Tires 20.00 No Bid 15.00
5 F!at Repair, 16.9" thru 19.5/24 Rear Backhoe and Rear Mower 45.00 No Bid 35.00

Tires
3 |Mount/Dismount Truck Tires 17.5" and 22.5" 18.00 No Bid 15.00
4 |Flat Repair 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 No Bid 6.50
5 |Mount/Dismount Passenger and Light Truck Tires 15.00 No Bid 6.50
6 |Balance 14" thru 17" Passenger and Light Truck Tires 5.00 No Bid 6.50
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID THIS SECTION (*) 118.00 No Bid 84.50
Percent Discount (for items not listed) No Bid 0%

(*) Bid Received from Ace Tire Service should be rejected because vendor is not physically located within Area 4 as required in the bid specifications




