
RFB 2008-111
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR WINDOW WASHING

AWARD RECOMMENDATION:LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS:
PRIMARY- COLLINS WINDOW CLEANING
SECONDARY- CITY WIDE BUILDING SERVICES, INC.

CEV

COLLINS CITY WIDE A.L. DENNIS FTW WINDOW CLEANERS

ITEM WASHING FORT WORTH TX DALLAS TX DALLAS TX FORT WORTH TX

NO LOCATION PER YEAR HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO

1 ADMINISTRATION BLDG 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $1,375.00 $1,198.00 $1,375.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $995.00 $735.00 $865.00 NO BID

2 OLD COURTHOUSE 1-4
(EXCLUDE CLOCK TOWER)
EXTERIOR/VISIT $1,300.00 $1,200.00 $1,320.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $1,020.00 $1,000.00 $1,045.00 NO BID

3 CORRECTIONS CENTER 1--4
STREET LEVEL ONLY
EXTERIOR/VISIT $130.00 $125.00 $165.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $150.00 $80.00 $95.00 NO BID

4 CRIMINAL JUSTICE BLDG 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $925.00 $800.00 $950.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $715.00 $600.00 $765.00 NO BID

5 JUSTICE CENTER 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $2,500.00 $2,400.00 $2,865.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $2,200.00 $2,000.00 $2,310.00 NO BID

6 FAMILY  LAW  CENTER 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $1,295.00 $1,200.00 $1,980.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $1,050.00 $850.00 $1,595.00 NO BID

FAMILY  LAW  CENTER - SKYLIGHT 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $50.00 $50.00 $110.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $250.00 $360.00 $575.00 NO BID

7 PLAZA BUILDING 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $2,295.00 $2,400.00 $2,450.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $1,650.00 $1,450.00 $1,720.00 NO BID

PLAZA BUILDING(ATRIUM)
EXTERIOR/VISIT $400.00 $450.00 $750.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $2,580.00 $2,900.00 $3,450.00 NO BID

8 EDUCATION CENTER 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $475.00 $670.00 $810.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $450.00 $500.00 $575.00 NO BID

9 MEDICAL EXAMINNER'S OFFICE 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $240.00 $180.00 $165.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $175.00 $110.00 $135.00 NO BID



RFB 2008-111
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR WINDOW WASHING

AWARD RECOMMENDATION:LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS:
PRIMARY- COLLINS WINDOW CLEANING
SECONDARY- CITY WIDE BUILDING SERVICES, INC.

CEV

COLLINS CITY WIDE A.L. DENNIS FTW WINDOW CLEANERS

ITEM WASHING FORT WORTH TX DALLAS TX DALLAS TX FORT WORTH TX

NO LOCATION PER YEAR HUB - NO HUB - YES HUB - NO HUB - NO

10 SOUTHWEST  SUB 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $575.00 $550.00 $645.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $460.00 $440.00 $525.00 NO BID

11 MANSFIELD SUB 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $240.00 $145.00 $150.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $210.00 $100.00 $105.00 NO BID

MANSFIELD SUB (SKYLIGHT) 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $50.00 $85.00 $85.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $200.00 $310.00 $120.00 NO BID

12 JUVENILE DETENTION CTR 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $270.00 $240.00 $260.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $230.00 $210.00 $225.00 NO BID

JUVENILE DETENTION CTR(SKYLIGHT 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $40.00 $35.00 $50.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $35.00 $35.00 $95.00 NO BID

13 SOUTHEAST SUB 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $825.00 $1,400.00 $290.00 NO BID
INTERIOR/VISIT $635.00 $1,700.00 $240.00 NO BID

14 FAMILY LAW GARAGE 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $70.00 $100.00 $280.00 NO BID
INTERIOR/VISIT $50.00 $68.00 $190.00 NO BID

15 NORTH PATROL BUILDING 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $50.00 $50.00 $105.00 NO BID
INTERIOR/VISIT $45.00 $50.00 $95.00 NO BID

16 CHAS GRIFFIN ADMINISTRATION BLDG 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $55.00 $185.00 $225.00 NO BID
INTERIOR/VISIT $50.00 $170.00 $195.00 NO BID

17 ELECTIONS CENTER 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $85.00 $122.00 $165.00 NO BID
INTERIOR/VISIT $70.00 $100.00 $115.00 NO BID

18 NORTHWEST SUB-COURTHOUSE 1-4
EXTERIOR/VISIT $50.00 $70.00 $105.00 NO BID

INTERIOR/VISIT $40.00 $35.00 $65.00 NO BID

TOTAL - EXTERIOR/VISIT $13,295.00 $13,655.00 $15,300.00 NO BID

TOTAL - INTERIOR/VISIT $13,260.00 $13,873.00 $15,100.00 NO BID
TOTAL - ALL BIUILDINGS $26,555.00 $27,458.00 $30,400.00 NO BID


