Bid No. 2008-081 Annual Contract for Domestic, Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies, After Market and OEM

Bid award recommendations are to the overall low bid received per section.

Bankston Continental Interstate
Chevrolet Chandler Auto Parts Battery Sys of| Installer Sales Jesse P. Metroplex Moritz of O'Reilly Auto Stewart &
North Parts Company Fort Worth & Service Taylor Oil Battery Fort Worth Nichols Ford Parts Stevenson |Truck Pro, Inc.
Richland Hills, Fort Worth, Haltom City, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Dallas, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Springfield, Grand Prairie, Cordova,
Sec. Section Title TX TX X X X TX TX TX X MO X TN
Secondary Primary
1 |Air Conditioning - AC Delco 45.53 38.98 55.12 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 58% 28% 55%
Price List GM Master AC-15 Jobber GM Master
Primary Secondary
2 |Air Conditioning - Motorcraft NB 217.01 250.06 NB NB NB NB NB 325.09 NB NB NB
Percent Discount 25% 50% 35%
Price List MC Jobber GM Master MC FPS-3642
Secondary Primary
3 |Alternators / Starters - AC Delco (*) 522.66 423.26 (*) 522.66 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 50% 28% 50%
Price List GM Master AC-31 Jobber GM Master
Primary Secondary
4 |Alternators / Starters - Motorcraft NB 793.58 713.93 NB NB NB NB NB 773.43 NB NB NB
Percent Discount 15% 40% 35%
Price List MC Jobber MC Master MC FPS-3642

WW Grainger of Fort Worth, TX submitted a no-bid.

(*) Tie bids received for Secondary Awards for Sections 3, 16 and 34 were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order Number 60616, Procedure For Awarding Tie Bids.




Bid No. 2008-081 Annual Contract for Domestic, Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies, After Market and OEM

Bid award recommendations are to the overall low bid received per section.

Bankston Continental Interstate
Chevrolet Chandler Auto Parts Battery Sys of| Installer Sales Jesse P. Metroplex Moritz of O'Reilly Auto Stewart &
North Parts Company Fort Worth & Service Taylor Oil Battery Fort Worth Nichols Ford Parts Stevenson |Truck Pro, Inc.
Richland Hills, Fort Worth, Haltom City, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Dallas, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Springfield, Grand Prairie, Cordova,
Sec. Section Title X TX X X X X X X X MO X TN
Primary Secondary
5 |Batteries - AC Delco NB 174.77 199.04 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 20% 35%
Price List AC-07 Jobber AC Master
6 |Batteries - Delphi NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount
Price List
Primary
7 |Batteries - Interstate NB NB NB 387.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 12%
Price List IB #254082
Primary
8 |Batteries - Powertron NB NB NB NB NB NB 308.70 NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 43%

Price List

Powertron List

WW Grainger of Fort Worth, TX submitted a no-bid.

(*) Tie bids received for Secondary Awards for Sections 3, 16 and 34 were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order Number 60616, Procedure For Awarding Tie Bids.




Bid No. 2008-081 Annual Contract for Domestic, Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies, After Market and OEM

Bid award recommendations are to the overall low bid received per section.

Bankston Continental Interstate
Chevrolet Chandler Auto Parts Battery Sys of| Installer Sales Jesse P. Metroplex Moritz of O'Reilly Auto Stewart &
North Parts Company Fort Worth & Service Taylor Oil Battery Fort Worth Nichols Ford Parts Stevenson |Truck Pro, Inc.
Richland Hills, Fort Worth, Haltom City, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Dallas, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Springfield, Grand Prairie, Cordova,
Sec. Section Title X TX X X X X X X X MO X TN
Primary Secondary
9 |Belts - AC Delco NB 110.57 169.36 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 28% 55%
Price List AC-35 Jobber AC Master
Primary Secondary
10 |Belts - Gates NB NB NB NB 81.44 NB NB NB NB 91.97 NB NB
Percent Discount 70% 17%
Price List Gates List Gates Jobber
Primary Secondary
11 |Brake Pads - AC Delco 252.74 210.54 210.60 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 40% 20% 50%
Price List GM Master AC-14 Jobber GM Master
Primary Secondary
12 |Brake Pads - Wagner NB 140.69 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 170.20 NB NB
Percent Discount 38% 25%

Price List

Wagner Jobber

Wagner Jobber

WW Grainger of Fort Worth, TX submitted a no-bid.

(*) Tie bids received for Secondary Awards for Sections 3, 16 and 34 were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order Number 60616, Procedure For Awarding Tie Bids.




Bid No. 2008-081 Annual Contract for Domestic, Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies, After Market and OEM

Bid award recommendations are to the overall low bid received per section.

Bankston Continental Interstate
Chevrolet Chandler Auto Parts Battery Sys of| Installer Sales Jesse P. Metroplex Moritz of O'Reilly Auto Stewart &
North Parts Company Fort Worth & Service Taylor Oil Battery Fort Worth Nichols Ford Parts Stevenson |Truck Pro, Inc.
Richland Hills, Fort Worth, Haltom City, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Dallas, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Springfield, Grand Prairie, Cordova,
Sec. Section Title TX TX X X X TX TX TX X MO X TN
Primary
13 |Brake Rotors - Wagner NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 227.33 NB NB
Percent Discount 40%
Price List Wagner Jobber
Secondary Primary
14 |Electrical System Parts - AC Delco 194.83 169.90 216.36 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 55% 28% 50%
Price List GM Master AC-01 Jobber GM Master
Primary Secondary
15 |Electrical System Parts - Motorcraft NB 237.07 309.33 NB NB NB NB NB 365.58 NB NB NB
Percent Discount 22% 45% 35%
Price List MC Jobber MC Master MC FPS-3642
Secondary Primary
16 |Emission Parts - AC Delco (*) 112.73 95.03 (*) 112.73 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 50% 28% 50%
Price List GM Master AC-21 Jobber GM Master

WW Grainger of Fort Worth, TX submitted a no-bid.

(*) Tie bids received for Secondary Awards for Sections 3, 16 and 34 were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order Number 60616, Procedure For Awarding Tie Bids.




Bid No. 2008-081 Annual Contract for Domestic, Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies, After Market and OEM

Bid award recommendations are to the overall low bid received per section.

Bankston Continental Interstate
Chevrolet Chandler Auto Parts Battery Sys of| Installer Sales Jesse P. Metroplex Moritz of O'Reilly Auto Stewart &
North Parts Company Fort Worth & Service Taylor Oil Battery Fort Worth Nichols Ford Parts Stevenson |Truck Pro, Inc.
Richland Hills, Fort Worth, Haltom City, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Dallas, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Springfield, Grand Prairie, Cordova,
Sec. Section Title X TX X X X X X X X MO X TN
Primary Secondary
17 |Emission Parts - Motorcraft NB 276.07 284.77 NB NB NB NB NB 411.34 353.95 NB NB
Percent Discount 22% 55% 35% 0%
Price List MC Jobber MC Master MC FPS-3642 | MOT-04 Jobber
Secondary Primary
18 |Filters - Baldwin NB NB NB NB NB 56.06 NB NB NB NB NB 43.49
Percent Discount 42% 82%
Baldwin Baldwin
Price List Distributor Distributor
Secondary Primary
19 |Filters - Donaldson NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 62.78 54.80
Percent Discount 45% 52%
Donaldson Donaldson
Price List Distributor Distributor
Primary
20 |Filters - Fram NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 24.34 NB
Percent Discount 45%
Price List Fram 2155B

WW Grainger of Fort Worth, TX submitted a no-bid.

(*) Tie bids received for Secondary Awards for Sections 3, 16 and 34 were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order Number 60616, Procedure For Awarding Tie Bids.




Bid No. 2008-081 Annual Contract for Domestic, Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies, After Market and OEM

Bid award recommendations are to the overall low bid received per section.

Bankston Continental Interstate
Chevrolet Chandler Auto Parts Battery Sys of| Installer Sales Jesse P. Metroplex Moritz of O'Reilly Auto Stewart &
North Parts Company Fort Worth & Service Taylor Oil Battery Fort Worth Nichols Ford Parts Stevenson |Truck Pro, Inc.
Richland Hills, Fort Worth, Haltom City, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Dallas, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Springfield, Grand Prairie, Cordova,
Sec. Section Title TX TX X X X TX TX TX X MO X TN
Primary Secondary
21 |[Filters - Motorcraft NB 67.87 68.25 NB NB NB NB NB 80.70 88.14 NB NB
Percent Discount 23% 45% 35% 0%
Price List MC Jobber MC Master MC FPS-3642 | MOT-01 Jobber
Primary Secondary
22 |Filters - WIX NB NB NB NB 25.84 NB NB NB NB 27.66 NB NB
Percent Discount 72% 40%
Price List Wix List Wix Jobber
Primary Secondary
23 |Front End Parts - Moog NB 174.81 NB NB 183.34 NB NB NB NB 202.49 NB NB
Percent Discount 28% 63% 16%
Price List Moog Jobber Moog List Moog Jobber
Secondary Primary
24 |Fuel System Parts - AC Delco 233.98 190.28 248.01 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 50% 28% 47%
Price List GM Master AC-43 Jobber GM Master

WW Grainger of Fort Worth, TX submitted a no-bid.

(*) Tie bids received for Secondary Awards for Sections 3, 16 and 34 were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order Number 60616, Procedure For Awarding Tie Bids.




Bid No. 2008-081 Annual Contract for Domestic, Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies, After Market and OEM

Bid award recommendations are to the overall low bid received per section.

Bankston Continental Interstate
Chevrolet Chandler Auto Parts Battery Sys of| Installer Sales Jesse P. Metroplex Moritz of O'Reilly Auto Stewart &
North Parts Company Fort Worth & Service Taylor Oil Battery Fort Worth Nichols Ford Parts Stevenson |Truck Pro, Inc.
Richland Hills, Fort Worth, Haltom City, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Dallas, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Springfield, Grand Prairie, Cordova,
Sec. Section Title TX TX X X X TX TX TX X MO X TN
Primary Secondary
25 |Fuel System Parts - Motorcraft NB 255.80 272.11 NB NB NB NB NB 353.75 NB NB NB
Percent Discount 22% 50% 35%
Price List MC Jobber MC Master MC FPS-3642
Primary Secondary
26 |Ignition Parts - AC Delco 197.02 154.91 177.33 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 50% 28% 55%
Price List GM Master AC-01 Jobber GM Master
Primary Secondary
27 |Ignition Parts - Motorcraft NB 175.45 203.46 NB NB NB NB NB 293.93 224.95 NB NB
Percent Discount 22% 55% 35% 0%
Price List MC Jobber MC Master MC FPS-3642 | MOT-4 Jobber
Primary
28 |OEM - Dodge NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 536.95 NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 15%

Price List

Chrysler List

WW Grainger of Fort Worth, TX submitted a no-bid.

(*) Tie bids received for Secondary Awards for Sections 3, 16 and 34 were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order Number 60616, Procedure For Awarding Tie Bids.




Bid No. 2008-081 Annual Contract for Domestic, Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies, After Market and OEM

Bid award recommendations are to the overall low bid received per section.

Bankston Continental Interstate
Chevrolet Chandler Auto Parts Battery Sys of| Installer Sales Jesse P. Metroplex Moritz of O'Reilly Auto Stewart &
North Parts Company Fort Worth & Service Taylor Oil Battery Fort Worth Nichols Ford Parts Stevenson |Truck Pro, Inc.
Richland Hills, Fort Worth, Haltom City, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Dallas, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Springfield, Grand Prairie, Cordova,
Sec. Section Title X TX X X X X X X X MO X TN
Primary
29 |OEM - Ford NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 187.97 NB NB NB
Percent Discount 35%
Price List Ford FPS-3642
Primary Secondary
30 |[OEM-GM 261.86 NB NB NB NB NB NB 347.75 NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 36% 15%
Price List GM Master GM Dealer
Primary
31 [Shocks - KYB NB 197.57 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Percent Discount 30%
Price List KYB Jobber
Primary Secondary
32 |Spark Plugs - AC Delco 23.40 18.54 27.78 NB NB NB NB NB NB 22.21 NB NB
Percent Discount 30% 25% 55% 10%
Price List GM Master AC-41 Jobber AC Master AC-Plug Jobber

WW Grainger of Fort Worth, TX submitted a no-bid.

(*) Tie bids received for Secondary Awards for Sections 3, 16 and 34 were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order Number 60616, Procedure For Awarding Tie Bids.




Bid No. 2008-081 Annual Contract for Domestic, Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies, After Market and OEM

Bid award recommendations are to the overall low bid received per section.

Bankston Continental Interstate
Chevrolet Chandler Auto Parts Battery Sys of| Installer Sales Jesse P. Metroplex Moritz of O'Reilly Auto Stewart &
North Parts Company Fort Worth & Service Taylor Oil Battery Fort Worth Nichols Ford Parts Stevenson |Truck Pro, Inc.
Richland Hills, Fort Worth, Haltom City, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Dallas, Fort Worth, Fort Worth, Springfield, Grand Prairie, Cordova,
Sec. Section Title X TX X X X X X X X MO X TN
Secondary Primary
33 |Spark Plugs - Champion NB 7.45 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 7.00 NB NB
Percent Discount 15% 10%
Price List Champ. Jobber CHP-PL Jobber
Primary Secondary
34 [Spark Plugs - Motorcraft NB 12.78 (*) 16.62 NB NB NB NB NB 24.04 (*) 16.62 NB NB
Percent Discount 23% 55% 35% 0%
Price List MC Jobber MC Master MC FPS-3642 | MOT-00 Jobber
Primary
35 |Windshield Wiper Blades - Anco NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB 24.14 NB NB
Percent Discount 20%

Price List

Anco Jobber

WW Grainger of Fort Worth, TX submitted a no-bid.

(*) Tie bids received for Secondary Awards for Sections 3, 16 and 34 were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order Number 60616, Procedure For Awarding Tie Bids.




