RFB 2008-077, ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TOOLS
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** VVendor recommended as Primary Award for the following other brands: Jonard Industries 25% discount. ldeal Industries 35% discount.

O'Reilly Auto|Lowe's Store| Myers Tires DOT Keller Feed Colonial
Vendor Name: Parts #1582 Supply Communication & Lawn Grainger Hardware MSC Parts Master
City, State| Springfield, MO | Fort Worth, TX Akron, OH Arlington, TX Keller, TX Northbrook, IL Spring, TX Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX
HUB?| HUB-No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
Discounts per Brand

American Tools No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Baldor No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bosch No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.10% No Bid No Bid
Channellock No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.10% No Bid No Bid
Chicago Pnuematic No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.11% No Bid No Bid
Craftsman No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 46.71% No Bid No Bid
Crescent No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.51% No Bid No Bid
Delta Industrial No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.00% No Bid No Bid
Dewalt 41.00% 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 46.51% No Bid No Bid
Dremel No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fluke No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Greenlee No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.11% No Bid No Bid
Hitachi No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ingersoll-Rand 41.00% 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jacobs No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.11% No Bid No Bid
Klein No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.51% No Bid No Bid
Leatherman No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lufkin No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.51% No Bid No Bid
Magna No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Makita No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.11% No Bid No Bid
Milwaukee No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.51% No Bid No Bid
Nicholson No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.51% No Bid No Bid
OTC 41.00% 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Porter Cable No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.11% No Bid No Bid
Proto No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 61.71% No Bid No Bid
Ridgid No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.51% No Bid No Bid
Snap On No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stanley No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.51% No Bid No Bid
Weller No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00% No Bid No Bid
Werner No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.11% No Bid No Bid
Wiss No Bid 0.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.51% No Bid No Bid
Other Brands Represented but not * *% *kk

specified on bid.

Primary Award in bold type . O'Reilly Auto Parts 2 of 31 line items. Colonial Hardware 210f 31 line items.

Vendor recommended as Primary Award for the following other brands listed at a minimum 41% discount: KD Tool, Goodwrench, Mechanics, Jet, Vermont American, Buffalo,

and Lisle

*** VVendor recommended as Primary Award for the following other brand: Armstrong Tool 47% discount.




