
RFB 2008-054 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR TEMPORARY HEALTHCARE PERSONNEL

Vendor Continuous Care Solutions Worldwide Travel Staffing Emerald Health Services Supplemental Healthcare Maxim Staffing Solutions

HUB Vendor no no no no no
BILL RATE BILL RATE BILL RATE BILL RATE BILL RATE

STANDARD HOLIDAY STANDARD HOLIDAY STANDARD HOLIDAY STANDARD HOLIDAY STANDARD HOLIDAY

1a. Radiology Technologist - Day Shift no bid no bid 78.72 96.00 no bid no bid 74.25 111.38 39.60 59.40

1b. Radiology Technologist - Night Shift no bid no bid 78.72 96.00 no bid no bid 74.25 111.38 39.60 59.40

2.  Registered Sonographers no bid no bid 78.72 96.00 no bid no bid 76.95 111.38 52.80 79.20

3.  CT Scan Specialist no bid no bid 78.72 96.00 no bid no bid 74.25 111.38 54.45 81.68

4.  Nuclear Medicine Technologist no bid no bid 78.72 96.00 no bid no bid 81.00 121.50 57.75 86.63

5.  Registered Nuclear Medicine Techs no bid no bid 79.95 97.50 no bid no bid 81.00 121.50 57.75 86.63

6.  Registered Ultrasonographers no bid no bid 81.18 99.00 no bid no bid 76.95 115.43 54.45 81.68

7.  Registered Radiation Therapists no bid no bid 81.18 99.00 no bid no bid 94.50 141.75 74.25 111.38

8.  Registered Dosimetrists no bid no bid 81.18 99.00 no bid no bid 118.80 178.20 110.55 165.83

TOTAL GROUP I no bid no bid 717.09 874.50 no bid no bid 751.95 1123.90 541.20 811.83

TTL GROUP I (STANDARD + HOLIDAY) no bid 1591.59 no bid 1875.85 1353.03

9.  RN 41.00 56.00 56.58 69.00 58.00 87.00 47.00 61.10 47.85 71.78

10.  LVN 31.00 43.00 45.51 55.50 no bid no bid 37.00 48.10 36.30 54.45

TOTAL GROUP II 72.00 99.00 102.09 124.50 84.00 109.20 84.15 126.23

TTL GROUP II (STANDARD + HOLIDAY) 171.00 226.59 193.20 210.38

Award Recommendation Group I Group II
Primary Maxim Staffing Solutions Primary Continuous Care Solutions
Secondary Worldwide Travel Staffing Secondary Supplemental Healthcare
Alternate Supplemental Healthcare Alternate Maxim Staffing Solutions


