BID NO. 2008-042
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABLE/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

Royer & Workplace i
Schutts Office Depot SqutFi)ons Global MeDrI:r?Zrl:gitse
(WBE) Fort Worth, TX Fletcher, OH |\ i cion. TX
Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX gton.
Discount from List Price for Haworth
A-1 [Premise, 3 -7 Projects 73% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$3,000 to $6,000
Discount from List Price for Haworth
A-2 |Premise, 1 - 3 Projects 73% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$6,001 to $10,000
Discount from List Price for
A-3 [Haworth Premise, 0 - 2 Projects 73% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$10,000 and up
Product Greenguard Certified (Yes or No)
Category A
1. |Standard Acoustical Panel, "P" Top Cap, 204.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2. |Wire Management Acoustical Panel, 168.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3. |Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "P", 227.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4. |Glazed Panel, "P", 64" high x 24" wide 245.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, . . . .
5. 24"d x 36" W 63.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, . . . .
6. 30"d x 72"w 144,99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Standard Corner Work surface, . . . .
7. 42" x 30"d 146.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8. [Peninsula Work surface, 36"w x 60"| 101.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & . . . .
0. Lock, 42"w x 14-1/4"d 143.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Open Bookshelf, Half Height, . . . .
10. |30mw x 13-3/4"d 49.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11. |Task Light. 42.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, . . . .
12. 11 9"h x 22-7/8"d x 15"w 89.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13. |Articulating Keyboard Platform. 74.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Articulating Keyboard Platform . . . .
14. wiMouse Tray. 74.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15. |[Fabric Tackboard, 36"w x 18"h, 49.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




BID NO. 2008-042
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABLE/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

Royer & Workplace i
Schutts Office Depot SolutFi)ons Global Mg;fg::gitse
(WBE) Fort Worth, TX Fletcher, OH |\ i cion. TX
Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX gton.
Discount from List Price for Modular
B-1 [Furniture with Accessories, 3" Panel, No Bid 72.51% 76.15% No Bid No Bid
minimum
Discount from List Price for . . .
- 0, 0,
B-2 Moveable/Demountable Walls No Bid 72.51% 70.50% No Bid No Bid
Product Greenguard Certified (Yes or No) Yes Yes
Category B
1. [Standard Acoustical Panel, 66"h x 42"w No Bid 241.36 210.00 No Bid No Bid
Wire Management Acoustical Panel, . . .
2. 66'h X 12"w No Bid 251.53 142.00 No Bid No Bid
3. |Standard Acoustical Panel, 78"h x 12"w No Bid 232.29 258.00 No Bid No Bid
4. |Glazed Panel, 66"h x 30"w No Bid 333.45 270.00 No Bid No Bid
Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, . . .
5. 24 x 36" W No Bid 73.12 88.00 No Bid No Bid
Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, . . .
6. 30°d x 72" No Bid 159.44 135.00 No Bid No Bid
Standard Corner Work surface, . . .
7. 22" x 30"d No Bid 156.42 138.00 No Bid No Bid
Peninsula Work surface, . . .
8. 36"W x 60" No Bid 137.18 207.00 No Bid No Bid
Overhead Storage Cabinet w/Door & . . .
0. Lock, 42'w x 14-1/4"d No Bid 135.25 154.00 No Bid No Bid
Open Bookshelf, Full Height, . . .
10. 30"w x 13-3/4"d No Bid 49.49 49.00 No Bid No Bid
Task Light. . . .
1L For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage No Bid 55.53 71.00 No Bid No Bid
Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, . . .
12. 19h x 22-7/8"d x 15"w No Bid 176.21 137.00 No Bid No Bid
13. |Articulating Keyboard Platform. No Bid 176.49 134.00 No Bid No Bid
Slide Away Keyboard Platform. . . .
14 151-1/2"w x 10"d No Bid 103.91 103.00| No Bid No Bid
15. |Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 16" high, No Bid a5.08| Ncluded | aiy No Bid
in Panels
16. |Moveable Walls, 9 ft. high x 4 ft. wide No Bid 399.43 670.00 No Bid No Bid
17. |Demountable Walls, 9 ft. high x 4 ft. wide No Bid 399.43 670.00 No Bid No Bid




BID NO. 2008-042
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABLE/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

Royer & Workplace i
Schutts Office Depot SolutFi)ons Global Mg;fg::gitse
(WBE) Fort Worth, TX Fletcher, OH |\ i cion. TX
Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX gton.
Glass Panels, Full Height, . . .
18. 9 ft. high x 4 ft. wide No Bid 972.32 797.00 No Bid No Bid
19. |Door Units, 9 ft. high x 3 ft. wide No Bid 870.88 1175.00 No Bid No Bid
20. |Hinges No Bid Included Above Included No Bid No Bid
Above
21. |Lock Sets No Bid Included Above Included No Bid No Bid

Above




BID NO. 2008-042
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABLE/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

Royer & Workplace i
Schutts Office Depot SolutFi)ons Global Mg;fg::gitse
(WBE) Fort Worth, TX Fletcher, OH |\ i cion. TX
Fort Worth, TX Dallas, TX gton.
. . . 76.15%
Discount from List Price for Modular *R20 0 . .
c1 Furniture Systems, 3" Panel, minimum 63% 72.51%| sameas No Bid No Bid
category B
Product Greenguard Certified (Yes or No) Yes Yes
Category C
1. |Standard Acoustical Panel, 62"h x 42"w 176.86 241.36 210.00 No Bid No Bid
Wire Management Acoustical Panel, . .
2. 62"h x 12w 107.67 251.53 142.00 No Bid No Bid
3. |Standard Acoustical Panel, 80"h x 30"w, 182.81 249.88 258.00 No Bid No Bid
4. |Glazed Panel, 62"h x 30"w 191.66 333.45 270.00 No Bid No Bid
Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, . .
5. 24d x 36" W 39.59 73.12 88.00 No Bid No Bid
Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, . .
6. 30"d x 72"w 93.24 159.44 135.00 No Bid No Bid
Standard Corner Work surface, . .
7. 42w x 30"d 180.56 156.42 138.00 No Bid No Bid
8. [Peninsula Work surface, 36"w x 60"l 142.45 137.18 207.00 No Bid No Bid
Overhead Storage Cabinet w/Door & . .
9. Lock, 42"w x 14-1/4"d 157.25 135.25 154.00 No Bid No Bid
Open Bookshelf, Full Height, . .
10. |30 x 13-3/4"d 62.9 49.49 49.00{ NoBid No Bid
Task Light. . .
1. For use under 30"w Overhead Storage 68.45 55.53 71.00 No Bid No Bid
Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, . .
12. 19°h x 22-7/8"d x 15"w 139.12 176.21 137.00 No Bid No Bid
13. |Articulating Keyboard Platform. 120.00 176.49 134.00 No Bid No Bid
Slide Away Keyboard Platform. . .
14 151 12w x 10"d 120.00 103.91 103.00|  No Bid No Bid
15. |Fabric Tackboard, 36"w x 16"h, 75.48 45.08 0.00 No Bid No Bid
Note: Bid from Plano Office Supply was rejected. Bid did not include a signed addendum.

Bid for category C from Royer& Schutts did not include product information for evaluation and comparison.




