
RFB NO. 2008-003
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SECURITY GUARD SERVICES 

AT VARIOUS TARRANT COUNTY   LOCATIONS

ITEM 
NO. DESCRIPTION

Smith
Protective
Services

Fort Worth, 
TX

United 
Protection
Dallas, TX

HUB

Ruiz 
Protective 
Service, 

Inc.
Dallas, TX

HUB

Paragon 
Security

Arlington, 
TX

HUB

Davis 
Security

Dallas, TX

Texas 
Industrial 
Security

Fort Worth, 
TX

HUB

VRM 
Security 
Houston, 

TX
HUB

Applied 
Operations 

Security
Allen, TX

HUB

Allied 
Barton 

Security 
Services
Irving, TX

1. Security Guard, Uniformed and Unarmed
Hourly Rate 6:00 p.m - 6:00 a.m. $14.75 $15.98 $11.89 $13.00 $14.75 $12.50 $13.00 $14.75 $15.50

2. Security Guard, Uniformed and Unarmed
Hourly Rate 6:00 a.m - 6:00 p.m. $14.75 $15.98 $11.89 $13.00 $14.75 $12.50 $13.00 $14.75 $15.50

3. Security Guard, Uniformed and Unarmed
Hourly Rate 6:00 a.m. Saturday  - 6:00 a.m. Monday $14.75 $15.98 $11.89 $13.00 $14.75 $12.50 $13.25 $14.75 $15.50

4. Security Guard, Uniformed and Unarmed
Hourly Rate County Holidays $22.13 $19.81 $11.89 $19.50 $18.45 $18.61 $19.89 $22.13 $23.25

5. Marked Patrol Vehicle at LaGrave Field Site,
Hourly Rate $25.00 $23.77 $2.99 $0.78 $26.50 $0.78 $14.00 $20.45 $8.00

Alternate Bid

1. Security Guard, Uniformed and Armed
Hourly Rate 6:00 p.m - 6:00 a.m. No Bid $13.85 $13.13 $14.25 $15.75 $13.65 $13.00 $18.25 $18.35

2. Security Guard, Uniformed and Armed
Hourly Rate 6:00 a.m - 6:00 p.m. No Bid $13.85 $13.13 $14.25 $15.75 $13.65 $13.00 $18.25 $18.35

3. Security Guard, Uniformed and Armed
Hourly Rate 6:00 a.m. Saturday  - 6:00 a.m. Monday No Bid $13.85 $13.13 $14.25 $15.75 $13.65 $13.25 $18.25 $18.35

4. Security Guard, Uniformed and Armed
Hourly Rate County Holidays No Bid $17.30 $13.13 $21.38 $23.62 $20.34 $19.89 $27.38 $27.53

5. Marked Patrol Vehicle at LaGrave Field Site,
Hourly Rate No Bid $23.50 $2.99 $0.78 $25.50 $0.78 $14.00 $20.45 $8.00

Primary: Ruiz Protective Service, Inc.

Secondary: Texas Industrial Security
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