RFP 2007-184

PRISONER EXTRADITION SERVICES

Court Services

PTS of America, LLC Inc TransCor
Nashville, TN L Nashville, TN
' Riverside, CA
VENDOR
HUB /no HUB /no HUB /no
ITEM DESCRIPTION
Transport Male from:
San Francisco, CA $1,695.75 $1,625.56 NO BID
Corpus Christi, TX $400.00 $386.13 NO BID
Jackson, MS $414.20 $424.07 NO BID
Transport Female from:
Los Angeles, CA $1,545.50 $1,335.55 NO BID
Houston, TX $400.00 $249.19 NO BID
Farmington, NM $878.90 $764.30 NO BID
cost/mile MALE $0.95 $.95-$1.01 NO BID
cost/mile FEMALE $1.10 $0.95 NO BID
Minimum Trip Fee $400.00 $185.00 - $375.00 NO BID
Discount for more than 1/per 50% 50% NO BID
50% if less
Penalty f led tri 250.00 NO BID
enalty for canceled trip than 24 hrs $
References yes yes NO BID
Sighed Proposal yes yes NO BID
Attachment A yes yes NO BID
Attachment B yes yes NO BID

*»* AWARD RECOMMENDATION
PTS OF AMERICA, LLC.




