RFB No. 2007-173 -

Award Recommendation: Primary Vendor: GES, Inc.
Secondary Vendor: Double Eagle Mechanical Services, Inc.

Alternate Vendor: Dyna Ten Service
Services performed on as required basis as ordered

Annual Contract For Mechanical And Plumbing Services

HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE

Bidder Description Parts 8:00 Am. -5:00 P.m. 5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m. Contractor's Recognized/
Mark-Up HOURLY RATE HOURLY RATE Paid Holidays
PRIMARY VENDOR Licensed Licensed Licensed
v Journeyman| Helper |Journeyman| Helper Journeyman Helper
GES, Inc. Plumbing 20% $63.25 $40.00 $94.88 $60.00 $94.88 $60.00
1020 N. E. 12th Street
Fort Worth, Texas 76102 Licensed Licensed Licensed
Certified HUB/WBE Technician Helper Technician Helper Technician Helper
Certificate #: 1751818377100 HVAC 20% $63.25 $40.00 $94.88 $60.00 $94.88 $60.00
SECONDARY VENDOR Licensed Licensed Licensed
v Journeyman| Helper |Journeyman| Helper Journeyman Helper
Double Eagle Mechanical Svcs Plumbing 20% $65.00 $42.00 $97.50 $63.00 $97.50 $63.00
825-A Southwest Circle
Fort Worth, Texas 76115 Licensed Licensed Licensed
Technician Helper | Technician Helper Technician Helper
HVAC 20% $65.00 $42.00 $97.50 $63.00 $97.50 $63.00
ALTERNATE VENDOR Licensed Licensed Licensed
v Journeyman| Helper |Journeyman| Helper Journeyman Helper
Dyna Ten Service Plumbing 30% $65.00 $65.00 $97.50 $97.50 $97.50 $97.50
7415 White Hall Street, Ste 109
Richland Hills, Texas 76118 Licensed Licensed Licensed
Technician Helper | Technician Helper Technician Helper
HVAC 30% $65.00 $65.00 $97.50 $97.50 $97.50 $97.50
Licensed Licensed Licensed
Journeyman| Helper |Journeyman| Helper | Journeyman Helper
NPS National Plumbing Services, LLC Plumbing 30% $70.00 $45.00 $105.00 $67.50 $140.00 $90.00
DBA O'Grady Plumbing Company
PO Box 40392 Licensed Licensed Licensed
Fort Worth, Texas 76140 Technician Helper | Technician Helper Technician Helper
HVAC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




