RFP FOR ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PRINTING OF TAX STATEMENTS

Contract Awarded to: Laser Printer

RFP NO. 2006-123

4418 Center Gate, San Antonio, TX 78217 Katy Milward-Phone 210-590-6565/Fax 210-590-1620

VENDOR NAME Award
Cockrell Laser Printer Matrix Imaging Accurate
Allison Payment Printing San Antonio, TX National Data Services Soluntions Supplies
UNIT/EXTENDED Unit _ _ Unit _ _ _ _ _ _
Cost | Extension | Unit Cost Cost Extension | Unit Cost | Extension | Unit Cost [ Extension | Unit Cost
3-DAY DELIVERY
1. Tax Statements October No Bid
Supplemental (669,000) No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.16 | $56,972.04 $93.19 |$62,344.11 | $63.09 |$42,207.21
2. Tax Statement In House Yellow No Bid
Stock (10,000) No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $850.00 $76.91 $769.10 $13.09 $130.90
3. Tax Stat ts/Receipts In H No Bid
(3'856‘300;" EMEnts/ReceIpts In HoUse | N5 Bid | No Bid NoBid | $14.50 | $5,582.50 | $36.98 |$14,237.30| $13.09 | $5,039.65
No Bid
4. Envelopes Vendor Mailing #10 Non
Standard Window with Permit and No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.22 | $13,357.90 $33.54 |$23,310.30 | $20.64 |$14,344.80
Bleed Over Color (695,000)
No Bid
5. Envelopes In House (Bottom Flap)
#10 Non Standard Window w/o Permit | No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.93 $3,447.89 $34.00 $5,882.00 $22.62 $3,913.26
(173,000)
No Bid
6. Envelope In House (Top Flap) #10
Standard Window w/o Permit No. No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.22 $903.62 $64.92 $1,863.32 $20.64 $933.44
(21,500)
7. Envelope Vendor/In House #9 No Bid
Double Window Return (808,000) No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.45 | $14,099.60 $31.69 |$25,605.52  $24.30 |$19,634.40
8. Full Page Information Flyer, Tri No Bid
Color (950,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.09 | $11,485.50 $26.35 |$25,032.50 | $13.40 |$12,730.00
. . No Bid
9. Tax Information Flyer Printed from
electronic copy/stuffed in evelope w/tax| No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.60 $860.00 $13.75 $1,375.00 $20.54 $2,054.00
statement (100,000)
10. Tax Information Flyer - Multi No Bid
Colored Initial billing printed from . . .
electronic copy and stuffed in envelope No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.51 $5,755.00 $23.12 |$11,560.00 | $23.11 |$11,555.00
(500,000)
. . No Bid
11. Tax Informtion Flyer - Tri Color
Printed from electronic copy and No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.00 $920.00 $37.26 $745.20 $28.07 $561.40
stuffed in envelope (20,000)
’ } No Bid
12. Tax Information Flyer. Red Tile
Printed from electronic copy and No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.50 $577.50 $29.15 | $1,603.25 $23.11 | $1,271.05
stuffed in envelope (55,00)
13. Envelope Overprinting (55,000) No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 $440.00 $64.92 | $3,570.60 $25.31 | $1,392.05 No Bid
14. OPTION Tax Information Flyer No Bid
Provided by Tarrant Count. Stuffed in . . .
envelope with Tax Statement and #9 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 $17.25 $7.00
Return




RFP FOR ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR PRINTING OF TAX STATEMENTS

Contract Awarded to: Laser Printer

RFP NO. 2006-123

4418 Center Gate, San Antonio, TX 78217 Katy Milward-Phone 210-590-6565/Fax 210-590-1620

VENDOR NAME Award
Cockrell Laser Printer Matrix Imaging Accurate
Allison Payment Printing San Antonio, TX National Data Services Soluntions Supplies
UNIT/EXTENDED Unit _ _ Unit _ _ _ _ _ _
Cost | Extension | Unit Cost Cost Extension | Unit Cost | Extension | Unit Cost [ Extension | Unit Cost
6-DAY DELIVERY
1. Tax Statements No Bid
October/Supplemental (669,000) $84.86 |$56,771.34 No Bid $85.16 | $56,972.04 $80.98 |$54,175.62 $50.75 |$33,951.75
2. Tax Statement In House Yellow No Bid
Stock (10,000) $49.49 $494.90 No Bid $85.00 $850.00 $76.91 $769.10 $10.75 $107.50
3. Tax Stat ts/Receipts In H No Bid
(3'856‘300;" EMENLS/RECEIPLs In HOUSE | ¢1343 | $5,170.55 | NoBid | $14.50 | $5,582.50 $36.98 [$14,237.30| $10.75 |$4,138.75
- No Bid
4. Envelopes Vendor Mailing #10 Non
Standard Window with Permit and $16.14 ($11,217.30 No Bid $19.22 | $13,357.90 $33.54 [$23,310.30 $20.64 ($14,344.80
Bleed Over Color (695,000)
No Bid
5. Envelopes In House (Bottom Flap)
#10 Non Standard Window w/o Permit | $16.14 | $2,792.22 No Bid $19.93 $3,447.89 $34.00 $5,882.00 $22.62 $3,913.26
(173,000)
No Bid
6. Envelope In House (Top Flap) #10
Standard Window w/o Permit No. $16.14 | $838.94 No Bid $19.22 $903.62 $64.92 | $1,863.32 $20.64 $933.44
(21,500)
7. Envelope Vendor/In House #9 No Bid
Double Window Return (808,000) $21.43 ($17,315.44 No Bid $17.45 | $14,099.60 $31.69 [$25,605.52 $24.30 ([$19,634.40
8. Full Page Information Flyer, Tri No Bid
Color (950,000) $23.17 ($22,011.50 No Bid $12.09 | $11,485.50 $26.35 [$25,032.50 $11.39 ($10,820.50
. . No Bid
9. Tax Information Flyer Printed from
electronic copy/stuffed in evelope w/tax| $7.28 $728.00 No Bid $8.60 $860.00 $13.75 | $1,375.00 $19.71 | $1,971.00
statement (100,000)
10. Tax Information Flyer - Multi No Bid
Colored Initial billing printed from .
electronic copy and stuffed in envelope $7.48 | $3,740.00 No Bid $11.51 $5,755.00 $23.12 |$11,560.00 [ $21.90 |$10,950.00
(500,000)
. . No Bid
11. Tax Informtion Flyer - Tri Color
Printed from electronic copy and $7.47 $149.40 No Bid | $46.00 $920.00 $37.26 $745.20 $26.11 $522.20
stuffed in envelope (20,000)
. . No Bid
12. Tax Information Flyer. Red Tile
Printed from electronic copy and $7.36 $404.80 No Bid $10.50 $577.50 $29.15 $1,603.25 $21.90 $1,204.50
stuffed in envelope (55,00)
13. Envelope Overprinting (55,000) $11.18 | $614.90 No Bid $8.00 $440.00 $64.92 | $3,570.60 $25.31 | $1,392.05 No Bid
14. OPTION Tax Information Flyer No Bid
Provided by Tarrant Count. Stuffed in .
envelope with Tax Statement and #9 $15.00 No Bid $4.00 $15.00 $6.25
Return




