RFB 2006-100

FACSIMILE MULTI-FUNCTION MACHINES

Vendor: Oce' Imagistics, Inc.
ltem # List Price % Discount $ Discount Net Price
Brother IntelliFax-2820| $ 1,409.00 46.90%| $ 660.82 | $ 748.18
Brother IntelliFax-2920| $ 1,409.00 46.90%| $ 660.82 | $ 748.18
Brother IntelliFax-4750¢ $ 1,409.00 46.90%| $ 660.82 | $ 748.18
Brother IntelliFax-5750¢ $ 2,000.00 44.25%( $ 885.00 | $ 1,115.00
Brother MFC 7225N | $ 2,008.00 47.56%| $ 955.00 | $ 1,053.00
Brother MFC 8440 $ 2,008.00 47.56%| $ 955.00 | $ 1,053.00
Brother MFC 8840DN | $ 2,008.00 47.56%| $ 955.00 | $ 1,053.00
Vendor: P O Express, Inc
ltem # List Price % Discount $ Discount Net Price
Brother IntelliFax-2820| $ 349.99 50.00%| $ 175.00 | $ 175.00
Brother IntelliFax-2920| $ 499.99 50.00%| $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
Brother IntelliFax-4750¢ $ 949.99 56.00%]| $ 531.99 | $ 418.00
Brother IntelliFax-5750¢ $ 1,449.99 48.48%| $ 70296 | $ 747.03
Brother MFC 7225N | $ 499.99 48.00%]| $ 240.00 | $ 259.99
Brother MFC 8440 | $ 649.99 47.00%| $ 30550 | $ 344.49
Brother MFC 8840DN | $ 949.99 47.05%]| $ 44697 | $ 503.02
Primary Award
Vendor: FPC Office Solutions
ltem # List Price % Discount $ Discount Net Price
Brother IntelliFax-2820] $ 349.99 35.00%| $ 12250 | $ 227.49
Brother IntelliFax-2920| $ 499.99 39.00%| $ 195.00 | $ 304.99
Brother IntelliFax-47504 $ 799.99 40.00%| $ 320.00 | $ 479.99
Brother IntelliFax-57504 $ 1,449.99 47.00%| $ 681.50 | $ 768.49
Brother MFC 7225N | $ 499.99 39.00%| $ 195.00 | $ 304.99
Brother MFC 8440 | $ 649.99 38.00%| $ 247.00 | $ 402.99
Brother MFC 8840DN | $ 949.99 40.00%| $ 380.00 | $ 569.99
Secondary Award
Vendor: USA Datafax, Inc
ltem # List Price % Discount $ Discount Net Price
Brother IntelliFax-2820| $ 349.99 29.00%| $ 10150 | $ 248.49
Brother IntelliFax-2920| $ 499.99 30.00%| $ 150.00 | $ 349.99
Brother IntelliFax-4750¢ $ 799.99 31.00%| $ 248.00 | $ 551.99
Brother IntelliFax-5750¢ $ 1,449.99 34.00%| $ 493.00 | $ 956.99
Brother MFC 7225N | $ 499.99 31.00%]| $ 155.00 | $ 344.99
Brother MFC 8440 $ 649.99 31.00%| $ 20150 | $ 448.49
Brother MFC 8840DN | $ 799.99 31.00%]| $ 248.00 | $ 551.99




RFB 2006-100
FACSIMILE MULTI-FUNCTION MACHINES

Vendor: Konica Minolta
ltem # List Price % Discount $ Discount Net Price

Brother IntelliFax-2820 NO BID
Brother IntelliFax-2920 NO BID
Brother IntelliFax-4750¢ NO BID
Brother IntelliFax-5750¢ NO BID
Brother MFC 7225N NO BID
Brother MFC 8440 NO BID
Brother MFC 8840DN NO BID

Vendor: CMS, Inc
ltem # List Price % Discount $ Discount Net Price

Brother IntelliFax-2820 NO BID
Brother IntelliFax-2920 NO BID
Brother IntelliFax-4750¢ NO BID
Brother IntelliFax-5750¢ NO BID
Brother MFC 7225N NO BID
Brother MFC 8440 NO BID
Brother MFC 8840DN NO BID




