
RFB 2006-059
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS

AWARD RECOMMENDATION: LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
GST PUBLIC SAFETY SUPPLY, LLC  PER UNIT PRICE & PERCENT DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED PER SECTION

ITEM GST PUBLIC SAFETY SUPPLY, LLC PREVIOUS BID 2002-061 & UNIFORM, INC ELBECO, INC
NO DESCRIPTION GRAND PRAIRIE, TX COOPERATIVE  PURCHASING DALLAS, TX READING, PA

CATEGORY ONE: UNIFORM AND OUTERWEAR       BRAND BID: BLAUER

SECTION I : CLASS A UNIFORM PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS   

A LONG SLEEVE SHIRT, BLAUER 8450/8450W $51.65 $54.95 NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- SIZE 18 AND OVER $54.95 $57.95 NO BID NO BID

B. SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT, BLAUER 8460/8460W $46.63 $48.95 NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- SIZE 18 AND OVER $49.63 $51.50 NO BID NO BID

C TROUSER, 4 POCKET, BLAUER 8560/8560W $60.80 $63.95 NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- SIZE 44 AND OVER $64.35 $67.50 NO BID NO BID

D SIDE POCKET TROUSER , BLAUER 8980/8980W $57.42 $61.95 NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- SIZE 44 AND OVER $60.97 $65.50 NO BID NO BID

E GRAY SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, BLAUER 8910/8910W $40.92 $36.95 NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- SIZE 18 AND OVER $42.92 $38.95 NO BID NO BID

F BOMBER JACKET, LIGHTWEIGHT, BLAUER 6120 $102.30 $105.95 NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- 4XL- REG $132.70 N/A NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- 4XL- LONG $142.70 N/A NO BID NO BID

G RAINCOAT BLAUER 26976-1 $102.70 $95.50 NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- SIZE 2XL AND OVER $123.70 $95.50 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID SECTION I $462.42 N/A NO BID NO BID

% DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED, SECTION I 28% N/A NO BID NO BID

TYPE OF PRICE SHEET & DATE BLAUER RETAIL LIST, 
JAN 1-JUN 30,2006 N/A NO BID NO BID

CATEGORY ONE: UNIFORM AND OUTERWEAR       BRAND BID: EDWARDS

SECTION II :POLO SHIRTS PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

A POLO SHIRT, SHORT SLEEVE, EDWARDS #1430 $9.88 N/A NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- 2XL-3XL $11.86 N/A NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- 3XL-4XL $13.84 N/A NO BID NO BID

B. POLO SHIRT, LONG SLEEVE, EDWARDS #1780 $16.57 N/A NO BID NO BID

OVERSIZE- 2XL-4XL $19.89 N/A NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID SECTION II $26.45 N/A NO BID NO BID

% DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED, SECTION II 16% N/A NO BID NO BID

TYPE OF PRICE SHEET & DATE EDWARDS RETAIL PRICE LIST -2006 N/A NO BID NO BID



RFB 2006-059
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS

AWARD RECOMMENDATION: LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
GST PUBLIC SAFETY SUPPLY, LLC  PER UNIT PRICE & PERCENT DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED PER SECTION

ITEM GST PUBLIC SAFETY SUPPLY, LLC PREVIOUS BID 2002-061 & UNIFORM, INC ELBECO, INC

NO DESCRIPTION GRAND PRAIRIE, TX COOPERATIVE  PURCHASING DALLAS, TX READING, PA

CATEGORY ONE: UNIFORM AND OUTERWEAR       BRAND BID: GILDAN

SECTION III :T-SHIRTS PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

A T-SHIRT  100 % COTTON $2.81 N/A NO BID NO BID

B. T-SHIRT,  50/50 6.5 OZ $3.66 N/A NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID SECTION III $6.47 N/A NO BID NO BID

% DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED, SECTION III 10% N/A NO BID NO BID

TYPE OF PRICE SHEET & DATE NES RETAIL PRICE LIST - 2006 N/A NO BID NO BID

CATEGORY ONE: UNIFORM AND OUTERWEAR       BRAND BID: SFKM

SECTION IV :SWEATERS PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

A SWEATER, LONG SLEEVE, #SAI/SFKM 6745 $26.92 N/A NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID SECTION IV $26.92 N/A NO BID NO BID

% DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED, SECTION III N/A N/A NO BID NO BID

TYPE OF PRICE SHEET & DATE N/A N/A NO BID NO BID

CATEGORY TWO: ACCESSORIES & MISCELLANEOUS SERVICES

SECTION I :ACCESSORIES PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

A CORPORAL STRIPES/PAIR $2.95/PR N/A NO BID NO BID

B SGT. STRIPES/PAIR $2.95/PR $2.20/PR NO BID NO BID

C NAME TAGS $4.95/PR $4.95 NO BID NO BID

SECTION II: MISCELLANEOUS SERVICES

A EMBROIDERY OF NAME AND UNIT $6.00 $3.00 NO BID NO BID

B SEW ON PATCHES PROVIDED BY TARRANT COUNTY $1.00 N/A NO BID NO BID

C SCREEN PRINT $5.25 N/A NO BID NO BID

D ALTERATIONS(TAPERING OF PANTS & SHIRTS) $8.00 N/A NO BID NO BID

TOTAL UNIT PRICE $32.85 NO BID NO BID



RFB 2006-059
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS

AWARD RECOMMENDATION: LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS
GST PUBLIC SAFETY SUPPLY, LLC  PER UNIT PRICE & PERCENT DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED PER SECTION

ITEM GST PUBLIC SAFETY SUPPLY, LLC PREVIOUS BID 2002-061 & UNIFORM, INC ELBECO, INC

NO DESCRIPTION GRAND PRAIRIE, TX COOPERATIVE  PURCHASING DALLAS, TX READING, PA

CATEGORY THREE: DUTY GEAR, GUN HOLSTERS, LEATHER & ACCESSORIES

SECTION I : MICHAELS OF OREGON CO.  PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

A PRO-2 DUAL RETENTION JACKET $51.15 N/A NO BID NO BID

SLOT DUTY HOLSTER #4318-1,  #4318-2 N/A NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID SECTION I $51.15 N/A NO BID NO BID

% DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED, SECTION I 16% N/A NO BID NO BID

TYPE OF PRICE SHEET & DATE UNCLE MIKE'S PRICE LIST -2005 N/A NO BID NO BID

CATEGORY THREE: DUTY GEAR, GUN HOLSTERS, LEATHER & ACCESSORIES

SECTION II :BIANCHE INTERNATIONAL PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

A GUN HOLSTER  BI #7920 $82.67 N/A NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID SECTION II $82.67 N/A NO BID NO BID

% DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED, SECTION II 10% N/A NO BID NO BID

TYPE OF PRICE SHEET & DATE BIANCHI RETAILL PRICE LIST-2006 N/A NO BID NO BID

CATEGORY THREE: DUTY GEAR, GUN HOLSTERS, LEATHER & ACCESSORIES

SECTION III :SAFARILAND PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

A GUN HOLSTER  #6280 $117.78 N/A NO BID NO BID

B GUN HOLSTER  #6285 $117.78 N/A NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID SECTION III $235.56 N/A NO BID NO BID

% DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED, SECTION III 12% N/A NO BID NO BID

TYPE OF PRICE SHEET & DATE SAFARILAND RETAIL PRICE LIST-2006 N/A NO BID NO BID

CATEGORY THREE: DUTY GEAR, GUN HOLSTERS, LEATHER & ACCESSORIES

SECTION IV :DUTYMAN PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

A GARRISON BELT WITH BUCKLE $11.94 N/A NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID SECTION IV $11.94 N/A NO BID NO BID

% DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED, SECTION IV 16% N/A NO BID NO BID

TYPE OF PRICE SHEET & DATE DUTYMAN CATALOG PRICE SHEET-2005 N/A NO BID NO BID


