
RFP 2022-173 Annual Contract for Counseling and Education Services for Veterans Treatment Program
Primary Award

Section 1-Mental Health Assessments Center for Therapeutic 
Change

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Charles Overstreet, 
Ph.D.

Kennedale, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Dr. Jessica Batts, 
PsyD, LCDC, PLLC

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Forged In Valor 
Counseling and 

Consulting, PLLC
Hurst, TX
HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points Score Score Score

Qualification & Experience 300 130.00 280.00 No Bid 0.00
Response to Specifications 300 140.00 280.00 No Bid 0.00
References 100 26.67 86.67 No Bid 73.33
Price 300 90.00 112.50 No Bid 300.00
Total 1000 386.67 759.17 No Bid 373.33

Section 1-Mental Health Assessments Opportunities 
Counseling Center

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Recovery Monitoring 
Solutions, d/b/a 

Recovery Healthcare 
Corporation
Dallas, TX
HUB - No

Recovery Resource 
Council

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Substance Abuse 
Guidance & Education 

(SAGE)
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points

Qualification & Experience 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Response to Specifications 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
References 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Note:  There are no award recommendations for Section 4 becuase only no-bids were received for this section.



RFP 2022-173 Annual Contract for Counseling and Education Services for Veterans Treatment Program
Primary Award

Section 2-Intensive Outpatient Program 
(IOP) Center for Therapeutic 

Change
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

Charles Overstreet, 
Ph.D.

Kennedale, TX
HUB - No

Dr. Jessica Batts, 
PsyD, LCDC, PLLC

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Forged In Valor 
Counseling and 

Consulting, PLLC
Hurst, TX
HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points Score Score

Qualification & Experience 300 No Bid No Bid 250.00 0.00
Response to Specifications 300 No Bid No Bid 220.00 0.00
References 100 No Bid No Bid 53.33 73.33
Price 300 No Bid No Bid 200.00 200.00
Total 1000 No Bid No Bid 723.33 273.33

Primary Award Primary Award

Section 2-Intensive Outpatient Program 
(IOP)

Opportunities 
Counseling Center

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Recovery Monitoring 
Solutions, d/b/a 

Recovery Healthcare 
Corporation
Dallas, TX
HUB - No

Recovery Resource 
Council

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Substance Abuse 
Guidance & Education 

(SAGE)
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points Score Score Score

Qualification & Experience 300 270.00 No Bid 150.00 120.00
Response to Specifications 300 220.00 No Bid 260.00 180.00
References 100 53.33 No Bid 100.00 20.00
Price 300 200.00 No Bid 200.00 300.00
Total 1000 743.33 No Bid 710.00 620.00

Note:  There are no award recommendations for Section 4 becuase only no-bids were received for this section.



RFP 2022-173 Annual Contract for Counseling and Education Services for Veterans Treatment Program
Primary Award

Section 3-Supportive Outpatient 
Program (SOP) Including Discharge 
Session

Center for Therapeutic 
Change

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Charles Overstreet, 
Ph.D.

Kennedale, TX
HUB - No

Dr. Jessica Batts, 
PsyD, LCDC, PLLC

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Forged In Valor 
Counseling and 

Consulting, PLLC
Hurst, TX
HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points Score Score

Qualification & Experience 300 No Bid No Bid 250.00 0.00
Response to Specifications 300 No Bid No Bid 220.00 0.00
References 100 No Bid No Bid 53.33 73.33
Price 300 No Bid No Bid 150.00 300.00
Total 1000 No Bid No Bid 673.33 373.33

Primary Award Primary Award

Section 3-Supportive Outpatient 
Program (SOP) Including Discharge 
Session

Opportunities 
Counseling Center

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Recovery Monitoring 
Solutions, d/b/a 

Recovery Healthcare 
Corporation
Dallas, TX
HUB - No

Recovery Resource 
Council

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Substance Abuse 
Guidance & Education 

(SAGE)
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points Score Score Score

Qualification & Experience 300 270.00 No Bid 150.00 120.00
Response to Specifications 300 220.00 No Bid 260.00 180.00
References 100 53.33 No Bid 100.00 20.00
Price 300 150.00 No Bid 150.00 180.00
Total 1000 693.33 No Bid 660.00 500.00

Note:  There are no award recommendations for Section 4 becuase only no-bids were received for this section.



RFP 2022-173 Annual Contract for Counseling and Education Services for Veterans Treatment Program

Section 4-Inpatient Treatment Center for Therapeutic 
Change

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Charles Overstreet, 
Ph.D.

Kennedale, TX
HUB - No

Dr. Jessica Batts, 
PsyD, LCDC, PLLC

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Forged In Valor 
Counseling and 

Consulting, PLLC
Hurst, TX
HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points

Qualification & Experience 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Response to Specifications 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
References 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section 4-Inpatient Treatment Opportunities 
Counseling Center

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Recovery Monitoring 
Solutions, d/b/a 

Recovery Healthcare 
Corporation
Dallas, TX
HUB - No

Recovery Resource 
Council

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Substance Abuse 
Guidance & Education 

(SAGE)
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points

Qualification & Experience 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Response to Specifications 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
References 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Note:  There are no award recommendations for Section 4 becuase only no-bids were received for this section.



RFP 2022-173 Annual Contract for Counseling and Education Services for Veterans Treatment Program

Section 5-SCRAM Remote Breath, Drug 
Patches, and Secure Continuous 
Remote Alcohol Monitor (SCRAM)

Center for Therapeutic 
Change

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Charles Overstreet, 
Ph.D.

Kennedale, TX
HUB - No

Dr. Jessica Batts, 
PsyD, LCDC, PLLC

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Forged In Valor 
Counseling and 

Consulting, PLLC
Hurst, TX
HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points

Qualification & Experience 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Response to Specifications 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
References 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Primary Award

Section 5-SCRAM Remote Breath, Drug 
Patches, and Secure Continuous 
Remote Alcohol Monitor (SCRAM)

Opportunities 
Counseling Center

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Recovery 
Monitoring 

Solutions, d/b/a 
Recovery 

Healthcare 
Corporation
Dallas, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Recovery Resource 
Council

Fort Worth, TX
HUB - No

Substance Abuse 
Guidance & Education 

(SAGE)
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

Evaluation Criteria Max 
Points Score

Qualification & Experience 300 No Bid 280.00 No Bid No Bid
Response to Specifications 300 No Bid 300.00 No Bid No Bid
References 100 No Bid 53.33 No Bid No Bid
Price 300 No Bid 300.00 No Bid No Bid
Total 1000 No Bid 933.33 No Bid No Bid

Note:  There are no award recommendations for Section 4 becuase only no-bids were received for this section.
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