RFB 2022-199 Annual Contract for Elections Printed Forms and Printed Envelopes

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award
Stone Shield :jn;/aestments LLe American Solutions Runbe_ck Election
Digital Press Printing for Business Serwce;., Inc.
Crowley, TX Plano, TX Phoenix, AZ
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
ltem| Description Qty Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price
SECTION 1: Envelopes
Envelope, Spoiled Ballot 1,000 $ 60.00| $ 60.00| $ 107.39 | § 107.39 | $ 195.00| $ 195.00
1 Informatic;n and Instruction 10,000 $ 53.00| $ 530.00 | 3 49.92 | § 499.20 | $ 99.00| $ 990.00
25,000 $ 47.00| $ 1,175.00| ¥ 41.95 | $ 1,048.80 | $ 90.00| $ 2,250.00
1,000 $ 109.00 | $ 109.00 | $ 121.10 | $ 121.10| $ 252.00( $ 252.00
5 Envelope, Legal w/ Logo, 2,500 $ 86.00( $ 215.00( $ 99.68 | $ 249.20( $ 18450 $ 461.25
W/ Window 5,000 $ 76.00 | $ 380.00 | % 74.81 | $ 374.04 | $ 147.00 | $ 735.00
10,000 $ 74.00| $ 740.00| 3 67.61 | $ 676.08 | $ 112.50| $ 1,125.00
Envelope, Legal w/ Logo, No 1,000 $ 109.00 | $ 109.00 | $ 118.13 | § 118.13 | $ 24750 $ 247.50
3 Window ’ ’ 5,000 $ 75.00 | $ 375.00| $ 63.97 | $ 319.85( $ 12750 | $ 637.50
10,000 $ 73.00| $ 730.00| $ 63.05 | $ 630.48 | $ 106.50 | $ 1,065.00
Envelope, Early Voting Mail 2,500 $ 264.00( $ 660.00| $ 1,270.34 | § 3,175.85| $ 946.50 | $ 2,366.25
4 Out — En,li h/Spanish 10,000 $ 24400 $ 2,440.00]| $ 441.90 | $ 4,419.00 | $ 423.00| $ 4,230.00
glish/sp

25,000 $ 231.00( $ 5,775.00| $ 251.92 | § 6,298.03 | $ 276.00| $ 6,900.00
2,500 $ 349.00| $ 87250 $ 1,270.34|$ 3,17585| $ 946.50| $  2,366.25
5 Envelope, Early Voting Mail 5,000 $ 329.00| $ 1,645.00| $ 750418 375204 | $ 77250 $ 3,862.50
Out -- English/Vietnamese 10,000 | $ 309.00( $ 3,090.00]| $ 44190 $  4,419.00| $ 423.00| $  4,230.00
15,000 $ 289.00| $ 4,335.00| $ 333.79| $ 5,006.82 | $ 361.50( $ 5,422.50
2,500 $ 171.00| $ 427.50 | $ 801.14| §  2,002.85| $ 921.00] $  2,302.50
6 E)rr“’;?@e\’/z?r'";’tf”"e'°pe 5000 | $ 151.00| $  755.00| 8§  448.16| 8 2240.82| $ __ 56550| $ _ 2,827.50
English/Spanish 10,000 | $ 141.00| $ 1,410.00( § 281.08| $ 281082 | $ 369.00f $  3,690.00
25,000 $ 129.00| $ 3,225.00( $ 167.68 | $ 4,192.03 | $ 258.00| $ 6,450.00




RFB 2022-199 Annual Contract for Elections Printed Forms and Printed Envelopes

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award
Stone Shield Investments LLC ) )
dba American Solut/ons Runbeck Election Services, Inc.
. e for Business : ’
Digital Press Printing Phoenix, AZ
Crowley, TX Plano, TX HUB - No
HUB - No
HUB - No CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes
ltem| Description Qty Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price
SECTION 1: Envelopes
Envelope, Ballot Envelope 1,000 $ 225.00| $ 225.00( $ 1,896.05| $ 1,896.05| $ 1,534.50 | $ 1,534.50
7 |for Early Voting -- 2,500 $ 201.00( $ 502.50( $ 801.14| $ 2,002.85| $ 928.50| $ 2,321.25
English/Viethamese 5,000 $ 176.00| $ 880.00( $ 448.16 | $ 2,240.82 | $ 565.50 | $ 2,827.50
15000 | $  293.00| $ 4,395.00] $ 212.12| §  3181.80| $ 438.00| $  6,570.00
8 Affidavit for Provisional 25,000 $ 241.00( $ 6,025.00| ¥ 165.57 | $ 4,139.25| $ 35550 $ 8,887.50
Ballot Envelope 50000 | $ 193.00| $ 9,650.00] $ 127.70| §  6,385.00| $ 312.00[ $ 15,600.00
100,000 $ 176.00| $ 17,600.00( $ 11257 | $ 11,257.00| $ 27150 $ 27,150.00
) 2,500 $ 227.00( $ 567.50 | $ 1,419.14 | $ 3,547.85| $ 729.00| $ 1,822.50
o Foﬂvégi,"ye’vfﬁggi;jﬂ,vf'fpe 5000 | $  207.00] $ 1,035.00]| $  790.16]| $ 395082|$  46800| $  2,340.00
English/Spanish 10,000 $ 197.00| $ 1,970.00( $ 485.08 | $ 4,850.82 | $ 348.00| $ 3,480.00
25,000 $ 187.00| $ 4,675.00( 3 283.60| $ 7,090.03 | $ 252.00( $ 6,300.00
Envelope, Carrier Envelope | 1:.000 | $  349.00[ $  349.00[ § 337205 § 337205 §  1,52550| $  1,525.50
10 [for Early Voting Mail-In -- 2,500 $ 329.00| $ 822.50( $ 1,419.14 | $ 3,547.85| $ 729.00| $ 1,822.50
English/Vietnamese 5000 |$ 309.00| $ 1,545.00| $ 790.16 | $  3,950.82| $ 468.00( $  2,340.00
_ 2500 | $  329.00| $§  82250| § 1,419.14| $  3547.95| $ 72900 $  1,822.50
0 E;;’Ii'%%?i'nzphf:”ﬁa""'erfor 5000 | $ 309.00] $ 1,545.00] $ 790.16 | $  3,950.82]| $ 468.00| $  2,340.00
English/Vietnamese 10,000 $ 299.00( $ 2,990.00( 3 485.08 | $ 4,850.82 | $ 348.00 | $ 3,480.00
15,000 $ 289.00( $ 4,335.00( 3 366.61 | $ 5499.18 | $ 286.50| $ 4,297.50




RFB 2022-199 Annual Contract for Elections Printed Forms and Printed Envelopes

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award
Stone Shield :jn;/aestments LLe American Solutions Runbe_ck Election
Digital Press Printing for Business Serwce;., Inc.
Crowley, TX Plano, TX Phoenix, AZ
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
ltem| Description Qty Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price
SECTION 1: Envelopes
Envelope, FPCA, Carrier for 2,500 $ 227.00 $ 567.50( $ 1,419.14 $ 3,547.85 $ 729.00| $ 1,822.50
12 Early Voting Mail In, 5,000 $ 207.00( $ 1,035.00( 3 790.16 | $ 3,950.82 | $ 468.00( $ 2,340.00
English/Spanish - White 10,000 $ 197.00| $ 1,970.00( $ 485.08 | $ 4,850.82 | $ 348.00| $ 3,480.00
Paper 15,000 $ 192.00| $ 2,880.00( $ 366.61 | $ 5499.18 | $ 286.50| $ 4,297.50
Envelope, FPCA, Carrier for 2,500 $ 349.00| $ 872.50| $ 1,419.14 | $ 3,5647.85| $ 946.50| $ 2,366.25
13 Early Voting Mail In, 5,000 $ 329.00| $ 1,645.00| $ 790.16 | $ 3,950.82 | $ 77250 $ 3,862.50
English/Spanish - Green 10,000 $ 309.00( $ 3,090.00( 3 485.08 | $ 4,850.82 | $ 423.00| $ 4,230.00
Paper 15,000 $ 289.00| $ 4,335.00| ¥ 366.61 | $ 5499.18 | $ 36150 $ 5,422.50
Percent Discount 0% 0% No Bid
Section Total $ 105,387.00 | $ 131,877.01 | $ 176,909.00




RFB 2022-199 Annual Contract for Elections Printed Forms and Printed Envelopes

Primary Award

Secondary Award

Stone Shield Investments LLC

American Solutions

Runbeck Election

Digital dea Printi for Business Services, Inc.
'grial Fress Frinting Plano, TX Phoenix, AZ
Crowley, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
ltem| Description | Qty Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price
SECTION 2: Forms and Misc. Printing
Voter Redistrat 5000 |No Bid No Bid $ 12839 % 641.94] ¢ 650.00| $  3250.00
1 A;p?ircat?gr:sf;? '[‘)’gputy 10,000  |No Bid No Bid $ 92.67| $ 926.73| $ 380.00| $§  3.800.00
Registrars (English Only) 15,000 _ |No Bid No Bid $ 8311 $ 1,246.64] $ 280.00| $  4.200.00
25000 |No Bid No Bid $ 7085 $ 1,771.36| $ 270.00| §  6.750.00
Voter Redistrat 5000  |No Bid No Bid $ 12839 % 641.94| ¢ 650.00| $  3250.00
.5 Agpﬁigat?c?r']sf;f '[‘)’gputy 10,000 _ |No Bid No Bid $ 9267 $  926.73| $ 380.00| $§  3.800.00
Registrars (Spanish Only) 15,000 |No Bid No Bid $ 8311 $ 1,246.64] $ 280.00| $  4.200.00
25000 |No Bid No Bid $ 70.85| $ 1,771.36] $ 27000 $  6.750.00
Xotellr Rggls;[ratg)n 5,000 No Bid No Bid $ 128.39| $ 641.94 | $ 650.00 | $ 3,250.00
16 Rzgi'sctfzfs” or Deputy 15,000  |No Bid No Bid $ 8311 $ 1,246.64| $ 280.00| $  4,200.00
(Vietnamese Only) 25000 |No Bid No Bid $ 7085 $ 1,771.36| $ 27000 $  6.750.00
5000  |No Bid No Bid $ 15915| $  795.74| ¢ 340.00| §  1.700.00
Voter Reaistration 10,000 _ |No Bid No Bid $ 10594| $ 1,059.43| ¢ 320.00| $§  3.200.00
17 |0t hegistrator 25,000  |No Bid No Bid $ 8199 $ 2,049.69] $ 240.00| $§  6,000.00
Application (English Only) - -
50.000 |No Bid No Bid $ 60.68| $ 3,034.00| $ 170.00| ¢  8,500.00
100,000  |No Bid No Bid $ 53.73| $ 5,372.50| $ 160.00| $  16,000.00
Voter Redistration 1000  |No Bid No Bid $ 42835| $  428.35|$ 1,180.00| $  1,180.00
1g | VOter Registration 5000  |No Bid No Bid $ 15915| $  795.74| $ 340.00| $§  1.700.00
Application (Spanish Only) - -
25000 |No Bid No Bid $ 8199 $ 2,049.69| $ 24000 $  6.000.00




RFB 2022-199 Annual Contract for Elections Printed Forms and Printed Envelopes

Primary Award

Secondary Award

Stone Shield Investments LLC

American Solutions

Runbeck Election

Digital pfeii Printing for Business Services, Inc.
Crowley, TX Plano, TX Phoenix, AZ
HUB - No HUB - No FIUB - No
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
ltem| Description | Qty Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price Price Per M | Price
SECTION 2: Forms and Misc. Printing
. . 1,000 No Bid No Bid $ 428.35( $ 428.35| $ 1,180.00 | $§ 1,180.00
o Xg:jircit?gr'f”at'on 5,000 _ |No Bid No Bid $ 159.15| $ 79574 $ _ 340.00 | $ 1,700.00
(Vietnamese Only) 15,000 No Bid No Bid $ 96.49( $ 1,447.31| § 300.00 | $ 4,500.00
25,000 No Bid No Bid $ 8199 $ 2,049.69( $ 240.00 | $ 6,000.00
2,500 No Bid No Bid $ 350.98| $ 877.44| $ 580.00 | $ 1,450.00
20 Application for Ballot by Mail 5,000 No Bid No Bid $ 206.74| $ 1,033.69| 3 520.00 | $§ 2,600.00
(English Only) 10,000 No Bid No Bid $ 13463 $ 1,346.25| $ 460.00 | $ 4,600.00
15,000 No Bid No Bid $ 111.08| $ 1,666.25| $ 450.00 | § 6,750.00
Statement of Compensation 1,000 No Bid No Bid $ 171.60| $ 171.60| $ 410.00 | $ 410.00
21 and Oaths 5,000 No Bid No Bid $ 67.52| $ 337.60| 3 7190.00 | § 950.00
15,000 No Bid No Bid $ 4716 | $ 707.34| $ 120.00 | $ 1,800.00
Percent Discount 0% 0% 0%
Section Total No Bid | $ 39,279.40 | $ 126,420.00

Notes: A no-bid was received from Hart InterCivic.

There is no alternate award for Section 2 because only two (2) bids were received for this section.
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